PROCUREMENT CONTRACTS OFFICER:
BRENDA SENSIBAUGH

ITB 6854 OF AWARD
NEBRASKA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 27, 2024

TEMPORARY PAVEMENT MARKER

APEX UNIVERSAL, INC.

REVELAE GROUP LLC

SHUR-TITE PRODUCTS

LINE #

DESCRIPTION

QTy

Uuom

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT

EXTENDED PRICE
PRICE

WHITE PAVEMENT MARKERS

SINGLE SIDED; DISTRICT 1

Shipping Address:

5001 South 14th Street, Lincoln, NE 68512

80

BX

S 184.00

$

14,720.00

$

235.00

$

18,800.00

NO BID

YELLOW PAVEMENT MARKERS

SINGLE SIDED; DISTRICT 1

Shipping Address:

5001 South 14th Street,Lincoln, NE 68512

170

BX

S 184.00

$

31,280.00

235.00

$

39,950.00

NO BID

WHITE PAVEMENT MARKERS

T-TABS; DISTRICT 1

Shipping Address:

5001 South 14th Street Lincoln, NE 68512

BX

NO BID

164.00

820.00

S 160.00 | $ 800.00

YELLOW PAVEMENT MARKERS

T-TABS; DISTRICT 1

Shipping Address:

5001 South 14th Street. Lincoln, NE 68512

30

BX

NO BID

164.00

4,920.00

S 166.00 | $ 4,980.00

WHITE PAVEMENT MARKERS
SINGLE SIDED; DISTRICT 2

Shipping Address:

2829 N 204th St Elkhorn, NE 68022

10

BX

S 184.00

1,840.00

235.00

2,350.00

NO BID

YELLOW PAVEMENT MARKERS
SINGLE SIDED; DISTRICT 2

Shipping Address:

2829 N 204th St Elkhorn, NE 68022

10

BX

S 184.00

1,840.00

235.00

2,350.00

NO BID

WHITE PAVEMENT MARKERS
DOUBLE SIDED; DISTRICT 2
Shipping Address:

2829 N 204th St Elkhorn, NE 68022

30

BX

S 194.00

5,820.00

235.00

7,050.00

NO BID

YELLOW PAVEMENT MARKERS
DOUBLE SIDED; DISTRICT 2
Shipping Address:

2829 N 204th St Elkhorn, NE 68022

30

BX

S 194.00

5,820.00

235.00

7,050.00

NO BID

WHITE PAVEMENT MARKERS
T-TABS; DISTRICT 2

Shipping Address:

2829 N 204th St Elkhorn, NE 68022

30

BX

NO BID

164.00

4,920.00

S 160.00 | $ 4,800.00

10

YELLOW PAVEMENT MARKERS
T-TABS; DISTRICT 2

Shipping Address:

2829 N 204th St Elkhorn, NE 68022

30

BX

NO BID

164.00

4,920.00

S 166.00 | $ 4,980.00

11

WHITE PAVEMENT MARKERS

SINGLE SIDED; DISTRICT 3

Shipping Address:

1001 Alaska Avenue, Norfolk, NE 68701

90

BX

S 184.00

16,560.00

235.00

21,150.00

NO BID

12

YELLOW PAVEMENT MARKERS

SINGLE SIDED; DISTRICT 3

Shipping Address:

1001 Alaska Avenue, Norfolk, NE 68701

90

BX

S 184.00

16,560.00

235.00

21,150.00

NO BID

13

WHITE PAVEMENT MARKERS

DOUBLE SIDED; DISTRICT 3

Shipping Address:

1001 Alaska Avenue, Norfolk, NE 68701

200

BX

S 194.00

38,800.00

235.00

47,000.00

NO BID

14

YELLOW PAVEMENT MARKERS
DOUBLE SIDED; DISTRICT 3

Shipping Address:

1001 Alaska AvenueNorfolk, NE 68701

100

BX

S 194.00

19,400.00

235.00

23,500.00

NO BID

15

WHITE PAVEMENT MARKERS

T-TABS; DISTRICT 3

Shipping Address:

1001 Alaska Avenue, Norfolk, NE 68701

100

BX

NO BID

164.00

16,400.00

S 160.00 | $ 16,000.00

16

YELLOW PAVEMENT MARKERS

T-TABS; DISTRICT 3

Shipping Address:

1001 Alaska Avenue, Norfolk, NE 68701

100

BX

NO BID

164.00

16,400.00

S 166.00 | $ 16,600.00

17

WHITE PAVEMENT MARKERS

SINGLE SIDED; DISTRICT 4

Shipping Address:

3305 W Old Potash Highway Grand Island, NE 68802

140

BX

S 184.00

$

25,760.00

235.00

32,900.00

NO BID

18

YELLOW PAVEMENT MARKERS

SINGLE SIDED; DISTRICT 4

Shipping Address:

3305 W Old Potash Highway Grand Island, NE 68802

230

BX

S 184.00

$

42,320.00

235.00

54,050.00

NO BID

19

WHITE PAVEMENT MARKERS

DOUBLE SIDED; DISTRICT 4

Shipping Address:

3305 W Old Potash Highway Grand Island, NE 68802

20

BX

S 194.00

$

3,880.00

235.00

$

4,700.00

NO BID

20

YELLOW PAVEMENT MARKERS

DOUBLE SIDED; DISTRICT 4

Shipping Address:

3305 W Old Potash Highway Grand Island, NE 68802

40

BX

S 194.00

235.00

$

9,400.00

NO BID

21

WHITE PAVEMENT MARKERS

T-TABS; DISTRICT 4

Shipping Address:

3305 W Old Potash Highway Grand Island, NE 68802

100

BX

NO BID

164.00

$

16,400.00

S 160.00
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YELLOW PAVEMENT MARKERS

T-TABS; DISTRICT 4

22 o 200 BX NO BID $ 164.00$ 32,800.00 S 166.00
Shipping Address:

3305 W Old Potash Highway Grand Island, NE 68802

WHITE PAVEMENT MARKERS

SINGLE SIDED; DISTRICT 5

23 - 30 BX S 184.00| $ 5,520.00| $ 23500 $ 7,050.00 | NOBID
Shipping Address:

140375 Rundell Road Gering, NE 69341

YELLOW PAVEMENT MARKERS

SINGLE SIDED; DISTRICT 5

24 - 130 BX S 184.00|$ 23,92000|S$ 23500|$ 30,550.00 | NOBID
Shipping Address:

140375 Rundell Road Gering, NE 69341

WHITE PAVEMENT MARKERS

DOUBLE SIDED; DISTRICT 5

25 L 65 BX S 19400|$ 12,61000| S 23500|$ 15,275.00| NOBID
Shipping Address:

140375 Rundell Road Gering, NE 69341

YELLOW PAVEMENT MARKERS

DOUBLE SIDED; DISTRICT 5

26 L 65 BX S 19400|$ 12,61000|S$ 23500|$ 15,275.00| NOBID
Shipping Address:

140375 Rundell Road Gering, NE 69341
WHITE PAVEMENT MARKERS

SINGLE SIDED; DISTRICT 6
27 |Shipping Address: 70 BX |$ 184.00($ 12,880.00|$ 23500($ 16,450.00| NOBID
2400 West 14th St

North Platte, NE 69103
YELLOW PAVEMENT MARKERS
SINGLE SIDED; DISTRICT 6

28 |Shipping Address: 240 BX |[$ 184.00|$ 44,160.00|$ 235.00|$ 56,400.00| NOBID
2400 West 14th St

North Platte, NE 69103
WHITE PAVEMENT MARKERS
T-TABS; DISTRICT 6

29 |(Shipping Address: 6 BX NO BID $  164.00|$ 984.00 [ S 160.00 | $ 960.00
2400 West 14th St

North Platte, NE 69103
YELLOW PAVEMENT MARKERS
T-TABS; DISTRICT 6

30 |Shipping Address: 20 BX NO BID $ 16400|$  3,280.00|$ 166.00 | $ 3,320.00
2400 West 14th St
North Platte, NE 69103

31 |WHITE PAVEMENT MARKERS 30 BX S 184.00| S 5,520.00 | $ 235.00 | $ 7,050.00 | NO BID
SINGLE SIDED; DISTRICT 7
Shipping Address: 38764 US Highway 6, McCook, NE 69001

YELLOW PAVEMENT MARKERS
32 SINGLE SIDED; DISTRICT 7 140 BX S 184.00|S$ 25760.00|$ 235.00($ 32,900.00| NOBID
Shipping Address: 38764 US Highway 6, McCook, NE 69001
WHITE PAVEMENT MARKERS

T-TABS; DISTRICT 7

33 |Shipping Address: 60 BX NO BID S 164.00| S 9,840.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 9,600.00
38764 US Highway 6

McCook, NE 69001

YELLOW PAVEMENT MARKERS
T-TABS; DISTRICT 7

34 [Shipping Address: 60 BX NO BID S 164.00| $ 9,840.00 | S 166.00 | $ 9,960.00
38764 US Highway 6
McCook, NE 69001

WHITE PAVEMENT MARKERS
SINGLE SIDED; DISTRICT 8

35 |Shipping Address: 110 BX S 184.00|S$ 20,240.00|$ 23500($ 25,850.00| NOBID
736 E 4th St

Ainsworth, NE 69210

YELLOW PAVEMENT MARKERS
SINGLE SIDED; DISTRICT 8

36 [Shipping Address: 150 BX S 184.00|S$ 27,600.00| S 23500|S$ 35,250.00| NOBID
736 E 4th St

Ainsworth, NE 69210

WHITE PAVEMENT MARKERS
T-TABS; DISTRICT 8

37 |[Shipping Address: 75 BX NO BID S 164.00|$ 12,300.00$ 160.00| $ 12,000.00
736 E 4th St

Ainsworth, NE 69210

YELLOW PAVEMENT MARKERS
T-TABS; DISTRICT 8

38 |[Shipping Address: 150 BX NO BID S 164.00|$ 24,600.00(S 166.00| S 24,900.00
736 E 4th St
Ainsworth, NE 69210
TOTAL: S 415,420.00 S 691,874.00 S 108,900.00
PAYMENT TERMS: 0%, N30 DAYS 0.5%, 10 DAYS
DELIVERY DAYS ARO: 21 DAYS
COMMENTS:

Revelae group LLC did come in low for the “Yellow T-tabs” lines by

$2, but based on calculating the overall cost of the T-tabs, Shur-tite

came in overall lower ($158,100.00 for Shur-tite and $158,424.00
for Revelae Group LLC).
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