Buyer: Joshua Riekenberg 6852 OF Opening Date: 01/30/24
Department of Administrative Services

3 | 2024 or current Production Year Ford E-450 Bus (12 Passengers + Masters Transportation Masters Transportation
_g 2 Wheelchairs) 42" Entry Door Alternate Bid 36" Entry Door
- Description Qty UoM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

2024 SMALL E-450 BUS

OR CURRENT MODEL YEAR
2 |cCOMPRESSED NATURAL GAS CNG opT | °20-0000 | M NO BID $ - NO BID $ -
ADDITIONAL WHEELCHAIR POSITION

3 | /SECURMENT 500000 | M |$  220400|$ 114700.00|$  2295.00| $ 114,750.00
DEDUCT REMOVAL OF 2 PASSENGER
4 | ADD WhEAL AR PoaTIon 50.0000 | M -$760.00 -$38.,000.00 -$759.00 -$37.950.00
DEDUCT REMOVAL OF 5 PASSENGER
5 | ON BACK WALL 50.0000 | M NO BID $ ; NO BID $ .
ADD A 2 PASSENGER SEAT
6 |ON CURB SIDE **Foldseat Driver Side** 500000 | M |$  1,81000|$ 9050000{$  1.810.00| $ 90,500.00
**Double seat NA curb side due to space™*

1 INTERGRATED CHILD SEAT W/

—

50.0000 M | $ 124,960.00( $6,248,000.00| $ 124,961.00| $ 6,248,050.00

7 COMPANION SEAT AISLE SIDE 50.0000 M |$ 2,250.00| $ 112,500.00( $ 2,250.00| $ 112,500.00
1 FEDERAL MOTOER VEH SAFETY
8 STANDARD CRS W DBL LATCH HOOK 50.0000 M |$ 149.00( $ 7,450.00( $ 149.00| $ 22,201.00
MID TO HIGH FEATHER WEIGHT TWO
9 PASSENGER SEAT FLIP SEAT/W ARM 50.0000 M |$ 1,694.00( $ 84,700.00( $ 1,694.00| $ 84,700.00
24" BLACK ADJUSTABLE PASSENGER
10 SEAT BELT FOR AMBULITORY PASS 50.0000 $ 39.00| $ 1,950.00| $ 39.00| $ 1,950.00
DROP SHIP CHARGE
11 OUTSIDE LINCOLN AREA 50.0000 $ 3.00( $ 150.00( $ 3.00( $ 150.00
Total $ 132,439.00| $6,621,950.00( $ 132,442.00| $ 6,636,851.00
Payment Terms 1 30 2 30
Delivery Days ARO 30 31

In order to meet the 36” clear
opening specification, we had to
use a 42” entry door with
Comments the 24’ body. We have submitted
an alternate bid for the 36” entry
door with the 22’
body.
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