PROCUREMENT CONTRACTS OFFICER: 6851 OF OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 21, 2024

BRENDA SENSIBAUGH NEBRASKA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, . . Martin Resource
Inc. Flint Hills Resources, LP Jebro, Inc. Management Corp. DBA
LIQUID ASPHALTIC MATERIALS Monarch Qil
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT UNIT EXTENDED
LINE # DESCRIPTION QTy uom PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE EXTENDED PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 DISTRICT 1 CRS-2P 4050 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 715.02|S 2,895,831.00 No Bid
2 |DISTRICT 3 CRS-2P 4405 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 695.69 S 3,064,514.45 No Bid
3 DISTRICT 4 CRS-2P 4195 TN No Bid No Bid S 612.00|$ 2,567,340.00 | S 729.60| S 3,060,672.00 No Bid
4  |DISTRICT 4 HFE-300 575 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 785.15|$ 451,461.25 No Bid
5 DISTRICT 4 MC-250 50 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,116.65 | S 55,832.50 No Bid
6 [DISTRICT 5 CRS-2P 2680 TN S 673.77 | $ 1,805,703.60 No Bid No Bid S 786.29 (S 2,107,257.20 No Bid
7 |DISTRICT 5 CSS-1H (50/50) 10 TN S 463.99| S 4,639.90 No Bid No Bid no bid No Bid
8 |DISTRICT 5 MC-250 5 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid no bid No Bid
9 DISTRICT 6 CRS-2P 2480 TN No Bid No Bid S 642.00|S$ 1,592,160.00 (S 750.74|S 1,861,835.20 No Bid
10 |[DISTRICT 6 CSS-1H (50/50 125 TN S 41873 S 52,341.25 No Bid No Bid S 44183 S 55,228.75| S 695.00 [ $ 86,875.00
11 [DISTRICT 6 CSS-1H (75/25) 1045 TN S 51277 | S 535,844.65 No Bid No Bid S 589.13| S 615,640.85 | $ 675.00 [ S 705,375.00
12 |DISTRICT 6 HFE-300 935 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 82344 (S 769,916.40 No Bid
13 |DISTRICT 6 MC-250 120 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,138.08 | § 136,569.60 No Bid
14 |DISTRICT 7 CRS-2P 1185 TN No Bid No Bid S 658.00|S 779,730.00 (S 769.54 (| $ 911,904.90 No Bid
15 |DISTRICT 7 CSS-1H STRAIGHT 52 TN S 677.78| S 35,244.56 No Bid No Bid S 74593 | S 38,788.36 [ S 700.00 | $ 36,400.00
16 |DISTRICT 8 CRS-2P 2155 N No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 72669 (S 1,566,016.95 No Bid
17 |DISTRICT 8 CSS-1H (75/25) 1000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 57743 | S 577,430.00 | § 555.00 [ S 555,000.00
18 |DISTRICT 8 HFE-150 17 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 77182 S 13,120.94 No Bid
19 |DISTRICT 8 HFE-300 205 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 798.84| S 163,762.20 No Bid
20 |DISTRICT 8 HFE-1000 50 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 861.21| S 43,060.50 No Bid
21 |[DISTRICT 8 MC-250 50 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,128.16 | S 56,408.00 No Bid
22 |CRS-2L PLANT PICK UP 25 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid no bid No Bid
23 |CRS-2P PLANT PICK UP 25 TN S 750.00| S 18,750.00 No Bid No Bid S 675.00| S 16,875.00 No Bid
24 |CSS-1H PLANT PICK UP 25 TN S 700.00| S 17,500.00 No Bid No Bid S 600.00| S 15,000.00 | $ 650.00 | S 16,250.00
25 |CSS-1H (50/50) PLANT PICK UP 25 TN S 425.00| S 10,625.00 No Bid No Bid S 350.00|$ 8,750.00 | § 550.00 | S 13,750.00
26 |CSS-1H (75/25) PLANT PICK UP 25 TN S 535.00| S 13,375.00 No Bid No Bid S 500.00| S 12,500.00 | $ 600.00 | S 15,000.00
27 |SS-1H (50/50) PLANT PICK UP 25 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid no bid No Bid
28 |[SS-1H (75/25) PLANT PICK UP 25 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid no bid No Bid
29 |CFS/FS-1 PLANT PICK UP 25 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid no bid No Bid
30 |CMS-1 PLANT PICK UP 25 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid no bid No Bid
31 |CMS-1W PLANT PICK UP 25 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid no bid No Bid
32 |MC-250 PLANT PICK UP 25 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,100.00 | S 27,500.00 No Bid
33 [HFE-150 PLANT PICK UP 25 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 725001 S 18,125.00 No Bid
34 |[HFE-300 PLANT PICK UP 25 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 750.00| S 18,750.00 No Bid
35 |HFE-500 PLANT PICK UP 25 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid no bid No Bid
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36 |[HFE-1000 PLANT PICK UP 25 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 790.00| S 19,750.00 No Bid
37 |HFMS-2L PLANT PICK UP 25 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid no bid No Bid
38 |HFM-2P PLANT PICK UP 25 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid no bid No Bid
39 |CRS-2P (80/20) PLANT PICK UP 25 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid no bid No Bid
40 [CRS-2VHL PLANT PICK UP 25 TN S 750.00 | $ 18,750.00 No Bid No Bid no bid No Bid

RETURNED LOAD FEE (BILLED PER
41 HWY MILE FROM POINT THE 1 MI S 14.00(S 14.00 $0.00 $0.00 S 14.00] S 14.00|$ 10.00 | S 10.00
TRANSFER TRUCK IS NOTIFIED BACK ' ' ' ' ' ' ' '

TO THE SHIPPING POINT ORIGIN

42 |[DEMURRAGE CHARGE 1| HR $ 300.00 | S 300.00 $0.00 $0.00 S 320.00($ 320.00 | $ 350.00 | S 350.00
TOTAL: $ 2,513,087.96 $ 4,939,230.00 $ 18,582,835.05 $ 1,429,010.00
PAYMENT TERMS: 0%, 30 DAYS 0%, 30 DAYS net %, 45 DAYS 0%, 30 Days
DELIVERY DAYS ARO: 1 day 1 day 1day Spec
COMMENTS:
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