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Institutional Clothing BOB BARKER COMPANY BSA INTERCONTINENTAL Care Apparel INC CHARM-TEX, INC. ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC. Mini Wing USA
F*
o -
c Estimated
- Description Size Annual uom Unit Price Extended Price | Unit Price |Extended Price| Unit Price Extepded Unit Price |Extended Price| Unit Price Extepded Unit Price Extepded
Usage Price Price Price
WHITE CREW SOCKS 5.12 5,862.40 5.67 6,492.15 6.36 7,282.20 5.54 6,343.30 7.49 8,576.05 - -
OSFAM 1145 bz $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $
BRAND: BBC: WC Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel SCK/CREW ICS
2 ORANGE CREW SOCKS OSFAM 135 bz $ 578 ($ 780.30 | § 7.36 | $ 993.60 | $ 6.36 | $ 858.60 | $ 6.18 | § 834.30 | § 1052 | $ 142020 | $ $
BRAND: BBC: OC Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel SCK/CREW ICS
LOOSE KNIT STOCKING
HATS/WATCH CAPS $ 11.78 | § 6,502.56 | $ 16.33 | $ 8,462.16 | § 16.00 | $ 8,832.00 | $ 1354 |$ 7,474.08 | $ 16.07 | $ 831864 |$ 19.00 | $ 10,488.00
3 DARK BROWN OR ORANGE OSFM 552 Y4
BBC: 101K-OR (ORANGE)
BRAND: JZ-CP90 BR (BROWN) Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel CL/WATCHCAP ICS
L $2.60/EA
TIGHT KNIT STOCKING
HATS/WATCH CAPS $ 11.78 | $ 227354 | § 1495 (% 288535 § 33.00($ 6,369.00 | $ 49.90($ 9,630.70 | § 16.07|$ 290851 | § 17.00|$ 3,281.00
4 BLACK OSFM 193 Dz
BRAND: BBC: 101K-BK Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel CL/BEANIEBK ICS
UNISEX THERMAL BOTTOMS
NATURAL OR OFF WHITE $ 2532 |$ 50.64 | $ 3527 |$ 7054 | $ 33.00($ 66.00 | $ 33.90|$ 67.80 | § 39.70 | $ 7940 $ 33.00($ 66.00
5 MEDIUM 2 274
BRAND: BBC: 112-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel CL/ATHERP ICS
UNISEX THERMAL BOTTOMS
NATURAL OR OFF WHITE LARGE 4 oz |8 2532 | $ 10128 |§ 3527 |$ 14108 $ 33.00($ 13200 |$ 33.90|$ 13560 S 3970|$  158.80 | §  33.00|$  132.00
BRAND: BBC: 112-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel CL/MTHERP ICS
UNISEX THERMAL BOTTOMS
NATURAL OR OFF WHITE XL 2 bz $ 25.32 ‘ $ 50.64 | $ 3527 | $ 7054 | § 33.00‘ $ 66.00 | § 3390‘ $ 67.80 | § 39.70 | § 7940 | $ 33.00($ 66.00
BRAND: BBC: 112-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel CL/THERP ICS
UNISEX THERMAL BOTTOMS
NATURAL OR OFF WHITE v 28 bz $ 25.32 | $ 708.96 | $ 40.63 | $ 113764 | $ 36.00| $ 1,008.00 | $ 37.90| $ 106120 § 42.93| $ 1,202.04 | $ 36.00| $ 1,008.00
BRAND: BBC: 112-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel CL/THERP ICs
UNISEX THERMAL BOTTOMS
NATURAL OR OFF WHITE axL 2 oz $ 27.12 | $ 867.84 | § 4523 ($ 144736 | $ 36.00| $ 1,152.00 | § 40.90| $ 130880 | § 42.93| $ 137376 $ 38.00| $ 1,216.00
BRAND: BBC: 112-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel CL/MTHERP ICS
UNISEX THERMAL BOTTOMS
10|NATURAL OR OFF WHITE XL 2 oz $ 28.32 | $ 962.88 | $ 48.30 | $ 164220 $ 36.00| $ 122400 $ 43.90| $ 149260 | $ 52.93| $ 179962 | $ 40.00| $ 1,360.00
BRAND: BBC: 112-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel CL/THERP ICs
UNISEX THERMAL BOTTOMS
11 |NATURAL OR OFF WHITE XL 2 bz $ 28.32 | $ 679.68 | $ 51.37 | $ 123288 $ 36.00| $ 864.00 | § 46.90| $ 1,12560 | § 52.93| $ 127032 $ 42.00| $ 1,008.00
BRAND: BBC: 112-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel CL/THERP ICS
UNISEX THERMAL BOTTOMS
12 |NATURAL OR OFF WHITE XL 14 bz $ 28.32 ‘ $ 396.48 | $ 5443 | $ 762.02 | $ 39.00‘ $ 546.00 | $ 48,90‘ $ 684.60 | $ 5663‘ $ 79282 | $ 44.00‘ $ 616.00
BRAND: BBC: 112-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel CL/THERP ICs
UNISEX THERMAL BOTTOMS
13|NATURAL OR OFF WHITE axL 4 bz $ 29.76 | $ 119.04 | § 6363 | $ 25452 | § 42.00| $ 168.00 | $ 59v90| $ 239.60 | $ 56v63| $ 22652 | $ 46.00| $ 184.00
BRAND: BBC: 112-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel CL/MTHERP ICs
UNISEX THERMAL TOPS
14 |NATURAL OR OFF WHITE MEDIUM 2 bz $ 27.36 | $ 5472 | $ 35.27 | $ 7054 | $ 33.00| $ 66.00 | $ 33.90| $ 67.80 | § 39.70| $ 7940 $ 49.00| $ 98.00
BRAND: BBC: 63-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel CL/THERS ICS
UNISEX THERMAL TOPS
15 [NATURAL OR OFF WHITE LARGE 4 bz $ 27.36 | $ 109.44 | § 35.27 | $ 141.08 | § 33.00 | $ 132.00 | § 33v90| $ 135.60 | § 39.70 | $ 158.80 | $ 33.00 | $ 132.00
BRAND: BBC: 63-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel CL/THERS ICS
UNISEX THERMAL TOPS
16 NATURAL OR OFF WHITE XL 2 Dz $ 2736 | $ 5472 | $ 35.27 ‘ $ 7054 | $ 33.00($ 66.00 | $ 33.90|$ 67.80 | § 39.70 | $ 7940 $ 33.00($ 66.00
BRAND: BBC: 63-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel CL/MTHERS ICs
UNISEX THERMAL TOPS
17|NATURAL OR OFF WHITE XL 2 bz $ 27.36 | $ 601.92 | § 40.63 | $ 893.86 | $ 36.00| $ 792.00 | $ 37v90| $ 833.80 | $ 42v93| $ 944.46 | $ 33.00| $ 726.00
BRAND: BBC: 63-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel CL/THERS ICS
UNISEX THERMAL TOPS
18 [NATURAL OR OFF WHITE axL 2 bz $ 27.36 | $ 875.52 | § 45.23 | $ 144736 | $ 36.00| $ 1,152.00 | § 40.90| $ 130880 § 42.93| $ 137376 $ 36.00| $ 1,152.00
BRAND: BBC: 63-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel CL/MTHERS ICs
UNISEX THERMAL TOPS $ 2880 |$ 979.20 | § 4830 [ $ 1,64220 | $ 36.00 [$ 1,224.00 | $ 4390 [$ 1,49260 | $ 5293 |$ 1,799.62 | $ 38.00 [ $ 1,292.00
NATURAL OR OFF WHITE
9 4XL 34 274 ICS
BRAND: BBC: 63-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel CL/MTHERS
UNISEX THERMAL TOPS $ 30.00 | $ 720.00 | $ 5137 |$ 123288 (% 36.00 | $ 864.00 | $ 46.90 [$ 1,12560 | $ 5293 |$ 127032 |$ 40.00 | $ 960.00
NATURAL OR OFF WHITE
0 5XL 24 274 ics
BRAND: BBC: 63-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel CL/MTHERS
UNISEX THERMAL TOPS $ 31.20 | $ 624.00 | $ 54.43|$ 1,08860 | $ 39.00 | $ 780.00 | $ 48.90 | $ 978.00 | $ 56.63|$ 1,132.60 | $ 42.00($ 840.00
NATURAL OR OFF WHITE
1 XL 20 274 ics
BRAND: BBC: 63-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel CL/MTHERS
UNISEX THERMAL TOPS $ 31.20 | $ 499.20 | § 63.63|$ 1,018.08| $ 42.00($ 672.00 | $ 59.90| $ 958.40 | $ 56.63 | $ 906.08 | $ 4400 $ 704.00
NATURAL OR OFF WHITE
2 8XL 16 274 ics
BRAND: BBC: 63-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel CL/M1THERS
UNISEX THERMAL TOPS $ 36.00 | $ 216.00 | $ 7283 $ 436.98 | $ 45.00 | $ 270.00 | $ 64.90| $ 389.40 NO BID #VALUE! $ 46.00 | $ 276.00
NATURAL OR OFF WHITE
3 10XL 6 274
BRAND: BBC: 63-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel CL/MTHERS
UNISEX THERMAL TOPS $ 36.00 | $ 144.00 | $ 99.67 | $ 398.68 $ - $ 69.90 | $ 279.60 NO BID #VALUE! $ 49.00( $ 196.00
NATURAL OR OFF WHITE
4 12XL 4 274
BRAND: BBC: 63-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery CL/MTHERS
SOLID ORANGE
s JUMPSUIT WITH SNAP CLOSURE " 2 A $ 15.00| $ 360.00 | $ 1840 $ 441.60 | $ - $ 12.90| $ 309.60 | $ 23.67| $ 568.08 | $ 19.00| $ 456.00
BRAND: BBC: OJSN-SIZE (SOLD 12/CASE) Manhattan Hosiery EJOR 1cs
SOLID ORANGE
JUMPSUIT WITH SNAP CLOSURE $ 15.83 | $ 189.96 | $ 18.78 | $ 225.36 | $ - $ 12.90| $ 15480 | $ 23.67| $ 284.04 | $ 21.00| $ 252.00
6 2XL 12 EA ics
BRAND: BBC: OJSN-SIZE (SOLD 12/CASE) Manhattan Hosiery EJOR
SOLID ORANGE
JUMPSUIT WITH SNAP CLOSURE $ 16.67 | $ 400.08 | $ 19.55($ 469.20 | $ - $ 13.90| $ 333.60 | $ 26.16 | $ 627.84 | $ 23.00 | $ 552.00
7 3XL 24 EA ics
BRAND: BBC: OJSN-SIZE (SOLD 12/CASE) Manhattan Hosiery EJOR
SOLID ORANGE
JUMPSUIT WITH SNAP CLOSURE $ 16.00 | $ 288.00 | $ 2032 $ 365.76 | $ - $ 14.90| $ 268.20 | $ 26.16 | $ 470.88 | $ 25.00 | $ 450.00
8 4XL 18 EA ics
BRAND: BBC: OJSN-SIZE (SOLD 6/CASE) Manhattan Hosiery EJOR
SOLID ORANGE 16.00 | $ 96.00 2185($ 131.10 | $ - $ 15.90| $ 9540 | § 28.64| $ 17184 | § 27.00| $ 162.00
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BRAND: BBC: OJSN-SIZE (SOLD 6/CASE) Manhattan Hosiery EJOR 1cs

SOLID ORANGE

JUMPSUIT WITH SNAP CLOSURE $ 18.00 | $ 108.00 | $ 39.48($ 236.88 | $ - $ 16,90| $ 101.40 | § 28.64 | $ 17184 | § 29.00 | $ 174.00
30 8XL 6 EA 1CS

BRAND: BBC: OJSN-SIZE (SOLD 6/CASE) Manhattan Hosiery EJOR

SOLID ORANGE

JUMPSUIT WITH VELCRO CLOSURE $ 13.90 | $ 278.00( $ 2952 $ 590.40 | $ - $ 14,54| $ 290.80 | $ 24.36 | $ 487.20 | $ 19.00 | $ 380.00
31 XL 20 EA 1CS

BRAND: BBC: OVJ-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery JORVL

SOLID ORANGE

JUMPSUIT WITH VELCRO CLOSURE $ 15.90 | $ 318.00( $ 2982 $ 596.40 | $ - $ 14,90| $ 298.00 | $ 24.36 | $ 487.20 | $ 21.00 | $ 420.00
32 2XL 20 EA 1CS

BRAND: BBC: OVJ-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery JORVL

SOLID ORANGE

JUMPSUIT WITH VELCRO CLOSURE $ 15.90 | $ 477.00( $ 3067 $ 920.10 | $ - $ 15,54| $ 466.20 | $ 26,92| $ 807.60 | $ 23.00| $ 690.00
33 3XL 30 EA 1CS

BRAND: BBC: OVJ-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery JORVL

SOLID ORANGE

JUMPSUIT WITH VELCRO CLOSURE $ 15.90| $ 636.00 $ 31.43|$ 1,257.20 | $ - $ 16,54| $ 661.60 | $ 26,92| $ 107680 | $ 25.00| $ 1,000.00
34 4XL 40 EA 1CS

BRAND: BBC: OVJ-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery JORVL

SOLID ORANGE

JUMPSUIT WITH VELCRO CLOSURE $ 16.90 | $ 40560 $ 3274 $ 785.76 | $ - $ 17,54| $ 42096 | $ 26.92 | $ 646.08 | $ 26.00 | $ 624.00
35 5XL 24 EA 1CS

BRAND: BBC: OVJ-SIZE (SOLD 6/CASE) Manhattan Hosiery JORVL

SOLID ORANGE

JUMPSUIT WITH VELCRO CLOSURE $ 16.90 | $ 304.20( $ 3312 $ 596.16 | $ - $ 17,90| $ 32220 | $ 29.47 | $ 530.46 | $ 27.00 | $ 486.00
36 B6XL 18 EA 1CS

BRAND: BBC: OVJ-SIZE (SOLD 6/CASE) Manhattan Hosiery JORVL

::¢E| SSII:I/\{IVE/B?I\,I\\IIG $ 27.50| $ 990.00 $ - | $ - $ 69,90| $ 251640 § 44.00 | $ 1,584.00 | $ -
37 NA 36 RL

BRAND: BBC: WEB-KH Manhattan Hosiery WC/7LKH

WSM—ENS BRIEF UNDERWEAR $ 6.33 | $ 227.88 | $ 10.73 | $ 386.28 | $ 12.00| $ 432.00 | $ 8.90| $ 32040 | $ 11.01] 8§ 396.36 | $ 14.50| $ 522.00
38 5 36 Dz 1CS

BRAND: BBC: ELBLCTN- SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel CL/PANT

WSM—ENS BRIEF UNDERWEAR $ 6.47 | $ 49172 | $ 10.73 | $ 81548 | § 12.00| $ 912.00 | $ 8.90| $ 676.40 | $ 11.01 | $ 836.76 | $ 14.50| $ 1,102.00
39 6 76 Dz 1CS

BRAND: BBC: ELBLCTN- SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel CL/PANT

WSM—ENS BRIEF UNDERWEAR $ 6.47 | $ 854.04 | $ 10.73$ 141636 | $ 12.00| $ 1,584.00 | $ 9.54| $ 125928 | § 11.01 | $ 145332 $ 14.50| $ 1,914.00
40 7 132 Dz 1CS

BRAND: BBC: ELBLCTN- SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel CL/PANT

WSM—ENS BRIEF UNDERWEAR $ 6.47 | $ 1,112.84 | § 10.73|$ 1,84556 | $ 12.00| $ 2,064.00 | $ 9.54| $ 164088 | § 11.01 | $ 189372 % 14.50| $ 2,494.00
41 8 172 Dz 1CS

BRAND: BBC: ELBLCTN- SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel CL/PANT

WSM—ENS BRIEF UNDERWEAR $ 7.57 | $ 2,119.60 | $ 13.03($ 3,64840 | $ 12.00| $ 3,360.00 | § 10,90| $ 3,05200| $ 12v93| $ 362040 | $ 16.50| $ 4,620.00
42 9 280 Dz 1CS

BRAND: BBC: ELBLCTN- SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel CL/PANT

WSM—ENS BRIEF UNDERWEAR $ 8.30 | $ 730.40 | $ 13.03( $ 1,146.64 | $ 13.00| $ 1,144.00 | $ 10,90| $ 959.20 | $ 12v93| $ 113784 | § 16.50| $ 1,452.00
43 10 88 Dz 1CS

BRAND: BBC: ELBLCTN- SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel CL/PANT

WSM—ENS BRIEF UNDERWEAR $ 8.30 | $ 43160 | $ 1495 $ 77740 $ 13.00 | $ 676.00 | $ 11,90| $ 618.80 | $ 14.83 | $ 77116 | $ 16.50 | $ 858.00
44 11 52 Dz 1CS

BRAND: BBC: ELBLCTN- SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel CL/PANT

WSM—ENS BRIEF UNDERWEAR $ 8.30 | $ 664.00 | $ 1495 $ 1,196.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 1,120.00 | § 11,90| $ 952.00 | $ 14.83 | $ 1,186.40 | $ 18.50 | $ 1,480.00
45 12 80 Dz 1CS

BRAND: BBC: ELBLCTN- SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel CL/PANT

WSM—ENS BRIEF UNDERWEAR $ 894 § 80.46 | $ 16.48 | $ 14832 § 14.00 | $ 126.00 | § 12,90| $ 116.10 | § 15.82 | $ 14238 | § 18.50 | $ 166.50
46 14 9 Dz ICS

BRAND: BBC: ELBLCTN- SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel CL/PANT

SPORTS AND FULL FIGURE BRA $ 19.49 | $ 93552 | § 29.13| $ 1,398.24 no bid | #VALUE! | $ - $ 25.92 | $ 124416 $ 3.25 | $ 156.00
47 34C 48 EA ICS

BRAND: GLAMORISE: Z1000GL-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel

SPORTS AND FULL FIGURE BRA $ 19.49 | $ 1,169.40 | $ 29.13| $ 1,747.80 no bid | #VALUE! | $ - $ 25.92 | $ 155520 $ 3.25 | $ 195.00
48 36C 60 EA 1CS

BRAND: GLAMORISE: Z1000GL-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel

SPORTS AND FULL FIGURE BRA $ 19.49 | $ 1,169.40 | $ 33.73| $ 2,023.80 no bid | #VALUE! | $ - $ 25.92 | $ 1555208 3.25 | $ 195.00
49 36D 60 EA 1CS

BRAND: GLAMORISE: Z1000GL-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel

SPORTS AND FULL FIGURE BRA $ 19.49 | $ 1,169.40 | $ 36.80| $ 2,208.00 no bid | #VALUE! | $ - $ 25.92 | $ 155520 $ 3.25 | $ 195.00
50 36DD 60 EA 1CS

BRAND: GLAMORISE: Z1000GL-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel

SPORTS AND FULL FIGURE BRA $ 19.49 | $ 1,403.28 | $ 29.13| $ 2,097.36 no bid | #VALUE! | $ - $ 25.92 | $ 1866.24 | § 3.25 | $ 234.00
51 38C 72 EA 1CS

BRAND: GLAMORISE: Z1000GL-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel

SPORTS AND FULL FIGURE BRA $ 19.49 | $ 1,403.28 | $ 33.73| $ 242856 no bid | #VALUE! | $ - $ 25.92 | $ 1866.24 | § 3.25 | $ 234.00
52 38D 72 EA 1CS

BRAND: GLAMORISE: Z1000GL-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel

SPORTS AND FULL FIGURE BRA $ 19.49 | $ 1,169.40 | $ 36.80| $ 2208.00 no bid | #VALUE! | $ - $ 25.92 | $ 155520 $ 3.25 | $ 195.00
53 38DD 60 EA 1CS

BRAND: GLAMORISE: Z1000GL-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel

SPORTS AND FULL FIGURE BRA $ 19.49 | $ 29235 | $ 61.33| § 919.95 no bid | #VALUE! | $ - $ 25.92 | $ 388.80 | $ 3.25 | $ 48.75
54 38F 15 EA 1CS

BRAND: GLAMORISE: Z1000GL-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel
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SPORTS AND FULL FIGURE BRA $ 1949 | $ 1,403.28 | § 30.67| $ 220824 no bid #VALUE! $ - $ 2592|% 1,866.24 | § 3.50|$ 252.00
55 40C 72 EA ics
BRAND: GLAMORISE: Z1000GL-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel
SPORTS AND FULL FIGURE BRA $ 19.49 | $ 1,403.28 | § 33.73| $ 242856 no bid | #VALUE! | $ - $ 25.92 | $ 1866.24 | § 3.50 | $ 252.00
56 40D 72 EA ics
BRAND: GLAMORISE: Z1000GL-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel
SPORTS AND FULL FIGURE BRA $ 19.49 | $ 1,188.89 | § 36.80| $ 2244.80 no bid | #VALUE! | $ - $ 25.92 | $ 158112 § 3.50 | $ 213.50
57 40DD 61 EA ics
BRAND: GLAMORISE: Z1000GL-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel
SPORTS AND FULL FIGURE BRA $ 19.49 | $ 1,169.40 | § 30.67| $ 1,840.20 no bid | #VALUE! | $ - $ 29.10 | $ 1,746.00 | § 3.50 | $ 210.00
58 42C 60 EA ics
BRAND: GLAMORISE: Z1000GL-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel
SPORTS AND FULL FIGURE BRA $ 19.49 | $ 1,403.28 | § 33.73| $ 242856 no bid | #VALUE! | $ - $ 29.10 | $ 2095.20 | § 3.50 | $ 252.00
59 42D 72 EA ics
BRAND: GLAMORISE: Z1000GL-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel
SPORTS AND FULL FIGURE BRA $ 19.49 | $ 1,169.40 | $ 36.80| $ 2,208.00 no bid | #VALUE! | $ - $ 29.10 | $ 1,746.00 | § 3.50 | $ 210.00
60 42DD 60 EA ics
BRAND: GLAMORISE: Z1000GL-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel
SPORTS AND FULL FIGURE BRA $ 19.49 | $ 93552 | § 3067 $ 1472.16 no bid | #VALUE! | $ - $ 29.10 | $ 1,396.80 | § 3.50 | $ 168.00
61 44C 48 EA Ics
BRAND: GLAMORISE: Z1000GL-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel
SPORTS AND FULL FIGURE BRA $ 19.49 | $ 93552 | § 3373 $ 1,619.04 no bid | #VALUE! | $ - $ 29.10 | $ 1,396.80 | § 3.50 | $ 168.00
62 44D 48 EA ics
BRAND: GLAMORISE: Z1000GL-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel
SPORTS AND FULL FIGURE BRA $ 19.49 | $ 1,169.40 | $ 36.80| $ 2,208.00 no bid | #VALUE! | $ - $ 29.10 | $ 1,746.00 | § 3.50 | $ 210.00
63 44DD 60 EA ics
BRAND: GLAMORISE: Z1000GL-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel
SPORTS AND FULL FIGURE BRA $ 19.49 | $ 93552 | § 3067 $ 1472.16 no bid | #VALUE! | $ - $ 31.52 | $ 151296 | § 3.50 | $ 168.00
64 46D 48 EA ics
BRAND: GLAMORISE: Z1000GL-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel
SPORTS AND FULL FIGURE BRA $ 19.49 | $ 93552 | § 3373 $ 1,619.04 no bid | #VALUE! | $ - $ 31.52 | $ 151296 | § 3.50 | $ 168.00
65 46DD 48 EA ics
BRAND: GLAMORISE: Z1000GL-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel
SPORTS AND FULL FIGURE BRA $ 19.49 | $ 467.76 | $ 30.67| $ 736.08 no bid | #VALUE! | $ - $ 31.52 | $ 756.48 | $ 3.50 | $ 84.00
66 48C 24 EA ics
BRAND: GLAMORISE: Z1000GL-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel
SPORTS AND FULL FIGURE BRA $ 19.49 | $ 93552 | § 3373 $ 1,619.04 no bid | #VALUE! | $ - $ 31.52 | $ 151296 | § 3.50 | $ 168.00
67 48D 48 EA ics
BRAND: GLAMORISE: Z1000GL-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel
SPORTS AND FULL FIGURE BRA $ 19.49 | $ 701.64 | § 36.80 $ 1,324.80 no bid | #VALUE! | $ - $ 31.52 | $ 113472 § 3.50 | $ 126.00
68 48DD 36 EA ics
BRAND: GLAMORISE: Z1000GL-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel
SPORTS AND FULL FIGURE BRA $ 19.49 | $ 233.88 | § 33.73| § 404.76 no bid | #VALUE! | $ - $ 34.49 | $ 413.88 | $ -
69 50D 12 EA ics
BRAND: GLAMORISE: Z1000GL-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel
SPORTS AND FULL FIGURE BRA $ 19.49 | $ 701.64 | $ 39.87| $ 143532 no bid | #VALUE! | $ - $ 34.49 | $ 1,241.64 | $ -
70 50DD 36 EA ics
BRAND: GLAMORISE: Z1000GL-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel
SPORTS AND FULL FIGURE BRA $ 19.49 | $ 233.88 | § 6133 | § 735.96 no bid | #VALUE! | $ - |8 34.49 | $ 413.88 | $ -
7 50F 12 EA ics
BRAND: GLAMORISE: Z1000GL-SIZE Manhattan Hosiery Care Apparel
STATE DISCOUNT STATE STATE STATE STATE STATE STATE STATE STATE STATE STATE
STATE DISCOUNT DISCOUNT DISCOUNT DISCOUNT DISCOUNT
PERCENTAGE OFF CATALOG CATALOG CATALOG CATALOG CATALOG
. " CATALOG PERCENTA PERCENTA PERCENTA PERCENTA PERCENTA
LI Description Size OF AND/OR AND/OR AND/OR AND/OR AND/OR
CATALOG/PRICE AND/OR PRICE | GE OFF OF PRICE LIST GE OFF OF PRICE LIST GE OFF OF PRICE LIST GE OFF OF PRICE LIST GE OFF OF PRICE LIST
N LIST LIST NAME: | CATALOG/ NAME: CATALOG/ NAME: CATALOG/ NAME: CATALOG/ NAME: CATALOG/ NAME:
E# PRICE LIST . PRICE LIST - PRICE LIST - PRICE LIST . PRICE LIST -
SOCKS BBC 2024 BSAI
72 |EXCLUDING CORE ITEMS MULTIPLE 30% CATALOG 25% Institutional 15% 10% WWW.ICSW
Clothing ACO.COM
BELT WEBBING BBC 2024 BSAl
73 EXCLUDING CORE ITEMS NA 20% CATALOG 25% Inst\tutl.onal no bid 15% 10% WWW.ICSW
Clothing ACO.COM
BRAS BBC 2024 BSAl
74 MULTIPLE 25% 25% Institutional 15% 10% WWW.ICSW
EXCLUDING CORE ITEMS CATALOG Clothin ACO.COM
UNDERWEAR BBC 2024 BSAl
75| ExCLUDING CORE ITEMS MULTIPLE 25% CATALOG 25% Institutional 15% 0%  |www.icsw
Clothing ACO.COM
HAT/STOCKING CAPS BBC 2024 BSAl
76 EXCLUDING CORE ITEMS MULTIPLE 15% CATALOG 25% Inst\tutl_onal 15% 10% WWW.ICSW
Clothing ACO.COM
77 |THERMAL TOPS MULTIPLE 20% BBC 2024 2% | insatonal 15% 10%
EXCLUDING CORE ITEMS o CATALOG o ) o e |www.icsw
Clothing ACO.COM
THERMAL BOTTOMS BBC 2024 BSAl
o o o o
78| £ GLUDING CORE ITEMS MULTIPLE 20% CATALOG 25% Institutional 15% 10%  |www.icsw
Clothing ACO.COM
BBC 2024 BSAl
79 |MENS CLOTHING MULTIPLE 25% 25% Institutional 15% 10%  |www.icsw
CATALOG . :
Clothing ACO.COM
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- Description Size Annual uom Unit Price Extended Price | Unit Price |Extended Price| Unit Price Extepded Unit Price |Extended Price| Unit Price Extepded Unit Price Extepded
Usage Price Price Price
BSAI
80 |WOMENS CLOTHING MULTIPLE 25% gfffgé 25% Institutional 15% 10%  |www.icsw
Clothing ACO.COM
BSAI
FOOTWEAR BBC 2024 .
81 MULTIPLE 25% 25% Institutional 15% 10% WWW.ICSW
FULL CATALOG ACCESS CATALOG Clothin ACO.COM
BSAI
DISPOSABLE MEDICAL CLOTHING o BBC 2024 5 . . " o
82 FULL CATALOG ACCESS MULTIPLE 20% CATALOG 25% Inst\tutl.onal no bid 15% 10% WWW.ICSW
Clothing ACO.COM
BSAI
83 |BLANKETS MULTIPLE 25% CBAB‘IE:Aig)zé 25% Institutional no bid 15% 10% WWW.ICSW
Clothing ACO.COM
BSAI
SUICIDE PREVENTION BLANKETS o BBC 2024 o ) . o, o
84 FULL CATALOG ACCESS MULTIPLE 30% CATALOG 25% Inst\tutl.onal no bid 15% 10% WWW.ICSW
Clothing ACO.COM
BSAI
INHERENT FIRE RATED BLANKETS : : o BBC 2024 o . . o, o
85 FULL CATALOG ACCESS Modacrylic, NFPA 701 Compliant 30% CATALOG 25% Inétlgtllzlizgal no bid 15% 10% xvgévg(l;:’jw
RAW MATERIALS INCLUDING TWILL BSAI
FABRIC YARDAGE, JERSEY FABRIC o, BBC 2024 5 . . o o
86 |VARDAGE, THREAD AND BUTTONS NA 0% CATALOG 2% | Insatational o bid 15% 0% www.icsw
FULL CATALOG ACCES 9 ACO.COM
BSAI
ENTIRE CATALOG N BBC 2024 N 4 ) ) )
87 EXCLUDING CORE ITEMS NA 15% CATALOG 25% In(s:tlwtutl_ona\ no bid 15% 10% WWW.ICSW
othing ACO.COM
Payment Terms 0% 30 DAYS 2% 15 DAYS 0 % net 30 DAYS 0% 30 DAYS 0% 30 DAYS
Delivery Days ARO 7-10 0 7-30 30 5-45
Comments SectionVI.D. BBC WHITE Section VI.G. 1.f. Tagless, Section VI. G. 1.f. Tagged, |Section VI. C.3. N/A; C.5.

SOCK:WC;BBC ORANGE SOCK;0OC,
Section VI. E. BBC:101K-IR
(ORANGE); JZ-CP90-BR(BROWN),
Section VI.F. BBC:101K-BK, Section
VI. G. 1.f. TAGGED, BBC:112-SIZE,
BBC:112-SIZE, Section VI.H.1. g.
TAGGED, BBC:63-SIZE, Section
VLI.1.f. BOTH, g. TAGGED, ITEM
OJSN (SNAPS) ITEM: OVJ(VELCRO)
OJSN SIZES S-3XL SOLID 12 PER
CASE. OJSN SIZES 4-8XL SOLD 6
PER CASE. OVJ SIZES M-4XL SOLD
BY THE EACH. OVJ SIZES 5-8XL
SOLD 6 PER CASE., Section VI. K.
ITEM:WEB-KH, Section VI.L.1.g.
TAGGED, 100% COTTON - ITEM
ELBLCTN. 50/50/ BLEND -ITEM:
ELBLS, Section VI. M. h. TAGGED,
ITEM: Z100GL(WHITE), Section VI.R.
INVOICE AND ORDER TRACKING
AVAILABLE VIA BOB BARKER
WEBSITE WITH ACCOUNT SETUP.,
Section VI.S. SEE ATTACHED BOB
BARKER WARRANTY,

Section VI.H. 1. g. Tagless,
Section VI. I. 1.f. Both; g.
Tagged, Section VI. L. 1. a.
Polyester, Section VI.M.1.h.
Tagless

Section VI. I. 1.f. Snap
Closure; g. Tagged

N/A, Section VI.G.1.f.
Tagged, Section VI.H.1.g.
Tagged, Section VI.I.1.f.
Velcro Closure, elastic waist
in back; g. Tagged, Section
VI.K.1.a. 100% Cotton,
Section VI.L.1.a. 100%
Cotton; g. Tagged, Section
VI.M.1.h. Tagged, Section
VI.N.See Enclosed
Spec.Sheet, Section
VI.U.See Warranty
Enclosed

Section VI. D. no bid,
Section VI. E. $19/dozen,
Section VI. F. $17/dozen,
Section VI. G. 1. .f. both,
VI.G.2.a. $33/dz; b.
$33/dz;c. $33/dz; d. $36/dz;
e. $38/dz; f. $40/dz; g.
$42/dz; h. $44/dz; i.
$46/dz,Section VI. H. 1. e.
up 10XL; 1. g. both, VI. H.
2. a. $33/dz; b. $33/dz, c.
$33/dz, d. $36/dz, e. $38/dz,
f. $40/dz; g. $42/dz; h.
$44/dz; i. $46/dz; j. $49/dz,
Section VI. 1. f. Closure &
Velcro,Section VI. I. g.
tagged, VI.J.1.a.$19;b.
$21; c. $23; d. $25; e. $27"
f. $29; VI. J. 2. a. $19; b.
$21; c. $23; d. $25; e. $26;
f. $27, Section VI. K. no bid,
Section VI. L. 1. a. 100%
cotton; c. panties; g. tagged,
VI. L. 2. a. 14.50dz; b.
14.50/dz; c. 14.50/dz; d.
14.50/dz; e. 16.50/dz; f.
16.50/dz; g. 16.50/dz; h.
18.50/dz; i. 18.50/dz,

Section VI. M. 1. g. No
50,51,54,56,58; h. tagged,
N. 1. a. 3.25/ea; b. 3.25/ea;
c.3.25/ea; d.3.25/ea, e.
3.25/ea; f.3.25/ea;
9.3.25/ea; h.3.25/ea;
i.3.50/ea; j.3.50/ea, k.
3.50/ea; i. 3.50/ea;
j.3.50/ea; k.3.50/ea;
1.3.50/ea;
m.3.50/ea;n.3.50/ea;
0.3.50/ea;p.3.50/ea;q.3.50/e
a;r.3.50/ea;s.3.50/ea;t.3.50/
ea; u.3.50/ea; v.3.50/ea,
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