PROCUREMENT CONTRACTS OFFICER: ITB 6846 OF AWARD OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 15, 2024

BRENDA SENSIBAUGH NEBRASKA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
EXPANDED SHALE BUILDEX, LLC RELIANT TRANSPORTATION
LINE # |DESCRIPTION Qry uomM UNIT EXTENDED PRICE UNIT EXTENDED PRICE
PRICE PRICE

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D1
1 |GREENWOOD YARD 760 cY S 94.00|S 71,440.00 | S 104.00 | $ 79,040.00
12909 238TH ST GREENWOOD, NE 68366

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D1
2 HWY 92 MP 420 825 Ccy S 9760 80,520.00 | $ 101.00 | $ 83,325.00

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D1

3 |SEWARD/SALINE COUNTY LINE 200 CcY S 9460 |S 18,920.00 [ $ 102.00 | $ 20,400.00
HWY 103
EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D1

4 |OLD HWY 2 (HWY 34 MP 356-366) 1800 cY $ 94.00|S 169,200.00 | $ 106.00 | $ 190,800.00

NEBRASKA CITY, NE
EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D1

5 |HWY 105 MP 28 2500 Ccy S 9340|5S 233,500.00 | $ 107.00 | $ 267,500.00
JOHNSON, NE
EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D1

6 / 1400 Ccy S 94.00|S 131,600.00 | $ 107.00 | $ 149,800.00

JUNCTION 34 & 1

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D1
7 JUNCTIONS 73 & 67 1300 Ccy S 94.00|S 122,200.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 143,000.00
EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D3
8 JUNCTIONS 32 & 77 600 CcY $ 97.60|S 58,560.00 | $ 107.00 | $ 64,200.00
EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D3
9 [HWY 77,1 MILE SOUTH 600 Ccy S 9760 58,560.00 | $ 107.00 | $ 64,200.00

OF OAKLAND ON HWY 77

CAFANULU STTALE 5/9% A RO US

HWY 51 RP 35.5
10 DECATUR AT SOUTH JCT. 1000 Cy S 9760 97,600.00 | $ 111.00 | $ 111,000.00

ACC1 0 IC

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D3
HWY 9 MILE MARKER 35.6 NORTH
11 5 MILES NORTHEAST 800 Ccy $ 101.20 | S 80,960.00 | S 109.00 | $ 87,200.00

OF WAKEFIELD

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D4
12 |HWY 66 MILE MARKER 18 NW SIDE 1600 CcY $ 94.00|S 150,400.00 [ $  96.00 | $ 153,600.00
3 MILES WEST OF HWY 81/66 JUNCTION

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D4
13 |HWY 8 MILE MARKER 23 N SIDE 3600 Ccy $ 9040|5S 325,440.00 | S 101.00 | $ 363,600.00
1/2 MILE WEST OF 81/136 JUNCTION

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D4
14 |HWY 69 MILE MARKER 68 W CURVE 3100 Ccy $ 9340|5S 289,540.00 [ S 97.00 | S 300,700.00
4 MILES NORTH OF GRESHAM

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D4
15 [JUNCITON HWY 4/281 4000 CcY No Bid $ 9295|S 371,800.00
14 MILES NORTH OF RED CLOUD, RP 20 ON HWY 281

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D4
16 |RP 7 HWY 281 3500 Ccy No Bid S 94.05|S 329,175.00
1 MILE NORTH OF RED CLOUD, EAST SIDE

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D4
17 HWY 14, 4 MILES S AURORA RP 61 3600 CcY $ 9460 340,560.00 | S 93.41 (S 336,276.00

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D4 .
18 HWY 6 RP 219, 6 MILES E HASTINGS 5000 cY No Bid $ 9332]|5S 466,600.00

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D4 .
19 CENTRAL CITY MAINTENANCE YARD 1600 Ccy No Bid S 94.00|S 150,400.00
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20

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D4
GREELEY MAINTENANCE YARD
SOUTHEAST CORNER HWY 281 AND RAILWAY ST IN GREELEY

1500

CcY

No Bid

$

96.76

S 145,140.00

21

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D5
GERING 140375 RUNDELL ROAD

2000

CcY

No Bid

95.00

S 190,000.00

22

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D5
BRIDGEPORT HWY 385 RP 65

1500

CcY

No Bid

95.00

S 142,500.00

23

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D5
SIDNEY HWY 30 RP 55.3

1500

Ccy

No Bid

93.00

S 139,500.00

24

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D6
N-47 GOTHENBURG SOUTH
SITE #662 MILE MARKER 61.2, 1/2 MILE SOUTH OF

1200

Ccy

No Bid

95.00

S 114,000.00

25

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D6

N-47 GOTHENBURG SOUTH

MILE MARKER 50.9, 11 MILES SOUTH OF THE GOTHENBURG I+
80 INTERCHANGE

1200

CcY

No Bid

97.00

S 116,400.00

26

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D6
N-21 OCONTO YARD
MILE MARKER 52 IN OCONTO

1000

CcY

No Bid

102.00

S 102,000.00

27

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D6
N-2 ANSLELMO

MILE MARKER 257

WEST EDGE ANSLEMO

1000

Ccy

No Bid

101.00

S 101,000.00

28

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D6
N-2 HYANNIS EAST
MILE MARKER 155, 7 MILES EAST OF HYANNIS

3200

cY

No Bid

103.00

S 329,600.00

29

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D6
US 83 MILE MARKER 205
SITE 606 - 2 MLES NORTH OF THEDFORD

2700

Ccy

No Bid

106.00

S 286,200.00

30

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D6
HWY 61 MILE MARKER 128
SITE 619 - 1 MILE NORTH OF ARTHUR

2500

Ccy

No Bid

98.00

S 245,000.00

31

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D6
HWY 2 MILE MARKER 183
SITE 605 - 1 MILE WEST OF MULLEN

2500

cY

No Bid

107.00

S 267,500.00

32

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D7
HWY 136 RP 9.41 WEST END OXFORD

900

Ccy

No Bid

99.00

S 89,100.00

33

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D7
HWY 23 RP 131.6 WEST ELMWOOD

2000

Cy

No Bid

102.00

S 204,000.00

34

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D7
HWY 10 RP 23.6 SOUTH OF MINDEN

3830

CcY

No Bid

108.00

S 413,640.00

35

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D7
HWY 136 RP 50.9
WEST END OF FRANKLIN

1100

CcY

No Bid

110.00

S 121,000.00

36

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D7
HWY 6 RP 157 WEST OF HOLDRIDGE

1350

Ccy

No Bid

104.00

S 140,400.00

37

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D7
HWY 6 RP 88.8 EAST OF MCCOOK

1800

CcY

No Bid

96.00

S 172,800.00

38

EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D7
HWY 83 RP 36.4
18 MILES NORTH OF MCCOOK

1500

CcY

No Bid

97.00

S 145,500.00

39

EXPANDED SHALE 1/4" X 1/8" D1

ALTERNATE LOCATION

1400 HICKMAN ROAD ROCA, NEBRASKA 68430
OPTIONAL

25

Ccy

No Bid

122.00

S 3,050.00
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EXPANDED SHALE 1/4" X 1/8" D2
ALTERNATE LOCATION .

40 4425 S 108TH OMAHA, NE 68137 25 CcY No Bid $ 127.00 | $ 3,175.00
OPTIONAL
EXPANDED SHALE 1/4" X 1/8" D3
ALTERNATE LOCATION .

4 HWY 32 MILE MARKER 33.27, 1 MILE WEST OF MADISON 25 « No Bid v D) S 3,125.00
OPTIONAL
EXPANDED SHALE 1/4" X 1/8" D4
ALTERNATE LOCATION

42 25 CcY No Bid 112. 2 .
1-80/L40C ALDA INTERCHANGE NE CORNER oF 2 b8 & ,800.00
OPTIONAL
EXPANDED SHALE 1/4" X 1/8" D5
ALTERNATE LOCATION .

43 140375 RUNDELL ROAD GERING, NE 69341 25 < No Bid D REY)E 2,725.00
OPTIONAL
EXPANDED SHALE 1/4" X 1/8" D6
ALTERNATE LOCATION .

a4 123 LAKE AVE PO BOX 394 GOTHENBURG NE 69138-0394 25 < No Bid > 1090015 2,72>.00
OPTIONAL
EXPANDED SHALE 1/4" X 1/8" D7
ALTERNATE LOCATION .

45 38764 US HIGHWAY 6; 2 MILES EAST OF MCCOOK 25 < No Bid v HEEY & 2,775.00
OPTIONA
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ALTERNATE LOCATION

EXPANDED SHALE 1/4" X 1/8" D8

46 [HWY 12 RP 80.6 25 Ccy No Bid S 124.00 | $ 3,100.00
SPRINGVIEW, NE 68778
OPTIONAL
EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 D3
HWY 75 MILE MARKER 167 .
47 3 MLES SOUTH OF WINNEBAGO 750 Ccy No Bid $ 111.00 | $ 83,250.00
OPTIONAL
TOTAL: S 2,229,000.00 S 7,304,621.00
PAYMENT TERMS: %, 30 DAYS
DELIVERY DAYS ARO: 30 DAYS
COMMENTS:

Section VI, Subsection E Buildex
requires minimum 14 days notice
for project delivery to plan for
availability and will aim to deliver
when requested but may require
more than 21" days . We will
deliver all products by the end of
the contract period.

Section VII, Subsection C, Buildex
will supply 3/4" x #8 for Districts
1& 3 as specified. A marginally
coarser alternate product is
proposed for delivery at a
discounted price to the State for
Disctrict 4 ONLY due to supply
constraints of 3/4 x #8. A gradation
sample of the proposed 5/8" x 3/8"
is attched on the final page of the
bid form. This product is supplied
locally for chip/seal application and
additional information can be
provided as needed. The District 4
locations will be "no bid" if
gradation is rejected.

Section VIII, Subsection C, N/A not
bidding 1/4" x 1/8" Expanded Shale
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