

LINE #	DESCRIPTION	UOM	QTY	ARMSTRONG RENTALS llc		ATKINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC		D-L Sand Gravel LLC		ED Broadfoot & SonS Sand & Gravel		ELKHORN SAND & GRAVEL LLC		Emme Sand And Gravel ,inc		Jeffres Sand and Gravel Inc		Matteo Sand & Gravel		Paulsen Inc		SIMON		Southwest Gravel Products LLC		Ulrich Gravel Inc		
				UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
1	DISTRICT 1 SURFACING GRAVEL PAWNEE CITY HWY 65 MP 7.5	TN	1500	\$ 33.10	\$ 49,650.00									\$ -	\$ 35.35	\$ 53,025.00									\$ 35.19	\$ 52,785.00		
2	DISTRICT 3 ARMORCOAT GRAVEL HWY 32 RP 68.5	TN	2400	No Bid										\$ 34.94	\$ 83,856.00	\$ 38.00	\$ 91,200.00											
3	DISTRICT 3 ARMORCOAT GRAVEL HWY 98 RP 1	TN	1200	No Bid										\$ 25.11	\$ 30,132.00	\$ 26.00	\$ 31,200.00	\$ 30.33	\$ 36,396.00									
4	DISTRICT 3 ARMORCOAT GRAVEL HWY RP 141.3	TN	600	No Bid										\$ 37.16	\$ 22,296.00	\$ 37.00	\$ 22,200.00											
5	DISTRICT 3 ARMORCOAT GRAVEL HWY 32 RP 100.8	TN	600	No Bid										\$ 39.38	\$ 23,628.00	\$ 39.00	\$ 23,400.00											
6	DISTRICT 3 ARMORCOAT GRAVEL HWY 94 RP 11.75	TN	2900	No Bid										\$ 36.42	\$ 105,618.00	\$ 37.00	\$ 107,300.00											
7	DISTRICT 4 WINDROW GRAVEL ROCKVILLE SITE 403 HWY 58 MM 29.18	TN	1360	No Bid						\$ 26.08	\$ 35,468.80					\$ 19.80	\$ 26,928.00							\$ 15.71	\$ 21,365.60	\$ 13.48	\$ 18,332.80	
8	DISTRICT 4 WINDROW GRAVEL LOUP CITY SITE 418 HWY 92 MM 320.15	TN	860	No Bid						\$ 27.26	\$ 23,443.60					\$ 18.30	\$ 15,738.00							\$ 17.15	\$ 14,749.00	\$ 14.00	\$ 12,040.00	
9	DISTRICT 4 WINDROW GRAVEL RAVENNA YARD 42775 HWYz	TN	320	No Bid						\$ 22.23	\$ 7,113.60					\$ 22.50	\$ 7,200.00							\$ 16.22	\$ 5,190.40	\$ 16.98	\$ 5,433.60	
10	DISTRICT 6 WINDROW GRAVEL DICKENS SITE 611 HWY 23 MP 57	TN	2000	No Bid												\$ 16.50	\$ 33,000.00			\$ 14.97	\$ 29,940.00	\$ 24.40	\$ 48,800.00					
11	DISTRICT 6 WINDROW GRAVEL SUTHERLAND SITE 603 HWY 30 MP 104	TN	1000	No Bid												\$ 23.00	\$ 23,000.00			\$ 12.95	\$ 12,950.00	\$ 19.15	\$ 19,150.00					
12	DISTRICT 6 WINDROW GRAVEL NO PLATTE NORTH SITE 602 HWY 97 MP 9	TN	1500	No Bid												\$ 14.50	\$ 21,750.00			\$ 13.66	\$ 20,490.00	\$ 25.40	\$ 38,100.00					
13	DISTRICT 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY 21 MP 68 SITE 635 BROKEN BOW SOUTH	TN	700	No Bid												\$ 20.90	\$ 14,630.00			\$ 15.65	\$ 10,955.00							
14	DISTRICT 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY 183 MP 89 SITE 638 ANSLEY NORTH	TN	700	No Bid												\$ 18.40	\$ 12,880.00			\$ 14.58	\$ 10,206.00					\$ 15.25	\$ 10,675.00	
15	DISTRICT 6 WINDROW GRAVEL SITE 603 HWY 92 MP 205 AREA 650 TYRON WEST	TN	660	No Bid												\$ 19.00	\$ 12,540.00			\$ 17.65	\$ 11,649.00	\$ 29.15	\$ 19,239.00					
16	DISTRICT 6 WINDROW GRAVEL SITE 604 HWY 2 MP 176 AREA 650 MULLEN WEST	TN	660	No Bid												\$ 25.70	\$ 16,962.00			\$ 23.07	\$ 15,226.20	\$ 31.80	\$ 20,988.00					
17	DISTRICT 6 WINDROW GRAVEL SITE 619 HWY 61 MP 126 AREA 650 ARTHUR NORTH	TN	660	No Bid												\$ 24.00	\$ 15,840.00			\$ 18.53	\$ 12,229.80	\$ 20.20	\$ 13,332.00					
18	DISTRICT 6 WINDROW GRAVEL SITE 621 HWY 92 MP 175 AREA 650 ARTHUR EAST	TN	660	No Bid												\$ 24.50	\$ 16,170.00			\$ 20.42	\$ 13,477.20	\$ 22.00	\$ 14,520.00					
19	DISTRICT 6 DEICING GRAVEL SUTHERLAND YARD 63600 921 NO HWY 25	TN	1000	No Bid												\$ 12.25	\$ 12,250.00			\$ 13.11	\$ 13,110.00	\$ 16.75	\$ 16,750.00					
20	DISTRICT 6 DEICING GRAVEL ANSLEY YARD 63100	TN	1500	No Bid												\$ 18.40	\$ 27,600.00			\$ 16.45	\$ 24,675.00					\$ 15.25	\$ 22,875.00	
21	DISTRICT 6 DEICING GRAVEL OCONTO YARD 63700	TN	1500	No Bid												\$ 18.50	\$ 27,750.00			\$ 15.50	\$ 23,250.00							
22	DISTRICT 6 DEICING GRAVEL BROKEN BOW STOCKPILE WEST	TN	1500	No Bid												\$ 20.00	\$ 30,000.00			\$ 14.80	\$ 22,200.00							

