PROCUREMENT CONTRACTS OFFICER: ITB 6844 OF AWARD OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 20, 2024

BRENDA SENSIBAUGH NDOT
3/8" WASHED, 1" AND 1.5" CRUSHER RUN ROCK, AND CRUSHED ROCK FOR SURFACING  Armstrong Rentals, LLC Gana Trucking & Excavating [Jeffres Sand and Gravel Inc. NSG Logistics, LLC Westover Rock & Sand, Inc.
LINE # DESCRIPTION Qry UoM UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED PRICE UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED PRICE
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

3/8" WASHED CRUSHED ROCK D1
1 |SUPERIOR ST YARD 365 TN $ 4249|S 15508.85|S 4260| S 15,549.00 | $ 4240 S 15476.00|S 4886|S 17,83390(S 41.75|S 15,238.75
302 SUPERIOR ST LINCOLN, NE 68521
3/8" WASHED CRUSHED ROCK D1

2 |GARRISON, NE 68632 1125 TN S 4649 |S 52,301.25(S$ 4740 S 53,325.00 | $ 4965 S 55856.25|S 57.32|S 64,485.00|S 4530(S 50,962.50
HWY 92 MP 420

3 [3/8" WASHED CRUSHED ROCK D1 2500 TN |$ 4448 ¢ 111,20000($ 4523 |$ 113,075.00 | $ 48.25|$ 120,625.00 | $ 54.12 | $ 135,300.00 | $ 43.90| $ 109,750.00
#33 MP 24 1/4 MILE E DORCHESTER
3/8" WASHED CRUSHED ROCK D1

4 #15 MP 24, 13 MILES N FAIRBURY 3500 TN S 4955 S 173,425.00 S 4832 | $ 169,120.00 | $ 52.55|$ 183,925.00$ 59.83|$ 209,405.00| S 46.30| $ 162,050.00

3/8" WASHED CRUSHED ROCK D1
5 lusMP 126 2500 [ TN |$ 44.48|$ 111,20000|$ 46.89 | $ 117,225.00 | $ 47.75 | $ 119,375.00 | $  52.98 | $ 132,450.00 | $ 43.65| $ 109,125.00
12 MILES SOUTHEAST OF PAWNEE CITY
3/8" WASHED CRUSHED ROCK D1

6 |ICT #112 & #77 2500 | TN |$ 4530|$ 11325000 $ 47.27|$ 118,175.00 | $ 46.55 | $ 116,375.00 | $ 56.63 | $ 141,575.00 | $ 4510 | $ 112,750.00
7 MILES EAST OF BEATRICE
1.5" CRUSHER RUN ROCK D2
7  |FREMONT 400 | TN |$ 3475|$ 1390000 |$ 3649 |$  14,596.00 | $ 36.00 | $ 14,400.00 | $ 3583 |$ 14,332.00|$ 31.25|$  12,500.00
HWY 30 WEST 2550 W 23RD DR, FREMONT, NE 6802
1.5" CRUSHER RUN ROCK D2

8 |BLAIR 400 | TN |$ 3650|S$ 1460000 |$ 33.98|$  13,592.00 | $ 36.00 | $ 14,400.00 | $ 3058 |$ 12,232.00|$ 27.25|$  10,900.00
2252 PITTACK ST, BLAIR, NE 63008
1.5" CRUSHER RUN ROCK D2

9 |MORMON BRIDGE 250 | TN |$ 3400|$ 850000|% 3277|s  819250|%  3300|$ 825000|% 3103|¢ 775750|$ 2075|$ 743750
5015 BATTLEFIELD DR, OMAHA, NE 68152
10 |1->" CRUSHER RUN ROCK D2 %0 | TN |$ 3175|$  793750|$ 3087|$  771750|$  3100|$  775000|$ 33.78|$ 844500|$ 3025|$  7,562.50

4425 S 108TH ST OMAHA,NE 68145

1.5" CRUSHER RUN ROCK D2
11 SOUTH OMAHA 250 TN S 31995 7,997.50 | S 32.28( S 8,070.00 | S 3250 | $ 8,125.00 | S 33.55( S 8,387.50 S 31.25(S$ 7,812.50
5929 S 25TH ST OMAHA, NE 68107
1.5" CRUSHER RUN ROCK D2

12 |MELIA HILL 400 TN $ 3050 (|$ 12,200.00|$ 30.24|S 12,096.00 | $ 3200 S 12,80000(S$ 36.75|S$ 14,70000 S 2875(S 11,500.00

15525 S 234TH ST GRENTA, NE 68028
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13

1.5" CRUSHER RUN ROCK D2
ELKHORN
2829 N 204TH ST ELKHORN, NE 68022

400

TN

32.00

12,800.00

S 3265(S

13,060.00

33.00

13,200.00

$

34.23

$

13,692.00

31.00

$

12,400.00

14

1.5" CRUSHER RUN ROCK D2
PLATTSMOUTH
1000 S 22ND ST PLATTSMOUTH, NE 68048

400

TN

29.75

11,900.00

S 3154(S

12,616.00

30.75

12,300.00

No Bid

No Bid

28.50

11,400.00

15

1.0 CURSHER RUN ROCK D1
ALTERNATE LOCATION
1400 HICKMAN ROAD ROCA, NE 68430

25

TN

32.50

812.50

$ 3178(5S

794.50

36.00

900.00

No Bid

No Bid

31.95

798.75

16

1.0 CURSHER RUN ROCK D2
ALTERNATE LOCATION
4425 S 108TH ST OMAHA, NE 68137

25

TN

31.75

793.75

S 3087(S

771.75

32.25

806.25

$

33.78

$

844.50

31.75

793.75

17

1.0 CURSHER RUN ROCK D3
ALTERNATE LOCATION
HWY 32 MILE MARKER 33.27, 1 MILE WEST OF MADISON

25

TN

NO

BID

S 4532|5S

1,133.00

56.70

1,417.50

$

49.55

$

1,238.75

43.75

1,093.75

18

1.0 CURSHER RUN ROCK D4
ALTERNATE LOCATION
I-80/L40C ALDA INTERCHANGE NE CORNER

25

TN

NO

BID

S 42875

1,071.75

50.50

1,262.50

$

45.66

$

1,141.50

43.75

1,093.75

19

1.0 CURSHER RUN ROCK D5
ALTERNATE LOCATION
140375 RUNDELL ROAD GERING, NE 69341

25

TN

NO

BID

No Bid

104.00

2,600.00

No Bid

No Bid

82.75

2,068.75

20

1.0 CURSHER RUN ROCK D6
ALTERNATE LOCATION

123 LAKE AVE, PO BOX 394
GOTHENBURG, NE 69138

25

TN

NO

BID

No Bid

68.50

1,712.50

54.46

$

1,361.50

54.75

1,368.75

21

1.0 CURSHER RUN ROCK D7
ALTERNATE LOCATION
38764 US HIGHWAY 6. 2 MILES EAST OF MCCOOK

25

TN

NO

BID

No Bid

75.50

1,887.50

58.69

$

1,467.25

64.75

1,618.75

22

1.0 CURSHER RUN ROCK D8
ALTERNATE LOCATION
SPRINGVIEW, NE 68778
HWY 12 RP 80.6

25

TN

NO

BID

No Bid

No Bid

68.50

1,712.50

No Bid

No Bid

$

59.75

1,493.75

23

CRUSHED ROCK SURFACING D1
ALTERNATE LOCATION
1400 HICKMAN ROAD ROCA, NE 68430

25

TN

$

32.50

812.50

S 3178( S

794.50

36.50

912.50

No Bid

No Bid

$

31.95

798.75

24

CRUSHED ROCK SURFACING D2
ALTERNATE LOCATION
4425 S 108TH ST OMAHA, NE 68137

25

TN

$

31.75

793.75

$ 3087|5S

771.75

32.50

812.50

$

34.69

$

867.25

$

31.75

793.75

20F3




PROCUREMENT CONTRACTS OFFICER:
BRENDA SENSIBAUGH

ITB 6844 OF AWARD

NDOT

OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 20, 2024

CRUSHED ROCK SURFACING D3
25 | ALTERNATE LOCATION
HWY 32 MILE MARKER 33.27; 1 MILE WEST OF MADISON

25

TN

NO BID

S 4532

S 1,133.00

56.70 | S 1,417.50

$

4349 [ S 1,087.25

4375 | $ 1,093.75

CRUSHED ROCK SURFACING D4
26 |ALTERNATE LOCATION
I-80/L40C ALDA INTERCHANGE NE CORNER

25

TN

NO BID

S 4287

S 1,071.75

50.50 | $ 1,262.50

$

45.66 | $ 1,141.50

4375 | $ 1,093.75

CRUSHED ROCK SURFACING D5
27 |ALTERNATE LOCATION
140375 RUNDELL ROAD GERING, NE 69341

25

TN

NO BID

No Bid

104.00 | $ 2,600.00

No Bid No Bid

8275 | $ 2,068.75

CRUSHED ROCK SURFACING D6
ALTERNATE LOCATION

123 LAKE AVE, PO BOX 394
GOTHENBURG, NE 69138

28

25

TN

NO BID

No Bid

68.50 | $ 1,712.50

$

5446 | S 1,361.50

5475 | S 1,368.75

CRUSHED ROCK SURFACING D7
29 |ALTERNATE LOCATION
38764 US HIGHWAY 6; 2 MILES EAST OF MCCOOK

25

TN

NO BID

No Bid

7550 | S 1,887.50

$

58.69 | $ 1,467.25

64.75 | $ 1,618.75

CRUSHED ROCK SURFACING D6
ALTERNATE LOCATION

123 LAKE AVE.

PO BOX 394

SPRINGVIEW, NE 68778

30

25

TN

NO BID

No Bid

68.50 | $ 1,712.50

No Bid No Bid

59.75 | $ 1,493.75

S 669,932.60

S 683,951.00

S 727,473.50

$ 792,573.15

S 662,048.75

PAYMENT TERMS:

0%, 30 Days

net %, 30 Days

Net %, 30 Days

DELIVERY DAYS ARO:

14 Days

5 days

AS Required

14-21 Days

as requested

COMMENTS:
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