

CAMPGROUND SELF-REGISTRATION ENVELOPES				BSA INTERCONTINENTAL, LLC		ENVELOPES PLUS, INC	
LINE #	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UOM	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
1	WHITE RECYCLE 5,000-24,000M CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND PA	25	M	\$ 271.03	\$ 6,775.75	NO BID	
2	WHITE RECYCLE 25,000-49,000M CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND PA	50	M	\$ 169.89	\$ 8,494.50	NO BID	
3	WHITE RECYCLE 50,000-74,999M CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND PA	75	M	\$ 136.57	\$ 10,242.75	NO BID	
4	WHITE RECYCLE 75,000-99,999M CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND PA	100	M	\$ 118.03	\$ 11,803.00	NO BID	
5	WHITE RECYCLE 100,000-124,999M CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND PA	125	M	\$ 117.03	\$ 14,628.75	NO BID	
6	WHITE RECYCLE 125,000-149,999M CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND PA	150	M	\$ 116.03	\$ 17,404.50	NO BID	
7	WHITE RECYCLE 150,000-174,999M CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND PA	175	M	\$ 115.03	\$ 20,130.25	NO BID	
8	WHITE RECYCLE 175,000-199,999M CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND PA	200	M	\$ 114.03	\$ 22,806.00	NO BID	
9	WHITE RECYCLE 200,000-224,999M CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND PA	225	M	\$ 110.03	\$ 24,756.75	NO BID	
10	WHITE RECYCLE 225,000-249,999M CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND PA	250	M	\$ 92.70	\$ 23,175.00	NO BID	
11	WHITE RECYCLE 250,000M PLUS CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND PA	250	M	\$ 90.70	\$ 22,675.00	NO BID	
12	WHITE VIRGIN 5,000-24,000M CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND PA	25	M	\$ 266.34	\$ 6,658.50	\$ 545.83	\$ 13,645.75
13	WHITE VIRGIN 25,000-49,000M CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND PA	50	M	\$ 164.61	\$ 8,230.50	\$ 200.40	\$ 10,020.00
14	WHITE VIRGIN 50,000-74,999M CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND PA	75	M	\$ 130.50	\$ 9,787.50	\$ 152.05	\$ 11,403.75
15	WHITE VIRGIN 75,000-99,999M CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND PA	100	M	\$ 111.83	\$ 11,183.00	\$ 139.55	\$ 13,955.00
16	WHITE VIRGIN 100,000-124,999M CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND PA	125	M	\$ 110.83	\$ 13,853.75	\$ 98.66	\$ 12,332.50
17	WHITE VIRGIN 125,000-149,999M CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND PA	150	M	\$ 109.83	\$ 16,474.50	\$ 84.81	\$ 12,721.50
18	WHITE VIRGIN 150,000-174,999M CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND PA	175	M	\$ 108.83	\$ 19,045.25	\$ 80.30	\$ 14,052.50
19	WHITE VIRGIN 175,000-199,999M CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND PA	200	M	\$ 107.83	\$ 21,566.00	\$ 76.29	\$ 15,258.00
20	WHITE VIRGIN 200,000-224,999M CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND PA	225	M	\$ 102.83	\$ 23,136.75	\$ 73.61	\$ 16,562.25
21	WHITE VIRGIN 225,000-249,999M CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND PA	250	M	\$ 86.69	\$ 21,672.50	\$ 71.04	\$ 17,760.00
22	WHITE VIRGIN 250,000M PLUS CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND PA	250	M	\$ 84.69	\$ 21,172.50	\$ 69.55	\$ 17,387.50
TOTAL:					\$ 355,673.00		\$ 155,098.75
PAYMENT TERMS:				.5% 20 DAYS		NET 30 DAYS	
DELIVERY DAYS ARO:				30 DAYS			
COMMENTS:				Per Section VI, Subsection D BSA Intercontinental did not meet specifications			