

AWARDED  
6457 OF  
Department of Transportation  
Awarded Bid Tab

Line #	Liquid Asphaltic Materials			Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc.		Flint Hills Resources, LP		Jebro, Inc.		Martin Resource Management Corp. DBA Monarch Oil		Simon Contractors of SD, Inc.	
	Description	Qty	UOM	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	CRS-2P DISTRICT 1	4359	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 514.66	\$ 2,243,402.94	No Bid			No Bid
2	CSS-1H(75/25) DISTRICT 2 PLANT PICKUP	5	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 375.00	\$ 1,875.00	No Bid			No Bid
3	CRS-2 STRAIGHT DISTRICT 3	25	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 499.70	\$ 12,492.50	No Bid			No Bid
4	CRS-2P DISTRICT 3	8871	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 534.63	\$ 4,742,702.73	No Bid			No Bid
5	CSS-1H DISTRICT 3	45	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 480.43	\$ 21,619.35	\$ 500.00	\$ 22,500.00		No Bid
6	HFE-150 DISTRICT 3	15.4	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 533.52	\$ 8,216.21	No Bid			No Bid
7	CRS-2P DISTRICT 4	5973	TN	No Bid	No Bid	\$475.50	\$ 2,840,161.50	\$ 563.00	\$ 3,362,799.00	No Bid			No Bid
8	MC-250 DISTRICT 4	25	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 780.47	\$ 19,511.75	No Bid			No Bid
9	HFE-300 DISTRICT 4	357	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 555.16	\$ 198,192.12	No Bid			No Bid
10	HFE-1000 DISTRICT 4	250	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 633.81	\$ 158,452.50	No Bid			No Bid
11	CRS-2P DISTRICT 5	325	TN	\$ 552.99	\$ 179,721.75	\$555.00	\$ 180,375.00	\$ 610.35	\$ 198,363.75	No Bid			No Bid
12	CRS-2VHL DISTRICT 5	2025	TN	\$ 533.99	\$ 1,081,329.75	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 693.95	\$ 1,405,248.75	No Bid		\$ 613.00	\$ 1,241,325.00
13	CSS-1H(50/50) DISTRICT 5	550	TN	\$ 305.99	\$ 168,294.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$325.86	\$ 179,223.00	No Bid			No Bid
14	MC250 DISTRICT 5	25	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$815.40	\$ 20,385.00	No Bid			No Bid
15	CRS-2P DISTRICT 6	2685	TN	No Bid	No Bid	\$526.50	\$ 1,413,652.50	\$578.27	\$ 1,552,654.95	No Bid			No Bid
16	CSS-1H(75/25) DISTRICT 6	3219	TN	\$ 396.99	\$ 1,277,910.81	No Bid	No Bid	\$405.85	\$ 1,306,431.15	\$ 500.00	\$ 1,609,500.00		No Bid
17	CSS-1H(50/50) DISTRICT 6	248	TN	\$ 321.99	\$ 79,853.52	No Bid	No Bid	\$310.78	\$ 77,073.44	\$ 480.00	\$ 119,040.00		No Bid
18	MC-250 DISTRICT 6	20	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$794.24	\$ 15,884.80	No Bid			No Bid
19	HFE-300 DISTRICT 6	1113	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$571.03	\$ 635,556.39	No Bid			No Bid
20	HFE-1000 DISTRICT 6	25	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 647.25	\$ 16,181.25	No Bid			No Bid
21	CRS-2P DISTRICT 7	1630	TN	No Bid	No Bid	\$509.50	\$ 830,485.00	\$586.68	\$ 956,288.40	No Bid			No Bid
22	CSS-1H DISTRICT 7	76	TN	\$ 510.99	\$ 38,835.24	No Bid	No Bid	\$515.77	\$ 39,198.52	\$ 525.00	\$ 39,900.00		No Bid
23	CRS-2P DISTRICT 8	3223	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$545.17	\$ 1,757,082.91	No Bid			No Bid
24	SS-1H DISTRICT 8	275	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid			No Bid
25	MC-250 DISTRICT 8	43	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$775.45	\$ 33,344.35	No Bid			No Bid
26	HFE-150 DISTRICT 8	20	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$549.14	\$ 10,982.80	No Bid			No Bid
27	HFE-300 DISTRICT 8	450	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$556.81	\$ 250,564.50	No Bid			No Bid
28	HFE-1000 DISTRICT 8	50	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$644.53	\$ 32,226.50	No Bid			No Bid
29	CSS-1H(75/25) DISTRICT 8	425	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$407.80	\$ 173,315.00	\$ 445.00	\$ 189,125.00		No Bid
30	CRS-2 (STRAIGHT) PLANT PICK UP	50	TN	\$ 460.00	\$ 23,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 470.00	\$ 23,500.00	No Bid			No Bid
31	CRS-2L PLANT PICK UP	200	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		\$ 563.00	\$ 112,600.00
32	CRS2-P PLANT PICK UP	200	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$495.00	\$ 99,000.00	No Bid			No Bid
33	CRS-2P 80/20 PLANT PICK UP	200	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid			No Bid
34	CRS-2VHL PLANT PICK UP	200	TN	\$ 490.00	\$ 98,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		\$ 552.00	\$ 110,400.00
35	CSS-1H PLANT PICK UP	200	TN	\$ 460.00	\$ 92,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 470.00	\$ 94,000.00	\$ 480.00	\$ 96,000.00		No Bid
36	CSS-1H 75/25 PLANT PICK UP	200	TN	\$ 370.00	\$ 74,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 370.00	\$ 74,000.00	\$ 450.00	\$ 90,000.00		No Bid
37	CSS-1H 50/50 PLANT PICK UP	200	TN	\$ 280.00	\$ 56,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 270.00	\$ 54,000.00	\$ 425.00	\$ 85,000.00		No Bid
38	SS-1H PLANT PICK UP	200	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		\$ 498.00	\$ 99,600.00
39	SS-1H 75/25 PLANT PICK UP	200	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		\$ 373.50	\$ 74,700.00
40	SS-1H 50/50 PLANT PICK UP	200	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		\$ 265.00	\$ 53,000.00
41	CFS/FS-1 PLANT PICK UP	200	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 495.00	\$ 99,000.00	No Bid			No Bid
42	CMS-1 PLANT PICK UP	200	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid			No Bid
43	CMS-1W PLANT PICK UP	200	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid			No Bid
44	MC-250 PLANT PICK UP	200	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 755.00	\$ 151,000.00	No Bid			No Bid
45	HFE-150 PLANT PICK UP	200	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 520.00	\$ 104,000.00	No Bid		\$ 513.00	\$ 102,600.00
46	HFE 300 PLANT PICK UP	200	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 540.00	\$ 108,000.00	No Bid		\$ 526.00	\$ 105,200.00
47	HFE 500 PLANT PICK UP	200	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		\$ 528.00	\$ 105,600.00
48	HFE 1000 PLANT PICK UP	200	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$610.00	\$ 122,000.00	No Bid		\$ 560.00	\$ 112,000.00
49	HFMS-2L PLANT PICK UP	200	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid			No Bid
50	HFM-2P PLANT PICK UP	200	TN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid			No Bid
51	RETURNED LOAD FEE	1	MI	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 10.19	\$ 10.19	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 3.70	\$ 3.70
52	DEMURRAGE CHARGE	1	HR	\$ 200.00	\$ 200.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 200.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00
<b>Total</b>					\$ 3,169,155.57		\$ 5,264,674.00		\$ 20,357,979.75		\$ 2,251,425.00		\$ 2,117,113.70
Payment Terms					0 30		Net 30		Net 45		0 30		0 30
Delivery Days ARO					1		1		one				0
Comments													