

								AWARDED	
Line #	Fleece and Rib Knit Material and Jersey Knit to Cornhusker State Industries			ATLANTIC TEXTILES		Club Tex Inc.		JAG TEXTILE COMPANY	
	Description	Qty	UOM	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price
1	RIB KNIT 30" TUBLAR 50/40/10 COTTON-POLY GRAY	2000	YD	\$ 1.81	\$ 3,620.00	\$ 1.49	\$ 2,980.00	\$ 1.93	\$ 3,860.00
2	FLEECE 60" WIDE 50/40/10 COTTON-POLY GRAY	15,000	YD	\$ 2.02	\$ 30,300.00	\$ 2.75	\$ 41,250.00	\$ 2.07	\$ 31,050.00
3	JERSEY KNIT WHITE, 5.5 OZ 50/50 COTTON-POLY	135,852	YD	\$ 1.15	\$ 156,229.80	\$ 1.27	\$ 172,532.04	\$ 1.03	139,927.56
4	RIB KNIT MATERIAL WHITE 50/50 COTTON-POLY	5,588	YD	\$ 0.51	\$ 2,849.88	\$ 1.49	\$ 8,326.12	\$ 0.53	\$ 2,961.64
5	RIB KNIT MATERIAL ORANGE 50/50 COTTON-POLY	60	YD	\$ 0.58	\$ 34.80	\$ 1.49	\$ 89.40	\$ 0.70	\$ 42.00
6	JERSEY KNIT ORANGE, 5.5 OZ 50/50 COTTON-POLY	125	YD	\$ 1.50	\$ 187.50	\$ 1.85	\$ 231.25	\$ 1.59	\$ 198.75
7	SHOULDER TAPE WHITE	36,000	YD	\$ 0.07	\$ 2,520.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.08	\$ 2,880.00
8	SHOULDER TAPE ORANGE	66	YD	\$ 0.05	\$ 3.30	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.10	\$ 6.60
	Total			\$ 195,745.28		\$ 225,408.81		\$ 180,926.55	
Payment Terms						0 30		NET 30	
Delivery Days ARO								30 - 40	
Comments						VI. N. Delivery ARO - 60-80 days			

AWARD EXPLANATION

The awarded bidder was selected for overall lowest bid submitted.

NO BIDS

None