BUYER: Brenda Sensibaugh

Corrosion Inhibitor for Sodium
Chloride Brine(Clear Roads Product
Categol
AWARDED BID TABULATION
(ITB NO. 6327 OF)

A3,

District

Yard

David City
Greenwood
Lincoln - Superior
Seward
Wahoo
Beatrice
Blue Springs.
Dorchester
Fairbury
Lincoln - Salt Valley
Pawnee City
Wilber
Auburn
Eagle
Falls City
Nebraska City
Palmyra
Syracuse
Tecumseh

Omaha - Dome
Omaha - Mormon Bridge
Omaha - South
Blair
Fremont
Elkhorn
Manley
Melia Hill
Plattsmouth

6327 OF Corrosion Inhibitor for Sodium Chloride Brine
(Clear Roads Product Category A3)

$124,605.00 $85,410.00 $78,975.00

Opening Date: August 7, 2020

Harmoney Deicing Products, Inc

NO BID

Est. Ann. Rqmt.(gallons)

BID Price Per Gallon delivered

INVALID

INVALID
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BUYER: Brenda Sensibaugh

6327 OF Corrosion Inhibitor for Sodium Chloride Brine

(Clear Roads Product Category A3)

Opening Date: August 7, 2020

Corrosion Inhibitor for Sodium
Chloride Brine(Clear Roads Product
Category A3)

AWARD
Envirotech Amp

AWARD

Smith Fertilizer and Grain Beet 55

Smith Fertlizer and Grain Beet 55+

Harmoney Deicing Products, Inc
NO BID

AWARDED BID TABULATION
(ITB NO. 6327 OF)

District Yard
THREE Albion

Est. Ann. Rqmt.(gallons) BID Price Per Gallon delivered

Est. Ann. Rqmt.(gallons)

BID Price Per Gallon delivered

Est. Ann. Rqmmt. (gallons)

BID Price Per Gallon delivered

Est. Ann. Rqmt.(gallons)

BID Price Per Gallon delivered

Clarkson

Columbus

Humphrey

Schuyler

Bloomfield

Neligh

Niobrara

' Plainview
Norfolk

West Point

@ Dakota City

Lyons

S Sioux City

Crofton

Hartington

Laurel

Newcastle

Wayne

472,500

472,500

472,500

472,500

$1,006,425.00
Extended Price T

$675,675.00

$0.00

INVALID

Extended Price T

Extended Price T

FOUR Central City

Fullerton

Greeley

Loup City

Ord

St Paul

Geneva

Hebron

Osceola

Strang

York

‘ Grand Island
Kearney (80)

@ Kearney (Hwy-30)

Ravenna

Shelton

Aurora

Ayr

Harvard

Hastings

Red Cloud

Superior

22,500

22,500

22,500 $

22,500

$47,925.00

$34,200.00

$31,950.00

INVALID

Extended Price

Extended Price T
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BUYER: Brenda Sensibaugh 6327 OF Corrosion Inhibitor for Sodium Chloride Brine Opening Date: August 7, 2020
(Clear Roads Product Category A3)

AWARD AWARD Smith Fertlizer and Grain Beet 55+ Harmoney Deicing Products, Inc
Envirotech Amp Smith Fertilizer and Grain Beet 55 - NO BID

Corrosion Inhibitor for Sodium
Chloride Brine(Clear Roads Product
Category A3)
AWARDED BID TABULATION
(ITB NO. 6327 OF)

Est. Ann. Rqmt.(gallons) BID Price Per Gallon delivered Est. Ann. Rqmt.(gallons) BID Price Per Gallon delivered Est. Ann. Rqm.(gallons) BID Price Per Gallon delivered Est. Ann. Rqmt.(gallons) BID Price Per Gallon delivered

District I Yard

FIVE Alliance
Chadron
Crawford

Gordon

Harrison

Hemingford
Bridgeport 9,000 $ 213 9,000 $ 152 9,000 9,000

Gering
Oshkosh

® Chappell

Harrisburg

Kimball
Sidney

$19,170.00 $13,680.00 $0.00 INVALID
Extended Price Extended Price Extended Price

SIX Gothenburg
Lexington
Maxwell
North Platte (1-80)
North Platte (W-30)
Sutherland
Wallace

Big Springs
Ogallala

Lake Mac (Brule)
Paxton 9,000 $ 213 9,000 $ 155 9,000 9,000

Ansley
Arnold

®

Broken Bow

Oconto
Arthur

Hyannis

Mullen

Stapleton
Thedford

$19,170.00 $13,950.00 $0.00 INVALID
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BUYER: Brenda Sensibaugh

6327 OF Corrosion Inhibitor for Sodium Chloride Brine
(Clear Roads Product Category A3)

Opening Date: August 7, 2020

AWARD AWARD . " . Harmoney Deicing Products, Inc
5 N Smith Fertlizer and Grain Beet 55+
Corrosion Inhibitor for Sodium Envirotech Amp Smith Fertilizer and Grain Beet 55 - NO BID
Chloride Brine(Clear Roads Product
Category A3)
AWARDED BID TABULATION
(ITB NO. 6327 OF)
Est. Ann. Rqmt.(gallons) BID Price Per Gallon delivered Est. Ann. Rgmt.(gallons) BID Price Per Gallon delivered Est. Ann. Rqmt.(gallons) BID Price Per Gallon delivered Est. Ann. Rgmt.(gallons) BID Price Per Gallon delivered
District I Yard
Extended Price 1 Extended Price Extended Price 1
SEVEN Alma
Franklin
Holdrege
Minden
Arapahoe
Elwood 9,000 $ 213 9,000 $ 158 9,000 9,000
Maywood
h McCook
@ Benkelman
Grant
Imperial
Palisade
$19,170.00 $14,220.00 $0.00 INVALID
Extended Price Extended Price Extended Price
EIGHT Ainsworth
Bassett
Springview
Atkinson
Bartlett
“ Burwell
Naper 27,000 $ 213 27,000 $ 156 27,000 27,000
O'Neill
Spencer,
Taylor
Cody
Merriman
Valentine
$57,510.00 $42,120.00 $0.00 INVALID
Extended Price Extended Price T Extended Price
TOTAL: 1313,145] $ - 892,485.00 | 123,075.00 |
PAYMENT TERMS: 0-30 NA/NA NA/NA
DELIVERY ARO: 7 days 7 Days 7 Days
COMMENTS:
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