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1 CRS-2P
DISTRICT 1 4375 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      498.92  $   2,182,775.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

2 CRS-2P
DISTRICT 1 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      490.00  $        12,250.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

3 CRS-2P 80/20
DISTRICT 1 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

4 CRS-2VHL
DISTRICT 1 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

5 CRS-2 STRAIGHT
DISTRICT 1 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      460.00  $        11,500.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

6 CSS-1H STRAIGHT 
DISTRICT 1 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      460.00  $        11,500.00  $      720.00  $      18,000.00  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

7 CSS-1H 50/50
DISTRICT 1 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      260.00  $          6,500.00  $      650.00  $      16,250.00  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

8 CSS-1H 75/25
DISTRICT 1 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      360.00  $          9,000.00  $      680.00  $      17,000.00  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

9 HFE-150
DISTRICT 1 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      500.00  $        12,500.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

10 HFE-300
DISTRICT 1 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      550.00  $        13,750.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

11 HFE-1000
DISTRICT 1 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      610.00  $        15,250.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

12 MC-250
DISTRICT 1 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      750.00  $        18,750.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

13 RETURNED LOAD FEE 
DISTRICT 1 1 EA  $              -    $                    -    $          9.89  $                  9.89  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

14 DEMURRAGE CHARGE 
DISTRICT 1 1 HR  $              -    $                    -    $      200.00  $              200.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

15 CRS-2P
DISTRICT 2 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      490.00  $        12,250.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

16 CRS-2P 80/20
DISTRICT 2 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

17 CRS-2VHL
DISTRICT 2 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

18 CRS-2 STRAIGHT 
DISTRICT 2 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      460.00  $        11,500.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

19 CSS-1H STRAIGHT 
DISTRICT 2 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      460.00  $        11,500.00  $      720.00  $      18,000.00  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

20 CSS-1H 50/50
DISTRICT 2 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      260.00  $          6,500.00  $      650.00  $      16,250.00  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

21 CSS-1H 75/25
DISTRICT 2 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      360.00  $          9,000.00  $      680.00  $      17,000.00  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

22 HFE-150
DISTRICT 2 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      500.00  $        12,500.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

23 HFE-300
DISTRICT 2 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      550.00  $        13,750.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

24 HFE-1000
DISTRICT 2 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      610.00  $        15,250.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

25 MC-250
DISTRICT 2 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      745.00  $        18,625.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

26 RETURNED LOAD FEE 
DISTRICT 2 1 EA  $              -    $                    -    $          9.89  $                  9.89  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

27 DEMURRAGE CHARGE 
DISTRICT 2 1 HR  $              -    $                    -    $      200.00  $              200.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

28 CRS-2P
DISTRICT 3 12425 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      537.31  $   6,676,076.75  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

29 CRS-2P
DISTRICT 3 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      490.00  $        12,250.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

30 CRS-2P 80/20
DISTRICT 3 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

31 CRS-2VHL
DISTRICT 3 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

32 CRS-2 STRAIGHT 
DISTRICT 3 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      460.00  $        11,500.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

33 CSS-1H STRAIGHT 
DISTRICT 3 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      460.00  $        11,500.00  $      720.00  $      18,000.00  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

34 CSS-1H 50/50
DISTRICT 3 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      260.00  $          6,500.00  $      650.00  $      16,250.00  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

35 CSS-1H 75/25
DISTRICT 3 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      360.00  $          9,000.00  $      680.00  $      17,000.00  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

36 HFE-150
DISTRICT 3 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      531.42  $        13,285.50  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

37 HFE-150
DISTRICT 3 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      500.00  $        12,500.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

38 HFE-300
DISTRICT 3 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      550.00  $        13,750.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

39 HFE-1000
DISTRICT 3 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      610.00  $        15,250.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

40 MC-250
DISTRICT 3 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      745.00  $        18,625.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

41 RETURNED LOAD FEE 
DISTRICT 3 1 EA  $              -    $                    -    $          9.89  $                  9.89  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

42 DEMURRAGE CHARGE 
DISTRICT 3 1 HR  $              -    $                    -    $      200.00  $              200.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

43 CRS-2P
DISTRICT 4 7125 TN  $      459.50  $ 3,273,937.50  $      547.27  $   3,899,298.75  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

44 CRS-2P
DISTRICT 4 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      490.00  $        12,250.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

45 CRS-2P 80/20
DISTRICT 4 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 Western States Asphalt, LLC  Simon Contractors of SD, Inc.  Flint Hills Resources, LP Liquid Asphaltic Materials  Jebro, Inc.  Martin Resource Management 
Corp. DBA Monarch Oil 
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 Western States Asphalt, LLC  Simon Contractors of SD, Inc.  Flint Hills Resources, LP Liquid Asphaltic Materials  Jebro, Inc.  Martin Resource Management 
Corp. DBA Monarch Oil 

46 CRS-2VHL
DISTRICT 4 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

47 CRS-2 STRAIGHT 
DISTRICT 4 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      460.00  $        11,500.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

48 CSS-1H STRAIGHT 
DISTRICT 4 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      460.00  $        11,500.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

49 CSS-1H 50/50
DISTRICT 4 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      260.00  $          6,500.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

50 CSS-1H 75/25
DISTRICT 4 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      360.00  $          9,000.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

51 HFE-150
DISTRICT 4 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      500.00  $        12,500.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

52 HFE-300
DISTRICT 4 1100 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      551.42  $      606,562.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

53 HFE-300
DISTRICT 4 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

54 HFE-1000
DISTRICT 4 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      610.00  $        15,250.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

55 MC-250
DISTRICT 4 50 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      797.23  $        39,861.50  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

56 MC-250
DISTRICT 4 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      745.00  $        18,625.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

57 RETURNED LOAD FEE 
DISTRICT 4 1 EA  $              -    $                    -    $          9.89  $                  9.89  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

58 DEMURRAGE CHARGE 
DISTRICT 4 1 HR  $              -    $                    -    $      200.00  $              200.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

59 CRS-2P
DISTRICT 5 300 TN  $      579.50  $    173,850.00  $      571.31  $      171,393.00  No Bid  No Bid  $      553.00  $    165,900.00  No Bid  No Bid 

60 CRS-2P
DISTRICT 5 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      490.00  $        12,250.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

61 CRS-2P 80/20
DISTRICT 5 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

62 CRS-2VHL
DISTRICT 5 2700 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      677.61  $   1,829,547.00  No Bid  No Bid  $      566.25  $ 1,528,875.00  $      502.91  $ 1,357,857.00 

63 CRS-2VHL
DISTRICT 5 PLANT PICKUP 2675 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

64 CRS-2 STRAIGHT 
DISTRICT 5 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      460.00  $        11,500.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  $      450.00  $      11,250.00 

65 CSS-1H STRAIGHT 
DISTRICT 5 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      460.00  $        11,500.00  No Bid  No Bid  $      510.00  $      12,750.00  $      450.00  $      11,250.00 

66 CSS-1H 50/50
DISTRICT 5 300 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      349.26  $      104,778.00  No Bid  No Bid  $      311.00  $      93,300.00  $      292.91  $      87,873.00 

67 CSS-1H 50/50
DISTRICT 5 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      260.00  $          6,500.00  No Bid  No Bid  $      267.50  $        6,687.50  $      275.00  $        6,875.00 

68 CSS-1H 75/25
DISTRICT 5 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      360.00  $          9,000.00  No Bid  No Bid  $      378.55  $        9,463.75  $      350.00  $        8,750.00 

69 HFE-150
DISTRICT 5 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      500.00  $        12,500.00  No Bid  No Bid  $      471.00  $      11,775.00  No Bid  No Bid 

70 HFE-300
DISTRICT 5 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      550.00  $        13,750.00  No Bid  No Bid  $      485.00  $      12,125.00  No Bid  No Bid 

71 HFE-1000
DISTRICT 5 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      610.00  $        15,250.00  No Bid  No Bid  $      520.00  $      13,000.00  No Bid  No Bid 

72 MC-250
DISTRICT 5 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      840.35  $        21,008.75  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

73 MC-250
DISTRICT 5 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      745.00  $        18,625.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

74 RETURNED LOAD FEE 
DISTRICT 5 1 EA  $              -    $                    -    $          9.89  $                  9.89  No Bid  No Bid  $      450.00  $           450.00  $        10.00  $              10.00 

75 DEMURRAGE CHARGE 
DISTRICT 5 1 HR  $              -    $                    -    $      200.00  $              200.00  No Bid  No Bid  $        85.00  $              85.00  $      190.00  $           190.00 

76 CRS-2P
DISTRICT 6 5200 TN  $      477.50  $ 2,483,000.00  $      559.35  $   2,908,620.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

77 CRS-2P
DISTRICT 6 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      490.00  $        12,250.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

78 CRS-2P 80/20
DISTRICT 6 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

79 CRS-2VHL
DISTRICT 6 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

80 CRS-2 STRAIGHT 
DISTRICT 6 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      460.00  $        11,500.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  $      450.00  $      11,250.00 

81 CSS-1H STRAIGHT 
DISTRICT 6 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      460.00  $        11,500.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  $      450.00  $      11,250.00 

82 CSS-1H 50/50
DISTRICT 6 475 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      325.48  $      154,603.00  $      675.00  $    320,625.00  $              -    No Bid  $      300.99  $    142,970.25 

83 CSS-1H 50/50
DISTRICT 6 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      260.00  $          6,500.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  $      275.00  $        6,875.00 

84 CSS-1H 75/25
DISTRICT 6 800 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      425.48  $      340,384.00  $      700.00  $    560,000.00  $              -    No Bid  $      382.99  $    306,392.00 

85 CSS-1H 75/25
DISTRICT 6 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      360.00  $          9,000.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  $      350.00  $        8,750.00 

86 HFE-150
DISTRICT 6 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      500.00  $        12,500.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

87 HFE-300
DISTRICT 6 1475 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      580.92  $      856,857.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

88 HFE-300
DISTRICT 6 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      550.00  $        13,750.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

89 HFE-1000
DISTRICT 6 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      664.06  $        16,601.50  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

90 HFE-1000
DISTRICT 6 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      610.00  $        15,250.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
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 Western States Asphalt, LLC  Simon Contractors of SD, Inc.  Flint Hills Resources, LP Liquid Asphaltic Materials  Jebro, Inc.  Martin Resource Management 
Corp. DBA Monarch Oil 

91 MC-250
DISTRICT 6 100 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      807.73  $        80,773.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

92 MC-250
DISTRICT 6 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      745.00  $        18,625.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

93 RETURNED LOAD FEE
DISTRICT 6 1 EA  $              -    $                    -    $          9.89  $                  9.89  $   1,500.00  $        1,500.00  $              -    No Bid  $        10.00  $              10.00 

94 DEMURRAGE CHARGE 
DISTRICT 6 1 HR  $              -    $                    -    $      200.00  $              200.00  $      500.00  $           500.00  $              -    No Bid  $      190.00  $           190.00 

95 CRS-2P
DISTRICT 7 3350 TN  $      508.50  $ 1,703,475.00  $      570.84  $   1,912,314.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

96 CRS-2P
DISTRICT 7 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      490.00  $        12,250.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

97 CRS-2VHL
DISTRICT 7 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

98 CRS-2 STRAIGHT 
DISTRICT 7 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      460.00  $        11,500.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  $      450.00  $      11,250.00 

99 CSS-1H STRAIGHT 
DISTRICT 7 50 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      526.19  $        26,309.50  $      720.00  $      36,000.00  $              -    No Bid  $      473.99  $      23,699.50 

100 CSS-1H STRAIGHT 
DISTRICT 7 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      460.00  $        11,500.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  $      450.00  $      11,250.00 

101 CSS-1H 50/50
DISTRICT 7 250 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      353.60  $        88,400.00  $      675.00  $    168,750.00  $              -    No Bid  $      311.99  $      77,997.50 

102 CSS-1H 50/50
DISTRICT 7 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      260.00  $          6,500.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  $      275.00  $        6,875.00 

103 CSS-1H 75/25
DISTRICT 7 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      360.00  $          9,000.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  $      350.00  $        8,750.00 

104 HFE-150
DISTRICT 7 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      500.00  $        12,500.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

105 HFE-300
DISTRICT 7 100 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      602.56  $        60,256.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

106 HFE-300
DISTRICT 7 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      550.00  $        13,750.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

107 HFE-1000
DISTRICT 7 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      610.00  $        15,250.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

108 MC-250
DISTRICT 7 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      745.00  $        18,625.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

109 RETURNED LOAD FEE 
DISTRICT 7 1 EA  $              -    $                    -    $          9.89  $                  9.89  $   1,500.00  $        1,500.00  $              -    No Bid  $        10.00  $              10.00 

110 DEMURRAGE CHARGE 
DISTRICT 7 1 HR  $              -    $                    -    $      200.00  $              200.00  $      500.00  $           500.00  $              -    No Bid  $      190.00  $           190.00 

111 CRS-2P
DISTRICT 8 3350 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      531.68  $   1,781,128.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

112 CRS-2P
DISTRICT 8 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      490.00  $        12,250.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

113 CRS-2VHL
DISTRICT 8 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

114 CRS-2 STRAIGHT 
DISTRICT 8 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      460.00  $        11,500.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

115 CSS-1H STRAIGHT 
DISTRICT 8 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      460.00  $        11,500.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

116 CSS-1H 50/50
DISTRICT 8 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      260.00  $          6,500.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

117 CSS-1H 75/25
DISTRICT 8 500 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      412.09  $      206,045.00  $      725.00  $    362,500.00  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

118 CSS-1H 75/25
DISTRICT 8 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      360.00  $          9,000.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

119 HFE-150
DISTRICT 8 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      515.40  $        12,885.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

120 HFE-150
DISTRICT 8 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      500.00  $        12,500.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

121 HFE-300
DISTRICT 8 150 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      584.22  $        87,633.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

122 HFE-300
DISTRICT 8 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      550.00  $        13,750.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

123 HFE-1000
DISTRICT 8 100 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      646.41  $        64,641.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

124 HFE-1000
DISTRICT 8 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      610.00  $        15,250.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

125 MC-250
DISTRICT 8 50 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      786.51  $        39,325.50  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

126 MC-250
DISTRICT 8 PLANT PICKUP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $      745.00  $        18,625.00  No Bid  No Bid  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

127 RETURNED LOAD FEE 
DISTRICT 8 1 EA  $              -    $                    -    $          9.89  $                  9.89  $   1,500.00  $        1,500.00  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

128 DEMURRAGE CHARGE 
DISTRICT 8 1 HR  $              -    $                    -    $      200.00  $              200.00  $      500.00  $           500.00  $              -    No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 $ 7,634,262.50  $ 25,056,415.87  $ 1,607,625.00  $ 1,854,411.25  $ 2,111,764.25 
 0 30 

1

 Line 63 - Per Addendum #2 

 per spec 
 0 30 

Total

1
0 30

Comments

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms

1
Net 30  0 30 
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