Buyer: Brenda Sensibaugh

6211 OF

Bulk Bituminous Cold Patch Material

Opening Date: 1/20/20

Knife River Midwest, LLC. Award Award Award Simon Contractors
Logan County Asphalt Omni Engineering Pavers Inc
Line Description Qty UoMm Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
# Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
1 |DIST 1 BULK COLD PATCH | 10.0000 | TN $ 140.25 1,402.50 NB No Bid
LINCOLN SALT VALLEY
2 [DIST 1 BULK COLD PATCH | 30.0000 | TN $ 167.00: $ 5,010.00] $ 143.90 4,317.00 NB No Bid
AUBURN
3 |DIST 1 BULK COLD PATCH | 30.0000 | TN $ 167.00: $ 5,010.00] $ 149.46 4,483.80 NB No Bid
FALLS CITY
4 |DIST 1 BULK COLD PATCH | 10.0000 | TN $ 146.76 1,467.60 NB No Bid
BEATRICE
5 [DIST 1 BULK COLD PATCH | 10.0000 | TN $ 142.95 1,429.50 NB No Bid
DAVID CITY
6 [DIST 1 BULK COLD PATCH | 10.0000 | TN $ 145.49 1,454.90 NB No Bid
DORCHESTER
7 [DIST 1 BULK COLD PATCH | 10.0000 | TN $ 151.52 1,515.20 NB No Bid
FAIRBURY
8 [DIST 1 BULK COLD PATCH | 30.0000 | TN $ 167.00i $ 5,010.00] $ 140.89 4,226.70 NB No Bid
NEBRASKA CITY
9 [DIST 1 BULK COLD PATCH | 10.0000 | TN $ 145.33 1,453.30 NB No Bid
PAWNEE CITY
10 |DIST 1 BULK COLD PATCH | 30.0000 | TN $ 167.00: $ 5,010.00] $ 140.25 4,207.50 NB No Bid
PALMYRA
11 |DIST 1 BULK COLD PATCH | 30.0000 | TN $ 167.00: $ 5,010.00] $ 143.11 4,293.30 NB No Bid
SEWARD
12 |DIST 1 BULK COLD PATCH | 30.0000 | TN $ 167.00: $ 5,010.00] $ 142.32 4,269.60 NB No Bid
TECUMSEH
13 |DIST 1 BULK COLD PATCH | 50.0000 | TN $ 167.00: $ 8,350.00] $ 138.19 6,909.50 NB No Bid
WAHOO
14 |DIST 2 BULK COLD PATCH | 50.0000 | TN $ 17150: $ 8,575.00] $ 134.54 6,727.00 NB No Bid
OMAHA 108TH
15 |DIST 2 BULK COLD PATCH | 50.0000 | TN $ 17150i $ 8,575.00] $ 134.86 6,743.00 NB No Bid
OMAHA SOUTH
16 |DIST 2 BULK COLD PATCH | 50.0000 | TN $ 17150: $ 8,575.00] $ 134.86 6,743.00 NB No Bid
OMAHA MORMON
17 |DIST 2 BULK COLD PATCH | 50.0000 | TN $ 17150: $ 8,575.00] $ 138.19 6,909.50 NB No Bid
FREMONT
18 |DIST 2 BULK COLD PATCH | 50.0000 | TN $ 17150: $ 8,575.00] $ 137.87 6,893.50 NB No Bid
BLAIR
19 |DIST 2 BULK COLD PATCH | 50.0000 | TN $ 17150: $ 8,575.00] $ 134.54 6,727.00 NB No Bid
GRETNA
20 |DIST 2 BULK COLD PATCH | 50.0000 | TN $ 17150: $ 8,575.00] $ 137.08 6,854.00] No Bid No Bid
PLATTSMOUTH
21 |DIST 2 BULK COLD PATCH | 50.0000 | TN $ 17150: $ 8,575.00] $ 135.34 6,767.00] No Bid No Bid
ELKHORN
22 |DIST 3 BULK COLD PATCH | 25.0000 | TN $ 180.00: $ 4,500.00| $ 152.95 3,823.75] No Bid No Bid
ALBION
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23 |DIST 3 BULK COLD PATCH 25.0000 TN | $ 166.00i $ 4,150.00] $ 180.00: $ 4,500.00 158.34 : $ 3,958.50 No Bid No Bid
BLOOMFIELD

24 |DIST 3 BULK COLD PATCH 25.0000 TN $ 180.00: $ 4,500.00 14581 $ 3,645.25 No Bid No Bid
CLARKSON

25 |DIST 3 BULK COLD PATCH 25.0000 TN $ 180.00: $ 4,500.00 146.28 ; $ 3,657.00 No Bid No Bid
COLUMBUS

26 |DIST 3 BULK COLD PATCH 25.0000 TN | $ 160.00: $ 4,000.00] $ 180.00: $ 4,500.00 155.17 ; $ 3,879.25 No Bid No Bid
HARTINGTON

27 |DIST 3 BULK COLD PATCH 25.0000 TN $ 180.00: $ 4,500.00 148.82 : $ 3,720.50 No Bid No Bid
HUMPHREY

28 |DIST 3 BULK COLD PATCH 25.0000 TN | $ 157.00: $ 3,925.00] $ 180.00: $ 4,500.00 152.00 ; $ 3,800.00 No Bid No Bid
LAUREL

29 |DIST 3 BULK COLD PATCH 25.0000 TN | $ 157.00: $ 3,925.00] $ 180.00: $ 4,500.00 144.06 ; $ 3,601.50 No Bid No Bid
LYONS

30 |DIST 3 BULK COLD PATCH 25.0000 TN | $ 17200 $ 4,300.00] $ 180.00: $ 4,500.00 155.96 ; $ 3,899.00 No Bid No Bid
NELIGH

31 |DIST 3 BULK COLD PATCH 25.0000 TN | $ 169.00i $ 4,225.00] $ 180.00: $ 4,500.00 162.79: $ 4,069.75 No Bid No Bid
NIOBRARA

32 |DIST 3 BULK COLD PATCH 25.0000 TN | $ 169.00: $ 4,225.00] $ 180.00: $ 4,500.00 15041 : $ 3,760.25 No Bid No Bid
NORFOLK

33 |DIST 3 BULK COLD PATCH 25.0000 TN | $ 166.00: $ 4,150.00] $ 180.00: $ 4,500.00 156.12 ; $ 3,903.00 No Bid No Bid
PLAINVIEW

34 |DIST 3 BULK COLD PATCH 25.0000 TN | $ 151.00: $ 3,775.00] $ 180.00: $ 4,500.00 15041 : $ 3,760.25 No Bid No Bid
SO. SIOUX CITY

35 |DIST 3 BULK COLD PATCH 25.0000 TN | $ 160.00;: $ 4,000.00] $ 180.00: $ 4,500.00 14946 : $ 3,736.50 No Bid No Bid
WAYNE

36 |DIST 3 BULK COLD PATCH 25.0000 TN $ 180.00: $ 4,500.00 143.75: $ 3,5693.75 No Bid No Bid
WEST POINT

37 |DIST 3 BULK COLD PATCH 100.0000 | TN $ 165.00: $ 16,500.00 151.20; $ 15,120.00 No Bid No Bid
AURORA

38 |DIST 4 BULK COLD PATCH 30.0000 TN $ 165.00: $ 4,950.00 150.73  $ 4,521.90 No Bid No Bid
GENEVA

39 |DIST 4 BULK COLD PATCH 30.0000 TN $ 165.00: $ 4,950.00 154.96 ; $ 4,648.80 No Bid No Bid
GRAND ISLAND

40 |DIST 4 BULK COLD PATCH 75.0000 TN $ 165.00: $ 12,375.00 156.60 ; $ 11,745.00 No Bid No Bid
HASTINGS

41 |DIST 4 BULK COLD PATCH 30.0000 TN $ 165.00: $ 4,950.00 154.85: $ 4,645.50 No Bid No Bid
HEBRON

42 |DIST 4 BULK COLD PATCH 30.0000 TN $ 165.00: $ 4,950.00 16041 : $ 4,812.30 No Bid No Bid
KEARNEY

43 |DIST 4 BULK COLD PATCH 15.0000 TN 158.34: $ 2,375.10 No Bid No Bid
LOUP CITY

44 |DIST 4 BULK COLD PATCH 30.0000 TN $ 165.00: $ 4,950.00 146.13 ; $ 4,383.90 No Bid No Bid
OSCEOLA

45 |DIST 4 BULK COLD PATCH 30.0000 TN $ 165.00: $ 4,950.00 159.93 : $ 4,797.90 No Bid No Bid
RAVENNA
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46 |DIST 4 BULK COLD PATCH 50.0000 TN $ 165.00: $ 8,250.00 162.95 ; $ 8,147.50 No Bid No Bid
RED CLOUD
47 |DIST 4 BULK COLD PATCH 50.0000 TN $ 165.00: $ 8,250.00 160.09 ;| $ 8,004.50 No Bid No Bid
SUPERIOR
48 |DIST 4 BULK COLD PATCH 15.0000 TN 153.74: $ 2,306.10] No Bid No Bid
ST. PAUL
49 |DIST 4 BULK COLD PATCH 30.0000 TN $ 165.00: $ 4,950.00 147.87 : $ 4,436.10 No Bid No Bid
YORK
50 |BIST4BULK-COLD-PATCH |1,000.0000( TN $ 210.00: $ 210,000.00 202.93: $ 202,930.00 No Bid No Bid $ 192.00 192,000.00
ALHANCE
51 |BISTF5BULK-COLD-PATCH |1,000.0000( TN $ 210.00: $ 210,000.00 19754: $ 197,540.00 No Bid No Bid $ 191.00 191,000.00
BRIDGEPORT
52 |BIST5BULK-COLD-PATCH |3,000.0000( TN $ 210.00: $ 630,000.00 211.18: $ 633,540.00 No Bid No Bid
CHABRON
53 |BISTF5BULK-COLD-PATCH |1,000.0000( TN $ 210.00i $ 210,000.00 189.92: $ 189,920.00 No Bid No Bid
CHAPPELL
54 |BIST5BULK-COLD-PATCH- | 1,000.0000 | TN $ 210.00i $ 210,000.00 21182 % 211,820.00 No Bid No Bid $ 205.00 205,000.00
CRAWFORD
55 |BIST5BULK-COLD-PATCH- | 3,000.0000( TN $ 210.00: $ 630,000.00 20246 $ 607,380.00 No Bid No Bid $ 195.00 585,000.00
GERING
56 |BIST5BULK-COLD-PATCH |1,000.0000( TN $ 210.00: $ 210,000.00 194.36; $ 194,360.00 No Bid No Bid
GORDON
57 |BIST5BULK-COLD-PATCH |1,000.0000( TN $ 210.00: $ 210,000.00 200.23: $ 200,230.00 No Bid No Bid $ 192.00 192,000.00
KHMBALL
58 |BIST5BULK-COLD-PATCH |3,000.0000( TN $ 210.00: $ 630,000.00 19452 $ 583,560.00 No Bid No Bid
SIDNEY
59 |BIST5BULK-COLD-PATCH 500000 N $ 180.00: $ 9,000.00 167.71: $ 8,385.50 No Bid No Bid
BROKEN-BOW
60 |DIST 6 BULK COLD PATCH 50.0000 TN $ 180.00i $ 9,000.00 166.12 i $ 8,306.00 No Bid No Bid
LEXINGTON
61 |DIST 6 BULK COLD PATCH 50.0000 TN $ 180.00i $ 9,000.00 17464 $ 8,732.00 No Bid No Bid
NORTH PLATTE
62 |DIST 6 BULK COLD PATCH 15.0000 TN 168.50 ; $ 2,527.50] No Bid No Bid
ALMA
63 |DIST 7 BULK COLD PATCH 15.0000 TN 169.77 : $ 2,546.55 No Bid No Bid
ARAPAHOE
64 |DIST 7 BULK COLD PATCH 15.0000 TN 164.69 : $ 2,470.35 No Bid No Bid
HOLDREGE
65 |DIST 7 BULK COLD PATCH 30.0000 TN $ 176.00: $ 5,280.00 176.27 : $ 5,288.10 No Bid No Bid
MCOOK
66 |OMAHA 50.0000 TN 135.00: $ 6,750.00 No Bid No Bid
PLANT PICK UP
BULK COLD PATCH
67 |LINCOLN 50.0000 TN NA $ 136.85: $ 6,842.50
PLANT PICK UP
BULK COLD PATCH
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68 |[NORTH PLATTE 50.0000 TN NA No Bid No Bid
PLANT PICK UP
BULK COLD PATCH
69 [S SIOUX CITY 50.0000 | TN | $ 145.00: $ 7,250.00 NA No Bid No Bid
PLANT PICK UP
BULK COLD PATCH
70 |SCOTTSBLUFF 50.0000 | TN NA No Bid No Bid $  180.00: $ 9,000.00
PLANT PICK UP
BULK COLD PATCH
71 50.0000 | TN NA No Bid No Bid
PLANT PICK UP
BULK COLD PATCH
Total] $1,772.00: $47,925.00| $9,662.00: $3,436,815.00] $10,375.49: $3,298,833.25] $ 136.85: $ 6,842.50| $1,155.00: $ 1,374,000.00
Payment Terms - - 1 10 0 30 -0- -0- NA
Delivery Days ARO 10 5 7 45 30
Comments|] ** Bulk Plant Picjup:
2220 Hawkeye Drive
Sioux City, IA 51105
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