Buyer: Brenda Sensibaugh

6160 OF
NDOT

Opening Date: 02/28/20

ﬁ Asphaltic Concrete Cather and Sgr\:\;ACFczEstruction, Inc. Concrete Materials - Yankton CAr\s:eﬁ,er?c Flinn Paving Co. Inc.
£
Description Qty |UOM Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
DIST 1 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE .
LINCOLN & SURROUNDING AREA 4000] TN | $ SBED|| & ZAREnI $ ) $ ) No Bid $ -
1 Plant address and location: 6400 N 70th Street, Lincoln
Mix Name: SPR
Asphalt Binder: 58H-34
| |Date material will be available: 3-16-2020
DIST 1 ALTERNATE MIX #1 .
LINCOLN & SURROUNDING AREA | 200 | N | $ 53.50( $  10,700.00 | $ - | $ - No Bid | $ -
2 Plant address and location: 6400 N 70th Street, Lincoln
Mix Name: SPR
Asphalt Binder: 58-28
Date material will be available: 3-16-2020
DIST 1 ALTERNATE MIX #2 .
LINCOLN & SURROUNDING AREA | 200 | ™S SEED|O  MEInY | $ ) | $ - No Bid | $ -
3 Plant address and location: 6400 N 70th Street, Lincoln
Mix Name: SPR
Asphalt Binder: 64-34
| |Date material will be available: 3-16-2020
DIST 2 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE .
OMAMA & SURROUNDING AREA |2000| N | $ 56.50( $  113,000.00 | $ - | $ - No Bid | $ -
4 Plant address and location: 6400 N 70th Street, Lincoln
Mix Name: SPR
Asphalt Binder: 58H-28
Date material will be available: 3-16-2020
DIST 2 ALTERNATE MIX #1 TN .
OMAHA & SURROUNDING AREA | 1500| 9 SOED||©® Dz | $ ) | $ ) No Bid | $ -
5 Plant address and location: 6400 N 70th Street, Lincoln
Mix Name: SPR
Asphalt Binder: 58-28
| |Date material will be available: 3-16-2020
DIST 2 ALTERNATE MIX #2 TN .
OMAHA & SURROUNDING AREA | 1500| Y SR §  EAwENeY | $ - | $ - No Bid | $ -
6 Plant address and location: 6400 N 70th Street, Lincoln
Mix Name: SPR
Asphalt Binder: 64-34
Date material will be available: 3-16-2020
DIST 3 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE TN .
NORFOLK & SURROUNDING AREA |5000| $ 56.50( $ 282,500.00 69.00| $  345,000.00 | $ - No Bid | $ -
7 Plant address and location: 6400 N 70th Street, Lincoln 2210 Alumax Road - Yankton
Mix Name: SPR 1/2 SD Pot Mix
Asphalt Binder: 58H-34 PG 64-22
| |Date material will be available: 3-16-2020 April 15, 2
DIST 3 ALTERNATE MIX #1 TN
NORFOLK & SURROUNDING AREA |SOOO| $ 5350 $ 267,500.00 69.00 | $  345,000.00 | $ - 89.90 | $  449,500.00
8 Plant address and location: 6400 N 70th Street, Lincoln 1100 E. Monroe-Norfolk
Mix Name: SPR Nebraska Type 17C
Asphalt Binder: 58-28 PG 64-22
Date material will be available: 3-16-2020 May 15, 2020
DIST 3 ALTERNATE MIX #2 TN .
NORFOLK & SURROUNDING AREA |5000| 9 SEED|Y 2RIy | $ ) | $ ) No Bid | $ -
9 Plant address and location: 6400 N 70th Street, Lincoln
Mix Name: SPR
Asphalt Binder: 64-34
| |Date material will be available: 3-16-2020
DIST 4 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE TN X
GRAND ISLAND & SURROUNDING AREA |5000| $ 56.50( $ 282,500.00 | $ - | $ - No Bid | $ -
10 |Plant address and location: 6400 N 70th Street, Lincoln
Mix Name: SPR
Asphalt Binder: 58H-28
| |Date material will be available: 3-16-2020
DIST 4 ALTERNATE MIX #1 TN .
GRAND ISLAND & SURROUNDING AREA |5000| $ 5350 $ 267,500.00 | $ - | $ - No Bid | $ -
1 Plant address and location: 6400 N 70th Street, Lincoln
Mix Name: SPR
Asphalt Binder: 58-28
Date material will be available: 3-16-2020
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Buyer: Brenda Sensibaugh

6160 OF
NDOT

Opening Date: 02/28/20

Line #

Asphaltic Concrete

AWARD

Cather and Sons Construction, Inc.

Concrete Materials - Yankton

AWARD
Croell, Inc

Flinn Paving Co. Inc.

Description

Qty

UoM

Unit Price Extended Price

Unit Price

Extended Price

Unit Price

Extended Price

Unit Price

Extended Price

DIST 4 ALTERNATE MIX #2
GRAND ISLAND & SURROUNDING AREA

5000

TN

$

56.50 $ 282,500.00

$ -

$ -

No Bid

$ -

1

N

Plant address and location:

6400 N 70th Street, Lincoln

Mix Name:

SPR

Asphalt Binder:

64-34

Date material will be available:

3-16-2020

DIST 5 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE SCOTTSBLUFF &
SURROUNDING AREA

| 2000|

[+ -

$ -

No Bid

1

w

Plant address and location:

2210 Alumax Road - Yankton

Mix Name:

1/2 SD Pot Mix

Asphalt Binder:

PG 64-22

Date material will be available:

April 15

DIST 5 ALTERNATE MIX #1
SCOTTSBLUFF & SURROUNDING AREA

| 2000|

[« -

No Bid

1

'

Plant address and location:

Mix Name:

Asphalt Binder:

Date material will be available:

DIST 5 ALTERNATE MIX #2
SCOTTSBLUFF & SURROUNDING AREA

| 2000|

No Bid

15

Plant address and location:

Mix Name:

Asphalt Binder:

Date material will be available:

DIST 6 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE SPR
NORTH PLATTE, LEXINGTON,
OGALLALA & SURROUNDING AREA

1000

TN

$

90.00

$ 90,000.00

No Bid

16

Plant address and location:

3506 US-20 N

orth Platte, NE

Mix Name:

SPR

Asphalt Binder:

PG 64-22

Date material will be available:

5/1/2020

DIST 6 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE SPS
NORTH PLATTE, LEXINGTON,
OGALLALA & SURROUNDING AREA

350

TN

$

90.00

$ 31,500.00

No Bid

17

Plant address and location:

3506 US-20 N

orth Platte, NE

Mix Name:

SPS

Asphalt Binder:

PG 64-22

Date material will be available:

5/1/2020

DIST 6 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE SPH
NORTH PLATTE, LEXINGTON,
OGALLALA & SURROUNDING AREA

350

TN

$

90.00

$ 31,500.00

No Bid

18

Plant address and location:

3506 US-20 N

orth Platte, NE

Mix Name:

SPH

Asphalt Binder:

PG 64-22

Date material will be available:

5/1/2020

DIST 6 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE SLX
NORTH PLATTE, LEXINGTON,
OGALLALA & SURROUNDING AREA

350

TN

$

90.00

$ 31,500.00

No Bid

1

©

Plant address and location:

Mix Name:

Asphalt Binder:

Date material will be available:

2l

o

DIST 7 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE
MCCOOK & SURROUNDING AREA

| 200|

No Bid

Plant address and location:

Mix Name:

Asphalt Binder:

Date material will be available:
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Buyer: Brenda Sensibaugh

6160 OF
NDOT

Opening Date: 02/28/20

ﬁ Asphaltic Concrete Cather and Sgr\:\;ACFczEstruction, Inc. Concrete Materials - Yankton CAr\s:eﬁ,er?c Flinn Paving Co. Inc.
£
Description Qty [lUOM Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
DIST 7 ALTERNATE MIX #1 TN .
MCCOOK & SURROUNDING AREA 200 $ . $ . $ . No Bid $ .
21 Plant address and location:
Mix Name:
Asphalt Binder:
| |Date material will be available:
DIST 7 ALTERNATE MIX #2 TN .
MCCOOK & SURROUNDING AREA 200| $ ) $ ) $ ) No Bid $ )
2 Plant address and location:
Mix Name:
Asphalt Binder:
Date material will be available:
Total [ '$ 2,191,000.00 [$  690,000.00 [$ 184,500.00 [$  449,500.00
Payment Terms nana 0 Net 30
Delivery Days ARO
Comments reqyired
required #
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Buyer: Brenda Sensibaugh 6160 OF Opening Date: 02/28/20
NDOT

AWARD

Asphaltic Concrete Knife River Midwest, LLC. Omni Engineering Pavers Inc .
Simon Contractors

Line #

Description Qty |UOM Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

DIST 1 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE
LINCOLN & SURROUNDING AREA 4000| TN $ -8 78.00( $ 312,000.00| $ 59.59| $ 238,360.00 $ -
Plant address and location: G Street 12303 Hwy 6 Waverly NE

Mix Name: SPR City SPR

Asphalt Binder: PG 64-34 58V-34

Date material will be available: 5-1-20 March 30th

DIST 1 ALTERNATE MIX #1 | 200| TN | $ - s 79.00| $ 15,800.00| $ 67.00( $ 13,400.00 | $ -

[N

LINCOLN & SURROUNDING AREA
Plant address and location: G Street March 30th
Mix Name: SPR Fine City SLX
Asphalt Binder: PG 64-34 58V-34
Date material will be available: 5-1-20 March 30th
DIST 1 ALTERNATE MIX #2
LINCOLN & SURROUNDING AREA | 200 | ™ | $ ¢ 73.00 | $ 14,600.00 NB | $ ) | $ B
Plant address and location: G Street
Mix Name: 3/8 Surface
Asphalt Binder: PG 64-22
Date material will be available: 5-1-20
DIST 2 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE
OMAMA & SURROUNDING AREA |2000| ™N | $ -ls 78.00| $  156,000.00 NB | $ - | $ -
Plant address and location: G Street
Mix Name: SPR City
Asphalt Binder: PG 64-34
Date material will be available: 5-1-20
DIST 2 ALTERNATE MIX #1
OMAHA & SURROUNDING AREA | 15OO| $ ¢ 79.00 | $ 118,500.00 NB | $ B | $ )
Plant address and location: G Street
Mix Name: SPR Fine City
Asphalt Binder: PG 64-34
Date material will be available: 5-1-20
DIST 2 ALTERNATE MIX #2
OMAHA & SURROUNDING AREA |1500| $ -1 $ 73.00 | $ 109,500.00 NB | $ - | $ -
Plant address and location: G Street
Mix Name: 3/8 Surface
Asphalt Binder: PG 64-22
Date material will be available: 5-1-20
DIST 3 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE .

NORFOLK & SURROUNDING AREA |5000| | $ ) No Bid | $ - NB | $ - | $ -
Plant address and location: 2220 Hawkeye Dr. Sioux City, IA
Mix Name: 1 M ESAL 1/2" Surface
Asphalt Binder: PG 58-28

Date material will be available: 4-20-2020

DIST 3 ALTERNATE MIX #1 |5000| $ 63.75 | $ 318,750.00 No Bid

N

w

IN

o

o

~

NORFOLK & SURROUNDING AREA
Plant address and location: 2220 Hawkeye Dr. Sioux City, 1A
Mix Name: SPR

Asphalt Binder: PG 58H-34

Date material will be available: 4-20-2020

DIST 3 ALTERNATE MIX #2 .
NORFOLK & SURROUNDING AREA |5ooo| $ 68.00 | $  340,000.00 No Bid
Plant address and location: 2220 Hawkeye Dr. Sioux City, IA
Mix Name: 3/8: Surface

Asphalt Binder: PG 58-28

Date material will be available: 4-20-2020

DIST 4 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE TN .
GRAND ISLAND & SURROUNDING AREA |5OOO| s 78.00 | $ 39000000 NoBid |
Plant address and location:

Mix Name:

Asphalt Binder:

Date material will be available:

DIST 4 ALTERNATE MIX #1

GRAND ISLAND & SURROUNDING AREA
Plant address and location:

Mix Name:

Asphalt Binder:

Date material will be available:

o]

©

1

o

|5000| | $ - No Bid | $ - NB | $ - | $ -

1

[
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Buyer: Brenda Sensibaugh

6160 OF

NDOT

Opening Date: 02/28/20

Line #

Asphaltic Concrete

Knife River Midwest, LLC.

Omni Engineering

Pavers Inc

AWARD
Simon Contractors

Description

Qty

UOM

Unit Price

Extended Price

Unit Price

Extended Price

Unit Price

Extended Price

Unit Price Extended Price

DIST 4 ALTERNATE MIX #2
GRAND ISLAND & SURROUNDING AREA

5000

TN

No Bid

$ -

NB

$ -

$ -

1

N

Plant address and location:

Mix Name:

Asphalt Binder:

Date material will be available:

DIST 5 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE SCOTTSBLUFF &
SURROUNDING AREA

| 2000|

No Bid

NB

$

73.00 | $  146,000.00

1

w

Plant address and location:

120018 21st Ave Scottsbluff NE

Mix Name:

SPR

Asphalt Binder:

58H-34 or Superior

Date material will be available:

4/1/2020

DIST 5 ALTERNATE MIX #1
SCOTTSBLUFF & SURROUNDING AREA

| 2000|

No Bid

NB

$

73.00 | $  146,000.00

1

'

Plant address and location:

120018 21st Ave Scottsbluff NE

Mix Name:

SLX

Asphalt Binder:

58H-34 or Superior

Date material will be available:

4/1/2020

DIST 5 ALTERNATE MIX #2
SCOTTSBLUFF & SURROUNDING AREA

| 2000|

No Bid

NB

$

73.00 | $  146,000.00

15

Plant address and location:

120018 21st Ave Scottsbluff NE

Mix Name:

P-401

Asphalt Binder:

70-28

Date material will be available:

5/18/20-9/1/20

DIST 6 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE SPR
NORTH PLATTE, LEXINGTON,
OGALLALA & SURROUNDING AREA

1000

TN

No Bid

NB

$ -

16

Plant address and location:

Mix Name:

Asphalt Binder:

Date material will be available:

DIST 6 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE SPS
NORTH PLATTE, LEXINGTON,
OGALLALA & SURROUNDING AREA

350

TN

No Bid

NB

17

Plant address and location:

Mix Name:

Asphalt Binder:

Date material will be available:

DIST 6 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE SPH
NORTH PLATTE, LEXINGTON,
OGALLALA & SURROUNDING AREA

350

TN

No Bid

NB

18

Plant address and location:

Mix Name:

Asphalt Binder:

Date material will be available:

DIST 6 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE SLX
NORTH PLATTE, LEXINGTON,
OGALLALA & SURROUNDING AREA

350

TN

No Bid

NB

1

©

Plant address and location:

Mix Name:

Asphalt Binder:

Date material will be available:

2l

o

DIST 7 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE
MCCOOK & SURROUNDING AREA

| 200|

No Bid

NB

Plant address and location:

Mix Name:

Asphalt Binder:

Date material will be available:
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Buyer: Brenda Sensibaugh

6160 OF
NDOT

Opening Date: 02/28/20

H* Asphaltic Concrete Knife River Midwest, LLC. Omni Engineering Pavers Inc : A
o Simon Contractors
5
Description Qty [lUOM Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
DIST 7 ALTERNATE MIX #1 TN .
MCCOOK & SURROUNDING AREA 200 $ . No Bid $ . NB $ . $ .
21 Plant address and location:
Mix Name:
Asphalt Binder:
| |Date material will be available:
DIST 7 ALTERNATE MIX #2 TN .
MCCOOK & SURROUNDING AREA 200| No Bid $ ) NB $ ) $ )

22

Plant address and location:

Mix Name:

Asphalt Binder:

Date material will be available:

Total

[ $ 1,048,750.00

[$  726,400.00
030

[$  251,760.00

Payment Terms

[$  438,000.00
A

Delivery Days ARO

3

Comments
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