
BUYER:  CHRISTIE KELLY 6138 OF
ATTACHMENT C

 2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR FOR HALF TON UTILITY VAN FFV E85

OPENING DATE: 09/13/2019

1 OF 5

E85 AND E15 
AS PRIMARY 

AWARDS
Anderson Ford

Baxter CDJR 
Lincoln

Gene Steffy 
Auto Group

Husker Auto 
Group LLC

Sid Dillon 
Chevrolet 

Buick

E85 AND E15 
AS 

SECONDARY 
AWARDS
Sid Dillon 

Ford
LINE 

#
DESCRIPTION QTY UOM UNIT

PRICE
UNIT
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR
HALF TON UTILITY VAN FFV E85
(E85=UNITS CAPABLE OF OPERATING ON A FUEL 
MIXTURE OF UP TO 85% ETHANOL / 15% UNLEADED 
GASOLINE WITHOUT ADDITIONAL CHANGE OR 
CONVERSION)

A SEPARATE BID IS REQUESTED IF THE MANUFACTURER IS 
PRODUCING ALTERNATIVE FUEL MOTOR VEHICLES DUE 
TO  A SEPARATE CONTRACT MAY BE AWARDED

 $        23,996.00  $          22,477.00  No Bid  $    24,527.00 

WHEELBASE:  MINIMUM OF 118"
LENGTH:  MINIMUM OF 195"
MINIMUM TIRE SIZE:  16"
MAKE:  Ford  NO BID E85  No Bid  Chevrolet  Ford 
MODEL:  TrANsit  Express Van - 

Cargo 
 Transit 

SERIES, CODE, TRIM LEVEL:  EIY, 101A, XL  2500 - CG23405 
Base WT 

 EIY, 101A,  

ENGINE (MINIMUM SIZE OF 3.5L V6):  3.5L V6  L96 6.0L V8 
Vortec 

 3.5L 

GVWR (MINIMUM OF 7,200): 8,670 8600 8670
DELIVERY ARO (NUMBER OF DAYS): 90 35/120 40 - 120
MSRP AS BID:  $        37,130.00  $          34,366.25  $    36,975.00 

ATTACHMENT C
 2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR FOR HALF TON UTILITY VAN FFV 

E85

1 5 EA
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E85 AND E15 
AS PRIMARY 

AWARDS
Anderson Ford

Baxter CDJR 
Lincoln

Gene Steffy 
Auto Group

Husker Auto 
Group LLC

Sid Dillon 
Chevrolet 

Buick

E85 AND E15 
AS 

SECONDARY 
AWARDS
Sid Dillon 

Ford

ATTACHMENT C
 2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR FOR HALF TON UTILITY VAN FFV 

E85

2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR
HALF TON UTILITY VAN E15 COMPLIANT
(E15=UNITS CAPABLE OF OPERATING ON A FUEL 
MIXTURE OF UP TO 15% ETHANOL / 85% UNLEADED 
GASOLINE WITHOUT ADDITIONAL CHANGE OR 
CONVERSION)

A SEPARATE BID IS REQUESTED IF THE MANUFACTURER IS 
PRODUCING ALTERNATIVE FUEL MOTOR VEHICLES DUE 
TO  A SEPARATE CONTRACT MAY BE AWARDED

 $        23,996.00  $        21,659.00  $    21,498.00  $          22,477.00  $    24,527.00 

WHEELBASE:  MINIMUM OF 118"
LENGTH:  MINIMUM OF 195"
MINIMUM TIRE SIZE:  16"
MAKE:  Ford  RAM  Ram  Chevrolet  Ford 
MODEL:  TrAnsit  PROMASTER 

1500 CARGO 
VAN 

 1500 Cargo 
VaN Low Roof 

118 WB 

 Express Van - 
Cargo 

 Transit 

SERIES, CODE, TRIM LEVEL:  EIY, XL, 101A  VF1L11, LOW 
ROOF, 118" WB 

 VF1L11 / 21A  2500 - CG23405 -  
Base WT 

 EIY, 101A  

ENGINE (MINIMUM SIZE OF 3.5L V6):  3.5L V6  3.6L V6 24V VVT 
ENG 

 3.6L V6  L96 6.0L V8 
Vortec 

 3.5L 

GVWR (MINIMUM OF 7,200): 8670 8,550 8550 8600 8670
DELIVERY ARO (NUMBER OF DAYS): 90 120 - 150 DAYS 120 to 150 35/120 40 - 120
MSRP AS BID:  $        37,130.00  $        34,090.00  $    34,150.00  $          34,366.25  $    36,975.00 

2 5 EA

OPTIONS:
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E85 AND E15 
AS PRIMARY 

AWARDS
Anderson Ford

Baxter CDJR 
Lincoln

Gene Steffy 
Auto Group

Husker Auto 
Group LLC

Sid Dillon 
Chevrolet 

Buick

E85 AND E15 
AS 

SECONDARY 
AWARDS
Sid Dillon 

Ford

ATTACHMENT C
 2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR FOR HALF TON UTILITY VAN FFV 

E85

3 ENGINE (OTHER) ALTERNATE ENGINE SIZE

SPECIFY ENGINE SIZE:  

5 EA $1,695
3.5L Ecoboost

 N/A  NA  <$497.00>
E10

LV1 4.3L V6 Direct 
Injection 

 $1,772.00
3.5 Ecoboost 

ADDITIONAL ROOF HEIGHT

  

 $          3,995.00 $2,354 MORE NA NA
NA

SPECIFY ROOF HEIGHT: Medium Roof HIGH ROOF 
105.9" TALL

118" WB Low 
Roof Only

NA

LIST ADDITIONAL ROOF HEIGHTS AND PRICING:  100.8" Tall 1500 HIGH 
ROOF 136" WB

$2,354.00 MORE
136 WB HIGH 

ROOF

$1,645.00 MORE
136 WB LOW 

ROOF

LENGTH: 148" Wheelbase 120.6" MORE 
INTERIOR 

CARGO LENGTH 
IN 136" WB

HIGH OR LOW 
ROOF

136 in WB 115.15 Wheel 
Base

SIDE AND REAR DOOR OPTION:  Cargo SAME AS BID yes E24 -50/50
(Rear) 

60/40 (Side)

4 5 EA

ADDITIONAL CARGO LENGTH 5 EA5  $          1,995.00  $       1,644.00  $             1,190.00 
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E85 AND E15 
AS PRIMARY 

AWARDS
Anderson Ford

Baxter CDJR 
Lincoln

Gene Steffy 
Auto Group

Husker Auto 
Group LLC

Sid Dillon 
Chevrolet 

Buick

E85 AND E15 
AS 

SECONDARY 
AWARDS
Sid Dillon 

Ford

ATTACHMENT C
 2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR FOR HALF TON UTILITY VAN FFV 

E85

6 HEAVY DUTY FOAM VINYL SEATS WITH VINYL TRIM AND 
LUMBAR SUPPPORT (DEDUCT) 

5 EA N/A $263.00
HD VINYL W/ 
PWR DRIVER 

LUMBAR SEAT
(DEDUCT)

$245.00 <$31.00> NC

7 MANUFACTURER'S ELECTRIC POWER WINDOWS 5 EA  STD  INCL  STD  Std  Incl 
8 MANUFACTURER'S ELECTRIC POWER DOOR LOCKS 5 EA  STD.  INCL  STD  Std  Incl 
9 GLASS ON LEFT SIDE (NOT LIMITED GLASS PER 

SPECIFICATION)
5 EA  $             495.00  $             619.00  NA

NA ON 188" 
WB 

 NA  NA 

10 STANDARD PAINT - ATTACH LIST AND IDENTIFY AS NO 
ADDITIONAL COST PAINTS

5 EA  STD- See Attch.  SEE ATTACH  STD  See attached  NC  

11 EXTRA COST PAINT - ATTACH LIST AND IDENTIFY AS 
EXTRA COST PAINTS

5 EA $200.00 -
See Attch. 

SEE ATTACH  $          178.00  $                497.00  See attached 

12 MANUFACTURER'S AUTOMATIC SPEED CONTROL  $             325.00 INCL  $          345.00  $                395.00  $          396.00 
13 REVERSE SENSING SYSTEM 5 EA  $             395.00  $             263.00  $          295.00  $                497.00  $          396.00 
14 REAR VISION CAMERA INSTALLED BY DEALER OR 

FACTORY

SPECIFY INSTALLATION TYPE:  

5 EA  STD
factory 

 INCL  STD  Std
GM 

 Incl 

15 REAR WINDOW DEFROSTER INSTALLED BY DEALER (IF 
NOT STANDARD EQUIPMENT)

5 EA  $             175.00  $             174.00  $          195.00  $                197.00  Incl 

16 ADDITIONAL DROP SHIPMENT CHARGES OUTSIDE THE 
LINCOLN AREA (DROP SHIPMENT CHARGES WOULD BE 
FOR VEHICLES PURCHASED BY POLITICAL ENTITES AND 
OTHER DIVISIONS OF GOVERNMENT)

1 MI  $             395.00  $             400.00  $          500.00  $                500.00  $          400.00 
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E85 AND E15 
AS PRIMARY 

AWARDS
Anderson Ford

Baxter CDJR 
Lincoln

Gene Steffy 
Auto Group

Husker Auto 
Group LLC

Sid Dillon 
Chevrolet 

Buick

E85 AND E15 
AS 

SECONDARY 
AWARDS
Sid Dillon 

Ford

ATTACHMENT C
 2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR FOR HALF TON UTILITY VAN FFV 

E85

17 ELECTRONIC STABILITY/ROLLOVER SYSTEM (IF NOT 
STANDARD EQUIPMENT)

5 EA  STD  INCL  STD  Std  Incl 

18 PROTECTIVE VINYL BODY MOLDING (DEALER INSTALLED 
IF NOT STANDARD EQUIPMENT)

5 EA  $             595.00  INCL  NA  $                499.00  $          350.00 

19 FULL CRASH SCREEN 5 EA  $             795.00  $             396.00  $          500.00  $                997.00  $          765.00 
20 FULL CRASH SCREEN WITH CENTER OPENING 5 EA  $             995.00  $             485.00  $          650.00  $                997.00  $          790.00 
21 EQUPMENT AND ENGINE SERVICE REPAIR MANUAL

CIRCLE TYPE(S) OF SERVICE REPAIR MANUAL(S) 
AVAILABLE:

                   PAPER COPY          CD ROM          ON-LINE

5 EA $325.00
CD ROM

THIRD PARTY 
ONLY

ON-LINE

$150.00
CD ROM

NA $395.00
CD ROM

22 EQUPMENT AND ENGINE PARTS MANUAL

CIRCLE TYPE(S) OF PARTS MANUAL(S) AVAILABLE:

                   PAPER COPY          CD ROM          ON-LINE

5 EA N/A THIRD PARTY 
ONLY

ON-LINE

NA NA NA

0  30 0  30 0    15 0  30
90 150 90 to 150 35/120 40-120

NON-RESPONSIVE BIDS
BAXTER CDJR

GENE STEFFY AUTO GROUP
HUSKER AUTO GROUP LLC

DELIVERY DAYS ARO:
COMMENTS:

PAYMENT TERMS:

NO BIDS
THREE (3) NO BIDS FOR LINE 1

ONE (1) NO BID FOR LINE 2


	6138 OF ATTACHMENT C

