
BUYER:  CHRISTIE KELLY 6138 OF
ATTACHMENT A

2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR FOR FWD 7 PASSENGER 4 BUCKET SEAT MINIVAN FFV E85

OPENING DATE: 09/13/2019

1 OF 5

E15 PRIMARY 
AWARD

Baxter CDJR 
Lincoln

Gene Steffy 
Auto Group

Gene Steffy 
Auto Group 

Sid Dillon 
Chevrolet 

Buick
Sid Dillon Ford

LINE 
#

DESCRIPTION QTY UOM UNIT
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR
FWD 7 PASSENGER 4 BUCKET SEAT MINIVAN FFV E85
(E85=UNITS CAPABLE OF OPERATING ON A FUEL MIXTURE OF UP 
TO 85% ETHANOL / 15% UNLEADED GASOLINE WITHOUT 
ADDITIONAL CHANGE OR CONVERSION)

A SEPARATE BID IS REQUESTED IF THE MANUFACTURER IS 
PRODUCING ALTERNATIVE FUEL MOTOR VEHICLES DUE TO  A 
SEPARATE CONTRACT MAY BE AWARDED

 No Bid  $     24,913.00 

WHEELBASE:  MINIMUM OF 102", MAXIMUM OF 106.5"
LENGTH:  MINIMUM OF 173", MAXIMUM OF 187"
MINIMUM TIRE SIZE:  15"
MAKE:  No BiD E85  No Bid  No Bid  Ford 
MODEL:  Transit 

Connect 
SERIES, CODE, TRIM LEVEL:  E9E, 200A, XL 
ENGINE (MINIMUM SIZE OF 1.4L 4 CYL):  2.0L 
DELIVERY ARO (NUMBER OF DAYS):  40 - 120 
MSRP AS BID:  $     29,285.00 
IF UNIT WILL SEAT MORE THAN 7 PASSENGERS SPECIFY NUMBER: 7 

ATTACHMENT A
2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR FOR FWD 7 PASSENGER 4 BUCKET SEAT 

MINIVAN FFV E85

1 45 EA



BUYER:  CHRISTIE KELLY 6138 OF
ATTACHMENT A

2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR FOR FWD 7 PASSENGER 4 BUCKET SEAT MINIVAN FFV E85

OPENING DATE: 09/13/2019

2 OF 5

E15 PRIMARY 
AWARD

Baxter CDJR 
Lincoln

Gene Steffy 
Auto Group

Gene Steffy 
Auto Group 

Sid Dillon 
Chevrolet 

Buick
Sid Dillon Ford

ATTACHMENT A
2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR FOR FWD 7 PASSENGER 4 BUCKET SEAT 

MINIVAN FFV E85

2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR
7 PASSENGER 4 BUCKET SEAT MINIVAN E15 COMPLIANT
(E15=UNITS CAPABLE OF OPERATING ON A FUEL MIXTURE OF UP 
TO 15% ETHANOL / 85% UNLEADED GASOLINE WITHOUT 
ADDITIONAL CHANGE OR CONVERSION)

A SEPARATE BID IS REQUESTED IF THE MANUFACTURER IS 
PRODUCING ALTERNATIVE FUEL MOTOR VEHICLES DUE TO  A 
SEPARATE CONTRACT MAY BE AWARDED

 $   22,220.00  $   22,505.00  $  27,342.00  No Bid  $     24,913.00 

WHEELBASE:  MINIMUM OF 102", MAXIMUM OF 106.5"
LENGTH:  MINIMUM OF 173", MAXIMUM OF 187"
MINIMUM TIRE SIZE:  15"
MAKE:  DODGE  Dodge   Chrysler   Ford 
MODEL:  GRAND 

CARAVAN 
 Grand 

Caravan 
 Voyager  Transit 

Connect 
SERIES, CODE, TRIM LEVEL:  RTKH53, SE  RTKH53, 29S  RUCL53, LX, 

27E 
 E9E, 

ENGINE (MINIMUM SIZE OF 1.4L 4 CYL):  3.6L V6 24V 
VVT ENG 

 3.6L V6  3.6L V6  2.0L 

DELIVERY ARO (NUMBER OF DAYS):  120 - 150 
DAYS 

 120 - 160  120 to 160  40 - 120 

MSRP AS BID:  $   29,926.00  $   29,935.00  $  33,630.00  $     29,285.00 
IF UNIT WILL SEAT MORE THAN 7 PASSENGERS SPECIFY NUMBER: 7 

2

OPTIONS:

THE OPTIONS SHALL MEET OR EXCEED THE FOLLOWING REQUIREMENTS THAT ARE EXCEPTIONS TO SPECIFICATION AND MUST BE FACTORY INSTALLED.  BIDS 
MUST BE FURNISHED IF AVAILABLE FOR ITEMS LISTED BELOW, IF NOT INCLUDED AS "STANDARD EQUIPMENT" OR "REQUIRED" IN MAIN PART OF THE 
SPECIFICAITONS

45 EA
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3 ENGINE (OTHER GAS) ALTERNATE ENGINE SIZE

SPECIFY ENGINE SIZE:

45 EA N/A NA
NA

NA
NA

 $628.00
2.5L 

4 HEAVY DUTY REAR SEATS WITH FOAM RUBBER CUSHIONS AND 
VINYL COVERING.
MUST BE QUICK DISCONNECT.

45 EA N/A NA NA  NC 

5 HEAVY DUTY CLOTH BENCH SEATS (DEDUCT) 45 EA -$1242.00
2ND ROW 

BENCH

 $     1,100.00 NA  NA 

6 LUMBAR SUPPORT FRONT SEATS (IF NOT STANDARD EQUIPMENT) 45 EA $352.00
PWR DRIVER 

ONLY

 $        450.00 STD
STD. Driver 
Seat Only

 NA 

7 POWER ELECTRIC SEATS 45 EA $352.00
PWR DRIVER 

ONLY

 NA STD
Drive Seat 

Only

 NA 

8 DEEP TINT GLASS BACK TO STANDARD TINTED SAFETY GLASS 
(DEDUCT)

45 EA N/A  NA  NA  <$196.00> 

9 FULL-SIZE SPARE TIRE (RIM CAN BE STEEL) 45 EA N/A  NA  NA  Incl 
10 FRONT AND REAR FACTORY FLOOR MATS (DEDUCT) 45 EA  INCL  STD  STD  <$54.00> 
11 PASSENGER TO CARGO IN-FLOOR, SEAT STORAGE CONVERSION 

SYSTEM (IF NOT STANDARD EQUIPMENT)
45 EA  INCL  $     1,395.00  $    1,395.00  Incl 

12 KEYLESS REMOTE ENTRY - SHALL INCLUDE TWO (2) FOBS TO 
ENTER THE VEHICLE 

45 EA  INCL STD STD  Incl 

13 ADDITIONAL FOB IF EQUIPPED WITH KEYLESS REMOTE ENTRY 45 EA  $        250.00  $        250.00  $       200.00  $          189.00 

14 STANDARD PAINT - ATTACH LIST AND IDENTIFY AS NO 
ADDITIONAL COST PAINTS

45 EA  SEE ATTACH  STD  STD  NC 

15 EXTRA COST PAINT - ATTACH LIST AND IDENTIFY AS EXTRA COST 
PAINTS

45 EA  SEE ATTACH  NA  NA  See attached 
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16 SECOND POWER OUTLET IN THE REAR OF THE VEHICLE 45 EA  $        200.00  $       200.00  NA 
17 ALL WHEEL DRIVE (AWD) 45 EA N/A  NA  NA 
18 REVERSE SENSING SYSTEM 45 EA  $        263.00  $        295.00  $       495.00  Incl 
19 REAR VISION CAMERA INSTALLED BY DEALER OR FACTORY 45 EA  INCL STD STD Incl
20 REAR WINDOW DEFROSTER INSTALLED BY DEALER (IF NOT 

STANDARD EQUIPMENT)
45 EA  INCL STD STD NA

21 ADDITIONAL DROP SHIPMENT CHARGES OUTSIDE THE LINCOLN 
AREA (DROP SHIPMENT CHARGES WOULD BE FOR VEHICLES 
PURCHASED BY POLITICAL ENTITES AND OTHER DIVISIONS OF 
GOVERNMENT)

1 MI  $        400.00  $        500.00  $       500.00  $          400.00 

22 ELECTRONIC STABILITY/ROLLOVER SYSTEM (IF NOT STANDARD 
EQUIPMENT)

45 EA  INCL STD STD Incl

23 PROTECTIVE SAFETY CAGE BEHIND THE DRIVER'S SEAT 45 EA N/A NA NA  $          770.00 
24 PROTECTIVE VINYL BODY MOLDING (DEALER INSTALLED IF NOT 

STANDARD EQUIPMENT)
45 EA N/A NA NA  $          350.00 

25 EQUPMENT AND ENGINE SERVICE REPAIR MANUAL.

CIRCLE TYPE(S) OF SERVICE REPAIR MANUAL(S) AVAILABLE:

                   PAPER COPY          CD ROM          ON-LINE

45 EA THird party
ON-LINE

$150.00
CD ROM

$150.00
CD ROM

 $          395.00 

26 EQUPMENT AND ENGINE PARTS REPAIR MANUAL.

CIRCLE TYPE(S) OF PARTS MANUAL(S) AVAILABLE:

                   PAPER COPY          CD ROM          ON-LINE

45 EA THird party
ON-LINE

NA NA NA

0  30 0  30 0  30
150 90 to 150 90 to 150 40-120

PAYMENT TERMS:
DELIVERY DAYS ARO:

COMMENTS:
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NON-RESPONSIVE BIDS
GENE STEFFY DODGE GRAND CARAVAN

GENE STEFFY CHRYSLER VOYAGER

NO BIDS
FOUR (4) NO BIDS FOR LINE 1

ONE (1) NO BID FOR LINE 2
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