BUYER: CHRISTIE KELLY 6133 OF OPENING DATE: 09/27/19
ATTACHMENT D
2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR FOR HALF TON REGULAR CAB 4X4 FFV E85 (REGULAR)
ATTACHMENT D —
2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR FOR HALF TON REGULAR CAB 4X4| Anderson Ford | S2Xt€"CDJR | GeneSteffy | Husker Auto SidDillon ~ 1 i billon Ford
FFV E85 (REGULAR) Lincoln Auto Group Group LLC Chevrolet Buick
LINE # DESCRIPTION QTY[uom UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 |2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR 11| EA | S 28,986.00 No - Bid No Bid S 30,260.00
HALF TON REGULAR CAB 4X4 TRUCK FFV E85
(REGULAR)
(E85=UNITS CAPABLE OF OPERATING ON A FUEL
MIXTURE OF UP TO 85% ETHANOL / 15% UNLEADED
GASOLINE WITHOUT ADDITIONAL CHANGE OR
CONVERSION)
A SEPARATE BID IS REQUESTED IF THE
MANUFACTURER IS PRODUCING ALTERNATIVE FUEL
MOTOR VEHICLES DUE TO A SEPARATE CONTRACT
MAY BE AWARDED
WHEELBASE: MINIMUM OF 133"
TIRE SIZE: MINIMUM OF 17"
MAKE: Ford NO BID E85 No Bid Ford
MODEL: F150 F-150
SERIES, CODE, TRIM LEVEL: F1E, 300A, XLT F1E, 300A, XLT
ENGINE (MINIMUM SIZE OF 5.0L V8): 5.0LV8 5.0L
GVWR (MINIMUM OF 6,600): 6,950 6950
TRANSMISSION #/GEAR RATION #: 10 Speed 44G, 10 speed
Auto/3.31
DELIVERY ARO (NUMBER OF DAYS): 90 40 - 120
MSRP AS BID: S 43,320.00 S 43.780.00
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BUYER: CHRISTIE KELLY 6133 OF OPENING DATE: 09/27/19
ATTACHMENT D
2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR FOR HALF TON REGULAR CAB 4X4 FFV E85 (REGULAR)
ATTACHMENT D L.
2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR FOR HALF TON REGULAR CAB 4X4| Anderson Ford | S2Xt€"CDJR | GeneSteffy | Husker Auto SidDillon ~ 1 i billon Ford
FFV E85 (REGULAR) Lincoln Auto Group Group LLC Chevrolet Buick
2 2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR 11 EA | S 28,986.00( S 28,695.00| S 27,771.00 No - Bid No Bid S 30,260.00
HALF TON REGULAR CAB 4X4 TRUCK E15 COMPLIANT
(REGULAR)
(E15=UNITS CAPABLE OF OPERATING ON A FUEL
MIXTURE OF UP TO 15% ETHANOL / 85% UNLEADED
GASOLINE WITHOUT ADDITIONAL CHANGE OR
CONVERSION)
A SEPARATE BID IS REQUESTED IF THE
MANUFACTURER IS PRODUCING ALTERNATIVE FUEL
MOTOR VEHICLES. A SEPARATE CONTRACT MAY BE
AWARDED.
WHEELBASE: MINIMUM OF 133"
TIRE SIZE: MINIMUM OF 17"
MAKE: Ford RAM Ram Ford
MODEL: F150 1500 CLASSIC, | 1500 Classic SLT F-150
REG CAB,
8' BOX
SERIES, CODE, TRIM LEVEL: F1E, 300A, XLT DS6H62, SLT DS6H62 F1E, 300A, XLT
ENGINE (MINIMUM SIZE OF 5.0L V8): 5.0L V8 5.7L V8 HEMI 5.7L V8 5.0L
MDS
GVWR (MINIMUM OF 6,600): 6,950 6,600 6,600 6950
TRANSMISSION #/GEAR RATION #: 10 - Speed 4X4, 3.92 845RE /3.21 44G, 10 speed
Auto/3.31
DELIVERY ARO (NUMBER OF DAYS): 90 90 - 120 DAYS 90 to 120 40-120
MSRP AS BID: S 43,320.00| $ 43,860.00 | S 42,250.00 S 43,780.00
OPTIONS:
THE OPTIONS SHALL MEET OR EXCEED THE FOLLOWING REQUIREMENTS THAT ARE EXCEPTIONS TO SPECIFICATION AND MUST BE FACTORY INSTALLED. BIDS MUST BE FURNISHED IF
AVAILABLE FOR ITEMS LISTED BELOW, IF NOT INCLUDED AS "STANDARD EQUIPMENT" OR "REQUIRED" IN MAIN PART OF THE SPECIFICAITONS
3 ENGINE (OTHER GAS) ALTERNATE ENGINE SIZE 11 EA $995.00 -$1,751.00 $26,022.00 $2,595.00
3.5L V6 Ecoboost| 3.6L V6 24V VVT 3.6L 3.5L Ecoboost
SPECIFY ENGINE SIZE:
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BUYER: CHRISTIE KELLY 6133 OF OPENING DATE: 09/27/19
ATTACHMENT D
2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR FOR HALF TON REGULAR CAB 4X4 FFV E85 (REGULAR)
ATTACHMENT D .
2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR FOR HALF TON REGULAR CAB 4X4| Anderson Ford | S2Xt€"CDJR | GeneSteffy | Husker Auto SidDillon ~ 1 i billon Ford
FFV E85 (REGULAR) Lincoln Auto Group Group LLC Chevrolet Buick
4 ENGINE (OTHER DIESEL) INCLUDING BLOCK HEATER, 11 EA N/A N/A NA NA
FACTORY OR DEALER INSTALLED NA
SPECIFY ENGINE SIZE:
5 PICKUP BOX LENGTH MINIMUM OF 6.4' (76") WITH 11 EA <$200.00> INCL S 27,508.00 NA
CORRESPONDING WHEELBASE 8ft BOX BED
SPECIFY DEMENSIONS OF BOX BID:
LENGTH: 78.9" 98.3" 6.'4" 76"
WIDTH: 65.2" 66.4" 63"
WIDTH BETWEEN WHEEL WELLS: 50.6" 51" 51"
6 |FACTORY BED LINER FOR REAR BOX OF TRUCK 11 EA $550.00 S 541.00 $595.00 $475.00
-Spray -in Spray - in
7 |CARGO LIGHT IN THE BOX AREA 11 EA STD S 132.00 STD Incl
8 |40-20-40 OR 60-40 VINYL BENCH SEAT WITH LUMBAR | 11 EA 0 INCL NA NA
SUPPORT (DEDUCT)
9 |40-20-40 OR 60-40 BENCH SEAT WITH DRIVER POWER| 11 EA | S 350.00 INCL S 900.00 S 350.00
CONTROLLED SEAT
10 |VINYL COVERED BUCKET TYPE SEATS WITH ARM 11 EA N/A N/A NA NA
RESTS ON THE RIGHT AND LEFT SIDES OF SEAT
11 |CLOTH BUCKET TYPE SEATS WITH VINYL TRIM AND 11 EA N/A S 1,178.00| $ 1,300.00 NA
ARM RESTS ON THE RIGHT AND LEFT SIDES OF SEAT
12 |ELECTRONIC COMPASS/TEMP DISPLAY (DEDUCT) 11 EA N/A INCL NA NA
13 |LUMBAR SUPPORT FRONT SEATS 11 EA STD - Driver INCL $900.00 S 350.00
(IF NOT STANDARD EQUIPMENT) Driver side only
14 |SLIDING REAR VISION WINDOW (DEALER 11 EA | S 395.00| S 177.00| S 195.00 NA
INSTALLATION ACCEPTABLE)
15 |KEYLESS REMOTE ENTRY INCLUDING TWO (2) 11 EA STD INCL STD Incl
FOBS/KEYS TO ENTER THE VEHICLE
16 |ADDITIONAL FOB IF EQUIPPED WITH KEYLESS 11 EA | S 295.00| S 250.00( $ 250.00 S 189.00
REMOTE ENTRY
17 |STANDARD PAINT - ATTACH LIST AND IDENTIFY ASNO| 11 EA STD. SEE ATTACH STD NC
ADDITIONAL COST PAINTS
18 |EXTRA COST PAINT - ATTACH LIST AND IDENTIFY AS 11 EA | S 395.00 SEE ATTACH S 450.00 see attached
EXTRA COST PAINTS
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BUYER: CHRISTIE KELLY 6133 OF OPENING DATE: 09/27/19
ATTACHMENT D
2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR FOR HALF TON REGULAR CAB 4X4 FFV E85 (REGULAR)

ATTACHMENT D

2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR FOR HALF TON REGULAR CAB 4X4| Anderson Ford

FFV E85 (REGULAR)

19 [FOR NDOT USE: YELLOW COLOR OF DODGE #PL1, 11| EA [$ 1,195.00 NA $ 660.00

FORD #84553, CHEVROLET/GMC #WA-253A CODE

(9W3) IF NOT STANDARD/NO CHARGE COLOR. NO
MINIMUM ORDER REQUIRED

Baxter CDJR Gene Steffy Husker Auto Sid Dillon

Sid Dillon Ford
Lincoln Auto Group Group LLC Chevrolet Buick el

20 |TWO (2) WHEEL DRIVE MODEL, TO INCLUDE ALL 11 | EA <$2,495.00> N/A -$3,829.00 <$1,254.00>
SEASON TIRES (DEDUCT)

21 |NON-STANDARD GEAR RATIO(S) 11 | EA $570.00 N/A $125.00 $570.00

3.73 E-locking 3.92 3.73

SPECIFY:

22 |ON/OFF ROAD MUD AND SNOW ALL TERRAIN TIRES 11 | EA $795.00 $228.00 $300.00 $295.00
AND SPARE (CAN BE STEEL RIM) 265/70R 17 LT265/70R17E | LT265/70R17E LT 245/
MINIMUM WHEEL SIZE OF 17" BSW A/T BSW A/T 70R17E

SPECIFY SIZE AND PLY RATING:

23 |ON/OFF ROAD TIRE WITH A LOAD RANGE C 11 | EA N/A N/A NA NA
MINIMUM THAT MEETS THE REQUIRED SIZE AND
GVWR OF THE VEHICLE

SPECIFY SIZE:

24 |INTEGRATED BRAKE CONTROLLER SYSTEM 11 | EA STD. INCL STD S 275.00
(DEALER INSTALLED IF NOT STANDARD EQUIPMENT)

25 |REVERSE SENSING SYSTEM 11| EA | S 275.00 INCL S 300.00 S 275.00
26 |REARVISION CAMERA 11| EA | S 295.00 INCL STD Incl
(DEALER OR FACTORY INSTALLED)

27 |SECOND POWER OUTLET 11 | EA STD INCL 150 Incl
28 [TOWING PACKAGE UPGRADE 11| EA | S 995.00 INCL NA NA

EQUIPMENT: Pro-Trailer Assist

/ Engine oil
cooler
HITCH CLASS: [\
MAXIMUM TRAILER WEIGHT: 9,100
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BUYER: CHRISTIE KELLY 6133 OF OPENING DATE: 09/27/19
ATTACHMENT D
2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR FOR HALF TON REGULAR CAB 4X4 FFV E85 (REGULAR)

ATTACHMENT D
2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR FOR HALF TON REGULAR CAB 4X4| Anderson Ford | S2Xt€"CDJR | GeneSteffy | Husker Auto SidDillon ~ 1 i billon Ford
FFV E85 (REGULAR) Lincoln Auto Group Group LLC Chevrolet Buick

29 |FRONT END ATTACHED TOW HOOKS (IF NOT 11 EA STD INCL STD S 350.00
STANDARD FROM FACTORY)

30 |TRAILER TOWING PACKAGE (DEDUCT) 11 EA <$95.00> INCL S 550.00 <$316.00>

31 |TRAILER SWAY CONTROL SYSTEM (IF NOT STANDARD | 11 EA STD INCL STD NA
EQUIPMENT)

32 |TAILGATE STEP (DEALER OR FACTORY INSTALLED) 11 EA | S 375.00 N/A S 425.00 S 375.00

33 |SMALLER FUEL TANK SIZE (DEDUCT) 11 EA <$200.00> N/A NA <$292.00>
SPECIFY GALLONS: 23 23

34 |PROTECTIVE VINYL BODY MOLDING 11 EA | S 495.00] $ 246.00( $ 275.00 S 350.00
(DEALER INSTALLED IF NOT STANDARD EQUIPMENT)

35 |MANUFACTURER'S WIRELESS BLUETOOTH 11 EA N/A INCL STD NA
TECHNOLOGY (DEDUCT)

36 |EQUIPMENT AND ENGINE SERVICE REPAIR MANUALS | 11 EA $295.00 THIRD PARTY $150.00 $295.00
CHECK OPTION(S) AVAILABLE: CD ROM ONLINE CD ROM CD ROM
__ PAPERCOPY ____CDROM _____ ONLINE

37 |EQUIPMENT AND ENGINE PARTS MANUALS 11 EA N/A THIRD PARTY NA NA
CHECK OPTION(S) AVAILABLE: ONLINE
_____ PAPERCOPY ____CDROM ____ ONLINE

38 |ADDITIONAL COSTS FOR WARRANTIES FROM 11 EA $2,995.00 $3,200.00 $2,695.00 Call for options
MANUFACTURER 5 years/ 6 YR/75,000 5YR 100,000

100,000 miles Bumper to
SPECIFY YEARS AND MILES: Premium CAre Bumper 100
Ded.

39 |ADDITIONAL DROP SHIPMENT CHARGES OUTSIDE THE| 1 MI | S 395.00( S 400.00( $ 500.00 S 400.00
LINCOLN AREA
(DROP SHIPMENT CHARGES WOULD BE FOR VEHICLES
PURCHASED BY POLITICAL ENTITES AND OTHER
DIVISIONS OF GOVERNMENT)

PAYMENT TERMS: 0 30 0 30 0 15 0 30
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BUYER: CHRISTIE KELLY 6133 OF OPENING DATE: 09/27/19
ATTACHMENT D
2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR FOR HALF TON REGULAR CAB 4X4 FFV E85 (REGULAR)
ATTACHMENT D Baxter CDJR Gene Steffy Husker Auto Sid Dillon
2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR FOR HALF TON REGULAR CAB 4X4| Anderson Ford Lincoln Auto Group Group LLC Chevrolet Buick Sid Dillon Ford
FFV E85 (REGULAR)
DELIVERY DAYS ARO: 90 120 90 to 120 35/120 40-120
COMMENTS:
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