BUYER: CHRISTIE KELLY 6132 OF OPENING DATE: 09/06/2019
ATTACHMENT C
2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR LARGE SUV 7 PASSENGER FFV E85
ATTACHMENT C Anderson Ford | Baxter CDJR | Gene Steffy | Husker Auto | Husker Auto Sid Dillon Sid Dillion
2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR LARGE SUV 7 PASSENGER FFV E85 Auto Group Group LLC Group LLC Chevrolet Ford
#1 #2 Buick
LINE DESCRIPTION QTY | UOM UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
# PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 (2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR 22 | EA NA $ 40,274.00 No Bid No Bid
LARGE SUV 7 PASSENGER FFV E85
(E85=UNITS CAPABLE OF OPERATING ON A FUEL
MIXTURE OF UP TO 85% ETHANOL /15%
UNLEADED GASOLINE WITHOUT ADDITIONAL
CHANGE OR CONVERSION)
A SEPARATE BID IS REQUESTED IF THE
MANUFACTURER IS PRODUCING ALTERNATIVE
FUEL MOTOR VEHICLES DUE TO A SEPARATE
CONTRACT MAY BE AWARDED
WHEELBASE: MINIMUM OF 116"
TIRE SIZE: MINIMUM OF 17"
MAKE: N/A No Bid No Bid NO-Bid Cheverolet Chevrolet
MODEL: N/A Tahoe Tahoe
SERIES, CODE, TRIM LEVEL: - Tahoe - CK15706, 1FL
CK15706 1FL
ENGINE (MINIMUM SIZE OF 3.5L V6): - L83 5.3L 5.3L
EcoTec V8
4X4 OR AWD: - 4X4 4X4
DELIVERY ARO (NUMBER OF DAYS): - 35/120 40-120
MSRP AS BID: - S 51,286.25
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BUYER: CHRISTIE KELLY 6132 OF OPENING DATE: 09/06/2019
ATTACHMENT C
2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR LARGE SUV 7 PASSENGER FFV E85
ATTACHMENT C Anderson Ford | Baxter CDJR | Gene Steffy | Husker Auto | Husker Auto Sid Dillon Sid Dillion
2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR LARGE SUV 7 PASSENGER FFV E85 Auto Group Group LLC Group LLC Chevrolet Ford
#1 #2 Buick
2 [2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR 22 EA | S 28,544.00( $ 30,086.00| S 27,085.00 NA to E15 S 40,274.00 No Bid S 40,993.00
LARGE SUV 7 PASSENGER FFV E15 COMPLIANT $27,677.00
(E15=UNITS CAPABLE OF OPERATING ON A FUEL E10
MIXTURE OF UP TO 15% ETHANOL / 85%
UNLEADED GASOLINE WITHOUT ADDITIONAL
CHANGE OR CONVERSION)
A SEPARATE BID IS REQUESTED IF THE
MANUFACTURER IS PRODUCING ALTERNATIVE
FUEL MOTOR VEHICLES. A SEPARATE CONTRACT
MAY BE AWARDED.
WHEELBASE: MINIMUM OF 116"
TIRE SIZE: MINIMUM OF 17"
MAKE: Ford Dodge Dodge Chevrolet Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford
MODEL: Explorer Durango Durango Traverse Tahoe Tahoe Expedition
SERIES, CODE, TRIM LEVEL: K8B, Base WDEL75, SXT,| WDEL75 SXT Traverse - Tahoe- CK15706 - UIG, 100A, XL
AWD INV56 - 1FL - | CK15706 1FL 1FL
LS
ENGINE (MINIMUM SIZE OF 3.5L V6): 3.3LTi-VCTV6 | 3.6LV6 24V 3.6L LFY 3.6L V6 L83 5.3L 5.3L 3.5L
VVT w/ESS VVT SIDI EcoTec V8 Ecoboost
4X4 OR AWD: 4X4 AWD AWD AWD 4X4 4X4 4X4
DELIVERY ARO (NUMBER OF DAYS): 90 120-150 Days 90 to 120 35/120 35/120 40-120 40-120
MSRP AS BID: S 36,005.00( $ 35,685.00| S 37,470.00| $ 37,101.25| S 51,286.25 S 55,770.00
OPTIONS:

THE OPTIONS SHALL MEET OR EXCEED THE FOLLOWING REQUIREMENTS THAT ARE EXCEPTIONS TO SPECIFICATION AND MUST BE FACTORY INSTALLED. BIDS MUST
BE FURNISHED IF AVAILABLE FOR ITEMS LISTED BELOW, IF NOT INCLUDED AS "STANDARD EQUIPMENT" OR "REQUIRED" IN MAIN PART OF THE SPECIFICAITONS
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BUYER: CHRISTIE KELLY 6132 OF OPENING DATE: 09/06/2019
ATTACHMENT C
2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR LARGE SUV 7 PASSENGER FFV E85
ATTACHMENT C Anderson Ford | Baxter CDJR | Gene Steffy | Husker Auto | Husker Auto Sid Dillon Sid Dillion
2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR LARGE SUV 7 PASSENGER FFV E85 Auto Group Group LLC Group LLC Chevrolet Ford
#1 #2 Buick
3 |ENGINE GASOLINE (OTHER) 22 | EA $995.00 S 43,332.00 NA NA NA NA NA
2.3L Ecoboost NA NA
SPECIFY ENGINE SIZE:
4 |HEAVY DUTY BENCH FRONT SEAT WITH LUMBAR 22 | EA N/A N/A NA NA NA NA NA
SUPPORT (DEDUCT)
40-40 MANUAL CLOTH BUCKET SEATS 22 | EA N/A INCL STD Std $299.00 NA NA
40-40 POWER BUCKET ELECTRIC SEATS 22 | EA | Power - Driver N/A NA Std S 299.00| $ 450.00| $330.00
Drivers only Drivers
7 |THIRD REAR SEAT REMOVED (DEDUCT) 22 | EA N/A -$0.00 -$900.00 NA <$289.00> NA <$566.00>
8 |CONSOLE BETWEEN FRONT SEATS (DEDUCT) 22 | EA N/A INCL STD NA NA NA NA
9 [LUMBAR SUPPORT FRONT SEATS (IF NOT 22 | EA STD INCL $ 450.00 Std Std Incl Incl
STANDARD EQUIPMENT) Drivers only
10 |KEYLESS REMOTE ENTRY LOCK SYSTEM TO 22 | EA STD INCL STD Std Std Incl Incl
INCLUDE TWO (2) FOBS (IF NOT STANDARD
EQUIPMENT)
11 |ADDITIONAL REMOTE FOB FROM 22| EA | S 275.00( $ 250.00] $ 250.00( $ 189.00( $ 189.00| $ 169.00| $ 189.00
MANUFACTURER
12 |STANDARD PAINT - ATTACH LIST AND IDENTIFYAS | 22 | EA STD INCL STD See attached | See attached NC NC
NO ADDITIONAL COST PAINTS
13 |EXTRA COST PAINT - ATTACH LIST AND IDENTIFY 22 | EA N/C INCL NA NA $ 499.00 | See Attached| See Attached
AS EXTRA COST PAINTS
14 |DUAL MODE TEMP SYSTEM FOR THE INTERIOR (IF | 22 | EA N/C INCL STD Std Std NA NA
NOT STANDARD EQUIPMENT)
15 |SECOND POWER OUTLET 22 | EA STD INCL STD Std Std NA Incl
16 |TRAILER TOWING PACKAGE (DEDUCT) 22 | EA <$150.00> - -$900.00 NA NA <$776.00>
See PG 3 of
Attachment C
17 [ELECTRONIC STABILITY/ROLL OVER TRACTION 22 | EA STD INCL STD Std Std Incl Incl
CONTROL SYSTEM (IF NOT STANDARD
EQUIPMENT)
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BUYER: CHRISTIE KELLY 6132 OF OPENING DATE: 09/06/2019
ATTACHMENT C
2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR LARGE SUV 7 PASSENGER FFV E85
ATTACHMENT C Anderson Ford | Baxter CDJR | Gene Steffy | Husker Auto | Husker Auto Sid Dillon Sid Dillion
2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR LARGE SUV 7 PASSENGER FFV E85 Auto Group Group LLC Group LLC Chevrolet Ford
#1 #2 Buick
18 |TWO (2) WHEEL DRIVE MODEL (DEDUCT) 22 | EA N/A -$2,361.00 -$1,061.00 <$899.00>
RWD, MODEL RWD FWD

SPECIFY IF BIDDING FWD OR RWD: WDDL75
19 |PROTECTIVE SAFETY CAGE, POSITION 22| EA | S 795.00 N/A NA $1,097.00 $1,097.00

DETERMINED BY THE FLEET MANAGER
20 |REVERSE SENSING SYSTEM 22 EA | S 395.00 $2,155.00 NA Std Std Incl S 310.00

MUST ORDER
MODEL
WDEH75
AWD

21 |REAR VISION CAMERA (IF NOT STANDARD 22 | EA STD INCL STD Std Std Incl Incl

EQUIPMENT)
22 |REAR WINDOW DEFROSTER (DEALER INSTALLED) 22 | EA Std INCL STD NA NA NA Incl
23 |BRAKE CONTROLLER SYSTEM (IF NOT STANDARD 22| EA | S 295.00 N/A $ 1,200.00 $397.00 $1297.00 NA 1,570.00

EQUIPMENT) Dealer Requires NHT

Max Trailering

24 |ADDITIONAL DROP SHIPMENT CHARGES OUTSIDE | 1 [ MI | $ 395.00( $ 400.00( $ 500.00 $ 500.00| $ 500.00( $ 400.00( $ 400.00

THE LINCOLN AREA (DROP SHIPMENT CHARGES

WOULD BE FOR VEHICLES PURCHASED BY

POLITICAL ENTITES AND OTHER DIVISIONS OF

GOVERNMENT)
25 |PROTECTIVE VINYL BODY MOLDING (DEALER 22| EA | S 495.00 N/A $ 350.00( $ 327.00( $ 327.00( S 350.00( $ 350.00

INSTALLED IF NOT STANDARD EQUIPMENT)

PAYMENT TERMS: 0 90 0 30 0 15 0 15 0 30 0 30
DELIVERY DAYS ARO: 90 150 90/160 40-120 40-120
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OPENING DATE: 09/06/2019

BUYER: CHRISTIE KELLY 6132 OF
ATTACHMENT C
2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR LARGE SUV 7 PASSENGER FFV E85
ATTACHMENT C Anderson Ford | Baxter CDJR | Gene Steffy | Husker Auto | Husker Auto Sid Dillon Sid Dillion
2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR LARGE SUV 7 PASSENGER FFV E85 Auto Group Group LLC Group LLC Chevrolet Ford
#1 #2 Buick
COMMENTS: Line 3: FOR 2020 Model
V8, MUST year Build out
ORDER approx 1st of
MODEL Oct. 2019
WDEP75 2021 model
W/V8 HEMI year order
5.7L W/MDS acceptance
AWD, INCL approx Oct
TOW PKG 2020
W/6,200 Ib
TOW
CAPACITY
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