
BUYER:  CHRISTIE KELLY 6131 OF
ATTACHMENT B

2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR MODEL FOR INTERMEDIATE 4 DOOR SEDAN FFV E85

OPENING DATE: 08/30/19

1 OF 3

Baxter CDJR
Sid Dillon 

Chevrolet Buick
Sid Dillon Ford

LINE # DESCRIPTION QTY UOM
2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR
INTERMEDIATE 4 DOOR SEDAN FFV E85
(E85=UNITS CAPABLE OF OPERATING ON A FUEL MIXTURE OF UP TO 85% 
ETHANOL / 15% UNLEADED GASOLINE WITHOUT ADDITIONAL CHANGE 
OR CONVERSION)

A SEPARATE BID IS REQUESTED IF THE MANUFACTURER IS PRODUCING 
ALTERNATIVE FUEL MOTOR VEHICLES DUE TO  A SEPARATE CONTRACT 
MAY BE AWARDED

WHEELBASE:  MINIMUM OF 110", MAXIMUM OF 120.5"
LENGTH:  MINIMUM OF 196"
TIRE SIZE:  MINIMUM OF 16"

MAKE:
MODEL:
SERIES, CODE, TRIM LEVEL:
ENGINE (MINIMUM SIZE OF 3.5L 4 CYL)
EPA:
DELIVERY ARO (NUMBER OF DAYS):
MSRP AS BID:  NO BID 

 NO BID  NO BID  NA
NO BID 

 NO BID 

ATTACHMENT "B"
2020 or CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR MODEL

INTERMEDIATE 4 DOOR SEDAN FFV E85

1 59 EA

AWARD
Gene Steffy Auto Group

(contains Regular bid and 
Alternate bid for Line 2)
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Baxter CDJR
Sid Dillon 

Chevrolet Buick
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ATTACHMENT "B"
2020 or CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR MODEL

INTERMEDIATE 4 DOOR SEDAN FFV E85

AWARD
Gene Steffy Auto Group

(contains Regular bid and 
Alternate bid for Line 2)

2020 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR 
INTERMEDIATE 4 DOOR SEDAN E15 COMPLIANT
(E15=UNITS CAPABLE OF OPERATING ON A FUEL MIXTURE OF UP TO 15% 
ETHANOL / 85% UNLEADED GASOLINE WITHOUT ADDITIONAL CHANGE 
OR CONVERSION)

A SEPARATE BID IS REQUESTED IF THE MANUFACTURER IS PRODUCING 
ALTERNATIVE FUEL MOTOR VEHICLES DUE TO  A SEPARATE CONTRACT 
MAY BE AWARDED.

WHEELBASE:  MINIMUM OF 110", MAXIMUM OF 120.5"
LENGTH:  MINIMUM OF 196"
TIRE SIZE:  MINIMUM OF 16"

 $         22,926.00  $         24,929.00  $        17,633.00  $        18,693.00 

MAKE:  Dodge  Dodge  Dodge  Chevrolet  Ford 
MODEL:  Charger RWD  Charger AWD  Charger  Malibu  Fusion 
SERIES, CODE, TRIM LEVEL:  LDDM48 SXT 

RWD 
 LDES48 SXT 

AWD 
 LDES48, SXT, 

AWD 
 1FL,  P0H-SE 

ENGINE (MINIMUM SIZE OF 3.5L 4 CYL):  3.6L V6  3.6L V6  3.6L V6 24V VVT  1.5L  2.5L 

EPA:  18 City/27 Hwy  18 City 27 Hwy  19 City/30 Hwy  29 City-32 Hwy  21 City-25 Hwy 

DELIVERY ARO (NUMBER OF DAYS): 120-160 120-160  120-150 Days  40-90  40-120 
MSRP AS BID:  $         22,926.00  $         24,929.00  $        24,579.00  $        24,061.00  $        25,715.00 

3 ENGINE (OTHER)

SPECIFY ENGINE SIZE: 

59 EA  NA  1.5L
NC 

4 HEAVY DUTY BENCH FRONT SEAT 59 EA  NA  NA 
5 HEAVY DUTY SPLIT FRONT SEAT 59 EA  NA  NA 

2 59 EA

NA

NA
NA

OPTIONS:

THE OPTIONS SHALL MEET OR EXCEED THE FOLLOWING REQUIREMENTS THAT ARE EXCEPTIONS TO SPECIFICATION AND MUST BE FACTORY INSTALLED.  BIDS MUST BE FURNISHED IF 
AVAILABLE FOR ITEMS LISTED BELOW, IF NOT INCLUDED AS "STANDARD EQUIPMENT" OR "REQUIRED" IN MAIN PART OF THE SPECIFICATIONS
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6 POWER HEAVY DUTY SPLIT FRONT SEATS 59 EA  $945.00
Drivers Side-

Bucket 

 INCL 

7 LUMBAR SUPPORT FRONT SEATS (IF NOT STANDARD EQUIPMENT) 59  EA  INCL  $              945.00  INCL 

8 FULL-SIZE SPARE TIRE (RIM CAN BE STEEL) 59 EA  INCL  $              245.00 

9 KEYLESS REMOTE ENTRY - SHALL INCLUDE TWO (2) FOBS TO ENTER THE 
VEHICLE 

59  EA  INCL  INCL  INCL 

10 ADDITIONAL FOB IF EQUIPPED WITH KEYLESS REMOTE ENTRY 59 EA  $              200.00  $              169.00  $              169.00 
11 STANDARD PAINT - ATTACH LIST AND IDENTIFY AS NO ADDITIONAL COST 

PAINTS
59 EA  NC  NC 

12 EXTRA COST PAINT - ATTACH LIST AND IDENTIFY AS EXTRA COST PAINTS 59 EA  See Attached  See Attached 

13 ALL WHEEL DRIVE (AWD) 59 EA INCL  NA  $           3,969.00 
14 REVERSE SENSING SYSTEM 59 EA  INCL  $              545.00  INCL 
15 REAR VISION CAMERA IF NOT STANDARD EQUIPMENT 59 EA  INCL  INCL  INCL 
16 ADDITIONAL COSTS FOR WARRANTIES FROM MANUFACTURER

SPECIFY YEARS AND MILES: 

59 EA  Call
Call for Options 

 Call
Call for Options 

17 ADDITIONAL DROP SHIPMENT CHARGES OUTSIDE THE LINCOLN AREA 
(DROP SHIPMENT CHARGES WOULD BE FOR VEHICLES PURCHASED BY 

1 MI  $              400.00  $              400.00  $              400.00 

18 PROTECTIVE VINYL BODY MOLDING (DEALER INSTALLED IF NOT 
STANDARD EQUIPMENT)

59 EA  $              350.00  $              350.00 

0 30 0 30
120 40-120 40-120

BIDS FROM THE BELOW VENDORS WERE NON-RESPONSIVE
BAXTER CDJR 

SID DILLON CHEVROLET BUICK
SID DILLON FORD

COMMENTS:

NA

 STD
Drivers Side Only 

 NA
Compact 

 STD  

 $                                               250.00 
STD

NO BIDS
HUSKER AUTO GROUP LLC

0 30
120/160

 $                                           2,003.00 
 STD 
STD

 $3,095.00
5yrs 100,000 max care 100. ded 

 $                                               500.00 

 NA 

 $                                                 70.00 

PAYMENT TERMS:
DELIVERY DAYS ARO:


	6131 OF ATTACHMENT B

