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Description Qty UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

1 50W UHF TRANSMITTER, 
CHANNEL 14 1 EA  $        7,840.00  $        7,840.00  $      17,700.00  $      17,700.00  $        7,258.31  $        7,258.31 

2
EXTERNAL HARMONIC 
FILTER (IF REQUIRED) 
CHANNEL 14

1 EA  N/A  Included   Included   $           841.70  $           841.70 

3 MASK FILTER, CHANNEL 14 1 EA  $        1,311.25  $        1,311.25  $        1,200.00  $        1,200.00  $           988.64  $           988.64 

4 50W UHF TRANSMITTER, 
CHANNEL 20 1 EA  $        7,840.00  $        7,840.00  $      17,700.00  $      17,700.00  $        7,908.31  $        7,908.31 

5
EXTERNAL HARMONIC 
FILTER (IF REQUIRED) 
CHANNEL 20

1 EA  N/A  Included   Included   $           841.70  $           841.70 

6 MASK FILTER, CHANNEL 20 1 EA  $        1,311.25  $        1,311.25  $        1,200.00  $        1,200.00  $           988.64  $           988.64 

7 50W UHF TRANSMITTER, 
CHANNEL 24 1 EA  $        7,840.00  $        7,840.00  $      17,700.00  $      17,700.00  $        6,258.31  $        6,258.31 

8
EXTERNAL HARMONIC 
FILTER (IF REQUIRED) 
CHANNEL 24 

1 EA  N/A  Included   Included   $           841.70  $           841.70 

9 MASK FILTER, CHANNEL 24 1 EA  $        1,311.25  $        1,311.25  $        1,200.00  $        1,200.00  $           988.64  $           988.64 

10 100W VHF TRANSMITTER, 
CHANNEL 6 1 EA  $        8,160.00  $        8,160.00  $      24,385.00  $      24,385.00  No Bid   No Bid  

Li
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Hitachi Kofusai Electric Comark 
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11
EXTERNAL HARMONIC 
FILTER (IF REQUIRED) 
CHANNEL 6

1 EA  N/A  Included   Included   No Bid   No Bid  

12 MASK FILTER, CHANNEL 6 1 EA  $        1,738.66  $        1,738.66  $        1,452.00  $        1,452.00  No Bid   No Bid  

13 100W VHF TRANSMITTER, 
CHANNEL 10 1 EA  $        8,160.00  $        8,160.00  $      24,385.00  $      24,385.00  $      19,900.00  $      19,900.00 

14
EXTERNAL HARMONIC 
FILTER(IF REQUIRED) 
CHANNEL 10 

1 EA  N/A  Included   Included  $              0.00 $              0.00

15 MASK FILTER, CHANNEL 10 1 EA  $        1,165.18  $        1,165.18  $        1,452.00  $        1,452.00  $        2,926.14  $        2,926.14 

16 1200W UHF TRANSMITTER 
CHANNEL 23 1 EA  $      25,455.23  $      25,455.23  $      37,800.00  $      37,800.00  $      40,000.00  $      40,000.00 

17
EXTERNAL HARMONIC 
FILTER (IF REQUIRED) 
CHANNEL 23 

1 EA N/A  Included   Included  $              0.00 $              0.00

18 MASK FILTER, CHANNEL 23 1 EA  $        3,981.89  $        3,981.89  $        3,500.00  $        3,500.00  $        3,229.41  $        3,229.41 

19
DUAL EXCITER 
CONFIGURATION CHANNEL 
23 

1 EA  $      11,440.00  $      11,440.00  $        9,500.00  $        9,500.00 $              0.00 $              0.00

20 SHELF SPARE PA MODULE 
OPTION CHANNEL 23  1 EA  $        5,100.75  $        5,100.75  $           707.00  $           707.00  $        7,300.00  $        7,300.00 

21 1200W UHF TRANSMITTER, 
CHANNEL 33 2 EA  $      25,455.23  $      50,910.46  $      37,800.00  $      75,600.00  $      40,000.00  $      80,000.00 
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22
EXTERNAL HARMONIC 
FILTER(IF REQUIRED) 
CHANNEL 33 

2 EA  N/A  Included   Included  $             0.00 $              0.00

23 MASK FILTER, CHANNEL 33 2 EA  $        3,981.89  $        7,963.78  $        3,500.00  $        7,000.00  $        3,229.41  $        6,458.82 

24
DUAL EXCITER 
CONFIGURATION CHANNEL 
33 

2 EA  $      11,440.00  $      22,880.00  $        9,500.00  $      19,000.00 $              0.00 $              0.00

25 SHELF SPARE PA MODULE 
OPTION CHANNEL 33  1  EA  $        5,100.75  $        5,100.75  $           707.00  $           707.00  $        7,300.00  $      14,600.00 

 $    179,510.45  $    262,188.00  $    201,330.32 

Comments

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms

45-60

Total

60
N/A 0% 30 Days  

Line 8:  In Warranty and out of 
warranty reparis are performed in 
Columbia, MD.  In Warranty has 
no charge for repairs or shipping.  

Out of warranty is charged for 
time and materials.  Phone 

Technicl support is always NO 
CHARGE. 
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