Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

6002 OF
Department of Transportation

g Bulk Bituminous Cold Patch Material Flinn Paving Co., Inc. Knife River Midwest, LLC. Pavers Inc

N Description Qty |UOM|  Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
! BII\SJZSLE:\IUSLSF?E%B:ATCH 30 | TN |$  12667|$ 380010| $ s $ - No Bid
2 |ONCOIN SALTVALLEY | % | TV |8 12667|s sso0iol s s s 1 e
3 /?:JSBTulR ;B\IULK COLDPATCH| 50 | tn |8 12758| s 382740 s $ . NB
4 gIIESATTlR ELIJELK cooPatcH| oo [ v ls  1as10] s 299300| s T . _ -
5 BL\S\J—”;. gH—LYK COLD PATCH 20| TN s 12650 § 3795.00] $ s s - -
6 Bg;éHi%LﬁESOLD PATCH! 30 | TN | s 13100 $ 393000 $ s s ) \B
. E/Ij; BlUBRL#LK cooPATCH | oo [ 1 ls 13778 s a1z2s0| s 1 . _ -
8 chlnglN\BAllJongOLD PATCH 30 [ TN | $ 126.25( $ 3,787.50 | $ -l s $ ) NB
9 BEBTRlA EE:KC%?(LD PATCH| 30 | Tn |8 12667| s 380020 s $ ) \E
10 ngEJEBEUéﬁFsOLD PATCH 30 [ TN | $ 130.25| $ 3,907.50| $ -l s $ B NB
1 EXSLT'\;(FB{XLK cooratcH| oo [ i ls  1asas| s a7sasol 1 . _ -
12 g:ES\ITI:RBDULK COLD PATCH 30| TN |3 12750| § 382500 8 s ] _ -
13 $IESCTUT\/| iéLéLHK COLDPATCH 30 | Tn |8 13243| s 397290 $ s $ . NEB
” \E/Jvliaégum coopatcH| oo [ v ls  1sess| s azsrs0| s T . _ -
15 E;%SETMZO iIB\IL;LK COLDPATCH| o | 1n | 3 12333| $ 3,699.90| $ s $ . NEB
16 glngzl\liULK COLD PATCH 20| Tn s 12343| $ 370290] % s . _ -
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17 E'&TT?SB,\;’(;ET?LD PATCH| 20 | Tn | s 12333| $ 3,699.90| $ -|s s NB
18 RI'ESNBULK COLDPATCH| 55 | TN |8 13745| s 412350| $ -|s s NB
19 g:zsg As;?BF\?Al\_Fl’(ISSOLD PATCH| 20 | T8 | s 137.30| $ 411000 $ s -|s No Bid
20 E'SI_TU?\ABB%"SK COLDPATCH| 60 | Tn |8 13025| s 7.815.00| $ s -|s No Bid
21 a'US,\;SHBRLIJELYK COLDPATCH| 65 | 1N |$  133.40| $ 8004.00| $ s -|s No Bid
22 E\'(SOTN%BULK COLDPATCH| 60 | Tn | 128.00| $ 7,680.00|$  150.05| $  9543.00| $ No Bid
23 R/'imEBULK COLDPATCH| 65 | 1N | s 13355|$ 801300|$ 15005 $ 9543.00| $ No Bid
24 QSRT;RE/:ULK COLDPATCH| 55 | tn | s 137.00| $ 411000| $ s -|s No Bid
25 2:;;;}1?28%}%&0 PATCH| 20 | Tn |8 13955| $ 418650 $ s s No Bid
26 ELSI‘_T_EF?TUO"S COLDPATCH| 55 | tn | s 135.80| $ 4074.00| $ s s No Bid
27 g'ES,\TIE‘t/BAULK COLDPATCH| o | 1N |§  137.75| s 4,13250] $ s s No Bid
28 2II§XI\?DBILSJt§I\?DOLD PATCH ! 530 | T8 |'$ 14000 $ 32,200.00 | $ -|s s No Bid
29 g'ng“L?LK COLDPATCH| 55 | tn |s  14150| s 4,245.00| $ s s No Bid
30 ELASSTT?NBGUSLK COLDPATCH| 55 | TN |8 14165| s 7,08250| $ -|s s No Bid
31 3'ES;R4O?\IULK COLDPATCH| 55 | N |'s  14450| $ 4,335.00| $ -|s s No Bid
32 E'ES/IR‘,‘\IEL;LK COLDPATCH| 60 | TN | $  14540| $ 8724.00| $ s -|s No Bid
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g3 | P> ABUKCOLDPATCR 50 | TN |8 14150| 8 424500 s $ -|  NoBid
34 |DS] A BOLKCOLDPATCH 50 | TN |'s 12050| s 3:885.00( s $ -|  NoBid
35 g'ASVTE"‘\IﬁLA’LK COLDPATCH | 120 | T~ | 8 144.80 | $ 17,376.00 | $ -1 s $ - No Bid
36|y AV COLDPATCH ] 50 | TN |'s 14660| 3 430800 $ | s $ -|  NoBid
37 g'TS_TPiUBLULK COLDPATCH| 35 | TN | 5 137.75| $ 413250 | $ - s $ - No Bid
38 "il'jTA"‘\EELK COLDPATCH! 30 | TN | 184.06 | $ 5521.80| $ -1 s $ - No Bid
39 EE;PE’PELLJLLK COLDPATCH| 35 | TN | s 176.41| $ 5729230 $ - s $ - No Bid
40 i:,\SAITBEL?_ULK COLDPATCH! 30 | N | s 187.22| $ 5,616.60| $ -1 8 $ - No Bid
41 Q:SLEYBULK COLDPATCH| 35 | TN | 3 180.64 | $ 5,419.20| $ - 8 $ - No Bid
42|07 OBULKCOLDPATER | 59 | tn |5 13370( s 4012.00| -l s $ | Nogid
43 KLIS;LGEEULK COLDPATCH| 35 | Tn | 148.70| $ 4,461.00 | $ -l s $ - No Bid
44| QST OBOKCOLDPATCR | 50 | TN |'s 17238| 8 517140 s $ -|  NoBid
45| D OBUE VO PATCR g0 | N s 15110( 8 453300 s $ -|  NoBid
46 ggTTHaEiLébKRCéOLD PATCH| o0 | v | s 15425 $ 462750 $ s $ - No Bid
a7 | P57 OB COLDPATCR ] 50 | TN |'s 15065| 8 451950 | s $ -|  NoBid
4g|0>) OBUNKCOLDPATCR ] 50 | TN |5 17046| s 511380 s $ | NoBid
49| QST OBILKCOLDPATCR 50 | TN |8 15313] s 450390 s $ -|  NoBid
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DIST 6 BULK COLD PATCH .
50 NORTH PLATTE 30 [ TN | & 16246 $ 4,873.80( $ -1 $ -1 8 - No Bid
51|DIST 7BULKCOLD PATCH 55 | 1y | s 15260| $ 4578.00( $ s s - No Bid
ALMA
DIST 7 BULK COLD PATCH .
52 ARAPAHOE 30 [ TN | $ 158.46| $ 4,753.80| $ -1 8 -1 $ - No Bid
DIST 7 BULK COLD PATCH .
53 BENKLEMAN 30 [ TN | $ 170.30| $ 5,109.00| $ -1 8 -1 $ - No Bid
54|PIST 7 BULKCOLDPATCH | 35 | oy | 5 160.06 | $ 4,801.80 | $ - s -8 - No Bid
CURTIS
DIST 7 BULK COLD PATCH .
55 HOLDREGE 30| TN | $ 148.40 $ 4,452.00( $ -8 -1 $ - No Bid
DIST 7 BULK COLD PATCH .
56 MCCOOK 30 | TN | $ 163.10( $ 4,893.00( $ - 8 -1 $ - No Bid
LINCOLN PLANT PICK UP .
57 BULK COLD PATCH 30 | TN No Bid $ -1 % -1 8 -8 127.00( $ 3,810.00
Total $ 8,015.19 | $304,438.70 | $ 318.10| $ 19,086.00 | $ 127.00| $ 3,810.00
Payment Terms NET 30
Delivery Days ARO required #
Comments
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