
Buyer:  Gayle Callahan-Wolfing 6002 OF
Department of Transportation

Opening Date:  1/31/19

Page 1 of 4

                  AWARD                  AWARD

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

1 DIST 1 BULK COLD PATCH
LINCOLN SUPERIOR 30 TN  $          126.67  $    3,800.10  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

2 DIST 1 BULK COLD PATCH
LINCOLN SALT VALLEY 30 TN  $          126.67  $    3,800.10  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    NB 

3 DIST 1 BULK COLD PATCH
AUBURN 30 TN  $          127.58  $    3,827.40  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    NB 

4 DIST 1 BULK COLD PATCH
BEATRICE 30 TN  $          133.10  $    3,993.00  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    NB 

5 DIST 1 BULK COLD PATCH
DAVID CITY 30 TN  $          126.50  $    3,795.00  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    NB 

6 DIST 1 BULK COLD PATCH
DORCHESTER 30 TN  $          131.00  $    3,930.00  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    NB 

7 DIST 1 BULK COLD PATCH
FAIRBURY 30 TN  $          137.75  $    4,132.50  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    NB 

8 DIST 1 BULK COLD PATCH
GREENWOOD 30 TN  $          126.25  $    3,787.50  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    NB 

9 DIST 1 BULK COLD PATCH
NEBRASKA CITY 30 TN  $          126.67  $    3,800.10  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    NB 

10 DIST 1 BULK COLD PATCH
PAWNEE CITY 30 TN  $          130.25  $    3,907.50  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    NB 

11 DIST 1 BULK COLD PATCH
PALMYRA 30 TN  $          125.15  $    3,754.50  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    NB 

12 DIST 1 BULK COLD PATCH
SEWARD 30 TN  $          127.50  $    3,825.00  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    NB 

13 DIST 1 BULK COLD PATCH
TECUMSEH 30 TN  $          132.43  $    3,972.90  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    NB 

14 DIST 1 BULK COLD PATCH
WAHOO 30 TN  $          126.25  $    3,787.50  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    NB 

15 DIST 2 BULK COLD PATCH
FREMONT 30 TN  $          123.33  $    3,699.90  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    NB 

16 DIST 2 BULK COLD PATCH
GRETNA 30 TN  $          123.43  $    3,702.90  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    NB 

Bulk Bituminous Cold Patch Material Knife River Midwest, LLC.

Li
ne

 # Flinn Paving Co., Inc. Pavers Inc
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17 DIST 2 BULK COLD PATCH
PLATTSMOUTH 30 TN  $          123.33  $    3,699.90  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    NB 

18 DIST 3 BULK COLD PATCH
ALBION 30 TN  $          137.45  $    4,123.50  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    NB 

19 DIST 3 BULK COLD PATCH
CEDAR RAPIDS 30 TN  $          137.30  $    4,119.00  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

20 DIST 3 BULK COLD PATCH
COLUMBUS 60 TN  $          130.25  $    7,815.00  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

21 DIST 3 BULK COLD PATCH
HUMPHREY 60 TN  $          133.40  $    8,004.00  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

22 DIST 3 BULK COLD PATCH
LYONS 60 TN  $          128.00  $    7,680.00  $          159.05  $       9,543.00  $                  -    No Bid 

23 DIST 3 BULK COLD PATCH
WAYNE 60 TN  $          133.55  $    8,013.00  $          159.05  $       9,543.00  $                  -    No Bid 

24 DIST 4 BULK COLD PATCH
AURORA 30 TN  $          137.00  $    4,110.00  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

25 DIST 4 BULK COLD PATCH
CENTRAL CITY 30 TN  $          139.55  $    4,186.50  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

26 DIST 4 BULK COLD PATCH
FULLERTON 30 TN  $          135.80  $    4,074.00  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

27 DIST 4 BULK COLD PATCH
GENEVA 30 TN  $          137.75  $    4,132.50  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

28 DIST 4 BULK COLD PATCH
GRAND ISLAND 230 TN  $          140.00  $  32,200.00  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

29 DIST 4 BULK COLD PATCH
GREELEY 30 TN  $          141.50  $    4,245.00  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

30 DIST 4 BULK COLD PATCH
HASTINGS 50 TN  $          141.65  $    7,082.50  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

31 DIST 4 BULK COLD PATCH
HEBRON 30 TN  $          144.50  $    4,335.00  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

32 DIST 4 BULK COLD PATCH
KEARNEY 60 TN  $          145.40  $    8,724.00  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 
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33 DIST 4 BULK COLD PATCH
LOUP CITY 30 TN  $          141.50  $    4,245.00  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

34 DIST 4 BULK COLD PATCH
OSCEOLA 30 TN  $          129.50  $    3,885.00  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

35 DIST 4 BULK COLD PATCH
RAVENNA 120 TN  $          144.80  $  17,376.00  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

36 DIST 4 BULK COLD PATCH
RED CLOUD 30 TN  $          146.60  $    4,398.00  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

37 DIST 4 BULK COLD PATCH
ST. PAUL 30 TN  $          137.75  $    4,132.50  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

38 DIST 4 BULK COLD PATCH
ALLIANCE 30 TN  $          184.06  $    5,521.80  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

39 DIST 5 BULK COLD PATCH
CHAPPELL 30 TN  $          176.41  $    5,292.30  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

40 DIST 5 BULK COLD PATCH
KIMBALL 30 TN  $          187.22  $    5,616.60  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

41 DIST 5 BULK COLD PATCH
SIDNEY 30 TN  $          180.64  $    5,419.20  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

42 DIST 6 BULK COLD PATCH
YORK 30 TN  $          133.70  $    4,011.00  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

43 DIST 6 BULK COLD PATCH
ANSLEY 30 TN  $          148.70  $    4,461.00  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

44 DIST 6 BULK COLD PATCH
BIG SPRINGS 30 TN  $          172.38  $    5,171.40  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

45 DIST 6 BULK COLD PATCH
BROKEN BOW 30 TN  $          151.10  $    4,533.00  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

46 DIST 6 BULK COLD PATCH
GOTHENBURG 30 TN  $          154.25  $    4,627.50  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

47 DIST 6 BULK COLD PATCH
LEXINGTON 30 TN  $          150.65  $    4,519.50  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

48 DIST 6 BULK COLD PATCH
OGALLALA 30 TN  $          170.46  $    5,113.80  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

49 DIST 6 BULK COLD PATCH
OCONTO 30 TN  $          153.13  $    4,593.90  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 
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50 DIST 6 BULK COLD PATCH
NORTH PLATTE 30 TN  $          162.46  $    4,873.80  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

51 DIST 7 BULK COLD PATCH
ALMA 30 TN  $          152.60  $    4,578.00  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

52 DIST 7 BULK COLD PATCH
ARAPAHOE 30 TN  $          158.46  $    4,753.80  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

53 DIST 7 BULK COLD PATCH
BENKLEMAN 30 TN  $          170.30  $    5,109.00  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

54 DIST 7 BULK COLD PATCH
CURTIS 30 TN  $          160.06  $    4,801.80  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

55 DIST 7 BULK COLD PATCH
HOLDREGE 30 TN  $          148.40  $    4,452.00  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

56 DIST 7 BULK COLD PATCH
MCCOOK 30 TN  $          163.10  $    4,893.00  $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    No Bid 

57 LINCOLN PLANT PICK UP
BULK COLD PATCH 30 TN  No Bid  $               -    $                  -    $                  -    $          127.00  $       3,810.00 

 $       8,015.19  $304,438.70  $          318.10  $     19,086.00  $          127.00  $       3,810.00 
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