Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

5990 OF
Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 2/6/19

z Armor Coat Gravel, gjifc;r;?n;;rél:/:\l,e\llvindrowGravel and Armstrong Rentals, LLC | Atkinson Sand & Gravel Inc D&LSANL?_é‘ GRAVEL DeWeese Sand & Gravel Ed Broad;?(o;trjvit)ns Sand ZSSDKERG?SS/LTEE(S:
£
3

Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price [ Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
1 EEEQNI&;E&%%GYEQSVEL 715| TN | $ 1815($ 12,977.25
s [osTonone SRRvEL 22| | oo
4 Eﬁzﬁgg;iﬁ%’\égGRAVEL 500 TN | $ 23.15($ 11,575.00
o o oA o | 25| | o
7 [DIST 2 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 1500] ™ | Nosia
o soo] | o
o e e soo] 70 [ o
10 |DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL 500 ™ | Nosid
11 |DIST4 DEICING GRAVEL 300 ™ | nosid
12 Z‘II'S;':UEI)_EI\I/IC;III;I\IC'I;'\?AR:E)/EL 1,000 TN No Bid $ 10.00( $ 10,000.00 $ 970| % 9,700.00
1 |PIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL s0o| ™| nosi
14 3:511;4DI\AE|1—’?4’1\‘7G31(\;A$®VAELI;RORA 1,000 TN No Bid $ 934 % 9,340.00 $ 890|$% 8,900.00
T DO CrAL s | 0| ™| nos
o e o I B
17D A peon oM ST soo] | o
18 E@zéasgﬂl(;il\c/:"o;gfsﬁ\gh\ms 500| TN No Bid $ 1550| $ 7,750.00 $ 1575| $ 7,875.00
19 a{fl-l\—(;BTT\A'\gol':;:N(ﬂAl\nglféggLCLouD 600| TN No Bid $ 19.75($ 11,850.00 $ 2058 $ 12,348.00
20 E:I?I-\I'(;S?T\A'\g;z%?:A;E%Rétlng 1,000 TN No Bid $ 1975 $  19,750.00 $ 2305($% 23,050.00
21 |DIST4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL - 1200 ™ | Nosu 5 1415|s 1698000
22 E(I)SJ:(';_?:;ASARR%OATGRAVEL 2,000 TN No Bid
23 aﬁlgn;g?gRgmggﬁ\:{ingNGS 400 TN | $ 1715 $ 6,860.00 $ 993(8$ 3,972.00 $ 1019| $ 4,076.00
24 z{/?l-\r(:s\iv:\,/\lf7R20l\)ll:ll\?gé\llRilbcLOUD 1,420 TN | $ 1765| $ 25,063.00 $ 1389 $ 19,723.80 $ 1415 $  20,093.00
oo eTssmoron et | zo| ] s
A B R
o7 e A roo] | o
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

5990 OF
Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 2/6/19

z Armor Coat Gravel, gjzr;?nsrél:/:\l,e\llvindrowGraveland Armstrong Rentals, LLC | Atkinson Sand & Gravel Inc D&LSA’\:_?_g GRAVEL DeWeese Sand & Gravel Ed Broad;?(o;trjvit)nssand ZSSDKERG?S_\(\)/LTEE(S:
£
-}
Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price [ Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
2 [ o e oo v | e
29 El/?l-l\'(;s\iv:\’/\lfgiolvxﬂﬁ?g\éESLTPAUL 700| TN No Bid $ 1017 $ 7,119.00 9.60 | $ 6,720.00
30 E:/?I-\I—(;Svlv:\,/\llgszosvxﬂ?gg\éESI}PAuL 700| TN No Bid $ 942|% 6,594.00 878 | % 6,146.00
3 | wyzs Mp120 2MIN OF Gregrey | 1200 T | Noed
32 | w201 Wp1Ze 1 MINOF GReELEY | 1200] TN | NoBid
3 | wyzs1 Mp129 10 MIN OF GReeLEY | 1200 T | Noed
3D e o e CKVILLE 1280 TN [ NoBid $ 1850|$  23,680.00
o e I I
a7 |DIST S DEICING GRAVEL 1000 ™ | Nosia
55O oo 20| | o
5o o CEAEL zo0o] 7 | o
41| wv20 WP 25 101w OF CrAwroRp_| 20%0| ™ | Nosid
4z [PIST 2 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 3,000 TN | NoBid
e [OT S NOR CON AV | 2| | o
5 | w250 P20 oW1  OF RUSHYILLE | 20%0| ™ | Nosd
4 | w71 MP30 271N OF SCOTTSBLY | 3090| TN | NoBid
o [oe o ConTeTeL zoo| [ o
s o spemon comomavel | soom| | e
N e 2| | o
o e e I
e R R
o e s | 20| ] oo
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

5990 OF

Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 2/6/19

z Armor Coat Gravel, gjlfc;r;?n;;g/;\l,e\llvindrowGravel and Armstrong Rentals, LLC | Atkinson Sand & Gravel Inc D&LSA’\:_DLg‘ GRAVEL DeWeese Sand & Gravel Ed Broad;?gtrjvit)ns Sand ';(A)SDKERG?S:/LTEE(S:
£

3

Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price [ Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price

4 [DISTEWINDROW GRAVEL——— FWY| 005l 1 | osa
oo e e | 20| | oo
S som| | o
o7 [oeanEens o o[ v [ oo
e o5 DT e som| | o
B o] | woss
oo DT SRR ComT CTAVEL soo] 70 [ o
o1 [y o e sooo] [ o
62 gllASI;r(_‘ueEY\lv'll'NYDARR?)W GRAVEL 750 TN No Bid
o5 [oey e sooo] [ o
o R e 70| 1 | o
o5 D5 s eron CAveL s7o] | voss
os Do one crve o] | o
o7 T ot A o] | o
os D57 oo oA 7o 70 [ oo
R e s e
71 SE;SL\,:\IGEE\EOW GRAVEL HWY 750| TN No Bid
T2 o RO e 2o 1 | o
T T S SO A sooo| [ o
T o o ST BRI
o o e | 2a| | voss
T et | 2o | nos
A e
T DT ayumeron ST zoo| [ o
o0 DT ot AL o] | o
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

5990 OF
Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 2/6/19

z Armor Coat Gravel, gjzr;?nsrél:/:\l,e\llvindrowGraveland Armstrong Rentals, LLC | Atkinson Sand & Gravel Inc D&LSA’\:_?_g GRAVEL DeWeese Sand & Gravel Ed Broad;?(o;trjvit)nssand ZSSDKERG?S_\(\)/LTEE(S:
£
3
Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price [ Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
e e o] |
82 E$1:3VVMIE?3%()1\QYM?EZ\;I1\I;LETON 1,000 TN f No Bid
B3 | W83 MPL27 1211 N STAPLETON 1500| ™ | Nosid
3 | wivo2 Mp22s s w OF STapLETON | 900| T | NoBid
T e P I [
o e o] |
88 E:/?I-\I'(:ZVVMIEE?Olv:I\.IM(I;EAAVRF:I}HUR 1,000 TN [ NoBid
e O S o] |
R Lo 70 | wooe
o T oo | oo
o ey | 00| | o
e St |0 ™| o
B e S N [
o oo [ [ woms
9 E:/?/I(Za\g:\,/\llg;ozvxn?; (A)\IgE(I)_RLEANS 680 TN | NoBid $ 1048|$  7,126.40
97 Q}LSF;SGD;EV'\T?A%RDAVEL 800| TN | NoBid $ 1452($ 11,616.00
9 | NNSWORTH YARD. 1,500 TN | NoBid $ 989s 1483500|s 995|8 14,92500
99 SIIASJ;\‘-I?IEIEIL\‘ERERAVEL 2,000 TN No Bid $ 20.00|$ 40,000.00] $ 1240 $ 24,800.00
100 EggfefégNG GRAVEL 500| TN No Bid $ 2400|$ 12,000.00| $ 17.75( $ 8,875.00
101 als;slai:\fg\‘AigRAVEL 2,000 TN No Bid $ 2948 $ 58960.000 $ 29.00( $ 58,000.00
102 E»IASI;’FE??DYIZISE’)\‘G GRAVEL 500| TN No Bid $ 1160| $ 5,800.00
103 QEETN%EEI?ESDGRAVEL 500 TN | NoBid $ 1020($  5,100.00
104 6L RWELL SOUTH YARD 1000 TN | No Eid 5 1000[s  100000
T e o] | s
106 ‘IE')IASY-II—_gEI\E(fII?,\I‘DG GRAVEL 2,000 TN No Bid

Page 4 of 20



Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

5990 OF

Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 2/6/19

Matteo Sand & Gravel

Page 5 of 20

z Armor Coat Gravel, gjifc;r;?n;;rél:/:\l,e\llvindrowGravel and Armstrong Rentals, LLC | Atkinson Sand & Gravel Inc D&LSA’\:_?_g GRAVEL DeWeese Sand & Gravel Ed Broad;?(o;trjvit)ns Sand ZSSDKERG?S_\(\)/LTEE(S:
£
3
Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price [ Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
107 g!z;iLD?ACR";G GRAVEL 500| TN No Bid $ 8.74| $ 4,370.00
108 ZL’SI;I—IS(?\';:\EA\E\)IRYZ:SSTGRAVEL 1,000 TN No Bid $ 18.08| $ 18,080.00
T 20| | o
110 E@ifﬁ\?&ié%?&ﬁﬁ@gﬁ 500| TN No Bid $ 947| $ 4,735.00
MR R R
T e N e I
113 a{fl-l\—(glAl\'/Rlly?gR COAT GRAVEL 3,500 TN No Bid
114 Eif;(glA’&&(;R COAT GRAVEL 2,500 TN No Bid
115 aﬁlfzmr\lx:saDoRgﬂaggé\géum 600| TN No Bid $ 1180 $ 7,080.00
116 E:/?I-\F(;BOWMIE%R;OIVI\:I(\;I\'I?)(A)\IiEI\I/I_ERRIMAN 1,200 TN No Bid $ 2950($ 35400.00]$ 20.60($ 24,720.00
L7 e o e 600 TN | NoBid $ 2625|$ 15750.00]$ 16.94| $  10,164.00
118 E:/?I-\r(fZWMIEfQR](.)I\)IIYIEGSIf\éE:RKS 600| TN No Bid $ 1962($ 11,772.00] $ 16.70( $ 10,020.00
119 a:/?/lfov;\l/:EEOZOSWMIE%?:VVEALLENTINE 1,200 TN No Bid $ 19.79|$ 23,748.00] $ 12.10( $ 14,520.00
i[OO IDELNERTCOSTTERTOT | aoo] | o T
L[ PTNEOELNERY COSTPER TN | aoo] | o s T
12 PTINSOELNERY COSTEERTON | a0l | o o, ool s 000
| TR COTTR TN |z | oo
o et e I
Total $ 7610 $ 56,47525] $ 281.24| $ 287,306.00] $135.74| $ 166,084.00) $128.23| $ 103,225.20| $ 18.20| $ 23,720.00] $134.85]| $ 115,888.00
Payment Terms 0-30 Net-30 100-30 et-45 00-30
Delivery Days ARO 14 15 10 45 15
Comments
No Bids
K4 Trucking
Invalid Bids



Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

Department of Transportation

5990 OF

Opening Date: 2/6/19

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and

HWY11 MP78 1MIN OF ORD

ﬁ Surfacing Gravel Island Landhandlers Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc, L.G. Everist, Inc L &L Gravel Lyman Richey Corporation| Marxsen Sand & Gravel

c

= - . ) . ) Unit ) R Extended . ) . )

Description Qty |UOM|Unit Price [ Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price Price Extended Price | Unit Price Price Unit Price [ Extended Price |Unit Price | Extended Price

oo e ]

¢ e S e

VR s

5 3@1;;3?5?&?@2%%;&05 2500 TN $ 1546($ 38650.00| $ 14.00| $ 35000.00

© |5CT 120 AND 32 6wl w OF wapison | 25%0| ™ s 2150[ s 5375000 5 10745 4935000

7 ?(I;TS?_,AA?]’\SC;'? COAT GRAVEL 1500 TN

5 DT i SORT A o]

o [T O e 500/ TN |$ 1455|8  7,275.00 $ 1542|$  7,710.00

e o] sools semm

1 Z'SEE“LEE'%'LGDGRAVEL 300| TN $ 1336($  4,008.00

12 g_II,S;—:U?_E'\IA(z:;‘\ﬁi;ERAgEL 1,000 TN | $ 10.20| $ 10,200.00

13 E(I)SJPA‘(:[TTE\I(C\I('/\@S RAVEL 600| TN $ 1265($  7,590.00

14 3@1;%;2%%3?@"5%'? A 1,000/ TN |$ 955|$  9550.00

15 |71 AND 92 341 W OF OSCEOLA 80| ™ s 1a73]s 1252050

16 351:2A;¥2§2Cﬁ$82§$\7v5u 500| TN | $ 17.30| $  8650.00| $ 1525($  7,625.00

17 | wy22 Mp2a swiw OF SCOTIA 50| ™ s 13755 687500

19 | AWYB MP219 611 E OF LASTINGS 50| ™ |5 15855 792500

19 | w26 MP12 TMINOF RED CLoup | 00| ™ |8 1925 8 1155000

20 3@1;£RM"’F',(;F;CO%A;E%RCA:’§L']D 1,000/ TN |$ 19.75| $  19,750.00

21 |DIST4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 1200| ™ |5 1585 5  1902000

22 Bng4$$y$§R%OATGRAVEL 2,000 TN $ 1625 $  32,500.00

23 | WG MP219 6MI £ OF HASTINGS 00| ™

24 | w21 wpT g N OF RED CLoup || 1420 ™

25 | W39 WP2L 1 MIN OF GENOA 2000 TN 5 98|s 1972000

% 3@1?4%2?0%%%?’\?2¥EFLULLERTO 100) ™ S ros 13000

27 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL 200| ™™ s 1085 & 7.505.00
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

5990 OF

Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 2/6/19

ﬁ A CoathaVel.gsri;i\r;?nsrg:/;\ié\ll\lindrowGravel and Island Landhandlers Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc, L.G. Everist, Inc L &L Gravel Lyman Richey Corporation| Marxsen Sand & Gravel

£

i ipfi it Pri i it Pri . Unit - . Extended L ] o '
Description Qty |UOM|Unit Price [ Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price Price Extended Price |Unit Price Price Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price

29 | 261 MPOS 1 MIN OF ST PAUL 70| T —

30 |, Wv261 MP69 511 S OF ST PAUL 00| T —

% 3@1;8?’:\;‘5]2?%\%RNAXELGREELEY 1,200) TN $ 1175 $  14,100.00

i 3@1&%&?3“ ﬁ%/?:vRE(ISCKVILLE 1,280) TN $ 1260 $  16,128.00

3 31/?/1\—(:2\/\!\’/:25201\AI(AIGV$A(¥IE::OUPCIT 640| TN $ 1275|$  8,160.00

3 | CERING MANT YARD. Looo]

3 |BRIDGPORT YARD Looo|

3 | ChApPeLL WANT YARD 2000] T

39 | IVBALL MANT YARD 2000 T

° | oNEY MANT vARD 2000] T

“ 3:/?/125;1\':;/' SSRl((;aIA\-Ir\I%T:AgE:WFORD 2,000f TN

% | ARRISON vARD. e

3 | W20 P55 9MI S OF HARRISON 4000 T

“ |inwvoo upse pain ot witcrer, | 2000 ™

S O T e | 2om| PPy P

4 |71 wpso e O scorrssiy | 90| ™

47 | w26 A1 SCT26 AND L62A 2000| TN

8 | wvss MPT 15W1 S OF GERING 2000| ™

9 |Fwv0 MPS 5MIW OF SIDNEY 2000] T

50 | IARRISBURG YARD - 2000] T

51| vz MPO2 101 £ OF CrappeL | 4000 ™

52 |inwve? wpis 16 Min OF ALLANGE | 49%0] ™

53 3{/?/1967\/\1\1/:25 T?l\)ll\ll l\?vl\j?)\::Ell\_lORTH PLA 2,000| TN
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing bevart 5{99]‘OTOF i Opening Date: 2/6/19
epartment of Transportation

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and Island Landhandlers | Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc, L.G. Everist, Inc L &L Gravel Lyman Richey Corporation| Marxsen Sand & Gravel

*® Surfacing Gravel
2
= Unit Extended
Description Qty |UOM|Unit Price [ Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price Price Extended Price | Unit Price Price Unit Price [ Extended Price |Unit Price | Extended Price
54 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY 2.000] ™

23 MP 56 DICKENS

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
55 HWY30 MP103 7MI NW BIG SPRINGS 25001 TN

DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
56 NORTH PLATTE W 14TH YARD 1,000] TN

DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
57 NORTH PLATTE I-80 YARD 1,000) TN

DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
58 SUTHERLAND MAINT YARD 1,000] TN

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
59 | ANSLEY HWY 183 MP89 7501 TN $ 1110 $ 832500
DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
60 | ASLEv WY 163 P8O 500| TN $ 1497|$  7,485.00

DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL

61 | ANSLEY MAINT YARD 1500 TN $ 1115 $  16,725.00
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL

62 | SARGENT YARD 750| TN $ 985|%$  7,387.50

3 |DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL L500] ™

OCONTO MAINT YARD

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
64 OCONTO JCT HWY 21AND 40 7,500] TN

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
65 ARNOLD HWY 92 MP 251 875 TN

DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
66 ARNOLD HWY 92 MP 251 1,500] TN

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
67 | ANSELMO HWY 2 MP 257 750| TN $ 1225|$  9,187.50

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
68 | o roKEN BOW HW o1 MPES 750| TN $ 1350 $ 10,125.00
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL

59 |BROKEN BOW WEST HWY2 MP277 1.500] ™ $ 13001 $  19,500.00

DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL

70 |BROKEN BOW WEST HWY2 MP277 5001 TN $ 1580| % 7,900.00

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL WY
71 e 750| TN $ 889|$ 666750 $ 15.15| $ 11,362.50
— |DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 2500] ™

ROSCOE HWY30 MP136

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
73 | OGALLALA HWY26 MP136 2,500 TN

DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
4 HWY26 MP141 ESTRADAS 5000f TN

DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
s HWY 30 AT OVERTON 1,500] TN

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY
76 |2 MP 183 1MI W OF MULLEN 2,500 TN $ 1500 $  37,500.00 $ 10.35| $ 25,875.00

DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
7 |HWY 2 MP 183 IMI W OF MULLEN 2,000f TN $ 1850($  37,000.00 $ 1245 $ 24,900.00

DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
78 |HWY 2 MP 183 1MI W OF MULLEN 500) TN $ 1500|$  7,500.00 $ 1050($ 5250.00

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
i HWY92 MP205 2MI E TYRON 2,000) TN

DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
80 HWY92 MP205 2MI E TYRON 1,500] TN
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

5990 OF

Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 2/6/19

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and

Island Landhandlers

Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc,

L.G. Everist, Inc

L &L Gravel

Lyman Richey Corporation

Marxsen Sand & Gravel

ﬁ Surfacing Gravel

c

= - . ) . ) Unit ) R Extended . ) . )
Description Qty |UOM|Unit Price [ Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price Price Extended Price | Unit Price Price Unit Price [ Extended Price |Unit Price | Extended Price

B | W2 MPLA 21 W HVANNIS Lo0o| TN s 10805 190000 5 1650] $ 1650000

82 31/?/1\—(863\/;\1/:2?3%01\21M?EAS\{I'EA|}’LET0N 1,000] TN $ 10.73| $ 10,730.00

B3 |, \ivas MPL27 1211 N STAPLETON 1500| TN s 1350 5 2025000

8 |iwvo2 pa2s amw OF sTapLETON | 9% ™

5 | wvoz Wpz25 aww OF STapLEToN | 1509| ™

196|176 20MW OF MULLEN | 1000 ™ s 1645] s 1645000 5 1164 5 1164000

7 | WYeL MP126 1M N ARTHUR Lo0o| TN

5 | W2 MPL75 1001 £ ARTHUR L00| T

9 | WYGL ML) 7MI N ARTHUR Lo0o| TN

90 ?LsgDngRRg?(ingATGRAVEL 1,000 TN $ 17.45|$  17,450.00 $ 10.50| $ 10,500.00

9 Wy 2 P 227 ATHALSEY. Lo0o| TN s 1615]s 1615000 5 1305| 5 1305000

92 | WvS15A MP3 amiw OF IvpERiL | 10%0| T

93 | et wp2a 20w N oF BEnkeLwan | 80| ™

9 | ive1 MP5D 1 S OF GRANT 2200| T

95 | W25 MP14 SMIW OF GRANT 00| ™

9 | AWv136 MP24 2 M £ OF ORLEANS 60) ™

97 ZEFI.S(?&'EC\X,“ sA(;%AVEL 800| TN $ 1145|$  9,160.00

98 i:ﬁgigiﬁ'\l\ggswa 1,500 TN $ 10.85|$  16,275.00

99 [V’JfLTEﬁ,?lﬁ'E'L“fR‘SRAVEL 2,000 TN $ 1240($  24,800.00

100 gl(?;f?fRIEINGGRAVEL 500 TN $ 1795| $ 8,975.00

101 3‘;;;335:\,0%(;3%\/& 2,000 TN $ 2145($  42,900.00

102 E'ASFTESRDY'i%\'G GRAVEL 500 TN $ 12.00|$  6,000.00

103 g::SETNBCEES(Z\‘SDGRAVEL 5001 TN $ 13.00| $  6,500.00

104|BURWELL SOUTH YARD 1,000 TN $ 1100[$  11,000.00

108 [B)EJT?_EDECYIESDGRAVEL 1,000| TN $ 1023|$  10,230.00

106 '[I')LS\(I?)EI\E(IEIIQI\EJG GRAVEL 2,000 TN $ 11.00( $ 22,000.00
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing bevart 5{99]‘OTOF i Opening Date: 2/6/19
epartment of Transportation

ﬁ Armor Coat Gravel, gsri;i\r;?n;;rg:/:\ié\ll\lindrow Gravel and Island Landhandlers Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc, L.G. Everist, Inc L &L Gravel Lyman Richey Corporation| Marxsen Sand & Gravel
c
= - . ) . ) Unit ) R Extended . ) . )

Description Qty |UOM|Unit Price [ Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price Price Extended Price | Unit Price Price Unit Price [ Extended Price |Unit Price | Extended Price
o
108 gs%sg\ﬁgv?/iisy GRAVEL 1,000 TN $ 1465 $ 14,650.00
109 3@1? G?rg?;R%gSTiQVEL 2,000 TN $ 17.00( $ 34,000.00
110 351?1A;£A132%%A:T?<ﬁ@§¢ 500 TN $ 1275| % 6,375.00
111|DISTE ARMOR CORT GRAVEL 1500 T 5 1389(s 2083500
I e N I
113 3@1:1A’§2A3%R COAT GRAVEL 3,500 TN $ 1580 $ 55,300.00
114 351;:1»&;&(;!? COAT GRAVEL 2,500 TN $ 1475 $ 36,875.00
115 3{/?/1]?2\AI\I/1ISBDOR2I\'NB§CR)€XEEURG 600 TN $ 1075 $ 6,450.00
117 3@150%2?&;%“IGER$:E;DY 600 TN $ 1850 $ 11,100.00
118 E{I?ILEZ\AI\II:SJF);??R)IAI,IEGS?\QE’:RKS 600 TN $ 1720 $ 10,320.00
120 2:;:82 égﬁ#leszggfggfﬁgﬁg 2001 TN|$ 0.18( $ 36.00] $ 015|$ 30.00 O.Jr}]6i|;'0n $ 32.00 $ 015($ 30.00
121 SEE(I?\I':BZ;ADL'EF/I:AI\I;E)RJO%?%TOT\IESR TON 200| TN |$ o018|s$ 3600|$ 015($ 30.00 '1&;0” $ 3200
i TIONSDELNERY COSTPERTON | s oisls o0 e
el I s os[s w0 el ww
124 3@1:1A;£AS3R4C“2?\‘T§FR€¥5\]S 5,000 TN $37.35( $ 186,750.00

Total $122.66 | $  93,992.00) $766.37| $ 971,283.50| $37.35| $ 186,750.00] $125.01 | $150,185.50| $107.78 | $ 142,943.50| $ 14.00| $  35,000.00
Payment Terms 30 et-30 Net-30 100-30
Delivery Days ARO 30 As required 45 45
Comments
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing bevart 5{99]‘OTOF i Opening Date: 2/6/19
epartment of Transportation

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and

3 . Overton Sand & Gravel Co. Paulsen Inc Pine Bluffs Gravel &Exc Inc Simon STALP GRAVEL, INC. Triple G Redimix LLC
Y Surfacing Gravel
c
£
Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price [ Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL
1 GREENWOOD YARD 75| TN
2 DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL 1500 TN

HWY S12D DWIGHT

DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL
3 |HwY JCT 79 AND 34 2,250( TN

DIST 1 SURFACING GRAVEL
4 HWY JCT 8 AND 65 500 TN

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
5 HWY22 MP 88 6MI E OF MONROE 25001 TN

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
© |3CT 121 AND 32 8MI W OF MADISON 2500| TN

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
7 JCT 51 AND 77 1,500 TN $ 18.00( $ 27,000.00

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
8 |scT32 AND 275 5001 TN $ 15.00| $  7,500.00

DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
FULLERTON MAINT YARD

DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
10 ORD MAINT YARD 500 TN

DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
u GREELEY YARD 00| TN

DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
12 ST PAUL MAINT YARD 1,000 TN

DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
13 LOUP CITY YARD 600| TN

DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
14 HWY34 MP247 3MI W AURORA 1,000) TN

DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
15 JCT81 AND 92 3 MIW OF OSCEOLA 850] TN

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
16 HWY92 MP339 2MIW OF FARWELL 500 TN

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
l HWY22 MP24 9MI W OF SCOTIA 5001 TN

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
18 HWY6 MP219 6MI E OF HASTINGS 00| TN

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
19 HWY281 MP12 7MI N OF RED CLOUD 600| TN

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
20 HWY281 MP5 S OF RED CLOUD 1,000] TN

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
2 HWY30 MP339 1MI E OF CENTRAL 1,200/ TN

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
2 LOUP CITY YARD 2,000 TN

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
= HWY6 MP219 6MI E OF HASTINGS 400] TN

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
24 |iwy281 MP7 2MI N OF RED CLOUD 1420 TN

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
25 |,,wY39 MP21 1 MI N OF GENOA 2,0001 TN

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
26 HWY14 MP106 7 MIN OF FULLERTO 100 TN

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
2 HWY11 MP78 1MIN OF ORD 700 TN
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

5990 OF

Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 2/6/19

ﬁ Armor Coat Gravel, gjlfc;ré?nSg/:J,e\lNindrow Gravel and Overton Sand & Gravel Co. Paulsen Inc Pine Bluffs Gravel &Exc Inc Simon STALP GRAVEL, INC. Triple G Redimix LLC
g

Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price [ Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
28 | Wy 11 MP6S 5MI S OF ORD La0| TN
29 | W51 PO 1 MIN OF ST PAUL 70| T
30 | W51 MPB9 & MI S OF ST PAUL 700| T
31 | w281 MP120 2MI N OF GREELEY 1200 TN
32 a{f/-\r(gs\f:\;‘glzg\;vMGIF:\IA(\;ELGREELEY 1,200| TN
33 | w281 MP129 10 MIN OF GReeLey | 2% ™
34 351548“(}2555 m E%AFV:(I'_)CKVILLE 1,280| TN
35 | w2 MP320 1 MIW OF LoUP CIT 640 TN
36 .?,E;f,(?ﬂim?f:é@’ﬂ 1,000{ TN $ 1300|$ 1300000 $ 615|$  6150.00
37 ggggggghﬁggwﬂ 1,000| TN $ 1500($ 1500000|$ 1025|$ 10,250.00
38 BEZSPEEILC&\‘A?N??X;% 2,000| TN $ 16.00|$ 3200000 $ 14.95| $  29,900.00
39 E:Egi,_ﬁiﬁf,?;::ﬁ%:gﬂ 2,000 TN $ 11.00|$ 2200000|$ 1150 $  23,000.00
40 Q:SLEYDEE:\T‘TG&?{SVEL 2,000| TN $ 1500|$ 3000000 $ 17.25| $  34,500.00
a1 E:f;gfm," SSR IESIAVTV%RFAQ/RE'A‘WFORD 2,000 TN $ 3300($ 6600000|$ 2623 $ 52460.00
42 5f§§$§,ﬂw siR%OATGRAVEL 3,000 TN $ 3300|$ 99,00000|$ 21.70| $  65100.00
43 | Awv20 MP5S 91 S OF HARRISON 4000 TN s 3300|s 15200000[s 2060| 5 8240000
44 Eﬁiffmiifmff ,GYTECLHELL 2,000| TN $ 2300|$ 4600000|$ 17.16| $  34,320.00
45 Eﬁigsgmgﬁgcﬁlgffﬁxghmg 2,000 TN $ 3300($ 6600000|$ 31.18$ 62360.00
46 3@151A§.§”900F§7CmT§§§Z§§TSBLU 3,000| TN $ 19.00|$ 57,00000|$ 1575|$  47,250.00
a7 Eif;g&?&?ig%ﬁ;ﬁfﬁg; 2,000 TN $ 21.00|$ 4200000|$ 1457|3$ 29140.00
48 aﬁig;&mgigﬁggfé\ég:‘m 3,000 TN $ 17.00|$ 51,00000|$ 14.06|$ 42180.00
49 3§1§OA§Q”5§253$TOGFZ‘?§EEY 2,000| TN $ 17.00| $ 3400000 $ 22.75| $  45500.00
50 EESQQSJAR%RYCA(;?GRAVEL 2,0001 TN $ 17.00| $ 3400000 $ 1472|$ 29,440.00
51 | W27 MPS2 10M) £ OF GHAPPELL 4,000 TN s 2000|s 80000005 16955 6780000
52 3@1857‘\3.!“1?15 am gE':\[Et\NCE 4,000| TN $ 2400|$ 9600000|$ 23.08|$ 92,320.00
53 3:2157\,325?2(31\;/:’ r\?vsngElr\]oRTH LA 2,000 TN $ 1092|$ 2184000($ 11.00|$ 22,000.00
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

5990 OF

Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 2/6/19

ﬁ Armor Coat Gravel, gjlfc;ré?nsg:/:\l,e\llvindrow Gravel and Overton Sand & Gravel Co. Paulsen Inc Pine Bluffs Gravel &Exc Inc Simon STALP GRAVEL, INC. Triple G Redimix LLC
£
Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price [ Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
54 SQSJSQAQ'SEF%’SGRAVEL HWYI 2000| ™ $ 1096 $ 21,920.00) $ 12.00| $  24,000.00
55 zﬁlgomgﬁozgxliw\é%SPR|NGs 2,500 TN $ 11.26|$ 28150.00| $ 11.00| $ 27,500.00| $ 10.95| $ 27,375.00
56 zgngDfﬂiﬁia,RfﬁiLmRD 1,000 TN $ 1098 $ 10,980.00| $ 13.00| $  13,000.00
57 ESFITGHDPE&?TESEOAXE;D 1,000 TN $ 1098|$ 10,980.00| $ 12.00| $ 12,000.00
58 QETTH%E{ES\:’\[‘)GM(ZWTV&RD 1,000 TN $ 1074 $ 10,740.00] $  9.00| $  9,000.00| $ 16.24| $  16,240.00
59 z:fgLGEy:\\‘/\[/)s?ggﬁsggEL 750 TN | $ 1099|$  824250| $ 14.34|$ 10,755.00| $ 27.00( $ 20,250.00
60 QL]SSTL?;F:{“\"A/%R&?QLE(’,E‘QRAVEL 500 TN | $ 1485|$% 742500| $ 17.60|$  8800.00| $ 30.00($ 15000.00
61 z:fgl_‘ésﬁi:s?f;ﬁ’ﬂ 1,500 TN | $ 11.18|$ 16,770.00| $ 1326|$ 19,890.00| $ 27.00( $  40,500.00
62 SERT;EV,\\‘”TN\?ARR%W GRAVEL 750 TN | $ 1475|$ 1106250 $ 11.10|$  8,32500| $ 27.00( $ 20,250.00
63 ?)ESST%E&AITNGT%%EL 1,500 TN | $ 11.00| $ 16,500.00| $ 11.12|$ 16,680.00| $ 25.00| $ 37,500.00
64 gEgSTWo"J\‘gTRS\\/\A/lYGle/:\\rﬁL4o 7500 TN |$ 1050 $ 78750.00] $ 13.64|$ 102,300.00( $ 24.00| $ 180,000.00
65 QEJSLVS"S\?I?%‘Q,\AGF?ZAQ’IEL 375 TN | $ 1400|$ 5250.00| $ 1350|$  506250| $ 21.00($  7,875.00
66 QIL’SI:II—(;SLDDE}—I:\:/\I/’\\I(%SEQ/ZES& 1,500 TN | $ 1440|$ 21,60000| $ 13.75|$ 2062500 $ 22.00( $ 33,000.00
67 2:?;?_‘&"5“3@3"2"352’5" 750 TN | $ 1400|$ 1050000 $ 11.75|$  8,81250| $ 26.00( $ 19,500.00
68 [ ey Ve 750| TN |$ 1079|s  809250] $ 10.75|$  806250|$ 2400 s 1800000
69 EB)IIR’S(-)FKGEEIJ\IE;(:)I\%GV\IG;SA'I'VIE\II_VYZ MP277 1,500 TN | $ 1075|$ 16,125.00| $ 1048|$ 15720.00| $ 25.00| $ 37,500.00
70 [ R o e o7 500| TN |$ 1410|s  7,05000] $ 13.99|$  699500|$ 27.00{ s 1350000
71 EETTSL\J’:GEE\‘%OW GRAVEL Hwy 750| TN $ 1434|$ 10,755.00| $ 27.00( $  20,250.00 $ 1165|$  8737.50
72 gﬁgfo“é'ﬁaﬁ%ﬁﬁgﬂ 2)500| TN $ 1046 |$ 26,150.00| $ 10.00| $ 25000.00| $ 13.25| $ 33,125.00
73 351&2':2?@%6@%? 2,500 TN $ 1250 $ 31,250.00| $ 11.00| $ 27,500.00| $ 13.25| $  33,125.00
“ E{f,I(SGAS&aTESTARTA%igVEL 5,000 TN $ 1740 $ 87,000.00| $ 14.00| $ 70,000.00| $ 16.40| $  82,000.00
75 aﬁig@ig”gs&aﬁlﬂwa 1,500 TN | $ 1046|$ 1569000 $ 14.03|$ 21,045.00| $ 23.00( $ 34,500.00
76 lealigAslTﬁle?gFG,&SfE"N HWY 1 5 500] ™ $ 2252|$ 56,300.00] $ 21.00|$ 52,500.00 $ 1197 $ 2992500
77 Eﬁzgﬁﬂiﬂggfﬁﬁ (G)E'?A\LEL'LEN 2,000( TN $ 27.02|$ 5404000 $ 23.00($ 46,000.00 $ 1547|$ 3094000
78 aﬁlgfgigﬁﬁm\/&wum 500 TN $ 2352|$ 11,760.00| $ 22.00( $  11,000.00 $ 1197|$  5985.00
79 E{fg:ZWM'EEOF;%V,\:IiRQVR%N 2,000( TN $ 1398|$ 27,960.00| $ 20.00( $  40,000.00 $ 1633 $ 3266000
80 3§1§2A§,2”2°0§2°ﬁ’§§§2‘(,a 1,500 TN $ 1946 $ 29,190.00] $ 23.00| $  34,500.00 $ 1083|$ 29745.00
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

5990 OF

Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 2/6/19

. A"“"'C°alG'a"e"gj:fc;r;?nsré‘;’:\lé‘l’\””dm""Gra"e'a"d Overton Sand & Gravel Co. Paulsen Inc Pine Bluffs Gravel &Exc Inc Simon STALP GRAVEL, INC. Triple G Redimix LLC
g

Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price [ Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
8L [P TS 1,000{ TN $ 2054 $ 2054000($ 2200($ 22000005 2312 $ 2312000 $ 1616|$ 16,160.00
83 [P N e Eron 1,500 TN $ 2072|$ 31,08000[$ 2300|$ 34,500.00 $ 1399 $ 20985.00
84 E{/?I-\I'(:ZWMIEEZR;%VI\:IC\;I\'I?(A)\IiESLTAPLETON S00) ™ $ 1364]9 ©682000)9 2000/$ 1000000 S 132018 6000%
85 55152A§QA23§3°@’$ gﬁg\ﬁ};LETON 1,500 TN $ 19.10|$ 28650.00| $ 23.00($  34,500.00 $ 1629| $  24,435.00
O A AWY2 1 000| TN $ 2414|$ 24,14000| $ 2300 $ 23,000.00 $ 1300|$ 13,0000
8 [P 1,000{ TN $ 1439|$ 1439000 2200($ 2200000|5 1678 16,780.00
88 z@z:z""M'EEF;OI"l"M?EAA\;ETLHUR 1,000| TN $ 1590|$ 15900.00| $ 2200($ 22,00000|$ 1858 $  18580.00
89 [P & 1,000{ TN $ 1520 $ 1520000($ 2200 $ 2200000|5 17.86[ 3 17:860.00
90 | AR e CRAVEL 1,000 TN $ 2504|$ 2504000 $ 27.00|$ 27,000.00 $ 1250 $  12,500.00
o1 a{f{lg"\\ﬂ"z‘;s:f:;gzﬁva 1,000| TN $ 27.74|$ 27,74000| $ 3000 $  30,000.00 $ 1400($  14,000.00
2 S 1,000 TN $ 1036|$ 1936000 $ 23.00| $ 23,000.00| $ 2328[$ 2328000
93 | o1 WPz 2oMIN OF BN | 550 ™ B 2116)8 178600 o 2o25]s 2Lae2so
7 Aoy 2,200 TN $ 1725|$ 37,95000| $ 19.00| $ 41,800.00| $ 1876[$ 4127200
95 D O ) o e 600| TN $ 16255 975000($ 1800 $ 10800005 18143 10884.00
o7 |DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL s00| ™ $ 1833[$  14,664.00
B o
a9 |DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 2000 ™ $ 1358|S  27.160.00
100|2ST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 00| TN $ 19843 992000
101 ’\DAIESIISIBE’I\?::\IA% SRAVEL 2,000 TN $ 2255|$  45,100.00
]
o ]
o
105 G AR TETT YARD Looo| ™
o]
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

5990 OF

Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 2/6/19

. | Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and o5 sand & Gravel Co. Paulsen Inc Pine Bluffs Gravel &Exc Inc Simon STALP GRAVEL, INC. Triple G Redimix LLC
Surfacing Gravel
2
)
Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price [ Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
07| ONEILL YARD 5001 TN
DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
108| SPRINGVIEW YARD 1,000 TN $ 2183|$ 21,830.00
DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
1091, \Wy7 MP3 AT BREWSTER 2,000) TN
DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
1101, /WY11 MP14 S OF ATKINSON 500 TN
DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
1111} iWy281 MP148 JCT 70 AND 281 1,500) TN
DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
1121, Wy281 MP142 6MI S OF JCT 70 A 4,000 TN
DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
11311 iwyo1 MP36 3500) TN
DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
114{ oo vpas 2,500 TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
1151, 1WY12 MP80 AT BROCKSBURG 600| TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
1161, 1WY20 MP135 1M W OF MERRIMAN 1,200) TN $ 2255| %  27,060.00
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
11711 WY20 MP165 6MI E OF CODY. 600 TN $ 1984| $  11,904.00
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
1181, /WY12 MP19 1MI E OF SPARKS 600| TN $ 1698| $ 10,188.00
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
1191} 1WY20 MP202 6MIE OF VALENTINE 1,200] TN $ 1348| $ 16,176.00
OPTION 1:DELIVERY COST PER TON 15/ton 18 per 207ton]
120| \RMOR COAT ALT/ADD LOCATIONS 2000 N| " | ® s0.00 on mie | se.00[ <L | s 4000|$ 020]$ 40.00
OPTION 2:DELIVERY COST PER TON 15/ton 18 per
121 DEICING ALT/ADD LOCATIONS 2000 N e | ® s0.00 ton mie | 36.00 $ 020]89 40.00
OPTION 3:DELIVERY COST PER TON 15/ton 18 per
122)\\/|INDROW ALT/ADD LOCATIONS 2000 TN e | ® s0.00 ton mile | 36.00 $ 0209 40.00
OPTION 4:DELIVERY COST PER TON 15/ton
123| SURFACING ALT/ADD LOCATIONS 2000 N e | $ s0.00 $ 02019 40.00
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
124|,,WY51 MP 23 4 MI N OF LYONS 5000) TN $ 18.00| $  90,000.00
Total $172.26 | $_230,310.70] $683.66 | $1,003,513.50| $ 1,241.00] $ 2,169,225.00| $531.25] $1,119.281.50] $ 51.20] $_124,540.00] $ _368.11] $_441,804.50
Payment Terms - 100-90 0-30
Delivery Days ARO 30 60 Per ITB 30 60
Comments
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

5990 OF

Department of Transportation

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and

Ulrich Gravel Inc.

WesTeRN MATeRIALs INC

ﬁ Surfacing Gravel
£
-}

Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
O e R ]
s [oSTorghe chver 22|
I A o]
A e
o o A o | 20|
7 ?éigiiiggs COAT GRAVEL 1500 TN
5 0Tt CORT G o]
S e e soo]
10 SES&BIEI\‘I_IC_:I\’(\‘AGRERAVEL 500( TN | $9.98Tn | $ 4,990.00
11 (DBIRSI-EI—IE‘tLE\E(IgA’\I‘?GDGRAVEL 300| TN | $12.98Tn| $ 3,894.00
12 Z_II_S;:UEI)_E’\LS:;‘\‘?\G(AR:;EL 1,000( TN | $10.10Tn| $ 10,100.00
13 E(I)SJP4CDHI§\I(CYH:(;[()3RAVEL 600| TN | $12.00Tn| $ 7,200.00
14 | W34 MP2A7 SMIW AURORA 100o| ™
15 | XCTe1 AND 92.3 MW OF OSCEOLA 0| ™
16 [P S O aer ELL 00| TN | s1450Tn|s  7,250.00
17 D o o o st 500| TN | $1325Tn|s  6,625.00
18 | W6 P219 611 £ OF HASTINGS s00| ™
19 | wvze1 Mp1o TMIN OF REDCLoun | 60| ™
20 | WY261 MPY S OF RED CLOUD 100o| ™
21 | Y30 P339 1M1 E OF CENTRAL 1200| ™
22 E(I)SJ;(?;W?ARR%OATGRAVEL 2,000 TN | $15.25Tn| $ 30,500.00
23 | Y6 MP219 6MI £ OF HASTINGS %0 ™
2 | wyzs1 MpT 2w N OF RED CLoup || 1420 ™
25 | Y39 MP2L 4 MIN OF GENOA 2000| TN
26 | WY1 MP106 7 MIN OF FULLERTO 100 ™
27 z:/?l-\r(flelgg)sR](_)l\)ll:ll\?gé\(l)i_D 700 TN | $10.26 Tn| $ 7,182.00
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

5990 OF

Department of Transportation

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and

Ulrich Gravel Inc.

WesTeRN MATeRIALs INC

ﬁ Surfacing Gravel
=
3

Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
28 | WY1 MPGE SMI S OF ORD 1400 ™ | 5105070 | 5 1470000
2 z{/?l-\r(:svlv:\,/\lfgiolvxﬂﬁ?g\fsl_TPAUL 700| TN | $1010Tn| $  7,070.00
30 | Y261 MPE9 5 M S OF ST PAUL 700| ™
st zl/?l-l\'(:s\iv:\,/\lfligvva?EA(;/FEI(_;REELEY 1200 TN | $1250Tn | $  15,000.00
32 aﬁzgs\ﬁl:uglzg\yMGIRI\JAXELGREELEY 1200 TN [ $11.37Tn[$  13,644.00
33 z:fl-\r(gsvlv:\,/\lfligvj\.locl;\ﬁ?\lvgtGREELEY 1200| TN | $11.37Tn | $  13,644.00
34 a{flrfgs\Ar\l/:QZDng m E%AFV:(I'_)CKVILLE 1,280 TN [ $11.50Tn [ $  14,720.00
35 zﬁigzvﬂggzﬁm?x%’f II:OUP cIT 640( TN | $1225Tn| $  7,840.00
36 | CERING MANT YARD - Lo00| T s o0|s 903000
37 gﬁgggggﬂﬁf\f[?AVﬂ 1,000 TN $ 14.25|$  14,250.00
38 | CHAPPELL MAINT YARD 2000| TN s 2508 47.00000
3 | MBALL MAINT vARD 2000| TN s 1677| 3 3350000
40 Q:SLEYDEE:\T‘TG&?{QVEL 2,000 TN $ 2411|$  48,220.00
41 | w20 wp 25 10w oF CrAwrorp | 29%°| ™ s 2787|s 5574000
42 afSRﬁé\gﬁf siR%OATGRAVEL 3,000 TN $ 2156 $  64,680.00
43 | \WV26 MPED M S OF HARRISON 4000| TN s 19075 7982000
%4 | W25 P3G 241 N OF MITCHELL 2000| ™ s 1523]s 3046000
45 | wvzsompao om s of mustviLie | 29%°| ™ s w54[5 7108000
46 | rwvz1 MPoo 278 N OF ScorTseLy | 39| ™ s 140]s  s220000
47 | w26 Mpa1 3CT26 AND L34 2000| T s 1689|s 3378000
48 | Wyes MPLT 13M1 S OF GERING 3000| s 15238 4569000
49 | W30 MPES BMIW OF SIDNEY 2000| TN s 31038 6206000
50 EEQQQSJ”R%R&%TGRAVEL 2,000 TN $ 1622 $  32,440.00
51 | Wv27 MPS? 10MIE OF CHAPPELL 4000| TN s 2735 s 10040000
52 | \Wve7 P18 16 Wi N OF ALLIANCE 4000| ™ s 2570[s 10280000
53 zﬁlgmgg?mﬁv%ﬁom PLA 2,000| TN $ 1216|$  24,320.00
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing bevart 5{99]‘OTOF i Opening Date: 2/6/19
epartment of Transportation

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and Ulrich Gravel Inc. WesTeRN MATeRIALS INC

* Surfacing Gravel
2
-}
Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY
54 23 MP 56 DICKENS 2,000 TN $ 1205|$ 24,100.00
55 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 2,500 TN $ 875($ 21,875.00

HWY30 MP103 7MI NW BIG SPRINGS

DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
56 NORTH PLATTE W 14TH YARD 1,000( TN $ 875| 8% 8,750.00

DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
NORTH PLATTE I-80 YARD
56 |DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL Loo] ™ s 7ss|s 755000
S e
S e |

DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL

57 1,000( TN $ 875|$% 8,750.00

61 | ANSLEY MAINT YARD 1,500 TN | $11.75Tn| $  17,625.00

%2 | CARGENT VARD 750| ™

53 | OCONTO MANT YARD 1500| TN

4 | OGONTO JCT HWY 24AND 40 7500| T

65 |DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL el ™ ol

ARNOLD HWY 92 MP 251

DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
66 ARNOLD HWY 92 MP 251 1,500( TN $ 1398|$ 20,970.00

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
67 ANSELMO HWY 2 MP 257 750| TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
68 BROKEN BOW HWY21 MP68 750 TN

DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL

69 BROKEN BOW WEST HWY2 MP277 1,500 TN
DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
70 BROKEN BOW WEST HWY2 MP277 5001 TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY
n 2 AT DUNNING 750 ™
72 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 2,500 TN $ 1364 ($ 34,100.00

ROSCOE HWY30 MP136

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
73 |0GALLALA HWY26 MP136 25001 TN $ 19.44|$  48,600.00

DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
74 HWY26 MP141 ESTRADAS 50001 TN

DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
s HWY 30 AT OVERTON 1,500 TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY
76 2 MP 183 1MIW OF MULLEN 25001 TN
DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
HWY 2 MP 183 1MIW OF MULLEN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL

8 HWY 2 MP 183 1MI'W OF MULLEN 5001 TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY92 MP205 2MI E TYRON
DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL

80 HWY92 MP205 2MI E TYRON 1,500 TN $ 1664 ($ 24,960.00

7 2,000 TN

79 2,000 TN $ 1364 | $ 27,280.00
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing bevart StggfoTOF i Opening Date: 2/6/19
epartment of Transportation

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and

. Ulrich Gravel Inc. WesTeRN MATeRIALs INC
Surfacing Gravel

Line #

Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
81 |HwY2 MP144 2MI W HYANNIS 10001 TN

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
82 HWY83 MP130 18MI N STAPLETON 1,000} TN $ 1369] % 13690.00

DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
83 HWY83 MP127 12MI N STAPLETON 1,5001 TN $ 161418 24,210.00

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
84 HWY92 MP225 3MI W OF STAPLETON 500 TN $ 1196] % 5.980.00

DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
8 HWY92 MP225 3MI W OF STAPLETON 1,500 TN $ 14961 $  22,440.00

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY2
86 |MP176 10MI W OF MULLEN 1,000 TN

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
87 HWY61 MP126 1MI N ARTHUR 1,000 TN

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
88 HWY92 MP175 11MI E ARTHUR 1,000) TN

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
89 HWY61 MP131 7MI N ARTHUR 1,000 TN

DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
90 THEDFORD YARD 1,000) TN

DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
o HWY 2 MP 227 AT HALSEY 1,000 TN

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
92 HWYS15A MP3 4MI W OF IMPERIAL 1,000) TN

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
% HWY61 MP24 20MI N OF BENKELMAN 850] TN

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
%4 |HWY61 MP58 OMI S OF GRANT 2,200| TN

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
9 HWY23 MP14 5MI'W OF GRANT 600| TN

DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
96 HWY136 MP24 2 MI E OF ORLEANS 680| TN

DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
il SPRINGVIEW YARD 800| TN

DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
98 AINSWORTH YARD 1,500) TN

DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL

99 VALENTINE YARD 20001 TN
o
P |
o
i |
104 EB)E;V?;EE)E%ISLGJTiR:A\/REé 1,000 TN | $10.75Tn| $ 10,750.00
105 gIAS;T?_EDﬁ?QSDGRAVEL 1,000( TN | $10.37Tn| $ 10,370.00
106 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 2,000 TN | $12.00Tn| $ 24,000.00

TAYLOR YARD
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing bevart StggfoTOF i Opening Date: 2/6/19
epartment of Transportation

. Armor Coat Gravel, Delcmg Gravel, Windrow Gravel and Ulrich Gravel Inc. WesTeRN MATeRIALS INC
Surfacing Gravel
2
-}
Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
107 O'NEILL YARD 500 TN
DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
108 SPRINGVIEW YARD 1,000) TN
DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
109 HWY7 MP3 AT BREWSTER 2,000) TN
DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
110 HWY11 MP14 S OF ATKINSON 500] TN
DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
111 HWY281 MP148 JCT 70 AND 281 1,500( TN | $18.00Tn| $ 27,000.00
DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
112 HWY281 MP142 6MI S OF JCT 70 A 4,000 TN | $17.00Tn| $ 68,000.00
DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
113 HWY91 MP36 3,500 TN
DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
114 HWY91 MP43 2,500 TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
115 HWY12 MP80 AT BROCKSBURG 600 TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
116 HWY20 MP135 1MI W OF MERRIMAN 1,200) TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
17 HWY20 MP165 6MI E OF CODY 600 TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
18 HWY12 MP19 1MI E OF SPARKS 600| TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
119 HWY20 MP202 6MIE OF VALENTINE 1,200] TN
OPTION 1:DELIVERY COST PER TON .22 ton
120 ARMOR COAT ALT/ADD LOCATIONS 2001 TN | $ 015)'% 30.00 mile $ 44.00
OPTION 2:DELIVERY COST PER TON .22ton
121 DEICING ALT/ADD LOCATIONS 2001 TN | $ 015/'$ s0.00 mile $ 44.00
OPTION 3:DELIVERY COST PER TON .23 ton
122 WINDROW ALT/ADD LOCATIONS 2001 TN | $ 015 % 80.00 mile $ 46.00
OPTION 4:DELIVERY COST PER TON .23 ton
123 SURFACING ALT/ADD LOCATIONS 200 TN mile $ 46.00
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
124 HWY51 MP 23 4 MI N OF LYONS 5000 TN
Total $ 25823 | $ 322,194.00| $566.63 | $1,215,997.50
Payment Terms 0-30
Delivery Days ARO as needed
Comments
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