Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

AWARD

5990 OF Revised
Department of Transportation

AWARD

AWARD

AWARD

AWARD

Opening Date: 2/6/19

AWARD

ﬁ Armor Coat Gravel, SDSri;:;r;?nggil\'/:\lé\lNindrowGravel and Armstrong Rentals, LLC | Atkinson Sand & Gravel Inc D&LSA’\:_?_C& CrAVEL DeWeese Sand & Gravel Ed Broad:gtrivirns Eand :/CA)I\(IDSERGBF;(\)/ETEI\FS
£
3
Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price| Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price [ Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
1 EE;;NE\)AIIE(I)%%GYERRQVEL 715| TN | $ 1815( $ 12,977.25
R 22| | voss
4 aﬁlﬁggsiﬁ%%ﬁGRAVEL 500( TN | $ 23.15|$ 11,575.00
O e o | 2] | nons
7 ?éiTSiAARN'\S(;s COAT GRAVEL 1,500 TN No Bid
s o7 Ao CORTSrAE: s | o
2 e soo | o
T sof | oo
T o] | s
12 QITS;:U?_E,\E:;‘\]?ﬁ:gEL 1,000 TN | NoBid $ 10.00| $  10,000.00 $ 970|$  9,700.00
R soo] | s
14 a:/?/1§4Dr\/E|£T7GaalR®VAESRORA 1,000| TN | NoBid $ 9343  9340.00 $ 890($  8900.00
) i pe N ) B
T e I
R o] [ o
s e ez | o] ™ | o sorsls nowo osls man
) P R T ) I
22 ECI)SJP“S_@MY)ER%OATGRAVEL 2,000 TN No Bid
24 Emfsmp[)ffw r\(l3 g?@bcmuo 1,420/ TN |$ 17.65|$  25063.00 $ 1389|$ 19,723.80 $ 14.15|$  20,093.00
e e
25 |\ Y14 MP106 7 M N OF FULLERTO 100) ™ | o
27 | W11 MP7E 111 N OF ORD 700) ™ | nosid
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

5990 OF Revised
Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 2/6/19

z Armor Coat Gravel, gjlfc;r;?n;;g/;\l,e\llvindrowGravel and Armstrong Rentals, LLC | Atkinson Sand & Gravel Inc D&LSA’\:_?_é‘ ERAYEL DeWeese Sand & Gravel = Broad;?gtrgvzlons Sand ggh?DKiRG??i?/ETIEISE
£
-}
Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
2 [ o e o] [ o
29 E:/?I-\r(;s\iv:\’/\lfgiolvxﬂﬁ\?g\éESLTPAUL 700| TN No Bid $ 1017 $ 7,119.00 $ 960| % 6,720.00
30 El/?l-l\'(gsvlv:\,/\lfszosvxﬂ?gg\élzsl:rPAuL 700| TN No Bid $ 942|% 6,594.00 $ 878($% 6,146.00
3 | wyzs Mp120 2MIN OF Gregrey | 1200 T | Noed
2 | 2o MpLzs 7 MNOF GReetey | 1200| ™ | Moo
3 | wyzs1 Mp129 10 MIN OF GReeLEY | 1200 T | Noed
34 [DSTAWNDROWGRAVEL 1 50| v [ o s 1850[ 5 2208000
o e I I
a7 |DIST S DEICING GRAVEL 1000 ™ | Nosia
e e 20| v | oo
5o o CEAEL zo0o] 7 | o
o e roms | 2000 | e
42 |DISTS ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 3000| ™ | Nosia
e [OT S NOR CON AV | 2| | o
R ) B
4 | w71 MP30 271N OF SCOTTSBLY | 3090| TN | NoBid
47| 26 MPAL 9CT26 AND Lo2A 2000] ™ | NoEid
s o spemon comomavel | soom| | e
N e 2| | o
o e e I
e R R
o e s | 20| ] oo

Page 2 of 20



Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

5990 OF Revised
Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 2/6/19

z Armor Coat Gravel, gjlfc;r;?n;;g/;\l,e\llvindrowGravel and Armstrong Rentals, LLC | Atkinson Sand & Gravel Inc D&LSA’\:_?_é‘ ERAYEL DeWeese Sand & Gravel = Broad;?gtrgvzlons Sand ggh?DKiRG??i?/ETIEISE
£

-}

Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price

4 [DISTEWINDROW GRAVEL——— FWY| 005l 1 | osa
oo e e | 20| | oo
S o[ v | oo
o7 [oeanEens o o[ v [ oo
e o5 DT e o[ v | oo
B o] [ s
oo DT SRR ComT CTAVEL soo] | o
o1 [y o e sooo] [ o
62 S,LS;(_‘,GEV[\\jl'erYDARR%W GRAVEL 750 TN No Bid
o5 [oey e sooo] [ o
o R e 70| 70 [ o
o5 D5 s eron CAveL s7o] | voss
os Do one crve soon| v | oo
o7 T ot A o] | o
os D57 oo oA roo] | o
R e s e
71 SE‘ITSL\;\IGEE\EOW GRAVEL HWY 750| TN No Bid
T2 o RO e 2s00] 70 | os
T T S SO A sooo| [ o
T o o ST sooo] [ o
7o DTt oL Y | za| | nos
T et | 2o | nos
A e
T DT ayumeron ST zoo| [ o
o0 DT ot AL 1] | oo
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

5990 OF Revised
Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 2/6/19

z Armor Coat Gravel, gjlfc;r;?n;;g/;\l,e\llvindrowGravel and Armstrong Rentals, LLC | Atkinson Sand & Gravel Inc D&LSA’\:_?_é‘ ERAYEL DeWeese Sand & Gravel = Broad;?gtrgvzlons Sand ggh?DKiRG??i?/ETIEISE
£
3
Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
e o s oo | e
82 Eﬁigamgf;ﬂvgm?mﬁhmm 1,000 TN f No Bid
B3 | W83 MPL27 1211 N STAPLETON 1500| ™ | Nosid
3 | wivo2 Mp22s s w OF STapLETON | 900| T | NoBid
o e e ST ST o | 50| | oo
e A oo | e
88 E$1:2m2f7§()1V1\IM?EAA\§TI_HUR 1,000 TN [ NoBid
SR oo | e
R o] | oo
o o oo | oo
o ey | 00| | o
e ) B I
o o O STAE 22| | oo
e o] | s
9 E:/?/I(Za\g:\,/\:g;ozvxn?; (A)\IgE(I)_RLEANS 680 TN | NoBid $ 1048|$  7,126.40
97 Q}LSF;SGDSEVI\T?A%RDAVEL 800| TN | NoBid $ 1452($ 11,616.00
98 z:,ﬁg\igiw\iggwﬂ 1,500| TN | No Bid $ 989($ 1483500[$ 995|$ 14,925.00
99 SfiE%EIEyERgRAVEL 2,000 TN No Bid $ 20.00($ 40,000.00] $ 12.40( $ 24,800.00
100 Egg\?EAigNG GRAVEL 500| TN No Bid $ 2400|$ 12,000.00| $ 17.75( $ 8,875.00
101 als;sllai:\?yAigRAVEL 2,000 TN No Bid $ 2948|$ 58960.00] $ 29.00( $ 58,000.00
102 E,IASPTE??DYI?AICR:’IE,)\‘G GRAVEL 500| TN No Bid $ 1160| $ 5,800.00
103 SEETN%'EEI?(TSDGRAVEL 500 TN | NoBid $ 1020($  5100.00
104| B RWELL SOUTH vARD 1000 TN | No Eid 5 1000[s 100000
s S CEERE SRV L] | oo
106 ‘IE')IASY-II'_gsI\E(fII?’\I‘DG GRAVEL 2,000 TN No Bid
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

5990 OF Revised
Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 2/6/19

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and . D & L SAND & GRAVEL Ed Broadfoot & Sons Sand| HOOKER BROTHERS
z Surfacing Gravel Armstrong Rentals, LLC | Atkinson Sand & Gravel Inc LLC DeWeese Sand & Gravel & Gravel SAND & GRAVEL INC
5
Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price

DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL .
107 O'NEILL YARD 500( TN No Bid $ 8.74| $ 4,370.00

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL .
108 SPRINGVIEW YARD 1,000 TN No Bid $ 18.08| $ 18,080.00

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL .
109 HWY7 MP3 AT BREWSTER 2,000) TN No Bid

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL .
110 HWY11 MP14 S OF ATKINSON 500| TN No Bid $ 947| $ 4,735.00

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL .
11 HWY281 MP148 JCT 70 AND 281 1,500) TN No Bid

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL .
12 HWY281 MP142 6MI S OF JCT 70 A 4,000 TN No Bid

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL .
113 HWY91 MP36 3,500 TN No Bid

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL .
114 HWY91 MP43 2,500 TN No Bid

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL .
115 HWY12 MP80 AT BROCKSBURG 600| TN No Bid $ 1180 $ 7,080.00

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL .
116 HWY20 MP135 1Ml W OF MERRIMAN 1,200 TN No Bid $ 2950|$ 35400.00] $ 20.60( $ 24,720.00

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL .
117 HWY20 MP165 6MI E OF CODY 600| TN No Bid $ 26.25($ 15750.000 $ 16.94( $ 10,164.00

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL .
118 HWY12 MP19 1MI E OF SPARKS 600| TN No Bid $ 1962|$ 11,772.00] $ 16.70( $ 10,020.00

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL .
119 HWY20 MP202 6MIE OF VALENTINE 1,200 TN No Bid $ 1979 $ 23,748.000 $ 12.10( $ 14,520.00

OPTION 1:DELIVERY COST PER TON .
120| \RMOR COAT ALT/ADD LOCATIONS 200] TN [ NoBid 9 wBs S

OPTION 2:DELIVERY COST PER TON . A5¢
121 DEICING ALT/ADD LOCATIONS 200 TN No Bid $ 0B 0y TON Mile

OPTION 3:DELIVERY COST PER TON . A5¢ .
1221\)|INDROW ALT/ADD LOCATIONS 2001 TN f NoBid TON Mile 'ZOTQ"’M' 2 R200

OPTION 4:DELIVERY COST PER TON .
123 SURFACING ALT/ADD LOCATIONS 200 TN No Bid

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL .
124],\WY51 MP 23 4 MI N OF LYONS 5000] TN [ NoBid

Total $ 76.10| $ 56,475.25| $ 281.24| $ 287,306.00| $135.74| $ 166,084.00] $128.23| $ 103,225.20| $ 18.20| $ 23,720.00] $134.85] $ 115,888.00
Payment Terms 0-30 Net-30 100-30 et-45 00-30
Delivery Days ARO 14 15 10 45 15
Comments
Award of Bid Tab Revised to correct Western
Materials, Inc. Unit Price bids for Lines 122 & 123.
No Bids Tie Breaker
K4 Trucking Line 20
DeWeese Sand & Gravel,Inc.Wins Tie Breaker
Island Landhandlers
Invalid Bids

Matteo Sand & Gravel

Line 99

D &L Sand & Gravel LLC-Wins Tie Breaker

Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc.
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

5990 OF Revised

Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 2/6/19

HWY11 MP78 1MI N OF ORD

AWARD AWARD AWARD AWARD AWARD
ﬁ Armor CoatGravel,;)Sri;::;?n;;ré;/ae\:é\ll\lindrowGravel and Island Landhandlers Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc, L.G. Everist, Inc L &L Gravel Lyman Richey Corporation| Marxsen Sand & Gravel
c
= . P . I . Unit . P Extended I . I .
Description Qty |UOM|Unit Price [ Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price Price Extended Price | Unit Price Price Unit Price [ Extended Price |Unit Price | Extended Price
i i
o e 2asa|
A o
5 3@1§2A;£A§8R6(l\:ﬂ?égivg§;OE 2,500 TN $ 1546( $ 38,650.00| $ 14.00| $ 35,000.00
7 ?(I;?—Tsi):i’\é%s COAT GRAVEL 1500 TN
5 |25 Ao SoRT GRAVE: soo]
9 ELIJSLTLAERD_II.E(I)(I;IN'\AGA%??(\QTQLD 500 TN |$ 1455| $ 7,275.00 $ 15.42| $ 7,710.00
10 gﬁgfﬁﬁ?'ﬁfRﬁRAVEL 500( TN $ 1043|$  5215.00
11 EEESLEEIS(:XL%GRAVEL 300| TN $ 1336 $ 4,008.00
12 [S)-II-S;:U[I)_E'\IA?AI:;‘\‘?(Y;EQ\)/EL 1,000 TN | $ 10.20| $ 10,200.00
13 E(I)SJ;;I)E\I(C\K(;E?RAVEL 600| TN $ 1265 $ 7,590.00
1 D A A RORA 1000 TN |s 9558 955000
15 [3CTo1 AND 92 341 W OF OSCEOLA 80| ™ s 1473 1252080
16 3@1;2A,§2"32§20,\2$22’;X§WELL 500| TN | $ 17.30|$  8650.00] $ 1525($  7,625.00
17 |Lwy22 P24 sMiw OF SCOTIA 00| ™ 5 1375)s 687500
N e I ) R
19 | hwv2ei MP1o TMINOF RED CLoup | 80| ™ [$ 1925]'8 1155000
20 [DIST4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL Looo| ™ |5 1975| 5 1975000
21|, W30 M3 111 £ OF CENTRAL 1200 TN |5 1585| 19.02000
22 |\ p ey R e 2,000{ TN $ 1625($  32,500.00
23 | WYG MP215 6MI £ OF HASTINGS 400| ™
24 |inwv2et wpT owI N OF RED cLoup | 2420 ™
25 | W39 P21 1 MIN OF GENOA 2000 TN s 98ls 1972000
2 | WY1 MP105 71 N OF FULLERTO w0 ™ il e
7 |DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL 00| TN s 1085|5 759500
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing o :990{O¢$evisedn . Opening Date: 2/6/19
epartment of Transportation

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and

iy Island Landhandlers Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc, L.G. Everist, Inc L &L Gravel Lyman Richey Corporation| Marxsen Sand & Gravel
Surfacing Gravel

Line #

Description Qty |UOM|Unit Price [ Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price PUHT:IL Extended Price | Unit Price Exli&er:lcied Unit Price [ Extended Price |Unit Price | Extended Price

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
28 HWY11 MP6E8 5MI S OF ORD 1,400 TN $ 1110 $ 15,540.00

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
2 HWY281 MP95 1 MIN OF ST PAUL 700 TN $ 1020 $ 7,140.00

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
30 |1iwy281 MP89 5 MI S OF ST PAUL 700) TN $ 936|% 6,552.00

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
st HWY281 MP120 2MI N OF GREELEY 1,200] TN $ 1285 $ 15420.00

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
32 HWY281 MP125 7 MIN OF GREELEY 1,200] TN $ 1L75]$ 1410000

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
33 HWY281 MP129 10 MIN OF GREELEY 1,200] TN e R

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
34 HWY58 MP29 1 MIN OF ROCKVILLE 1,280] TN $ 1260|$ 1612800

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
35 HWY92 MP320 1 MIW OF LOUP CIT 640 TN $ 1275| % 8,160.00

DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
36 | GERING MAINT YARD 1,000 TN

DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
s7 BRIDGPORT YARD 1,000) TN

DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
38 CHAPPELL MAINT YARD 2,000] TN

DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
39 |KIMBALL MAINT YARD 2,000 TN

DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
40 |SIDNEY MAINT YARD 2,000 TN

DIST 5§ ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
1 |HWY20 MP 25 10MI W OF CRAWFORD 2,000) TN

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
42 | JARRISON YARD 3,000 TN

DIST 5 ARMOR COATGRAVEL
43 HWY29 MP59 9MI S OF HARRISON 40001 TN

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
a4 HWY29 MP36 24MI N OF MITCHELL 2,000] TN

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
45 HWY250 MP39 9MI S OF RUSHVILLE 2,000 TN $ 32151 $ 64,300.00

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
46 HWY71 MP90 27MI N OF SCOTTSBLU 3,000] TN

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
47 HWY26 MP41 JCT26 AND L62A 2,000 TN

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
48 HWY88 MP17 13MI S OF GERING 3,0001 TN

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
49 HWY30 MP55 3MI W OF SIDNEY 2,000] TN

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
50 HARRISBURG YARD 2000f TN

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
51 HWY27 MP92 10MI E OF CHAPPELL 40001 TN

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
52 | w87 MP16 16 MI N OF ALLIANCE 4000 TN

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
53 HWY97 MP9 12MI NW OF NORTH PLA 2,000 TN
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

Department of Transportation

5990 OF Revised

Opening Date: 2/6/19

#* Armor CoatGraveI.;)Srif;r;?nsg:/;\ié\ll\lindrowGravel and Island Landhandlers Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc, L.G. Everist, Inc L & L Gravel Lyman Richey Corporation| Marxsen Sand & Gravel

@

c

] ipfi it Pri i it Pri . Unit - . Extended L ] o '
Description Qty |UOM|Unit Price [ Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price Price Extended Price |Unit Price Price Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price

5 | Do b 56 Dikens | 2000

55 3{/?/1360\/\1\’/:2?0207\1/\VA|?\5\/A\|;% SPRINGS 2,500| TN

5 | NORTH PLATTE W 14TH YARD 1o0o|

57 | NORTH PLATTE 180 YARD Looo| T

58 | U THERLAND MAIT YARD Looo|

oo QTSR con ol i s T

53 | SCONTO MANT YARD Ls00]

4 | OCONTO ICT Wy Z1AND 40 7500] TN

55 | ARNOLD Hw 52 WP 251 a7s|

55 | RNOLD HWY 82 M 251 Ls00|

o7 D578 MRy CRAVET = —

o TR oo | o PP PR

7L | AT NG HWYl - 780| ™ $ 8898 6667.50 s 15.15| 5 1036250

2 | ROSCOE MWV NP1 2500

3 | OGALLALA HW26 MPYS. 2500]

™ AW 26 MP141 ESTRADAS. 5000 T

75 | WY 30 AT OVERTON - Ls00|

i 3{/?/:62;?/'12?5,\%\,5 gs’:ﬂ\(ﬁiEN 2,000 TN $ 1850| $ 37,000.00 $ 12.45( $ 24,900.00

i 3@12?4?012613%\/55 MULLEN S00[ TN $ 1500 $  7,500.00 $ 1050 $ 5,250.00

7 | iwvo2 MP205 211 £ TYRON 2000 ™

0 |, Vo2 MP205 2MIE TYRON. 1500
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

5990 OF Revised

Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 2/6/19

e Armor CoatGraveI.gsri;i\r;?n;s?:/:\ié\l/\lindrowGravel and Island Landhandlers Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc, L.G. Everist, Inc L &L Gravel Lyman Richey Corporation| Marxsen Sand & Gravel

o

c

= - . ) . ) Unit ) R Extended . ) . )
Description Qty |UOM|Unit Price [ Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price Price Extended Price | Unit Price Price Unit Price [ Extended Price |Unit Price | Extended Price

B | W2 MPLA 21 W HVANNIS 1o0o| T s 10805 190000 5 1650] $ 1650000

82 31/?/1\—(863\/;\1/:2?3%01\21M?EAS\{I'EA|}’LET0N 1,000] TN $ 10.73| $ 10,730.00

3 | Wva3 W12 12W1 N STAPLETON 1500| TN s 1350 s 2025000

8 | wivo2 Mpazs smiw oF sapteron | %0 ™

5 | wvoz Wpz25 aww OF STapLEToN | 1509| ™

186 |upizo tomiw OF MULLEN | 20%0| ™ 5 1645| s 1645000 5 1164 5 12,6000

B o]

O A o]

B O A o]

90 -?':SI;I—D?:(A)RR’\S%':;:SAT GRAVEL 1,000 TN $ 1745 $  17,450.00 $ 10.50( $ 10,500.00

9 Wy 2 P 227 ATHALSEY. Lo0o| TN 5 1615[s 1615000 5 1305| 5 1305000

92 | WvS15A MP3 amiw OF IvpERiL | 10%0| T

93 | et wp2a 20w N oF BEnkeLwan | 80| ™

B o L 22

o oo

9 | \iY136 P24 2 MIE OF ORLEANS 60) ™

97 ZEFI,S(?&'EC&',“ sA(;%AVEL 800| TN $ 1145($  9,160.00

% g:sgfng%NvGAggAVEL 1500| TN $ 1085|$ 16,275.00

99 Sﬁziﬁﬁfiﬁgm\’a 2,000 TN $ 1240 $  24,800.00

100 glg;l)’f\l;)le(SINGGRAVEL 500 TN $ 1795| $ 8,975.00

101 a‘s;s”af:\,c %GRSRAVEL 2,000 TN $ 2145($  42,900.00

102 EIAS;—E??DYI%AIE::')\‘G GRAVEL 500 TN $ 12.00| $ 6,000.00

103 g::SETNBCEES(Z\‘SDGRAVEL 5001 TN $ 13.00| $  6,500.00

104|BURWELL SOUTH YARD 1,000 TN $ 1100[$  11,000.00

105 Tt ErTvARD 1,000 TN $ 1023 $  10,230.00

106 ?LS\(I?)E?E;%G GRAVEL 2,000 TN $ 11.00( $ 22,000.00
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

5990 OF Revised
Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 2/6/19

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and

Island Landhandlers

Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc,

L.G. Everist, Inc

L &L Gravel

Lyman Richey Corporation

Marxsen Sand & Gravel

ﬁ Surfacing Gravel
c
= - . ) . ) Unit ) R Extended . ) . )

Description Qty |UOM|Unit Price [ Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price Price Extended Price | Unit Price Price Unit Price [ Extended Price |Unit Price | Extended Price
s
108 EIPSRTHEGA;EAV(\)/F:(/ESST GRAVEL 1,000 TN $ 1465 $ 14,650.00
100 e A e/t 2,000 TN $ 17.00|$  34,000.00
110 35:?1A32A132%?:A:T?(:?\12\2)EI\I; 500 TN $ 1275| % 6,375.00
1 A o e i 51 1,500| TN $ 13893 20,835.00
112 3{/?/158?%%?32(:6?:2((;)T:AJVCI%FL7O A 4,000 TN $ 1350 $ 54,000.00
113|717 8 ARTIOR COAT GRAVEL 3500| TN $ 1580|$  55300.00
114 3{21;:;&;&(;!? COAT GRAVEL 2,500 TN $ 1475 $ 36,875.00
15| e o E e UG 600| TN $ 1075 $  6450.00
117 3@120%§?{;%“IGER£:E;DY 600 TN $ 1850 $ 11,100.00
118 3@:52%2?5?%;5?!§:RK8 600 TN $ 1720 $ 10,320.00
120 g:yggégi#leszggfggf_ﬁgﬁg 2001 TN | $ 0.18( $ 36.001 $ 015($ 30.00 O']rf”;—on $ 32.00 $ 015( $ 30.00
121 S 2R o 200 ™N | o018|s 3600| s 015]s 30.00 Ao s 3200
12| TONSOENERY COSTRERTON | zap| 7y s omsls s o ls oo
e G s osls o T ls wo
124 35::1A;£A23R4C’\2?\‘T§FR€¥§:\]S 5,000 TN $37.35| $ 186,750.00

Total $122.66 | $  93,992.00) $766.37| $ 971,283.50| $37.35| $ 186,750.00] $125.01 | $150,185.50| $107.78 | $ 142,943.50| $ 14.00| $  35,000.00
Payment Terms 30 et-30 Net-30 100-30
Delivery Days ARO 30 As required 45 45

Comments

Award of Bid Tab Revised to correct Western
Materials, Inc. Unit Price bids for Lines 122 & 123.
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing o r?QQOtOl;I_Revisedn . Opening Date: 2/6/19
epartment of Transportation

AWARD AWARD AWARD AWARD AWARD AWARD
Armor Coat Gravel, Delcmg Gravel, Windrow Gravel and Overton Sand & Gravel Co. Paulsen Inc Pine Bluffs Gravel &Exc Inc Simon STALP GRAVEL, INC. Triple G Redimix LLC

#* Surfacing Gravel

2

-

Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price [ Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price JUnit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL
1 GREENWOOD YARD 75| TN
2 DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL 1500 TN

HWY S12D DWIGHT

DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL
8 HWY JCT 79 AND 34 2250) TN

DIST 1 SURFACING GRAVEL
4 HWY JCT 8 AND 65 5001 TN

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
5 HWY22 MP 88 6MI E OF MONROE 25001 TN

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
© |JCT 121 AND 32 8MI W OF MADISON 2500) TN

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
’ JCT51 AND 77 1,500| TN $ 18.00( $ 27,000.00

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
8 JCT 32 AND 275 500| TN $ 15.00( $ 7,500.00

DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
FULLERTON MAINT YARD

DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
10 ORD MAINT YARD 5001 TN

DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
u GREELEY YARD 00| TN

DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
12 ST PAUL MAINT YARD 1,000 TN

DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
13 LOUP CITY YARD 600) TN

DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
14 HWY34 MP247 3MI W AURORA 1,000 TN

DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
15 JCT81 AND 92 3 MIW OF OSCEOLA 850 TN

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
16 HWY92 MP339 2MI W OF FARWELL 5001 TN

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
l HWY22 MP24 9MI W OF SCOTIA 00| TN

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
18 HWY6 MP219 6MI E OF HASTINGS 5001 TN

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
19 HWY281 MP12 7MI N OF RED CLOUD 600 TN

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
20 HWY281 MP5 S OF RED CLOUD 1,000 TN

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
%1 |WY30 MP339 1MI E OF CENTRAL 12001 TN

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
22 LOUP CITY YARD 2,000| TN

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
z HWY6 MP219 6MI E OF HASTINGS 400| TN

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
24 HWY281 MP7 2MI N OF RED CLOUD 1,420) TN

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
25 | W39 MP21 1 MI N OF GENOA 2,000 TN

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
26 HWY14 MP106 7 MIN OF FULLERTO 100] TN

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
z HWY11 MP78 1MI N OF ORD 700] TN
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

5990 OF Revised
Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 2/6/19

* Armor Coat Gravel, gjgré?nsg’:\l'e\{vmdmw Gravel and Overton Sand & Gravel Co. Paulsen Inc Pine Bluffs Gravel &Exc Inc Simon STALP GRAVEL, INC. Triple G Redimix LLC
g

Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price [ Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
28 | v MPGB M1 S OF ORD La0| TN
29 | w261 MPGS 1 MIN OF ST PAUL 700]
30 | w251 MPBO 5 I S OF ST PALL 700 T
31 | W26 MP120 2MI N OF GREELEY 1200| TN
32 a{f/-\r(:s\f:\;‘glzg\;vMGIF:\IA(\;ELGREELEY 1,200] TN
33 | w281 MP120 20 MIN OF GRegLey | 220 ™
34 a{f;gs\l\r\l/:sg{f m EF(E)AFVFE(I'_)CKVILLE 1,280| TN
35 | w02 WP320 1 MIW OF Lowp err 640 TN
36 25;|;gﬁi:s$$AF;®/EL 1,000 TN $ 1300|s 1300000|$ 6.45[$  6150.00
37 gggégggﬁfg AVEL 1,000| TN $ 1500|$ 1500000 $ 1025|$ 10,250.00
38 BEISPEEILC&A?NT:@;% 2,000 TN $ 1600|$ 3200000|$ 1495[$ 29,900.00
39 E:ETBiLEIJ_E,\'g::ﬁ%QgEL 2,000 TN $ 11.00|$ 22,00000|$ 11.50| $ 23,000.00
40 S:SLEYDEE:?TGY%SVEL 2,000| TN $ 1500($ 30,00000|$ 17.25| $ 34,500.00
41 E{fﬁgfmﬂ SSR 1galAJvGoiAgREkWFORD 2,000 TN $ 3300|$ 6600000|$ 2623| $ 52,460.00
42 5f§§$§,ﬂw siR%OATGRAVEL 3,000| TN $ 3300|$ 99,00000|$ 21.70| $  65100.00
43 | Y9 1PBS 9M1 S OF HARRISON 4000 TN s 3300|s 15200000[s 2060| 5 8240000
44 Eﬁiffmiifﬁﬁgf ,GYTECLHELL 2,000| TN $ 2300|$ 4600000|$ 17.16| $  34,320.00
45 El/?l-\:gs?)?\ﬂ'\g(;s;:l\jl)lAST(gaFRQEJ/EII:!VILLE 2,000 TN $ 3300|$ 6600000|$ 31.18| $ 62,360.00
46 3@151A§.§”900F§7CmT§§§Z§§TSBLU 3,000| TN $ 19.00|$ 57,00000|$ 1575| $  47,250.00
47 E{fgg?;&?ig%ﬁ;ﬁ%ﬁ_g; 2,000 TN $ 21.00|$ 4200000|$ 1457| $ 29,140.00
48 aﬁiggﬁmgigﬁggfé\éghm 3,000 TN $ 17.00|$ 51,00000| $ 14.06| $ 42,180.00
49 Eﬁiasoﬁé”siiﬁﬂfoiiﬁ\gﬁéy 2,000 TN $ 17.00($ 34,00000|$ 2275 $  45500.00
50 EESQQSJAR%RYCA(;?GRAVEL 2,0001 TN $ 1700|$ 34,00000|$ 1472| $ 29,440.00
51 Eﬁiﬁf;&gigﬁg&%ﬁ;PELL 4,000 TN $ 2000|$ 80,00000|$ 16.95|$ 67,800.00
52 3@1857‘\3&‘2?5 am g?’:{EE\NCE 4,000 TN $ 2400($ 9600000|$ 2308$ 9232000
53 351:7\,325?2():\;’:1 ,\?VSAOVFE',\]ORTH LA 2,000 TN $ 1092|$ 21,84000( $ 11.00{$ 22,000.00
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

5990 OF Revised
Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 2/6/19

z Armor Coat Gravel, gj:;r;?nsg’:\l'e\{vmdmw Graveland Overton Sand & Gravel Co. Paulsen Inc Pine Bluffs Gravel &Exc Inc Simon STALP GRAVEL, INC. Triple G Redimix LLC
£
Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price [ Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
54 ZD;,S,\IS &f‘gﬁi‘;ﬁ’ﬁ”ﬂ HWYI 2000| ™ $ 1096 $ 21,920.00| $ 12.00| $  24,000.00
55 Eﬁifovﬂgfﬁ%im%spRlNGs 2,500 TN $ 11.26|$ 28,150.00| $ 11.00|$ 27,500.00] $ 10.95| $ 27,375.00
56 zgngDfﬂiﬁia,RfﬁiLmRD 1,000 TN $ 1098 $ 10,980.00| $ 13.00| $  13,000.00
57 zg;fHDpEL'iﬂif;fXE;D 1,000| TN $ 1098|$ 10980.00| $ 12.00( $  12,000.00
58 QETTH%E{EEI\[‘)GM(ZWTV&RD 1,000 TN $ 1074 $ 10,740.00] $  9.00| $  9,000.00| $ 16.24| $  16,240.00
59 z:fgéy:\\‘h[;sfgg SIEQQ’E" 750 TN | $ 10.99|$  824250| $ 1434|$ 10,755.00( $ 27.00| $ 20,250.00
60 zﬁngﬁz%%ngga}zggRAVE" 500 TN | $ 1485|% 742500| $ 17.60|$  8800.00| $ 30.00($ 15000.00
61 z:fgé?ﬁimffgﬁlﬂ 1500 TN | $ 11.18|$ 16,770.00] $ 13.26|$ 19,890.00| $ 27.00| $  40,500.00
62 SL\SRTSEV,\\‘”TNEARR%W GRAVEL 750 TN | $ 1475|$ 11,06250| $ 11.10|$ 832500 $ 27.00| $ 20,250.00
63 SESST%E,'V?A'TNGT?&Q;EL 1500 TN | $ 122.00($ 16,500.00] $ 11.12|$ 16,680.00| $ 25.00| $ 37,500.00
64 3ESSTWO”J\‘&R$A,/YG2F;§$L4O 7,500| TN | $ 1050 $ 78750.00| $ 13.64|$ 102,300.00| $ 24.00| $ 180,000.00
65 SIIR’SI;II'(?LVE\)”S\I;\)I?(%;VI\AGF?ZAEYIEL 375| TN | $ 1400|$ 525000| $ 1350 $ 506250 $ 21.00|$  7,875.00
66 Q'F;SJSLDDEA%’\\‘(%SE’;V;& 1,500 TN | $ 14.40|$ 2160000 $ 13.75| $ 20625001 $ 22.00( $ 33,000.00
67 2:\?;?_‘&"5“5@3";3?2’5" 750| TN | $ 14.00|$ 10500.00| $ 11.75|$ 881250 $ 26.00| $ 19,500.00
68 [ ey Ve 750| TN |$ 1079|s  809250] $ 10.75|$  806250| $ 2400 s 1800000
69 S'ng}fE?\‘EEgule\?;SATVE\';WZ MP277 1500 TN | $ 1075 $ 16,125.00| $ 1048| $ 15,720.00| $ 25.00| $ 37,500.00
70 [ R o e o7 500{ TN|$ 1410|$  7,05000| $ 13.99|$  699500| $ 27.00{$ 13,500.00
71 EETTSL\J’:G,'\\:E\;OW GRAVEL Hwy 750| TN $ 1434|$ 10,755.00| $ 27.00 $  20,250.00 $ 11.65| $  8737.50
72 Eﬁgfové'ﬁm%i?’;gﬂ 2)500| TN $ 1046 |$ 26,150.00] $ 10.00| $ 25,000.00| $ 13.25| $ 33,125.00
73 gg&xzzwgﬁxl\g‘ 2,500 TN $ 1250|$ 31,250.00] $ 11.00| $ 27,500.00] $ 13.25|$  33,125.00
“ EﬁifsAﬁxﬁfgngTAiig"EL 5,000 TN $ 17.40| $ 87,000.00| $ 14.00( $ 70,000.00| $ 16.40( $  82,000.00
75 aﬁlg@ig”gs&aﬁlﬂwa 1,500 TN | $ 1046|$ 15690.00| $ 14.03|$ 21,045.00| $ 23.00($ 34,500.00
76 lealigAsllrl\‘,alRm?gFG,&G\fE"N HWY 1 5 500] ™ $ 2252|$ 5630000 $ 21.00($ 52,500.00 $ 11.97|$ 29,925.00
77 Eﬁzgﬁﬂiﬂggfﬁﬁ (G)E'?A\GEL'LEN 2,000 TN $ 27.02| $ 54,040.00| $ 23.00[$  46,000.00 $ 1547|$ 30,940.00
78 ﬁﬁlgﬂ'ﬁ'ﬁgﬁﬁf‘@koULLEN 500 TN $ 2352|$ 11,760.00| $ 22.00( $  11,000.00 $ 1197|$  5985.00
79 Eﬁig;ﬂg?&%",&l?@%‘,\‘ 2,000 TN $ 1398|$ 27,960.00] $ 20.00[$  40,000.00 $ 1633|$ 32,660.00
80 3§1§2A§Q”2‘3§§ﬁ’*ETTGY§§§,EL 1,500 TN $ 1946 $ 29,190.00] $ 23.00| $  34,500.00 $ 1083|$ 29745.00
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

5990 OF Revised
Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 2/6/19

« Armor Coat Gravel, gj:;r;?nsg':\l'e}’vmdmw Graveland 5 o rton Sand & Gravel Co. Paulsen Inc Pine Bluffs Gravel &Exc Inc Simon STALP GRAVEL, INC. Triple G Redimix LLC
g

Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price [ Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
81 5@1%2‘55?%‘53%%«5 1,000| TN $ 2054|$ 2054000|$ 2200($ 2200000]|$ 2312|$ 2312000 $ 1616|$ 16,160.00
83 [P N e Eron 1,500 TN $ 2072|$ 31,08000[$ 2300|$ 34,500.00 $ 1399 $ 20985.00
84 E\Iflzgzvnggzi(?svh\jlIC\;I\'I?(A)\IiESLTAPLETON S00) ™ $ 1364]9 ©682000)9 2000/$ 1000000 S 132018 6000%
85 aﬁlg;&ygg;\z’w gﬁg\ﬁ};LETON 1,500 TN $ 19.10|$ 28650.00| $ 23.00($  34,500.00 $ 1629| $  24,435.00
O A AWY2 1 000| TN $ 2414|$ 24,14000| $ 2300 $ 23,000.00 $ 1300|$ 13,0000
8 [P 1,000 TN $ 1439|$ 1439000| s 2200|$ 2200000|$ 1678 s 1678000
88 zﬁzgzmgf;oﬁvmﬁi\ghw 1,000| TN $ 1590 $ 15900.00| $ 2200($ 22,00000|$ 1858 $  18580.00
89 [P & 1,000 TN $ 1529|$ 1520000| s 2200|$ 2200000|$ 1786 s 17,860.00
90 | AR e CRAVEL 1,000 TN $ 2504|$ 2504000 $ 27.00|$ 27,000.00 $ 1250 $ 12,500.00
o1 aﬁlgﬁﬂiﬁgs:f:;g’;ﬁva 1,000| TN $ 27.74|$ 27,74000| $ 3000 $  30,000.00 $ 1400($  14,000.00
2 S 1,000 TN $ 1036|$ 1936000 $ 23.00| $ 23,000.00| $ 2328[$ 2328000
93 | o1 WPz 2oMIN OF BN | 550 ™ D) O o 2o25]s 2Lae2so
7 Aoy 2,200 TN $ 1725|$% 37,950.00[ $ 19.00| $ 41,800.00| $ 1876[$ 4127200
95 D O ) o e 600| TN $ 1625|% 975000| s 1800| $ 10800.00| $ 1814[s 1088400
o7 |DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL s00| ™ $ 1833[$  14,664.00
B o
a9 |DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 2000] ™ $ 1358|S  27.160.00
100|2ST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 00| TN $ 1984|3 992000
101 ’\DAIESIISIBE’I\?::\IA% SRAVEL 2,000 TN $ 2255|$  45,100.00
]
o ]
o
105 G AR TETT YARD Looo| ™
o]
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

5990 OF Revised
Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 2/6/19

* Armor Coat Gravel, Delcmg Gravel, Windrow Gravel and Overton Sand & Gravel Co. Paulsen Inc Pine Bluffs Gravel &Exc Inc Simon STALP GRAVEL, INC. Triple G Redimix LLC
Surfacing Gravel
2
)
Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price [ Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
07| ONEILL YARD 5001 TN
DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
108| SPRINGVIEW YARD 1,000) TN $ 2183($ 21,830.00
DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
1091, \Wy7 MP3 AT BREWSTER 2,000) TN
DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
1101, /WY11 MP14 S OF ATKINSON 500 TN
DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
1111} iWy281 MP148 JCT 70 AND 281 1,500) TN
DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
1121, Wy281 MP142 6MI S OF JCT 70 A 4,000 TN
DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
11311 iwyo1 MP36 3500) TN
DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
114 vver Mpas 2,500| TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
1151, 1WY12 MP80 AT BROCKSBURG 600| TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
1161, 1WY20 MP135 1M W OF MERRIMAN 1,200) TN $ 2255 $ 27,060.00
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
11711 WY20 MP165 6MI E OF CODY. 600 TN $ 1984| $  11,904.00
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
1181, /WY12 MP19 1MI E OF SPARKS 600| TN $ 1698 $ 10,188.00
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
1191} 1WY20 MP202 6MIE OF VALENTINE 1,200/ TN $ 1348| $ 16,176.00
OPTION 1:DELIVERY COST PER TON -15/ton .18 per 20/ton/
120| \RMOR COAT ALT/ADD LOCATIONS 200] ™N | e | ® S ton mile | 3600| " | ® | Ry oy
OPTION 2:DELIVERY COST PER TON _15/ton 118 per
121 DEICING ALT/ADD LOCATIONS 2000 N e [® oy e || 8500 $ o20]s 4y
OPTION 3:DELIVERY COST PER TON .15/ton .18 per
122)\\/|INDROW ALT/ADD LOCATIONS 2000 N i | ® 080 e || 9 SC80 ¥ 0d) S AU
OPTION 4:DELIVERY COST PER TON _15/ton
123| SURFACING ALT/ADD LOCATIONS 200) N | e | ® €0l $ 020]% 40.00
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
124|,,WY51 MP 23 4 MI N OF LYONS 5000 TN $ 18.00| $  90,000.00
Total $172.26 | $ 230,310.70| $683.66 | $ 1,003,513.50| $1,241.00| $2,169,225.00| $531.25 | $1,119,281.50] $ 51.20] $ 124,540.00] $ 368.11] $_ 441,804.50
Payment Terms - 100-90 0-30
Delivery Days ARO 30 60 Per ITB 30 60
Comments

Award of Bid Tab Revised to correct Western
Materials, Inc. Unit Price bids for Lines 122 & 123.
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

5990 OF Revised
Department of Transportation

AWARD

AWARD

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and

Ulrich Gravel Inc.

WesTeRN MATeRIALs INC

§ Surfacing Gravel
£
3

Description Qty [UOM] Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
N R i
s oy oHone SEAVEL 2aso]
T A o]
o O e | 2o |
A e
7 5)c|§rT531 ,:RNI\E/;(;I; COAT GRAVEL 1500| TN
5 [0 hruor SoRT AL soo]
o e e soo]
10 (DT DEICe SRAVEL s00| TN | $9.98Tn | $  4,990.00
11 EEI;FSLE\EIS(:L,\I‘R%GRAVEL 300 TN | $12.98 Tn | $ 3,894.00
12 |DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL 1000 ™ | 5101070 [ 5 1020000
13 E(I)SJ:SE\I{C\I(I:(;SRAVEL 600 TN | $12.00Tn | $ 7,200.00
e o o0
R B
16 [DIST4 ARMOR COATGRAVEL s00| ™ | s1450m| s 725000
17 |DIST4 ARVOR COAT GRAVEL so0| ™ [s1325T| s 662500
e I
R I
o e I
o o O AL | 1|
22 E(I)SJ:S_IR—’:}A(Y)ER%OATGRAVEL 2,000 TN | $15.25Tn| $ 30,500.00
23 | W5 MPZL 61 £ OF HASTINGS 00| ™
24 | 2o Mpr MINOF RED CLoup | 24%0| ™
o oo el o | 2]
2 | Y14 MPL0G 7 MIN OF FULLERTO 100] ™
2 PR s e el 700| TN | $1026T|$  7,182.00

Page 16 of 20

Opening Date: 2/6/19



Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

5990 OF Revised
Department of Transportation

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and

Ulrich Gravel Inc.

WesTeRN MATeRIALs INC

ﬁ Surfacing Gravel
=
3

Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
28 a{f,zflm,\/,:sggfm SG g,’:\éERLD 1,400| TN | $10.50Tn| $  14,700.00
i z:fl-\r(;s\iv:\’/\lfgiolvxﬂﬁ?g\éESLTPAUL 700| TN | $10.10Tn| $  7,070.00
30 | Y261 MPE9 5 M S OF ST PAUL 700| ™
st E:/?/I(;s\iv:\,/\llgligvzvmclaEA(;/FEEREELEY 1200 TN |'$12.50Tn | $  15,000.00
32 Emfsmp[ﬁg\yﬁl'TuAZELGREELEY 1,200 TN [($11.37Tn [ $ 13,644.00
33 E:/?/I(;s\iv:\,/\llgligvlvocf\:ﬁlvgtGREELEY 1200| TN | $11.37Tn | $  13,644.00
34 a{flrfgs\Ar\l/:QZDng m E%AFV:(I'_)CKVILLE 1,280 TN [($11.507Tn [$ 14,720.00
35 E:/?/I(;zwmlggzﬁ)olvxn?v?/gf II:OUP cIT 640( TN | $12.25Tn| $  7,840.00
36 | CERING MANT YARD - Lo00| T s o0|s 903000
37 S'Figgpf’g;?'iiﬁtf*AVEL 1,000 TN $ 14.25|$  14,250.00
38 | CHAPPELL MAINT YARD 2000| TN s 2508 47.00000
3 | MBALL MAINT vARD 2000| TN s 1677| 3 3350000
40 Q:SLEYDEE:\T‘TG&?{QVEL 2,000 TN $ 2411|$  48,220.00
41 | w20 wp 25 10w oF CrAwrorp | 29%°| ™ s 2787|s 5574000
42 5ES§$§,Z” $§R%OATGRAVEL 3,000 TN $ 2156|$ 64,680.00
43 | \WV26 MPED M S OF HARRISON 4000| TN s 19075 7988000
%4 | W25 P3G 241 N OF MITCHELL 2000| ™ s 15235 3046000
45 | wvzsompao om s of mustviLie | 29%°| ™ s 354[5 7108000
46 | rwvz1 MPoo 278 N OF ScorTseLy | 39| ™ s 140]s  s220000
47 | w26 Mpa1 3CT26 AND L34 2000| T s 1689|s 3378000
48 | Wyes MPLT 13M1 S OF GERING 3000| s 15238 4569000
49 | W30 MPES BMIW OF SIDNEY 2000| TN s 31038 6206000
50 EEQQQSJ”R%R&%TGRAVEL 2,000 TN $ 1622 $  32,440.00
51 | Wv27 MPS? 10MIE OF CHAPPELL 4000| TN s 2735 s 10040000
2 |pwver WPLe 1IN OF ALLENCE | 49%0| ™ s 2570[s 10280000
53 E:I?I-\F(;WMIEE?ZOI\XYI\?VS%\;E:\]ORTH PLA 2,000| TN $ 1216|$  24,320.00
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing o :990{O¢$evisedn . Opening Date: 2/6/19
epartment of Transportation

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and Ulrich Gravel Inc. WesTeRN MATeRIALS INC

* Surfacing Gravel

2

-}

Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY

54 23 MP 56 DICKENS 2,000 TN $ 1205|$ 24,100.00
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL

55 HWY30 MP103 7MI NW BIG SPRINGS 2500) TN $ GB||® 2E7E0eY
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL

56 NORTH PLATTE W 14TH YARD 1,000 TN $ 875|$ 8,750.00
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL

57 NORTH PLATTE 1-80 YARD 1,000 TN $ 875| % 8,750.00
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL

58 SUTHERLAND MAINT YARD 1,000 TN $ 755|$ 7,550.00
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL

59 ANSLEY HWY 183 MP89 750 ™
DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL

60 ANSLEY HWY 183 MP89 500 TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL

61 ANSLEY MAINT YARD 1,500( TN | $11.75Tn| $ 17,625.00
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL

62 SARGENT YARD 780 TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL

63 OCONTO MAINT YARD 1,500) TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL

64 OCONTO JCT HWY 21AND 40 7,500) TN

65 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 375| TN $ 1598| $ 5,992.50

ARNOLD HWY 92 MP 251

DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
66 ARNOLD HWY 92 MP 251 1,500( TN $ 1398|$ 20,970.00

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
67 ANSELMO HWY 2 MP 257 750| TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
68 BROKEN BOW HWY21 MP68 750 TN

DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL

69 BROKEN BOW WEST HWY2 MP277 1,500 TN
DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
70 BROKEN BOW WEST HWY2 MP277 5001 TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY
n 2 AT DUNNING 750 ™
72 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 2,500 TN $ 1364 ($ 34,100.00

ROSCOE HWY30 MP136

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
73 |0GALLALA HWY26 MP136 25001 TN $ 19.44|$  48,600.00

DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
74 HWY26 MP141 ESTRADAS 50001 TN

DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
s HWY 30 AT OVERTON 1,500 TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY
76 2 MP 183 1MIW OF MULLEN 25001 TN
DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
HWY 2 MP 183 1MIW OF MULLEN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL

8 HWY 2 MP 183 1MI'W OF MULLEN 5001 TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
HWY92 MP205 2MI E TYRON
DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL

80 HWY92 MP205 2MI E TYRON 1,500( TN $ 16.64| $ 24,960.00

7 2,000 TN

79 2,000 TN $ 1364 | $ 27,280.00
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing o :990{O¢$evisedn . Opening Date: 2/6/19
epartment of Transportation

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and

. Ulrich Gravel Inc. WesTeRN MATeRIALs INC
Surfacing Gravel

Line #

Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
81 |HwY2 MP144 2MI W HYANNIS 10001 TN

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
82 HWY83 MP130 18MI N STAPLETON 1,000} TN $ 1369] % 13690.00

DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
83 HWY83 MP127 12MI N STAPLETON 1,5001 TN $ 161418 24,210.00

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
84 HWY92 MP225 3MI W OF STAPLETON 500 TN i SEEHID

DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
8 HWY92 MP225 3MI W OF STAPLETON 1,500 TN G IAEE|| S ZBHREn

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY2
86 |MP176 10MI W OF MULLEN 1,000 TN

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
87 HWY61 MP126 1MI N ARTHUR 1,000 TN

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
88 HWY92 MP175 11MI E ARTHUR 1,000) TN

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
89 HWY61 MP131 7MI N ARTHUR 1,000 TN

DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
90 THEDFORD YARD 1,000) TN

DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
o HWY 2 MP 227 AT HALSEY 1,000 TN

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
92 HWYS15A MP3 4MI W OF IMPERIAL 1,000) TN

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
% HWY61 MP24 20MI N OF BENKELMAN 850] TN

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
%4 |HWY61 MP58 OMI S OF GRANT 2,200| TN

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
9 HWY23 MP14 5MI'W OF GRANT 600| TN

DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
96 HWY136 MP24 2 MI E OF ORLEANS 680| TN

DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
il SPRINGVIEW YARD 800| TN

DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
98 AINSWORTH YARD 1,500) TN

DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL

99 VALENTINE YARD 20001 TN
o
P |
o
i |
104 EB)E;V?;EE)I_E:%ISST?-!R:A\/REIZI; 1,000( TN | $10.75Tn| $ 10,750.00
105 gIAS;T?_EDﬁ?QSDGRAVEL 1,000( TN | $10.37Tn| $ 10,370.00
106 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 2,000 TN | $12.00Tn| $ 24,000.00

TAYLOR YARD
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

5990 OF Revised
Department of Transportation

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and

Ulrich Gravel Inc.

WesTeRN MATeRIALs INC

ﬁ Surfacing Gravel
£
-}

Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
soo]
ie[DTe A CORTGRAEL o]
D 20|
S ey o]
111[DISTE ARVOR CORT GRAVEL 1500| ™ | s1800T0[ 5 27.00000
112 z:ﬁzfs??wﬁ?iz%?ﬁ;%iﬁ\éiLmA 4,000 TN | $17.00Tn| $ 68,000.00
113 a{;‘\l’(;ilA’\I/?ugﬂa(ZR COAT GRAVEL 3500| TN
114 z:f,‘;glA,&ng COAT GRAVEL 2500 TN
115 Y12 MPBO AT BROCKSBURG 0] ™
18] v20 MpL3s i w OF wiemman | 1290 ™
17| Y20 MP165 M1 E OF CODY 0] ™
18] Y12 MPLO 1M1 £ OF SPARKS 00| ™
11920 P20 ewie OF vaewTe | 1200| ™
120]VIOR COAT ALTIADD LOGATIONS. 20| ™|s owsls woo] TN |s  aeo
121 | 2 R O e O 200 TN |8 015[s s000| 220" |'g 44.00
12 PTONSOENERY COSTEERTON | ool (s aasfs  soo0] 2O fs  aaco
e e | aw| Zels o
o et I

Total $ 25823 | $ 322,194.00] $566.61 [ $1,215,993.50

Payment Terms

0-30

Delivery Days ARO

as needed

Comments

Award of Bid Tab Revised to correct Western
Materials, Inc. Unit Price bids for Lines 122 & 123.
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