Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing

5985 OF

Department of Transportation

Opening Date:1/10/19

AWARD AWARD
O EXPANDED SHALE /RCOSATWB DBA Buildex, LLG
Description Est. Qty [UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

1 gElv\I/E,Z\(FTQNYiEg SHALE 3/4 X #8 1,600.0000| CY 65.25| $ 104,400.00 61.00 | $ 97,600.00
2 E;/\ll\l(z;(?PI'-Al\\'/\lv[\)(iggle-icﬁ'LlEl\/ﬁ/é)I(ZIZEEMONT 760.0000| CY 6750 $ 51,300.00 61.00 | $ 46,360.00
3 CD;éEEE)LF\)/C(N)[(;EDyi:gLE 3/4 X #8 665.0000| CY 66.75| $ 44,388.75 57.00 (| $ 37,905.00
4 E&Eégg’iﬁiﬁgggﬁgﬁ? 8 1,400.0000| CY 66.00 | $ 92,400.00 61.25( $ 85,750.00
5 EV\ll\I(EY)EJPI'-AI\\II\Iv[\)(iEl) JSCH'I"AZI\EIFx i(llflESCOLN 2,100.0000( CcY 66.00 | $ 138,600.00 5750 $ 120,750.00
6 EV\ll\I(E)S(;'IA\\/II\IIDDSE[D)()S:CAII:Ing‘E)F({ 8 4,000.0000| CY 66.00 | $ 264,000.00 61.00 | $ 244,000.00
7 EV\l/\I(E)S(T\;IA\F"\Ig;EASI:QLI]IFE{\?M X#8 750.0000| CY 6750 $ 50,625.00 5750 $ 43,125.00
8 Ev\llf)l(ggugag ziﬁ#ii/i)éjs 2,100.0000( CcY 66.75| $ 140,175.00 57.85( $ 121,485.00
9 Ev\ll\l(f )Y(E'IA\\AI\LD3E3DSSI\|/|-| IAI\II_ EASQUXR#NS 2,400.0000( cY 7050 $ 169,200.00 54.00 | $ 129,600.00
10 Ev\ll\l(f )igg‘klﬂgi[g)s VHVA'II:IIEE C3L/J4MXS§|8-| 800.0000| CY 69.75| $ 55,800.00 56.00 | $ 44,800.00
11 EV\ll\I(E;(SPQEgsDI\AISg%LFESKL\;(S#(;SN 900.0000| CY 71.25| $ 64,125.00 54.00 | $ 48,600.00
12 E;/?/\I(E)l(g'la\\/ll\lli’DlEZD3le-liﬁLglfglé(R#gE 2,500.0000( CY 7075 $ 176,875.00 No Bid $ -
13 EU4LEI)E(;)¢(|;IEE(2\FS{SALE 3/4 X #8 2,000.0000( cY 65.25( $ 130,500.00 No Bid $ -
14 CD;:EEEXLZ':‘(NY[;ERDDSHALE 3/4 X #8 1,000.0000| CY 65.25( $ 65,250.00 No Bid $ -
15 (D:E4NI§')I(QZ?_NC[T$$$:$IE;E 3/4 X #8 2,000.0000( cY 65.00 [ $ 130,000.00 No Bid $ -
16 EV?/\I(E(;(E/IAPE?QEEMSIZAICSE i{iS)SF?NSGS 600.0000| CY 64.25( $ 38,550.00 No Bid $ -
17 DST\f/IIIEL)I(EF;AEN[(;IE:Dsi(l)-?h%/V%Ll?i f?:T 2,000.0000( cY 66.88  $ 133,760.00 No Bid $ -
18 2T4Ri)lilFC);A$IA[\)F§[[)) I—Slvl-\il'?(l;i 3H/\£/1V)$: 18 ICT 2,000.0000( cY 66.88  $ 133,760.00 No Bid $ -
19 ?SAfI\IiI)I(_FI;ASNVI\:/)%EI):?-:-\i/oI\;gl3II-|4V\)/(Y#;86 JCT 2,000.0000( cY 67.25( $ 134,500.00 No Bid $ -
20 EV?/EEET\\ARLE;E?\ISSTDAE%?:/??)(;XS 1,000.0000| CY 64.25( $ 64,250.00 No Bid $ -
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O EXPANDED SHALE ARCOSALWB DBA Buildex, LLC
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21 :%;5;?&'“55%3:3;5\;? X#8 1,000.0000| CY 65.00 [ $ 65,000.00 No Bid $ -
22 3&5?%?555@;'{*5;{3; 8 1,500.0000| CY 64.25( $ 96,375.00 No Bid $ -
23 EV?/\I(E;E&AI\\JND[;E}? I\S/IEQL_EI\%4EXA#\E(8R 5,500.0000( CY 64.25( $ 353,375.00 No Bid $ -
24 EV?/E?EAAPg?ggMSIZAﬁiéﬁNXG? 600.0000| CY 64.25( $ 38,550.00 No Bid $ -
25 3\:'/5 );Z)f\\ﬂl\lli’[;Ele\/llszASLUEPsElgl)(()? 4,200.0000| CY 66.50 [ $ 279,300.00 No Bid $ -
26 3V?/\I(E)8(I:|)\;IAIL\I1DEE[|;[DSQQLOEF3ét)F(>§F82IOR 2,000.0000( cY 66.50 [ $ 133,000.00 No Bid $ -
27 &/?/\I(Eéz'lo\\/ll\lli’gi?C‘ssl\l/l-ilAVI\_/EO:gFMA)L(JIz?)RA 600.0000| CY 64.25( $ 38,550.00 No Bid $ -
28 3;357)(;62553lssHébIIED3é4R)éi8K 1,700.0000| CY 65.25( $ 110,925.00 No Bid $ -
29 3;:'/5)1(2'?\‘/"\;[;E5DM|SHASLUEP3EIQl)(();ls 1,000.0000| CY 66.50 [ $ 66,500.00 No Bid $ -
30 3V?/\I(E)8(I:|)\;IAIL\I1DEE[|;DSQQLOEF3ét)F(>§§OR 1,000.0000| CY 66.50 [ $ 66,500.00 No Bid $ -
31 825&.?3%258 iUV%AElOlllzlll).(]é{rS 1,000.0000| CY 66.00 [ $ 66,000.00 No Bid $ -
32 gF\?OiXEFI)\IAEl\Slg\?vDV\?l—IIIC\I/_E ;lll\l/lli’(;/f? 1,000.0000| CY 66.00 [ $ 66,000.00 No Bid $ -
33 gUGTEH)I(EFF):_xIIZ\)IE)DYi:gLE 3/4 X #8 2,000.0000( cY 6450 $ 129,000.00 No Bid $ -
34[D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 54 X #3 2,160.0000| CY o005 w2500 Nomu | s -
35 ENGSEL)ézAN'TIIBESEI)TSEH:VI;/Efgx 8 1,500.0000| CY 66.25( $ 99,375.00 No Bid $ -
3|06 EXPANDED SHALE 5 X 3 1,760.0000| CY o005 1616000 NoBu | -
37 (D)(SAEL)I(_Z?E[\)(,EA[F)QSQQIY_EE,?\/;‘TXD#EOUTH 2,000.0000( cY 63.00 [ $ 126,000.00 No Bid $ -
38 BLJGNi)TZgNN?I)E(DSIST:AI—II\EviglI:(Vi?(M ic 2,250.0000( CY 68.25| $ 153,562.50 No Bid $ -
39 R:N%XLFI)DAEI aSVDYsggASI:IES lg;; 8 2,400.0000( cY 66.00 [ $ 158,400.00 No Bid $ -
40 EKG; I;)F(’FI;?I\’TI(?SEE)(ESSEEE?R)(()#JBTAGE 2,000.0000( CY 63.00| $ 126,000.00 No Bid $ -
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41 CD;gTIf-IXEPI\'IABNUDREC?SSI'll-jéII-iEV\:/g\/(i;( I\#/EI?D61 1,250.0000| CY 6450 $ 80,625.00 No Bid $ -
42 g;?Ei);%ANNeAESDSHALE 3/4 X #8 1,250.0000| CY 65.25| $ 81,562.50 No Bid $ -
43 EVE\SI\I(E)Q(;?\/II\IIDDZEé iu?\lval\ingN#AS 1,170.0000| CY 66.25( $ 77,512.50 No Bid $ -
44 gTiiizﬁgﬁiaggﬁﬁjlgst#g 112 2,000.0000( CY 66.00 | $ 132,000.00 No Bid $ -
45 glfolf(xEFl)\lAEl\Slg\vaV\?l-leC\ll_E 3/;1/';(237 1,120.0000| CY 66.00 [ $ 73,920.00 No Bid $ -
46 I\D/I-L(JBLIIE_)I;EA\’(\IADRE[I)D SHALE 3/4 X #8 2,000.0000( CY 6750 | $ 135,000.00 No Bid $ -
a7 EV(/\I(E)(;I:I)\;IA\FI’\EEDESEggL;\%ﬁé;\SI 1,700.0000| CY 65.25( $ 110,925.00 No Bid $ -
45 7 EXPANDED SHALE 514 X6 [ 105 000 v 6375 s  8925000| Noma | s -
49 3&5?%??5%_8::&?3/4 X#8 1,600.0000| CY 65.25( $ 104,400.00 No Bid $ -
50 EVCEET\%AF’)\IEE%?QQZEJ?&/_? X#8 2,000.0000( CY 64.50 | $ 129,000.00 No Bid $ -
51 3\/(/5)(;7\;?‘;\'125[\)/\?:@&'; 3H/40I)_(D#F?EGE 1,000.0000| CY 65.25( $ 65,250.00 No Bid $ -
5 |D7 EXPANDED SHALE 314 X #6105 000 cy 65255  11745000] Nom | s -
53 EVT/\I(E)S(S'IA\\A'\;’DZESMSIWIE)EF3[/;A)I\(1§L8JRY 3,300.0000( CY 63.75 $ 210,375.00 No Bid $ -
54|07 EXPANDED SHALE 514 X6 1" 505 000 cy 75| s 750000 Noma | s -
55 EV(/\I(E;(SPIGEEYE[S) ESQEEH?A/:l(I)E(S#iENTER 2,200.0000( cY 6450 $ 141,900.00 No Bid $ -
56 EV?/\I(EET?/I,\FIP;D SHALE 3/4 X #8 1,300.0000| CY 63.75| $ 82,875.00 No Bid $ -
57 |D-2 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 200.0000| CY 72.00( $ 14,400.00 No Bid $ -
58 [D-3 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 200.0000| CY 76.50 | $ 15,300.00 No Bid $ -
59 |D-5 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 200.0000| CY 7350 $ 14,700.00 No Bid $ -
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Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing 5985 OF Opening Date:1/10/19
Department of Transportation

ARCOSA LWB DBA .
° EXPANDED SHALE ARCOSA Lightweight Buildex, LLC
Description Est. Qty |UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
60 |D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 200.0000| CY | $ 69.00 | $ 13,800.00 No Bid $ -
61 |D-7 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 200.0000| CY | $ 66.00 | $ 13,200.00 No Bid $ -
62 |D-8 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 200.0000| CY | $ 75.00 | $ 15,000.00 No Bid $ -
63 |D-2 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 200.0000| CY | $ 72.00| $ 14,400.00 No Bid $ -
64 |D-5 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 200.0000| CY | $ 7350 | $ 14,700.00 No Bid $ -
65 |D-8 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 200.0000| CY | $ 75.00 | $ 15,000.00 No Bid $ -
66 |D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200.0000| CY | $ 76.50 | $ 15,300.00 No Bid $ -
67 |D-2 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200.0000| CY | $ 72.00| $ 14,400.00 No Bid $ -
68 |D-3 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200.0000| CY | $ 76.50 | $ 15,300.00 No Bid $ -
69 |D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200.0000| CY | $ 66.25| $ 13,250.00 No Bid $ -
70 |D-5 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200.0000| CY | $ 7350 | $ 14,700.00 No Bid $ -
71 |D-7 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200.0000| CY | $ 66.00 | $ 13,200.00 No Bid $ -
72 |D-8 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200.0000| CY | $ 75.00 | $ 15,000.00 No Bid $ -
PRICE PER CUBIC YARD MILE .
73 FOR ADD/ALT DELIVERY LOCATIONS 200.0000| CY | $ 0.15]| $ 30.00 No Bid $ -
Total $ 4,846.16 | $ 6,553,816.25| $ 638.10 | $ 1,019,975.00
Payment Terms 0% 0 Days
Delivery Days ARO 60 Days
Comments
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