
Buyer: Rene Botts 5984OF
Department of Cornhusker State Industries

Opening Date:02/05/19  

Page 1 of 10

Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

PANEL FABRIC
MOMENTUM GROUP
MEANDER LINE
Sandshell, Overcast, Agate Taupe, Nightshadow

No Bid  $                  -   17.45  $       1,745.00  $            12.00  $       1,200.00 

OR 
Alternate Brand and Fabric Line offered:
List of item numbers/colors attached: yes no 

MOMENTUM GROUP
UNIVERSE LINE
Crème Brulee, Whitecap, Wheat, Seneca, Milkyway, 
Mica, Cosmic, Depth

 No Bid  $            12.95  $       1,295.00  $            12.00  $       1,200.00 

OR
Alternate Fabric Brand and Line offered:
List of item numbers/colors attached: yes no

MAYER FABRICS
MOONSCAPE LINE
333-014 Cobalt, 333-000 Bark, 333-003 Cilantro, 333-
009 Cinnamon, 333-016 Pewter, 333-013 Mallard, 333-
001 Flame, 333-006 Ebony, 333-004 Indigo, 333-011 
Ruby.

 No Bid  $            19.45  $       5,835.00 

OR
Alternate Fabric Line offered:
List of item numbers/colors attached: yes no

AWARD AWARD AWARD

 Yes 

 No Bid 

 Anasazi Color Card Submitted 

 Yes 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 Fresco and Copa - Color Cards 
Submitted 

 Yes 

YD

SEATING FABRIC

C.F. Stinson, LLC

Description

3 300 YD

Li
ne

 #

UPHOLSTERY  FABRIC

1 100 YD

2 100

Mayer Fabrics Momentum Textiles, LLC
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C.F. Stinson, LLC

DescriptionLi
ne

 #

UPHOLSTERY  FABRIC Mayer Fabrics Momentum Textiles, LLC

MAYER FABRICS
FOUNDATION LINE
M350-026 Graphite, M350-000 Chocolate, M350-001 
Wine, M350-002 Cornsilk, M350-003 Sherwood, M350-
004
Sapphire, M350-005 Concord, M350-006 Ebony, M350-
007 Sandstone, M350-008 Merlot, M350-009 Cayenne,
M350-010 Taupe, M350-011 Flame, M350-012 
Sunflower, M350-013 Hunter, M350-014 Navy, M350-
015 Deep
Purple, M350-016 Mercury, M350-014 Jodhpurs, M350-
018 Magenta, M350-019 Terra Cotta, M350-023 Apple
Green, M350-024 Blue Mist, M350-028 Purple Haze, 
M350-029 Cinnabar, M350-033 Cactus, M350-034 
Parade
Blue, M350-043 Peacock, M350-044 Capri, M350-053 
Aegean, M3519 Olive Green, M3523 Kelly, M3523 
Magenta, M3502 Mango, M3504 Lilac, M3508 Seafoam

 $            14.94  $       2,988.00  $            14.95  $       2,990.00 

OR
Alternate Fabric Brand and Line offered:

 "ACE"
-Recycled 

content
-made in the 

USA 
List of item numbers/colors attached: yes no

CF STINSON
BRYANT PARK LINE
6554 Dusk, 6555 Pumice, 6560 Gunmetal, 6551 
Marigold, 6556 Curry, 6561 Crocodile, 6552 Medoc, 
6557 Raspberry, 6562 Violet, 6553 Nile, 6558 Saxon 
Blue, 6563 Night Shadow, 6559 Hemlock, 6564 
Chocolate

 $            14.95  $          747.50  $            12.45  $          622.50 

OR
Alternate Fabric Brand and Line offered:  Cross Check and Quattro 

 Yes  No 
See enclosed card 

4 200 YD

 As Specified/NOT Alternate 

5 YD50

CF STINSON BRAND
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C.F. Stinson, LLC

DescriptionLi
ne

 #

UPHOLSTERY  FABRIC Mayer Fabrics Momentum Textiles, LLC

List of item numbers/colors attached: yes no

CF STINSON
CORE LINE
CRE16 Neptune, CRE55 Bucksuede, CRE74 Regal 
Blue, CRE65 Allspice, CRE22 Beige, CRE47 Berry, 
CRE71 Black, CRE62 Black Plum, CRE61 Blueberry, 
CRE31 Bluejay, CRE73 Burgandy, CRE13 Cadet, 
CRE44 Camelback, CRE52 Candy Apple, CRE69 
Chocolate, CRE41 Coal, CRE45 Coffee Cream, CRE21 
Colonial Blue, CRE67 Cordovan, CRE63 Deep Clay, 
CRE34 Emerald, CRE70 Fudge, CRE57 Grape, CRE14 
Gray, CRE18 Green Tea, CRE35 Harbour, CRE20 
Horizon Blue, CRE38 Hunter Green, CRE24 Jade, 
CRE15 Light Teal, CRE12 Lite Gray, CRE58 
Manzanita, CRE26 Marina, CRE66 Midnight Blue, 
CRE54 Nasturtium, CRE27 Natural, CRE36 Navy,
CRE68 New Burgandy, CRE56 New Purple, CRE60 
Outback, CRE53 Persimmon, CRE64 Port, CRE32 
Pumice, CRE51 Purple Iris, CRE30 Raintree, CRE40 
Royal Blue, CRE50 Saddle Tan, CRE19 Sea Grass, 
CRE23 Seafoam, CRE10 Slate, CRE11 Snow White, 
CRE39 Spruce, CRE37 Tea Leaf, CRE48 Tomato, 
CRE29 Vizcaya Palm, CRE17 White, CRE46 Wood 
Violet, CRE72 Otter, CRE33 Everglade, CRE25 Blue 
Nile, CRE42 Very Berry, CRE59 Red Cent, CRE28 
Leap Frog, CRE43 American Beauty, CRE49  Marigold, 
CRE75 Magenta, CRE76 Wheat, CRE77
Reflection, CRE78 Dream, CRE79 Aqua, CRE80 Gris, 
CRE81 Cerulean, CRE82 Grass

 $            15.42  $       7,710.00  $            23.45  $     11,725.00 

OR
Alternate Fabric Brand and Line offered:
List of item numbers/colors attached: yes no

 Yes 

 Slick-Color Card Submitted 

 Yes 

 As Specified/NOT Alternate 

500 YD6
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Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

C.F. Stinson, LLC

DescriptionLi
ne

 #

UPHOLSTERY  FABRIC Mayer Fabrics Momentum Textiles, LLC

CF STINSON
CASSIDY LINE
CAS05 Cactus, CAS04 Edamame, CAS08 Umber, 
CAS41 Evergreen, CAS40 Jungle, CAS38 Deep Sea, 
CAS37 Pacific, CAS36 Atlantic, CAS35 Black 
Raspberry, CAS33 Carmine, CAS15 Yobi, CAS14 Fire, 
CAS10 Mars, CAS01 Loam, CAS17 Denim, CAS13 
Hickory, CAS27 Stainless, CAS25 Pelican, CAS22 
Wisp, CAS24 Desert, CAS11 Penny Loafer, CAS31 
Brownstone, CAS26 Ash, CAS28 Forest Floor, CAS29 
Bisque, CAS06 Cattail, CAS30 Tumbleweed, CAS12 
Morocco, CAS42 Ebony, CAS56 Sour Apple, CAS57 
Russet, CAS55 Leek, CAS54 Mirage, CAS53 Marlin, 
CAS52 Peacock, CAS51 Parrot, CAS50 Quarry, 
CAS49 Orchid, CAS47 Butterscotch, CAS46 
Dandelion, CAS45 Champagne, CAS44 Snowcap, 
CAS43 Seashell, CAS48 Lady Bug, CAS60 Stucco, 
CAS61 Cashmere, CAS62 Nomad, CAS64 Argent, 
CAS65 Cove, CAS66 Armor, CAS67 Greige, CAS68 
Safari, CAS69 Armada, CAS70 Coyote, CAS71 Cadet, 
CAS77 Maize, CAS78 Pumpkin, CAS79 Teal, CAS80 
Chive, CAS81
Aquarius, CAS82 Hosta, CAS83 Garnet, CAS84 
Harbor, CAS85 Belfast

 $            21.75  $       1,087.50  $            19.95  $          997.50 

OR
Alternate Fabric Brand and Line offered:
List of item numbers/colors attached: yes no

CF STINSON
BRILLIANT LINE
64190 Sandbar, 64191 Glow, 64192 Clearwater, 64193 
Iron, 64194 Parrot, 64195 Torch, 64196 Poppy, 64197 
Lakeshore, 64198 Sapphire, 64199 Firecracker, 64200 
Razzle, 64201 Joe, 64202 Ink, 64203 Noir

 $            20.95  $       1,047.50  $            29.95  $       1,497.50 

OR
Alternate Fabric Brand and Line offered:
List of item numbers/colors attached: yes no

 Caressa FR-Color Card 
Submitted 

 Dazzle-Color Card Submitted 

 Yes 

 As Specified/NOT Alternate 

 As Specified-NOT Alternate 

7 50 YD

8 50 YD



Buyer: Rene Botts 5984OF
Department of Cornhusker State Industries

Opening Date:02/05/19  

Page 5 of 10

Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

C.F. Stinson, LLC

DescriptionLi
ne

 #

UPHOLSTERY  FABRIC Mayer Fabrics Momentum Textiles, LLC

CF STINSON
DART LINE
63644 Ruby, 63645 Bamboo, 63646 Fog, 63647 
Vermillion, 63648 Herb, 63649 Sapphire, 63650 Carob, 
63651, Evergreen, 63652 Abyss, 63653 Peat

 $            19.95  $          997.50  $            13.45  $          672.50 

OR
Alternate Fabric Brand and Line offered:
List of item numbers/colors attached: yes no

CF STINSON
FAST LANE LINE
63955 Linen, 63956 Gold, 63957 Firecracker, 63958 
Mushroom, 63959 Elctric Blue, 63960 Cherrywood, 
63961 Anthracite, 63962 Deep Plum, 63963 Chocolate

 $            18.35  $          917.50  $            17.95  $          897.50 

OR
Alternate Fabric Brand and Line offered:

List of item numbers/colors attached: yes no

CF STINSON
FURROWS LINE
64055 Ignite, 64056 Burnished, 64057 Prairie, 64058 
Parchment, 64059 Kelp, 64060 Marine, 64061 Granite, 
64062 Grotto, 64063 Passion, 64064 Onyx

 $            21.45  $       1,072.50  $            16.95  $          847.50 

OR
Alternate Fabric Brand and Line offered:
List of item numbers/colors attached: yes no

CF STINSON
HI-FI LINE
64041 Wavelength, 64042 Stereo, 64043 Sound, 
64044 Radio, 64045 Tone, 64046 Rhythm, 64047 
Clarity, 64048 Volume, 64049 Harmony, 64050 
Frequency, 64051 Pitch

 $            18.75  $          937.50  $            17.45  $          872.50 

OR
Alternate Fabric Brand and Line offered:
List of item numbers/colors attached: yes no

 Yes 

 Locomotion-Colr Card 
Submitted 

 Yes 

 As Specified-NOT Alternate 

 Yes 

 Patio-Color Card Submitted 

 Yes 

 Element-Color Card Submitted 

 Interlude-Color Card Submitted  As Specified-NOT Alternate 

 As Specified-NOT Alternate 

 As Specified-NOT Alternate 

11 50 YD

12 50 YD

9 50 YD

10 50 YD
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Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

C.F. Stinson, LLC

DescriptionLi
ne

 #

UPHOLSTERY  FABRIC Mayer Fabrics Momentum Textiles, LLC

CF STINSON
HIVE LINE
63671 Slate, 63672 Hornet, 63673 Bumble, 63674 
Water, 63675 Chili, 63677 Aegean, 63679 Violet, 
63680 Honeycomb, 63681 Brick

 $            18.75  $          937.50  $            17.95  $          897.50 

OR
Alternate Fabric Brand and Line offered:
List of item numbers/colors attached: yes no

CF STINSON
INSIDE TRACK LINE
63625 Aruba, 63626 Ecru, 63627 Chartreuse, 63628 
Blaze, 63629 Roma, 63630 Argent, 63631 Kelly, 63632 
Passion, 63633 Claret, 63634 Royal, 63635 Caper, 
63636 Violet, 63637 Espresso, 63638 Ink, 63639 
Demitasse,63640 Anthracite, 63641 Jet

 $            21.45  $       1,072.50  $            16.45  $          822.50 

OR
Alternate Fabric Brand and Line offered:

List of item numbers/colors attached: yes no

CF STINSON
POLKA LINE
63761 Limelight, 63762 Champagne, 63763 Blue 
Moon, 63764 Very Berry, 63765 Fuse, 63766 Sable, 
63767 Silhouette

 $            18.75  $          937.50  $            23.95  $       1,197.50 

OR
Alternate Fabric Brand and Line offered:
List item numbers/colors attached: yes no 
CF STINSON
RETROGRADE LINE
63770 Electric, 63771 Sunrise, 63773 Castlerock, 
63774 Coastal, 63775 Lava, 63776 Mercury, 63777 
Aquamarine, 63778 Riverside, 63779 Eclipse

 $            18.95  $          947.50  $            21.45  $       1,072.50 

OR
Alternate Fabric Brand and Line offered:
List of item numbers/colors attached: yes no

 Optic-Color Card Submitted 

 Yes 

 Yes 

 Yes 

 As Specified-NOT Alternate 

 Align and Batik-Color Cards 
Submitted 

 Yes 

 Portal-Color Card Submitted 

 As Specified-NOT Alternate 

 As Specified-NOT Alternate 

 As Specified-NOT Alternate 

 Orbit-Color Card Submitted 

15 50 YD

50 YD

13 50 YD

14 50 YD

16
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Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

C.F. Stinson, LLC

DescriptionLi
ne

 #

UPHOLSTERY  FABRIC Mayer Fabrics Momentum Textiles, LLC

CF STINSON
RIDDLE LINE
64118 Siren, 64119 Malt, 64120 Iris, 64121 Frost, 
64122 Citron, 64123 Peppercorn, 64124 Surf, 64125 
Chalkboard, 64126 Black Coffee

 $            19.75  $          987.50  $            20.45  $       1,022.50 

OR
Alternate Fabric Brand and Line offered:
List of item numbers/colors attached: yes no

CF STINSON
SEQUENCE LINE
64177 Sky, 64178 Crimson, 64179 Orange, 64180 
Navy, 64181 Cadet, 64182 Burgundy, 64183 Peat, 
64184 Abyss

 $            20.75  $       1,037.50  $            25.45  $       1,272.50 

OR
Alternate Fabric Brand and Line offered:
List of item numbers/colors attached: yes no

CF STINSON
SPRINT LINE
64020 Mist, 64021 Ivory, 64022 Quarry, 64023 
Turquoise, 64024 Gold, 64025 Twig, 64026 Graphite, 
64027 Fern,
64028 Breeze, 64029 Blaze, 64030 Rust, 64031 
Nocturne, 64032 Storm, 64033 Driftwood, 64034 
Cherry, 64035 Cordovan, 64036 Blackberry, 64037 
Peat, 64038 Abyss

 $            16.25  $          812.50  $            20.95  $       1,047.50 

OR
Alternate Fabric Brand and Line offered:
List of item numbers/colors attached: yes no

MOMENTUM GROUP
EXPO LINE
Festive, Fog, Latte, Leaf, Lemon, Oasis, Raspberry, 
Sky, Spirit, Sprout, Tuxedo, Viola, Zest

 $                  -    $            17.95  $       5,385.00  $            10.85  $       3,255.00 

OR
Alternate Fabric Brand and Line offered:
List of item numbers/colors attached: yes no

 Valet- Color Card Submitted 

 Yes 

 Genesis-Color Card Submitted 

 Yes 

 As Specified-NOT Alternate  In theGrove-Colr Card 
Submitted 

 Yes 

 Hoopla-Colr Card Sublitted 

 Yes 

 As Specified-NOT Alternate 

 No Bid 

 As Specified-NOT Alternate 

20 300 YD

18 50 YD

19 50 YD

17 50 YD
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C.F. Stinson, LLC

DescriptionLi
ne

 #

UPHOLSTERY  FABRIC Mayer Fabrics Momentum Textiles, LLC

MOMENTUM GROUP
ORIGIN LINE
Amethyst, Annatto, Arundel, Avalon, Basalt, Bayou, 
Bottle, Caraway, Eco, Eureka, Euro, Fez, Gala, Garnet, 
Indigo, Iron

 $              9.45  $       9,450.00  $            10.10  $     10,100.00 

OR
Alternate Fabric Brand and Line offered:
List of item numbers/colors attached: yes no

MOMENTUM GROUP
PERK LINE
Auburn, Cabana, Cedar, Crimson, Dijon, Ebony, Flint, 
Patriot, Pewter, Regal, Sesame, Walnut

 $            16.45  $     16,450.00  $            10.40  $     10,400.00 

OR
Alternate Fabric Brand and Line offered:
List of item numbers/colors attached: yes no

MOMENTUM GROUP
FUSE LINE
Azurean, Carmine, Cress, Ginger, Iris, Lunar, Malted, 
Morel, Pepper, Pimento, Pristine, Saffron, Walnut

 $            26.95  $     13,475.00  $            11.30  $       5,650.00 

OR
Alternate Fabric Brand and Line offered:
List of item numbers/colors attached: yes no

MOMENTUM GROUP
CORE LINE
Burst, Dune, Electric, Eve, Firey, Hydra, Macro, Rubio, 
Seed, Shale, Spritz, Tide, Vital

 $              9.45  $       4,725.00 

OR
Alternate Fabric Brand and Line offered:
List of item numbers/colors attached: yes no
100% VINYL FABRIC

25
DOUGLASS INDUSTRIES
ALL SEASON 1000 YD  $            15.42  $     15,420.00  $            15.95  $     15,950.00 

26 ARC.COM
ALL SEASON 1000 YD  $            15.95  $     15,950.00 

 Forte- Color Card Submitted 

 Yes 

 Optic-Color Card Submitted 

 Yes 

 Daydream- Color Card 
Submitted 

 Forte- Color Card Submitted 

 Yes 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

24 500 YD

22 1000 YD

23 500 YD

21 1000 YD
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Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

C.F. Stinson, LLC

DescriptionLi
ne

 #

UPHOLSTERY  FABRIC Mayer Fabrics Momentum Textiles, LLC

27
ALL OTHER PANEL FABRIC LINES
AVAILABLE FROM CATALOG
Sold by Cut Yard

1 YD

28
ALL OTHER SEATING FABRIC LINES
AVAILABLE FROM CATALOG
DISCOUNT FROM LIST PRICE

29
ALL OTHER HEALTHCARE FABRIC
LINES AVAILABLE FROM CATALOG
DISCOUNT FROM LIST PRICE

30
ALL OTHER VINYL LINES AVAILABLE
FROM CATALOG
DISCOUNT FROM LIST PRICE

31

CUSTOMIZED FABRIC CARD FOR
STOCK AND/OR NON-STOCK
Standard fabrics, up to six (6) fabrics with various 
colors per one vendor, two-page card, printed with CSI 
logo, and design approved by CSI prior to production.
Pricing per 100 cards

1 C  $4.80/card  $2.40/ Face  $         5.00
per card  $          500.00  $         3.50

each 

32

CUSTOMIZED FABRIC CARD FOR
STOCK AND/OR NON-STOCK
standard fabrics, up to six (6) fabrics with various colors 
per one vendor, one-page card, printed with CSI logo, 
and design approved by CSI prior to production.
Pricing per 100 cards

1 C  $2.40/card  $2.40/ Face  $         3.50
per card  $          350.00  $         1.75

each 

CUSTOMIZED FABRIC CARD FOR
STOCK AND/OR NON-STOCK
standard fabrics, up to six (6) fabrics with various colors 
from multiple vendors, one-page card, printed with CSI 
logo, and design approved by CSI prior to production.
Pricing per 100 cards

 $2.40/Face  $2.40/Face  $              5.00  $          500.00  No bid 

Is bidder capable of producing such a customized card 
with fabrics from multiple vendors?

 Momentum Textiles
20% Discount off of Net price. 

 Momentum Textiles
20% Discount off of Net price. 

 No 

15  Momentum Textiles
20% Discount off of Net price. 

15

15

 Yes 

 See Attached Price List  Momentum Textiles
20% Discount off of Net price. 

 Yes 

0%

10

10

0

33 1 C

%

%

%

0  30
(Terms Net 30 Days)Payment Terms 0  30 0  0

DISCOUNT FROM LIST PRICE
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Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

C.F. Stinson, LLC

DescriptionLi
ne

 #

UPHOLSTERY  FABRIC Mayer Fabrics Momentum Textiles, LLC

Award Explanation: 
Apparent low bidder on Line 9, offered seating fabric rather than 
panel fabric as specified.
Apparent low bidder on Lines 10, 12 - 14, and 21; offered lines of 
fabric not accepted as equivalent.
Not awarding line 33.

 

4 - 10

Comments

Delivery Days ARO 7

***It is really not Feasible to do 
only 100 Custom Cards because 
it is so expensive. Not saying 
that we can't do it. It is just more 
affordable a minimum of 1000 or 
1500 Custom Cards.***
***It is also not a good idea to 
put Multiple Vendors on the 
same card because if on vendor 
discontinues one item, then the 
card is no longer good. Not 
saying that we can't do it, but I 
would advise against it.***
***Please let me know if you any 
further questions.***
See bid for exceptions.

No Bids

24. ON PHASE OUT WILL BE 
Discounted on 1/1/20 Origin is a 
good alternate. See above.
29. Coated Fabrics
30. Excluding Silica family.
31/32. Note: Minimum order for 
customer cards is 1,500 Sample 
maker is an outside vendor.
Lines 31,32,& 33
Note: should CSI choose to 
make its own sample cards, 
Momentum Textiles, LLC can 
provide the sample yardage to 
make 100 cards at no charge.
See bid for exceptions.
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