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DESCRIPTION ESTM. 
QTY UOM UNIT PRICE EXTENDED 

PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED 
PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED 

PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED 
PRICE

1 1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 2 
FREMONT MAINT YARD 500 TN  $            19.42  $       9,710.00  $            19.95  $       9,975.00  NO BID  $                 -    $            20.15  $     10,075.00 

2 1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 2                  
BLAIR MAINT YARD 500 TN  $            18.55  $       9,275.00  $            19.20  $       9,600.00  NO BID  $                 -    $            17.45  $       8,725.00 

3 1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 2 
MORMON BRIDGE YARD 500 TN  $            17.70  $       8,850.00  $            19.20  $       9,600.00  NO BID  $                 -    $            18.70  $       9,350.00 

4 1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 2                
SOUTH OMAHA MAINT YARD 500 TN  $            19.05  $       9,525.00  $            19.95  $       9,975.00  NO BID  $                 -    $            19.55  $       9,775.00 

5 1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 2                 
OMAHA 108TH MAINT YARD 500 TN  $            18.50  $       9,250.00  $            18.75  $       9,375.00  NO BID  $                 -    $            19.45  $       9,725.00 

6 1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 2 
ELKHORN MAINT YARD 500 TN  $            19.05  $       9,525.00  $            19.95  $       9,975.00  NO BID  $                 -    $            19.75  $       9,875.00 

7 1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 2                  
MELIA HILL GRENTA MAINT YARD 500 TN  $            18.95  $       9,475.00  $            18.30  $       9,150.00  NO BID  $                 -    $            17.95  $       8,975.00 

8 1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 2 
PLATTSMOUTH MAINT YARD 500 TN  $            18.50  $       9,250.00  $            18.35  $       9,175.00  NO BID  $                 -    $            17.95  $       8,975.00 

9 1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 2 
MANLEY  MAINT 500 TN  $            16.00  $       8,000.00  $            16.45  $       8,225.00  NO BID  $                 -    $            16.50  $       8,250.00 

10 1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 1                  
DAVID CITY YARD 300 TN  $            23.72  $       7,116.00  $            26.65  $       7,995.00  $              29.40  $       8,820.00  $            24.15  $       7,245.00 

11 1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 1 
GREENWOOD YARD 300 TN  $            17.99  $       5,397.00  $            18.10  $       5,430.00  NO BID  $                 -    $            17.55  $       5,265.00 

12 1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 1                  
HWY 15 MP 12  FAIRBURY 500 TN  $            24.11  $     12,055.00  $            27.95  $     13,975.00  $              20.38  $     10,190.00  $            27.90  $     13,950.00 

13 1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 1                 
HWY 15 MP 24 FAIRBURY 500 TN  $            24.11  $     12,055.00  $            26.20  $     13,100.00  $              19.98  $       9,990.00  $            25.95  $     12,975.00 

14 1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 1                 
SALT VALLEY YARD 500 TN  $            19.31  $       9,655.00  $            18.85  $       9,425.00  NO BID  $                 -    $            20.15  $     10,075.00 

15 1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 1            
HWY 8 MP 112 PAWNEE CITY 500 TN  $            20.87  $     10,435.00  $            22.45  $     11,225.00  $              21.35  $     10,675.00  $            21.95  $     10,975.00 

16 1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 1 
DUNBAR YARD 1500 TN  $            17.43  $     26,145.00  $            17.95  $     26,925.00  $              18.60  $     27,900.00  $            17.85  $     26,775.00 

17 1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 1                  
HWY 136 MP 209 W EDGE TECUMSEH 1000 TN  $            19.20  $     19,200.00  $            18.95  $     18,950.00  $              19.35  $     19,350.00  $            19.75  $     19,750.00 

18 PRICE PER TON MILE                                       
FOR ADD/ALT DELIVERY LOCATIONS 200 TN $0.16  $            32.00 $0.16  $            32.00 $0.20  $            40.00 $0.15  $            30.00 

 $          332.62  $   184,950.00  $          347.36  $   192,107.00  $            129.26  $     86,965.00  $          342.85  $   190,765.00 

L.P. STEWART AND SONS, INC.

10 Days
 

VI. C. "WASHED" blacked out by 
vendor.   CRUSHER RUN ROCK 
IS NOT WASHED

James B Wessels dba Wessels 
Trucking

 
0% As Needed Days

Total

Armstrong Rentals, LLC

21 Days
0% 30 Days

Westover Rock & Sand, Inc.

 
As Requested

Comments

Li
ne

 #

1 1/2" Crusher Run Rock

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms
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