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1
XT3 TRADE IN FOR XT-VIA FIXED ASSET TAG 
#47T893290
S/N A023590

-1 EA N/A  N/A 

2

XT36-XTVCMH-UPG11
XT-VIA HD-ONLY CHANNELMAX upgr from XT3 6U 6-channel 
(2011)
Supports a list of ChannelMAX (12+ ch) configs in HD (720p, 1080i).
Support for Video over IP (10G SFP+) on XT-VIA (IP I/O option 
required).
Support for ST 2110 (-10, -20, -30, -50), ST 2022-6, AMWA NMOS 
IS-04.
Compatible with Super Motion configs (Super Motion license 
required).
Codec support: HD: DNxHD, ProRes 422, AVC-I class 100; XAVC 
HD.
Embedded audio support (24-bit uncompressed); Dolby-E support 
(pass-through & cut edit); Up to 16 audio tracks (mono) per video 
channel;
MADI: 128 Mono In + 128 Mono Out on 4x BNC;
Network: XNet-VIA 10Gbps (2x SFP+) + XNet 3Gbps (2x BNC) + 
10GigE (2x SFP+) + 1GigE (2x RJ45)
(SFP+ modules not included); XNet-VIA with software update end 
2018.
Video transitions on each playback channel (mix-on-1-ch) with all 
HD/Full HD config.
12x1800GB Disk Drives (hot swap).
Redundant power supply.
Supported since Multicam 16.

1 EA  $ 164,630.00  $      164,630.00 No Bid  No Bid 

3

XTVIA-SM
SUPER MOTION OPTION FOR XT-VIA Server
Record of Super motion cameras with XT-VIA. Supports for SLSM2x 
in UHD-4K.
Supports for SLSM2x, 3x, 4x, 6x, 8x, 10x in HD.

1 EA  $     9,255.00  $          9,255.00 No Bid  No Bid 
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4

XTVIA-MLT-O
MULTICAM LSM (OPEN CONFIG) for XT-VIA Server
Search while recording, cue points & clips management, instant 
replay;
Playlist Management to build highlights or other packages with wipes 
and dissolves effects;
Split Audio editing: define independent audio and video transitions 
and effect durations;
Integration with Hyper Motion cameras;
Ability to run the Multicam LSM application with any configuration 
compatible with the selected hardware (except Super Motion)
** Transfer of license from Trade in XT3

1 EA  NO CHARGE  NO CHARGE No Bid  No Bid 

5

XTVIA-SPOTBOX
SPOTBOX FOR XT-VIA SERVER 
VGA & Keyboard: Clip Screen, VGA Control Panel, Video Delay;
Assign custom keywords to clips, use them to search the server 
database. ** Transfer of license from Trade in XT3

1 EA  NO CHARGE  NO CHARGE No Bid  No Bid 

6

XTVIA-HYMO
INTEGRATION WITH HYPER MOTION 
cameras for XT-VIA Server
Ability to control Hyper Motion cameras from the LSM. ** Transfer of 
license from Trade in XT3

1 EA  NO CHARGE  NO CHARGE No Bid  No Bid 

7

XTVIA-SPM
SPLIT SCREEN OPTION FOR XT-VIA 
Show 2 perfectly synchronized replays side by side on the same 
screen.
Supported for HD (720p, 1080i), Full-HD (1080p) and UHD-4K (2-
sample interleaved) ** Transfer of license from Trade in XT3

1 EA  NO CHARGE  NO CHARGE No Bid  No Bid 

8

XT36U-HW3XM16-UPG
XT3 SN:A130010UPGRADE TO V4.21 
XT3 rev 3.x upgrade for Multicam 16 compatibility
Upgrade of XT3 HW rev. 3.10 to 3.30 for compatibility with Multicam 
16.
Regroups all internal boards to be replaced (MV4, H3XP, and if 
needed TGE, A3X). Includes 2GB RAM for MTPC. Storage capacity 
and software licenses remain unchanged.
The resulting HW revision will be 4.21.

1 EA  $   30,495.00  $        30,495.00 No Bid  No Bid 
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9

SAS-61800-HS-UPG INTERNAL RAID UPGRADE TO 6x1800GB 
(hot swap)
Upgrade of the internal RAID storage to 6x 1800GB disk drives (hot 
swap mounting) for an existing server. Supported since Multicam 15.

1 EA  INCLUDED  INCLUDED No Bid  No Bid 

10
XT3-6U-H-EXTW
XT3 6U WARRANTY EXTENSION 
(HD/SD), 1 Year

2 EA  INCLUDED  INCLUDED No Bid  No Bid 

11
RSRV
REPAIR & SUPPORT SERVICE 
(1 man-hour)

5 EA  INCLUDED  INCLUDED No Bid  No Bid 

12

XT36U-HW41M16-UPG
XT3 SN:A281810UPGRADE TO V4.21 
XT3 rev 3.x upgrade for Multicam 16 compatibility
Upgrade of XT3 HW rev. 3.10 to 3.30 for compatibility with Multicam 
16.
Regroups all internal boards to be replaced (MV4, H3XP, and if 
needed TGE, A3X). Includes 2GB RAM for MTPC. Storage capacity 
and software licenses remain unchanged.
The resulting HW revision will be 4.21.

1 EA  $   12,620.00  $        12,620.00 No Bid  No Bid 

13

SAS-61800-HS-UPG INTERNAL RAID UPGRADE TO (6x1800GB 
(hot swap)
Upgrade of the internal RAID storage to 6x 1800GB disk drives (hot 
swap mounting) for an existing server. Supported since Multicam 15.

1 EA  INCLUDED  INCLUDED No Bid  No Bid 

14
XT3-6U-H-EXTW
XT3 6U WARRANTY EXTENSION 
(HD/SD), 1 Year

2 EA  INCLUDED  INCLUDED No Bid  No Bid 

15
RSRV
REPAIR & SUPPORT SERVICE 
(1 man-hour)

5 EA  INCLUDED  INCLUDED No Bid  No Bid 

16
SSU
ONSITE XT3 UPGRADES 
On-site Technical Support (1 man-day)

2 EA  $     1,580.00  $          3,160.00 No Bid  No Bid 

17 TVLEXP
TRAVEL EXPENSES 1 EA  $     1,580.00  $          1,580.00 No Bid  No Bid 
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18

LSM-CONNECT-BASE
LSM CONNECT UPGRADE 
LSM Connect Base
Mini PC with Android O/S and LSM.Connect application 3 x USB2 
connectors, 1 x HDMI out
1 RJ45 Ethernet connection
1x OTG, Mic Jack, Headphone Jack
Optical SPDIF
SD/MMC Card reader
Mini USB QWERTY Keyboard
USB Mouse
Possibility to attach a multi touch screen.
Tested with iiyama touch screen type Prolite T2236MSC

2 EA  $     2,780.00  $          5,560.00 No Bid  No Bid 

19
TRADE-INS
TRADE IN LSM TABLET 
sn: T000056, T000057

-2 EA  $    (1,000.00)  $         (2,000.00) No Bid  No Bid 

20 SHIPPING AND DELIVERY 1 EA  INCLUDED  INCLUDED No Bid  No Bid 

21

PRODUCT ID: 0086-961-0009
GVLIC-XS-4WC-PERP 
PERPETUAL LDX86 XTREMESPEED eLICENSE FOR 
WORLDCAM

2 EA  $   43,470.00  $        86,940.00  $   46,312.50  $        92,625.00 

 $      312,240.00  $        92,625.00 

Comments
Delivery Days ARO

Payment Terms
30

N/A-N/A

No Bids

Total

30
0-30
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