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Description Qty UOM Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

1 BLACKMAGIC DESIGN, SMARTSCOPE 
DUO 4K RACK-MOUNTED DUAL 6G-SDI 
MONITORS PART #HDL-SMTWSCOPEDUO4K2

9 EA  $          798.00  $       7,182.00  $          668.36  $       6,015.24  $          669.00  $       6,021.00 

2 MATRIX SWITCH CORP. 3G/HD/SD-SDI 
4X4 COMPACT ROUTING SWITCH 
PART #MSC-HD44L #MSC-XD44L*

2 EA $  1,148.00
MSC-XD44L

 $       2,296.00  $       1,546.11  $       3,092.22  $          914.00  $       1,828.00 

3 BLACKMAGIC DESIGN, MINI CONVERTER 
SDI SDI DISTRIBUTION 4K  PART 
#CONVMSDIDA4K

15 EA  $          296.00  $       4,440.00  $          248.04  $       3,720.60  $          248.00  $       3,720.00 

4 BLACKMAGIC, ATEM 1 M/E PRODUCTION 
STUDIO 4K SWITCHER W/DVE PART 
#SWATEMPSW1ME4K

9 EA  $       2,502.00  $     22,518.00  $       2,097.83  $     18,880.47  $       2,099.00  $     18,891.00 

5 MICROTRONIX, TEXT INSERTER FOR 
HD-SDI W/PIP PART #DX-2200-TI-24

8 EA  $       1,399.00  $     11,192.00  $       1,142.44  $       9,139.52  $       1,388.00  $     11,104.00 

6 KANEXPRO, HDBASET HDMI EXTENDER 
PART #EXT-HD100MHBT

8 EA  $          282.00  $       2,256.00  $          320.34  $       2,562.72  $          330.00  $       2,640.00 

7 BLACKMAGIC DESIGN, MINI CONVERTER 
AUDIO TO SDI PART #CONVMCSAUD

11 EA  $          196.00  $       2,156.00  $          163.95  $       1,803.45 $  164.00 
*PART # SHOULD BE 

CONVMCSAUD2

 $       1,804.00 

8 BLACKMAGIC DESIGN, MINI CONVERTER 
SDI TO AUDIO PART #CONVMCSAUD

1 EA  $          196.00  $          196.00  $          163.95  $          163.95  $          164.00  $          164.00 

9 YAMAHA, DIGITAL AUDIO PROCESSOR 
PART #DME24N

1 EA  $       4,090.00  $       4,090.00  $       3,237.29  $       3,237.29  $       3,260.00  $       3,260.00 

10 YAMAHA, DIGITAL AUDIO PROCESSOR 
PART #DME64N

1 EA  $       7,218.00  $       7,218.00  $       5,713.48  $       5,713.48  $       5,759.00  $       5,759.00 

11 YAMAHA, MINI YGDAI AES EXPANSION 
MODULE PART #MY16-AE

1 EA  $          582.00  $          582.00  $          538.88  $          538.88  $          543.00  $          543.00 

12 YAMAHA, REMOTELY CONTROLLABLE 8-
CHANNEL 24-BIT HEAD AMP AND AD 
CONVERTER PART #AD8HR

2 EA  $       2,546.00  $       5,092.00  $       2,015.07  $       4,030.14  $       2,029.00  $       4,058.00 

13 YAMAHA, MINI YGDAI AES DIGITAL 
OUTPUT PART #MY8-DA96

2 EA  $          422.00  $          844.00  $          372.21  $          744.42  $          373.00  $          746.00 

14 YAMAHA, CABLE FROM MY16-AE TO 
AD8HR PART #D24 #D24 AES Cable*

2 EA $   134.00
D24 AES cable

 $          268.00  $          102.04  $          204.08  $          103.00  $          206.00 

15 YAMAHA, BREAK-OUT CABLE FROM MY8-
DA96 TO XLR-M'S PART #DA96

2 EA $   62.00
DA96 Cable

 $          124.00  $            58.94  $          117.88  $            49.00  $            98.00 

16 CLEARONE, VOIP TELEPHONE 
ONFERENCING PROCESSOR/HYBRID 
PART #CONVERGEPROVH20

2 EA  $          959.00  $       1,918.00  $          731.35  $       1,462.70  $          854.00  $       1,708.00 
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17 AUDIO-TECHNICAL, CARDIOID 
ONDENSER GOOSENECK MICROPHONE 
PART #ES915C #PRO 47L*

2 EA  $  130.00
PRO 47TL 

 $          260.00 $   89.00
Replaced  Pro 

490L

 $          178.00  $          201.00  $          402.00 

18 FABRICATION CHARGE PODIUM 
MOUNTING PART #AT8666RSP

2 EA  $          139.00  $          278.00 $  244.00
Replaced by U891 

RX

 $          488.00  $            89.00  $          178.00 

19 CRESTRON, PRO3 CONTROL SYSTEM 
PROCESSOR PART #PRO3

10 EA  $       2,942.00  $     29,420.00  $       2,551.00  $     25,510.00  $       2,787.00  $     27,870.00 

20 SERIAL COMM, INDUSTRIAL RS422 TO 
FIBER OPTIC SM CONVERTER 
PART #SER-FIBER-SM-SC

20 EA  $          169.00  $       3,380.00  $          132.60  $       2,652.00  $          146.00  $       2,920.00 

21 CRESTRON, POWER CONTROL 
MODULES FOR VIDEO RACK 
PART #ST-PC

10 EA  $          223.00  $       2,230.00  $          155.00  $       1,550.00  $      526.00
DISCONTINUED 
QUOTING 
CRESTRON 
RECOMMENDED 
REPLACEMENT PC-
200

 $       5,260.00 

22

23 PANDUIT, MPO FIBER OPTIC TRUNK 
CABLE LEGISLATIVE HEARING ROOM 
1003 - 524' LENGTH

524 EA
FT*

 $       3,696.00  $       3,696.00  No Bid  $       3,200.00  $       3,200.00 

24 PANDUIT, MPO FIBER OPTIC TRUNK 
CABLE LEGISLATIVE HEARING ROOM 
1113 - 374' LENGTH

374 FT  $       3,120.00  $       3,120.00  No Bid  $       2,467.00  $       2,467.00 

25 PANDUIT, MPO FIBER OPTIC TRUNK 
CABLE LEGISLATIVE HEARING ROOM 
1507 - 474' LENGTH

474 FT  $       3,504.00  $       3,504.00  No Bid  $       2,956.00  $       2,956.00 

PANDUIT, MPO FIBER OPTIC TRUNK CABLE                                                                                                         
OS1/OS2 24-FIBER, SMALL DIAMETER, INDOOR TRUNK, 
PLENUM, MPO FEMALE TO MPO FEMALE, METHOD A, 
STD. IL., PULLING EYE END SIDE A:  CONNECTOR TY;E: 
12 FIBER MTP/APC STD. FEMALE SIDE A:  NUMBER OF 
CONNECTORS: 2 SIDE A: BREAKOUT LENGTH: 1 METER
SIDE B:  CONNECTOR TYPE:  12 FIBER MTP/APCV STD. 
FEMALE SIDE B: NUMBER OF CONNECTORS: 2
SIDE B:  BREAKOUT LENGTH:  1 METER FIBER MODE:  
9/125 SINGLEMODE CABLE TYPE:  ARMORED
JACKET COLOR:  YELLOW JACKET TYPE:  PLENUM OFNP 
FIBER COUNT:  24 PIN-OUT CONFIGURATION:  STRAIGHT 
CABLE, KEY-UP TO KEY-DOWN, PIN 1 TO PIN 1  SPECIAL 
INSTRUCTIONS:  ON CABLE REEL WITH PULLING EYE 
AND CONNECTOR NETTING LENGTH:  SEE COMPOSITE 
OF LENGTHS FOR ALL TRUNKS BELOW

Specifications for lines 23 -35 Specifications for lines 23 -35 Specifications for lines 23 -35
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26 PANDUIT, MPO FIBER OPTIC TRUNK 
CABLE LEGISLATIVE HEARING ROOM 
1510 - 492' LENGTH

482 FT  $       3,574.00  $       3,574.00  No Bid $        3,044.00
QUOTING 492' 

LENGTH

 $       3,044.00 

27 PANDUIT, MPO FIBER OPTIC TRUNK 
CABLE LEGISLATIVE HEARING ROOM 
1524 - 214' LENGTH

214 FT  $       2,505.00  $       2,505.00  No Bid  $       1,686.00  $       1,686.00 

28 PANDUIT, MPO FIBER OPTIC TRUNK 
CABLE LEGISLATIVE HEARING ROOM 
1525 - 218' LENGTH

218 FT  $       2,521.00  $       2,521.00  No Bid  $       1,705.00  $       1,705.00 

29 PANDUIT, MPO FIBER OPTIC TRUNK 
CABLE LEGISLATIVE HEARING ROOM 
2102 - 314' LENGTH

314 FT  $       2,890.00  $       2,890.00  No Bid  $       2,174.00  $       2,174.00 

30 PANDUIT, MPO FIBER OPTIC TRUNK 
CABLE NORRIS (WEST) CLOAK ROOM - 
190' LENGTH

190 FT  $       2,251.00  $       2,251.00  No Bid  $       1,568.00  $       1,568.00 

31 PANDUIT, MPO FIBER OPTIC TRUNK 
CABLE NORRIS (WEST) CHAMBER -
350' LENGTH

350 FT  $       3,028.00  $       3,028.00  No Bid  $       2,350.00  $       2,350.00 

32 PANDUIT, MPO FIBER OPTIC TRUNK 
CABLE GOVERNOR'S PRESS ROOM - 
582' LENGTH

582 FT  $       3,919.00  $       3,919.00  No Bid  $       3,484.00  $       3,484.00 

33 PANDUIT, MPO FIBER OPTIC TRUNK 
CABLE SUPREME COURT COURTROOM - 
600' LENGTH

600 FT  $       3,988.00  $       3,988.00  No Bid  $       3,572.00  $       3,572.00 

34 PANDUIT, MPO FIBER OPTIC TRUNK 
CABLE COURT OF APPEALS 
COURTROOM - 600' LENGTH

600 FT  $       3,988.00  $       3,988.00  No Bid  $       3,572.00  $       3,572.00 

35 PANDUIT, MPO FIBER OPTIC TRUNK 
CABLE CLERK OF COURTS OFFICE RACK 
- 492' LENGTH

492 FT  $       3,574.00  $       3,574.00  No Bid  $       3,044.00  $       3,044.00 

36 PANDUIT, 12F DUP LC SM MPO SFQ 
CASSETTE FIBER COUNT: 12 FRONT 
CONNECTOR TYPE: LC UPC REAR 
CONNECTOR TYPE: 12 FIBER MTP/APC STD. 
MALE (PINS) NUMBER OF CONNECTIONS: 
REAR: 1 FIBER MODE: 9/125 SINGLEMODE 
CASSETTE BOX TYPE: SFQ PART #FQ9N-12-
10AS

26 EA  $          528.00  $     13,728.00  $          564.51  $     14,677.26  $          409.00  $     10,634.00 

37 PANDUIT, 24PORT PATCH PANEL FOR 
PRE-TERMINATED AD PART #QPP24BL

19 EA  $            42.00  $          798.00  $            45.42  $          862.98  $            29.00  $          551.00 

38 PANDUIT, SFQ CASSETTE ZERO RU 
BRACKET PART #FQCBRUA

4 EA  $            40.00  $          160.00  $            49.08  $          196.32  $            31.00  $          124.00 
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39 PANDUIT, 2M LC UPC TO LC UPC DUPLEX 
2.0MM 9/125 SINGLE MODE FIBER PATCH 
CABLE PART #NKFP92ERLLSM-02

24 EA  $            21.00  $          504.00  $            30.72  $          737.28  $            17.00  $          408.00 

40 PANDUIT, 10M LC UPC TO LC UPC 
DUPLEX 2.0MM 9/125 SINGLE MODE 
FIBER PATCH CABLE PART 
#NKFP92ERLLSM-10

24 EA  $            30.00  $          720.00  $            44.68  $       1,072.32  $            25.00  $          600.00 

41 PANDUIT, 2M LC UPC TO LC UPC DUPLEX 
2.0MM 9/125 SINGLE MODE FIBER PATCH 
CABLE PART #NKFP92ERLSSM-02

12 EA  $            19.00  $          228.00  $            28.19  $          338.28  $            16.00  $          192.00 

42 PANDUIT, 10M LC UPC TO LC UPC 
DUPLEX 2.0MM 9/125 SINGLE MODE 
FIBER PATCH CABLE PART 
#NKFP92ERLSSM-10

12 EA  $            25.00  $          300.00  $            37.70  $          452.40  $            21.00  $          252.00 

43 BELDEN, RG59, HD/SDI VIDEO
COAX ORANGE, RISER PER 1000' 
PART #1505A-ORANGE

5 EA  $          645.00  $       3,225.00  $          358.16  $       1,790.80  $          500.00  $       2,500.00 

44 ADC-COMMSCOPE, BNC PLUG (MALE) 
CONNECTOR PART #BNC-1-N

500 EA  $              3.00  $       1,500.00  $              1.59  $          795.00  $              2.00  $       1,000.00 

45 AMPHENOL, HD BNC TOOL FOR 
INSTALLATION / REMOVAL PART #227-
T2000

3 EA  $          110.00  $          330.00  $            77.54  $          232.62  $            79.00  $          237.00 

46 AMPHENOL, HD BNC TO BNC ADAPTER, 
BELDEN 1855A CABLE 12"  PART #095-
666-44883-2

150 EA  $            31.00  $       4,650.00  $            21.48  $       3,222.00  $            29.00  $       4,350.00 

47 MIDDLE ATLANTIC, VENTILATED RACK 
SHELF, 10" DEPTH PART #UTR1

36 EA  $            33.00  $       1,188.00  $            20.48  $          737.28  $            23.00  $          828.00 

48 HOSA TECHNOLOGY, XLR FEMALE TO 
MALE 1/4" TRS INTERCONNECT CABLE 
PART #24 HXS-001.5

28 EA  $              6.00  $          168.00  $              4.11  $          115.08  $              5.50  $          154.00 

49 HOSA TECHNOLOGY, 3-PIN XLR MALE TO 
XLR FEMALE BALANCED INTERCONNECT 
PART #XLR-0105 
#XLR-105*

28 EA  $              6.00  $          168.00  $              4.42  $          123.76  $              6.00  $          168.00 

50 SERIALCOMM, INDUSTRIAL
EXTERNALLY POWERED ISOLATED 
RS232 TO 2-WIRE RS485/RS422 
CONVERTER PART #CON-485/422-EE9

22 EA  $            44.00  $          968.00  $            36.68  $          806.96  $            38.00  $          836.00 

51 ARDUINO, MEGA2560 R3 COMPATIBLE 
MICRO CONTROLLER PART #MEGA2560

10 EA  $            42.00  $          420.00  $            37.04  $          370.40  $            36.00  $          360.00 
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52

53 TRIPP LITE, 8 OUTLET SURGE 
PROTECTOR POWER STRIP, 8FT 
CORD RIGHT ANGLE PLUG, BLACK
PART #TLP808B

24 EA  $            26.00  $          624.00  $            17.86  $          428.64  $            19.00  $          456.00 

 $   180,177.00  $   118,764.42  $   157,652.00 

Line 52 removed by Addenum Three

Total
0 - 0 

Lines 23-35: *All lines sold as "each"
"All or non" Total Extended Price = 
$180,177.00

II.B. 
Ed Pullen
Advanced Audio Visual, Inc. d.b.a. 
CCS Presentation Systems
11041 O St
Omaha, NE 68137

Exception: IV.E. Delivery ARO - 
proposes 60 days delivery. 

Comments

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms

7-10
0 - 45

II.B.
Tim McPherson
AV Associates of Nebraska
14845 N. 2nd Street
Raymond, NE 68428

0 - 30
30*

*Microtronix DX-2200-TI-24 has 
a 14 week lead time ARO
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1 BLACKMAGIC DESIGN, SMARTSCOPE 
DUO 4K RACK-MOUNTED DUAL 6G-SDI 
MONITORS PART #HDL-SMTWSCOPEDUO4K2

9 EA

2 MATRIX SWITCH CORP. 3G/HD/SD-SDI 
4X4 COMPACT ROUTING SWITCH 
PART #MSC-HD44L #MSC-XD44L*

2 EA

3 BLACKMAGIC DESIGN, MINI CONVERTER 
SDI SDI DISTRIBUTION 4K  PART 
#CONVMSDIDA4K

15 EA

4 BLACKMAGIC, ATEM 1 M/E PRODUCTION 
STUDIO 4K SWITCHER W/DVE PART 
#SWATEMPSW1ME4K

9 EA

5 MICROTRONIX, TEXT INSERTER FOR 
HD-SDI W/PIP PART #DX-2200-TI-24

8 EA

6 KANEXPRO, HDBASET HDMI EXTENDER 
PART #EXT-HD100MHBT

8 EA

7 BLACKMAGIC DESIGN, MINI CONVERTER 
AUDIO TO SDI PART #CONVMCSAUD

11 EA

8 BLACKMAGIC DESIGN, MINI CONVERTER 
SDI TO AUDIO PART #CONVMCSAUD

1 EA

9 YAMAHA, DIGITAL AUDIO PROCESSOR 
PART #DME24N

1 EA

10 YAMAHA, DIGITAL AUDIO PROCESSOR 
PART #DME64N

1 EA

11 YAMAHA, MINI YGDAI AES EXPANSION 
MODULE PART #MY16-AE

1 EA

12 YAMAHA, REMOTELY CONTROLLABLE 8-
CHANNEL 24-BIT HEAD AMP AND AD 
CONVERTER PART #AD8HR

2 EA

13 YAMAHA, MINI YGDAI AES DIGITAL 
OUTPUT PART #MY8-DA96

2 EA

14 YAMAHA, CABLE FROM MY16-AE TO 
AD8HR PART #D24 #D24 AES Cable*

2 EA

15 YAMAHA, BREAK-OUT CABLE FROM MY8-
DA96 TO XLR-M'S PART #DA96

2 EA

16 CLEARONE, VOIP TELEPHONE 
ONFERENCING PROCESSOR/HYBRID 
PART #CONVERGEPROVH20

2 EA

Li
ne

 # Nebraska Capitol Video Equipment Refresh Project 

Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

 $          699.00  $       6,291.00  N/A 

 N/A  N/A 

 $          259.00  $       3,885.00  N/A 

 $       2,199.00  $     19,791.00  N/A 

 N/A  N/A 

 N/A  N/A 

 $          169.00  $       1,859.00  N/A 

 $          169.00  $          169.00  N/A 

 N/A  N/A 

 N/A  N/A 

 N/A  N/A 

 N/A  N/A 

 N/A  N/A 

 N/A  N/A 

 N/A  N/A 

 N/A  N/A 

Graybar ElectricF&E Trading LLC
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17 AUDIO-TECHNICAL, CARDIOID 
ONDENSER GOOSENECK MICROPHONE 
PART #ES915C #PRO 47L*

2 EA

18 FABRICATION CHARGE PODIUM 
MOUNTING PART #AT8666RSP

2 EA

19 CRESTRON, PRO3 CONTROL SYSTEM 
PROCESSOR PART #PRO3

10 EA

20 SERIAL COMM, INDUSTRIAL RS422 TO 
FIBER OPTIC SM CONVERTER 
PART #SER-FIBER-SM-SC

20 EA

21 CRESTRON, POWER CONTROL 
MODULES FOR VIDEO RACK 
PART #ST-PC

10 EA

22

23 PANDUIT, MPO FIBER OPTIC TRUNK 
CABLE LEGISLATIVE HEARING ROOM 
1003 - 524' LENGTH

524 EA
FT*

24 PANDUIT, MPO FIBER OPTIC TRUNK 
CABLE LEGISLATIVE HEARING ROOM 
1113 - 374' LENGTH

374 FT

25 PANDUIT, MPO FIBER OPTIC TRUNK 
CABLE LEGISLATIVE HEARING ROOM 
1507 - 474' LENGTH

474 FT

PANDUIT, MPO FIBER OPTIC TRUNK CABLE                                                                                                         
OS1/OS2 24-FIBER, SMALL DIAMETER, INDOOR TRUNK, 
PLENUM, MPO FEMALE TO MPO FEMALE, METHOD A, 
STD. IL., PULLING EYE END SIDE A:  CONNECTOR TY;E: 
12 FIBER MTP/APC STD. FEMALE SIDE A:  NUMBER OF 
CONNECTORS: 2 SIDE A: BREAKOUT LENGTH: 1 METER
SIDE B:  CONNECTOR TYPE:  12 FIBER MTP/APCV STD. 
FEMALE SIDE B: NUMBER OF CONNECTORS: 2
SIDE B:  BREAKOUT LENGTH:  1 METER FIBER MODE:  
9/125 SINGLEMODE CABLE TYPE:  ARMORED
JACKET COLOR:  YELLOW JACKET TYPE:  PLENUM OFNP 
FIBER COUNT:  24 PIN-OUT CONFIGURATION:  STRAIGHT 
CABLE, KEY-UP TO KEY-DOWN, PIN 1 TO PIN 1  SPECIAL 
INSTRUCTIONS:  ON CABLE REEL WITH PULLING EYE 
AND CONNECTOR NETTING LENGTH:  SEE COMPOSITE 
OF LENGTHS FOR ALL TRUNKS BELOW

Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

Graybar ElectricF&E Trading LLC

 N/A  N/A 

 N/A  N/A 

 N/A  N/A 

 N/A  $          169.71  $       3,394.20 

 N/A  N/A 

 N/A  $              2.23  $       1,168.52 

 N.A  $              2.63  $          983.62 

 N/A  $              2.33  $       1,104.42 

Specifications for lines 23 -35 Specifications for lines 23 -35
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26 PANDUIT, MPO FIBER OPTIC TRUNK 
CABLE LEGISLATIVE HEARING ROOM 
1510 - 492' LENGTH

482 FT

27 PANDUIT, MPO FIBER OPTIC TRUNK 
CABLE LEGISLATIVE HEARING ROOM 
1524 - 214' LENGTH

214 FT

28 PANDUIT, MPO FIBER OPTIC TRUNK 
CABLE LEGISLATIVE HEARING ROOM 
1525 - 218' LENGTH

218 FT

29 PANDUIT, MPO FIBER OPTIC TRUNK 
CABLE LEGISLATIVE HEARING ROOM 
2102 - 314' LENGTH

314 FT

30 PANDUIT, MPO FIBER OPTIC TRUNK 
CABLE NORRIS (WEST) CLOAK ROOM - 
190' LENGTH

190 FT

31 PANDUIT, MPO FIBER OPTIC TRUNK 
CABLE NORRIS (WEST) CHAMBER -
350' LENGTH

350 FT

32 PANDUIT, MPO FIBER OPTIC TRUNK 
CABLE GOVERNOR'S PRESS ROOM - 
582' LENGTH

582 FT

33 PANDUIT, MPO FIBER OPTIC TRUNK 
CABLE SUPREME COURT COURTROOM - 
600' LENGTH

600 FT

34 PANDUIT, MPO FIBER OPTIC TRUNK 
CABLE COURT OF APPEALS 
COURTROOM - 600' LENGTH

600 FT

35 PANDUIT, MPO FIBER OPTIC TRUNK 
CABLE CLERK OF COURTS OFFICE RACK 
- 492' LENGTH

492 FT

36 PANDUIT, 12F DUP LC SM MPO SFQ 
CASSETTE FIBER COUNT: 12 FRONT 
CONNECTOR TYPE: LC UPC REAR 
CONNECTOR TYPE: 12 FIBER MTP/APC STD. 
MALE (PINS) NUMBER OF CONNECTIONS: 
REAR: 1 FIBER MODE: 9/125 SINGLEMODE 
CASSETTE BOX TYPE: SFQ PART #FQ9N-12-
10AS

26 EA

37 PANDUIT, 24PORT PATCH PANEL FOR 
PRE-TERMINATED AD PART #QPP24BL

19 EA

38 PANDUIT, SFQ CASSETTE ZERO RU 
BRACKET PART #FQCBRUA

4 EA

Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

Graybar ElectricF&E Trading LLC

 N/A  $              2.31  $       1,113.42 

 N/A  $              3.69  $          789.66 

 N/A  $              3.64  $          793.52 

 N/A  $              2.89  $          907.46 

 N/A  $              3.99  $          758.10 

 N/A  $              2.72  $          952.00 

 N/A  $              2.12  $       1,233.84 

 N/A  $              2.09  $       1,254.00 

 N/A  $              2.09  $       1,254.00 

 N/A  $              2.28  $       1,121.76 

 N/A  $          336.18  $       8,740.68 

 N/A  $            26.04  $          494.76 

 N/A  $            27.34  $          109.36 
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39 PANDUIT, 2M LC UPC TO LC UPC DUPLEX 
2.0MM 9/125 SINGLE MODE FIBER PATCH 
CABLE PART #NKFP92ERLLSM-02

24 EA

40 PANDUIT, 10M LC UPC TO LC UPC 
DUPLEX 2.0MM 9/125 SINGLE MODE 
FIBER PATCH CABLE PART 
#NKFP92ERLLSM-10

24 EA

41 PANDUIT, 2M LC UPC TO LC UPC DUPLEX 
2.0MM 9/125 SINGLE MODE FIBER PATCH 
CABLE PART #NKFP92ERLSSM-02

12 EA

42 PANDUIT, 10M LC UPC TO LC UPC 
DUPLEX 2.0MM 9/125 SINGLE MODE 
FIBER PATCH CABLE PART 
#NKFP92ERLSSM-10

12 EA

43 BELDEN, RG59, HD/SDI VIDEO
COAX ORANGE, RISER PER 1000' 
PART #1505A-ORANGE

5 EA

44 ADC-COMMSCOPE, BNC PLUG (MALE) 
CONNECTOR PART #BNC-1-N

500 EA

45 AMPHENOL, HD BNC TOOL FOR 
INSTALLATION / REMOVAL PART #227-
T2000

3 EA

46 AMPHENOL, HD BNC TO BNC ADAPTER, 
BELDEN 1855A CABLE 12"  PART #095-
666-44883-2

150 EA

47 MIDDLE ATLANTIC, VENTILATED RACK 
SHELF, 10" DEPTH PART #UTR1

36 EA

48 HOSA TECHNOLOGY, XLR FEMALE TO 
MALE 1/4" TRS INTERCONNECT CABLE 
PART #24 HXS-001.5

28 EA

49 HOSA TECHNOLOGY, 3-PIN XLR MALE TO 
XLR FEMALE BALANCED INTERCONNECT 
PART #XLR-0105 
#XLR-105*

28 EA

50 SERIALCOMM, INDUSTRIAL
EXTERNALLY POWERED ISOLATED 
RS232 TO 2-WIRE RS485/RS422 
CONVERTER PART #CON-485/422-EE9

22 EA

51 ARDUINO, MEGA2560 R3 COMPATIBLE 
MICRO CONTROLLER PART #MEGA2560

10 EA

Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

Graybar ElectricF&E Trading LLC

 N/A  $            13.65  $          327.60 

 N/A  $            19.78  $          474.72 

 N/A  $            12.47  $          149.64 

 N/A  $            16.68  $          200.16 

 N/A  $          470.58  $       2,352.90 

 N/A  $              1.73  $          865.00 

 N/A  N/A 

 N/A  $            18.99  $       2,848.50 

 N/A  $            23.22  $          835.92 

 N/A  $              4.36  $          122.08 

 N/A  $              4.65  $          130.20 

 N/A  $            38.31  $          842.82 

 N/A  N/A 
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52

53 TRIPP LITE, 8 OUTLET SURGE 
PROTECTOR POWER STRIP, 8FT 
CORD RIGHT ANGLE PLUG, BLACK
PART #TLP808B

24 EA

Line 52 removed by Addenum Three

Total

Comments

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms

Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

Graybar ElectricF&E Trading LLC

 N/A  $            20.27  $          486.48 

 $     31,995.00  $     35,809.34 

 *Revised by Addendum Two 

     

Terms and Conditions not 
completed. 

1 - 15
45

II.B. 
Josh Hankins
Graybar Electric
3300 North 35th Street
Lincoln, NE 68504

Exception: IV. E. Delivery ARO
No 45 days. The lead time for 
Panduit materials is 4-6 weeks


	Sheet1

