Buyer: Julie Dabydeen

5916 OF

Department of Correctional Services

Opening Date: 09/14/2018

Line #

Upholstery Fabric

CF Stinson, LLC

Mayer Fabrics

Momentum Textiles, LLC

Description

Qty

UoM

Unit Price

Extended Price

Unit Price

Extended Price

Unit Price | Extended Price

PANEL FABRIC

Mayer Fabrics

EQUAL

EQ401 Blue Neutral, EQ175
Crystal Blue, EQ539 Bleu Papier,
EQ468 Eucalyptus, EQ400
Cherry Neutral, EQ758 Desert
Sand, EQ130 Wheat, EQ538
Silver Papier, EQ150
Wedgewood, EQ153 Bailtic,
EQ402 Green Neutral, EQ405
Lavender Neutral, EQ404 Apricot
Neutral, EQ380 Quartz, EQ238
Grey Mix

50

YD

$11.94
Bidding Alt
"Aperture"”

$597.00

$

14.45

$ 722.50

COPA

143-014 Balboa, 143-004 Huron,
143-003 Padre, 143-009 Bruce
Canyon, 143-002 Newport, 143-
007 Hermosa, 143-006
Heartland, 143-005 Rusmore,
143-033 Green Bay, 143-023
Huntington, 143-017 Smith Point,
143-026 Cape May

50

YD

$11.95
Bidding Alt
"Intermix"

$597.50

$

14.45

$ 722.50

CF Stinson

AXIS TOO

AXT13 Slate, AXT14 Patina,
AXT15 Cypress, AXT 16 Meadow,
AXT12 Sand, AXT17 Copper,
AXT22 Bisque, AXT27 Quarry,
AXT23 Curry, AXT18 Cobalt,
AXT19 Mediterranean, AXT10
Crystal, AXT24 Shale, AXT20
Thistle, AXT25 Oxygen, AXT21
Stone, AXT26 Melba, AXT11
Saffron

50

YD

$14.45
Axis Too

$722.50

GENESIS
Full cotor line, GS _ _ _ color
name

100

YD

$11.94
Genesis

$1,194.00

MIRA

MIR8779 Turtle, MIR8815 Spring,
MIR8806 Limelight, MIR4628
Cashew, MIR7499 Honey,
MIR4635 Fawn, MIR4629 Dune,
MIR6858 Cocoa, MIR7619
Cinnamon, MIR5145 Garnet,
MIR8127 Lagoon, MIR2590
Dusk, MIRB729 Seamist,
MIR4631 Bone, MIR4637
Papyrus, MIR1454 Birch,
MIR1366 Shadow, MIR2766
Harbor, MIR5750 Lavender,
MIR5731 Violet

50

YD

$9.75
Bidding Alt
“Prime"

$487.50

DELMAR

DM610 Peacock, DM608 Leaf,
DM603 Mercury, DM601 Linen,
DM604 Desert, DM613 Harvest,
DMé611 Cashmere, DM607 Shale,
DM612 Iris, DM600 Whisper Blue

50

YD

$15.95
Del Mar

$797.50

Page 10of 5



Buyer: Julie Dabydeen 5916 OF Opening Date: 09/14/2018
Department of Correctional Services

Upholstery Fabric CF Stinson, LLC Mayer Fabrics Momentum Textiles, LLC
*
[]
£
- Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
M tum
MEANDER $14.50
7 |Sandshell. Overcast, Agate 100 | YD | Bidding Alt $1.450 $ -1$ 1155| % 1,155.00
Taupe, Nightshadow "Tussah"
UNIVERSE
Créme Brules, Whitecap, Wheat, |, | ) 3'23'4 Ain $1,445 $ $ 1155| $ 1,155.00
g Seneca, Milkyway, Mica, Cosmic, L :'S ing A ! i " e
Depth pree
| |SEATING FABRIC
Mayer Fabrics
FORTE
M298-000 Fudge, M298-001
Rouge, M298-002 Daffodil, M298-
003 Chive, M298-004 Cadet, M98
005 Crocus, M298-006 Tuxedo,
M298-007 Sable, M298-009 $11.75
Pimento, M289-011 Port, M298- oo
9 1013 Avocado, M298-014 Blue 100 | YD | Bidding Alt $1,175 $ 895(% 895.00 $ -

Ray, M298-016 Slate, M298-017 "Sprint”
Pumice, M298-019 Squash,
M298-023 Aspen, M298-024
Neptune, M298-026 Flint, M298-
033 Fairway, M298-034 Cosmo

CROSS CHECK

M299-021 Red Baron, M299-010
Earth, M299-019 Demerera,
M299-033 Evergreen, M299-054
Marine, M298-064 Martinique,
M298-000 Otter, M299-001
Cranberry, M299-003 Lime, M299
004 Midnight, M299-005 Wisteria,

M299-006 Slate Black, M299-007 $16.75
10 | Saddle Tan, M299-009 Paradise, | 100 | YD | Bidding Alt $1,675 $ 1095| % 1,085.00 $ =
M299-011 Vermillion, M299-013 "Refraction”

Malachite, M299-014 Imperial,
M299-016 Basalt, M299-017
Maple, M299-023 Aquamarine,
M299-024 Blue Ribbon, M299-
026 Platinum, M299-034
Concord, M299-036 Dove, M299-
044 Lapis

MOONSCAPE

333-014 Cobalt, 333-000 Bark,
333-003 Cilantro, 333-009 $13.98
11 [Cinnamon, 333-016 Pewter, 3331 300 | YD | Bidding Alt $4,194 $ 1845| $ 5,535.00 $ -
013 Mallard, 333-001 Flame, 333- “Shift"
006 Ebony, 333-004 Indigo, 333-
011 Ruby.
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Buyer: Julie Dabydeen

5916 OF

Department of Correctional Services

Opening Date: 09/14/2018

Line #

Upholstery Fabric

CF Stinson, LLC

Mayer Fabrics

Momentum Textiles, LLC

Description

Qty

uom

Unit Price

Extended Price

Unit Price

Extended Price

Unit Price

Extended Price

1

N

FOUNDATION

M350-026 Graphite, M350-000
Chocolate, M350-001 Wine,
M350-002 Cornsilk, M350-003
Sherwood, M350-004 Sapphire,
M350-005 Concord, M350-006
Ebony, M350-007 Sandstone,
M350-008 Merlot, M350-009
Cayenne, M350-010 Taupe,
M350-011 Flame, M350-012
Sunflower, M350-013 Hunter,
M350-014 Navy, M350-015 Deep

Purple, M350-016 Mercury, M350~

014 Jodhpurs, M350-018
Magenta, M350-019 Terra Cotta,
M350-023 Apple Green, M350-
024 Blue Mist, M350-028 Purple
Haze, M350-029 Cinnabar, M350-
033 Cactus, M350-034 Parade
Blue, M350-043 Peacock, M350-
044 Capri, M350-053 Aegean,
M3519 Olive Green, M3523 Kelly,
M3523 Magenta, M3502 Mango,
M3504 Lilac, M3508 Seafoam

200

YD

$16.60
Bidding Alt
"Ace”

$3,320

$ 1445

$ 2,890,00

CESH

1

w

BRYANT PARK

6554 Dusk, 6555 Pumice, 6560
Gunmetal, 6551 Marigold, 6556
Curry, 6561 Crocodile, 6552
Medoc, 6557 Raspberry, 6562
Violet, 6553 Nile, 6558 Saxon
Blue, 6563 Night Shadow, 6559
Hemlock, 6564 Chocolate

50

YD

$13.95
Bryant Park

$697.50

Momentum Group

14

EXPO

Festive, Fog, Latte, Leaf, Lemon,
Qasis, Raspberry, Sky, Spirit,
Sprout, Tuxedo, Viola, Zest

300

YD

$14.75
Bidding Alt
"Highlight"

$4,425

$ 1045

$ 3,135.00

15

ORIGIN

Amethyst, Annatto, Arundel,
Avalon, Basalt, Bayou, Bottle,
Caraway, Eco, Eureka, Euro,
Fez, Gala, Garnelt, Indigo, Iron

1000

YD

$14.21
Bidding Alt
“Blip"

$14,210

$ 9,700.00

16

PERK

Auburn, Cabana, Cedar,
Crimson, Dijon, Ebony, Flint,
Patriot, Pewter, Regal, Sesame,
Walnut

1000

YD

$18.43
Bidding Alt

"Inside

Track"

$18,430

$ 10.00

$ 10,000.00

ARC.COM

17

MOON BEAM 2
Mist

200

YD

No Bid

18

POLO
Flame

50

YD

No Bid

1

©

POLO
Periwinkle

50

YD

No Bid

VINYL FABRIC 100%

Momentum

20

ALL SEASON

1000

YD

$13.85
Bidding Alt
“Core"

$13,850

$ 16.95

$ 16,950.00

Not a
Momentum
Product
No Bid

ARC.COM

21

ALL SEASON

1000

YD

$14.25
Bidding Alt
"Rally"

$14,250

$ 16.95

$ 16,950.00

Total

$ 83,517.50

$ 45,760.00

$ 25,145.00

Payment Terms

0-Net 30

0-30

Delivery Days ARQC

210

7
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Buyer: Julie Dabydeen

5916 OF

Department of Correctional Services

Opening Date: 09/14/2018

Upholstery Fabric

CF Stinson, LLC

Mayer Fabrics

Momentum Textiles, LLC

Line #

Description Qty |UOM

Unit Price Extended Price

Unit Price | Extended Price

Unit Price | Extended Price

All Other Panel Fabric Lines Available From
Catalog - State Percentage of Discount

Sold by Cut Yard; FOB Destination, No Shipping
Charges Aliowed

0 Percent Discount
Vertical Surface MFG List” July 1, 2018

15% Percent Discount

20% Percent Discount

All Other Seating Fabric Lines Available - State
Percentage of Discount

10% Percent Discount
Performance Fabric July 1, 2018

15% Percent Discount

20% Percent Discount*

All Other Healthcare Fabric Lines - State
Percentage of Discount

10% Percent Discount
Performance Fabric July 1, 2018 Vinyl
+ Non PVC

15% Percent Discount

20% Percent Discount*

All Other Vinyl - State Percentage of Discount

0 Percent Discount
MFG List" July 1, 2018

15% Percent Discount

20% Percent Discount*
Momentum Texliles, LLC is PVC [ree
for coated fabrics

Customized fabric card for stock and/or non-stock
standard fabrics, up to six (6) fabrics with various
colors per one vendor; two-page card, imprinted
with CSl logo, and design approved by CSlI prior to
production.

Pricing per 100 Cards

$4.80/Card or $2.40/Face*

$5.00

$3.50 each Nole: minimum order for
custom cards is 1,500 cards. Sample
Maker is oulside vendor

Customized fabric card for stock and/or non-stock
standard fabrics, up to six (6) fabrics with various
colors per one vendor; one -page card, imprinted
with CSl logo, and design approved by CSlI prior to
production.

Pricing per 100 Cards

$2.40/card or $2.40/Face*

$3,50

$1.75 each Note: minimum order for
cuslom cards is 1,500 cards. Sample
maker is oulside vendor

Is bidder capable of producing such a customized
card with fabrics from multiple vendors?
If "Yes," Pricing per 100 cards

Yes, $4.80/card $2.40/Face- Min
order for cuslom cards including
multiple vendars is 1000 cards

Yes, $5.00

No
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Buyer: Julie Dabydeen

5916 OF

Department of Correctional Services

Opening Date: 09/14/2018

Upholstery Fabric CF Stinson, LLC Mayer Fabrics Momentum Textiles, LLC
= Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
Notes: “**Itis really not feasible to do V1. INVITATION TO BID -
1) Sprint, Refraclions, Shift, Ace only 100 Custom Cards because it| TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS
Bryant Park, Pivot, Highlight, Blip, |is so Expensive. Not saying that  |E. Technical Specification: Fabric
Inside Track, (All on Color Story we can'tdo it. It is just much more |Cards and Marketing Materiels
Card) affordable to do 1000 or 1500 1. Minimum order for custom
2) Tussah and Spree are on the E3 |cards.*™™* sample cards is 1,500. Sample
series card ***|t is also nol a good idea to put |maker is outside vendor to
Multiple Vendors on the same Momentum Textiles, LLC.
*Manufaclurers Verlical Surface card, because if one vendor 2. The card names listed are not
and Manufacturers Vinyl + Non discontinues one item, then the Momentum Textiles, LLC sample
PVC Price Lists included in bid Card is no longer goad. Not cards. Momentum Textiles, LLC
reflect Discounted Pricing. saying that we can'ldo it, but | can provide 100-2 panel Panel
*Min order for card of this type is would advise against it.*** Fabric cards product number
750 cards. ***Please let me know if you have |08999640 enclosed. Panel fabric
any further questions.*** patterns Meander and Universe
are sampled on this card.
Comments 3. Momentum Textiles, LLC does

not have 300 fabric cards of Expo,
Origin, and Perk Available. We can
provide 300 Access 2 panel cards
— 08999629 at no charge. Origin is
sample on this card. This would
offer CS| discounted pricing on
additional seating fabrics.Should
CSl choose to make their own
sample cards. Momentum Texliles
can provide the sample yardage at
no charge.

*= Excludes Silica famitiy of
products which will be priced at Nel
Price

Additional Note: Should CSI
choose to make its own sample
cards, Momentum Texliles, LLC
can provide the sample yardage to
make 100 cards at no charge.

Percent Discount only applies to
Momentum Textiles product
offerings.
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