

**DETAILED
HIGHWAY DEICING SALT BID TAB**

ALL VENDORS		Est. ann. rqmt	Avg % peak orders	Avg % off-peak orders	Black Strap Inc		Black Strap Inc		Central Salt, LLC		GMCO Corporation		GMCO Corporation		GMCO Corporation		Independent Salt Company		Morton Salt		Nebraska Salt & Grain Co.				
Superintendent Area	Yard				Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	
					Ice B Gone Magic Salt	Hwy Grade Deicing Salt	Bulk Deicing Salt	Kansas Rock Salt	Rocanville Standard	Rapid Thaw	NO BID	NO BID	Sodium Chloride	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			
					Explanation: Rejected Bid	Kansas Medium Rock Salt	Deicing Salt																		
					Peak price per ton (1 Nov - 28 Feb)	Off-peak price per ton (1 Mar - 31 Oct)	Peak price per ton (1 Nov - 28 Feb)	Off-peak price per ton (1 Mar - 31 Oct)	Peak price per ton (1 Nov - 28 Feb)	Off-peak price per ton (1 Mar - 31 Oct)	Peak price per ton (1 Nov - 28 Feb)	Off-peak price per ton (1 Mar - 31 Oct)	Peak price per ton (1 Nov - 28 Feb)	Off-peak price per ton (1 Mar - 31 Oct)	Peak price per ton (1 Nov - 28 Feb)	Off-peak price per ton (1 Mar - 31 Oct)	Peak price per ton (1 Nov - 28 Feb)	Off-peak price per ton (1 Mar - 31 Oct)	Peak price per ton (1 Nov - 28 Feb)	Off-peak price per ton (1 Mar - 31 Oct)	Peak price per ton (1 Nov - 28 Feb)	Off-peak price per ton (1 Mar - 31 Oct)			
	David City	1,950	25%	75%			\$68.26	\$54.67	\$50.82	\$42.35												\$66.50	\$62.50		
	Greenwood	2,500	9%	91%			\$58.48	\$54.93	\$52.70	\$44.27													\$66.00	\$62.00	
	Lincoln - Superior	1,575	21%	79%			\$58.67	\$55.10	\$50.82	\$43.15														\$64.00	\$60.00
	Seward	1,500	41%	59%			\$55.64	\$52.42	\$50.82	\$42.44														\$64.00	\$60.00
	Wahoo	2,225	37%	63%			\$59.44	\$55.80	\$53.25	\$44.01														\$68.00	\$64.00
	Total	9,750	25%	75%	INVALID	INVALID	\$547,080.58	\$444,124.26	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	\$613,701.00		
	Beatrice	1,200	10%	90%			\$55.19	\$50.48	\$50.12	\$41.09													\$61.00	\$57.00	
	Blue Springs	975	0%	100%			\$53.23	\$50.30	\$50.12	\$41.09														\$61.50	\$57.50
	Dorchester	1,475	32%	68%			\$54.96	\$51.87	\$50.29	\$41.43														\$64.50	\$60.50
	Fairbury	1,400	26%	74%			\$51.12	\$48.40	\$49.67	\$41.09														\$60.50	\$56.50
	Lincoln - Salt Valley	1,175	14%	86%			\$57.65	\$54.29	\$50.12	\$42.31														\$64.00	\$60.00
	Pawnee City	1,475	15%	85%			\$53.23	\$51.60	\$50.88	\$42.31														\$66.00	\$62.00
Wilber	500	9%	91%			\$54.38	\$51.35	\$50.32	\$41.09														\$63.00	\$59.00	
Total	8,200	17%	83%	INVALID	INVALID	\$423,525.97	\$352,657.35	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	\$489,797.00			
	Auburn	1,850	13%	87%			\$59.71	\$56.24	\$52.47	\$45.88													\$67.90	\$63.90	
	Eagle	500	0%	100%			\$60.00	\$56.50	\$52.47	\$45.88														\$66.00	\$62.00
	Falls City	775	48%	52%			\$58.56	\$55.20	\$52.47	\$45.88														\$67.80	\$63.80
	Nebraska City	1,475	34%	66%			\$61.54	\$57.88	\$53.52	\$45.88														\$67.00	\$63.00
	Palmyra	1,100	6%	94%			\$59.04	\$55.63	\$52.35	\$45.11														\$66.70	\$62.70
	Syracuse	875	10%	90%			\$59.23	\$55.81	\$52.47	\$45.11														\$65.00	\$61.00
Tecumseh	1,225	62%	38%			\$57.31	\$54.08	\$52.47	\$45.11														\$66.80	\$62.80	
Total	7,800	26%	74%	INVALID	INVALID	\$443,619.19	\$369,979.60	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	\$498,968.00			
	Omaha - Dome	5,450	1%	99%			\$64.04	\$60.13	\$52.67	\$46.99													\$50.45	\$49.45	
	Omaha - Mormon Bridge	2,025	84%	16%			\$70.40	\$61.26	\$54.67	\$46.99														\$50.45	\$49.45
	Omaha - South	2,400	85%	15%			\$68.38	\$59.96	\$54.67	\$46.99														\$50.45	\$49.45
Total	9,875	38%	62%	INVALID	INVALID	\$628,601.04	\$493,066.69	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	\$492,114.25			
	Blair	1,725	24%	76%			\$64.77	\$60.69															\$55.50	\$54.50	
	Fremont	3,300	23%	77%			\$61.37	\$58.53																\$54.50	\$53.50
Total	5,025	23%	77%	INVALID	INVALID	\$301,683.93	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	\$271,735.50			
	Elkhorn	3,275	28%	72%			\$62.56	\$58.70															\$64.00	\$60.00	
	Manley	200	60%	40%			\$61.60	\$57.84															\$62.00	\$58.00	
	Melia Hill	2,300	39%	61%			\$61.40	\$57.66															\$63.00	\$59.00	
	Plattsmouth	1,275	0%	100%			\$63.04	\$59.13															\$64.00	\$60.00	
Total	7,050	27%	73%	INVALID	INVALID	\$419,164.85	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	\$428,036.00			
	Albion	925	72%	28%			\$54.54	\$51.88															\$71.40	\$66.40	
	Clarkson	650	80%	20%			\$56.07	\$53.27															\$71.10	\$66.10	
	Columbus	825	60%	40%			\$52.90	\$50.41															\$69.20	\$64.20	
	Humphrey	1,250	64%	36%			\$55.02	\$52.32															\$70.20	\$65.20	
	Schuyler	1,200	67%	33%			\$54.54	\$51.88															\$69.20	\$64.20	
Total	4,850	68%	32%	INVALID	INVALID	\$260,617.50	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	\$332,315.00			

**DETAILED
HIGHWAY DEICING SALT BID TAB**

ALL VENDORS		Est. ann. rqmt	Avg % peak orders	Avg % off-peak orders	Black Strap Inc		Black Strap Inc		Central Salt, LLC		GMCO Corporation		GMCO Corporation		GMCO Corporation		Independent Salt Company		Morton Salt		Nebraska Salt & Grain Co.			
Superintendent Area	Yard				Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):	Product(s):
		Ice B Gone Magic Salt	Hwy Grade Deicing Salt	Bulk Deicing Salt	Kansas Rock Salt	Rocanville Standard	Rapid Thaw	NO BID	NO BID	Sodium Chloride	Peak price per ton		Off-peak price per ton		Peak price per ton		Off-peak price per ton		Peak price per ton		Off-peak price per ton			
		Explanation: Rejected Bid	Kansas Medium Rock Salt		Deicing Salt							(1 Nov - 28 Feb)	(1 Mar - 31 Oct)	(1 Nov - 28 Feb)	(1 Mar - 31 Oct)	(1 Nov - 28 Feb)	(1 Mar - 31 Oct)	(1 Nov - 28 Feb)	(1 Mar - 31 Oct)	(1 Nov - 28 Feb)	(1 Mar - 31 Oct)	(1 Nov - 28 Feb)	(1 Mar - 31 Oct)	
		Peak price per ton	Off-peak price per ton	Peak price per ton	Off-peak price per ton	Peak price per ton	Off-peak price per ton	Peak price per ton	Off-peak price per ton	Peak price per ton	Off-peak price per ton	Peak price per ton	Off-peak price per ton	Peak price per ton	Off-peak price per ton	Peak price per ton	Off-peak price per ton	Peak price per ton	Off-peak price per ton	Peak price per ton	Off-peak price per ton	Peak price per ton	Off-peak price per ton	
		(1 Nov - 28 Feb)	(1 Mar - 31 Oct)	(1 Nov - 28 Feb)	(1 Mar - 31 Oct)	(1 Nov - 28 Feb)	(1 Mar - 31 Oct)	(1 Nov - 28 Feb)	(1 Mar - 31 Oct)	(1 Nov - 28 Feb)	(1 Mar - 31 Oct)	(1 Nov - 28 Feb)	(1 Mar - 31 Oct)	(1 Nov - 28 Feb)	(1 Mar - 31 Oct)	(1 Nov - 28 Feb)	(1 Mar - 31 Oct)	(1 Nov - 28 Feb)	(1 Mar - 31 Oct)	(1 Nov - 28 Feb)	(1 Mar - 31 Oct)	(1 Nov - 28 Feb)	(1 Mar - 31 Oct)	
	Bloomfield	850	14%	86%			\$67.04	\$62.63														\$75.60	\$70.60	
	Neligh	1,350	22%	78%			\$62.81	\$58.83															\$73.90	\$68.90
	Niobrara	1,200	38%	62%			\$66.85	\$62.46															\$76.30	\$71.30
	Plainview	1,100	25%	75%			\$63.87	\$59.78															\$75.50	\$70.50
			4,500	25%	75%			\$278,199.44															\$321,870.00	
	Norfolk	2,300	15%	85%			\$62.13	\$59.22	\$59.77	\$52.66													\$72.20	\$67.20
	West Point	1,050	64%	36%			\$63.87	\$60.78	\$61.25	\$54.74													\$70.60	\$65.60
			3,350	30%	70%			\$203,105.43		\$185,422.67													\$228,525.00	
	Dakota City	600	89%	11%			\$77.94	\$65.11															\$75.60	\$70.60
	Lyons	1,375	82%	18%			\$66.21	\$61.99															\$70.30	\$65.30
	S Sioux City	675	90%	10%			\$69.96	\$65.37															\$75.60	\$70.60
		2,650	86%	14%			\$182,824.70																\$191,147.50	
	Crofton	425	58%	42%			\$68.32	\$63.89															\$76.10	\$71.10
	Hartington	1,225	50%	50%			\$67.75	\$63.38															\$75.50	\$70.50
	Laurel	950	71%	29%			\$67.17	\$62.86															\$75.30	\$70.30
	Newcastle	600	46%	54%			\$70.25	\$65.63															\$76.40	\$71.40
	Wayne	1,400	38%	62%			\$65.83	\$61.64															\$74.90	\$69.90
		4,600	51%	49%			\$300,364.67																\$335,772.50	
	Central City	500	42%	58%			\$51.56	\$49.20			\$176.00	\$172.00	\$172.00	\$168.00									\$68.20	\$63.20
	Fullerton	350	78%	22%			\$53.10	\$50.59			\$176.00	\$172.00	\$172.00	\$168.00									\$69.10	\$64.10
	Greeley	350	65%	35%			\$56.85	\$53.96			\$176.00	\$172.00	\$172.00	\$168.00									\$70.20	\$65.20
	Loup City	200	79%	21%			\$53.96	\$51.37			\$176.00	\$172.00	\$172.00	\$168.00									\$70.20	\$65.20
	Ord	650	34%	66%			\$56.46	\$53.62			\$176.00	\$172.00	\$172.00	\$168.00									\$70.90	\$65.90
	St Paul	725	30%	70%			\$53.58	\$51.02			\$176.00	\$172.00	\$172.00	\$168.00									\$69.00	\$64.00
		2,775	47%	53%			\$146,740.97				\$482,528.00		\$471,428.00										\$185,665.00	
	Geneva	250	55%	45%			\$45.50	\$43.75	\$51.35	\$43.99	\$178.00	\$174.00	\$175.00	\$171.00									\$48.90	\$46.90
	Hebron	450	84%	16%			\$49.13	\$41.59	\$49.63	\$43.45	\$178.00	\$174.00	\$175.00	\$171.00									\$47.55	\$45.55
	Osceola	475	79%	21%			\$50.21	\$47.99	\$51.50	\$45.53	\$178.00	\$174.00	\$175.00	\$171.00									\$54.60	\$52.60
	Strang	1,800	38%	62%			\$44.73	\$43.06	\$49.88	\$43.99	\$178.00	\$174.00	\$175.00	\$171.00									\$48.30	\$46.30
	York	1,425	40%	60%			\$47.81	\$45.83	\$51.35	\$44.79	\$178.00	\$174.00	\$175.00	\$171.00									\$51.90	\$49.90
		4,400	49%	51%			\$201,458.68		\$208,540.74		\$774,179.00		\$760,979.00										\$215,944.50	
	Grand Island	2,000	53%	47%			\$50.36	\$49.20			\$169.00	\$165.00	\$165.00	\$161.00									\$63.00	\$60.00
	Kearney (I-80)	750	58%	42%			\$50.40	\$48.16			\$169.00	\$165.00	\$165.00	\$161.00									\$64.50	\$61.50
	Kearney (Hwy-30)	975	61%	39%			\$50.40	\$48.16			\$169.00	\$165.00	\$165.00	\$161.00									\$64.50	\$61.50
	Ravenna	475	49%	51%			\$52.04	\$49.63			\$169.00	\$165.00	\$165.00	\$161.00									\$65.00	\$62.00
	Shelton	400	34%	66%			\$52.23	\$49.81			\$169.00	\$165.00	\$165.00	\$161.00									\$64.00	\$61.00
		4,600	53%	47%			\$229,400.54				\$768,834.00		\$750,434.00										\$287,313.00	
	Aurora	1,075	70%	30%			\$49.35	\$47.21	\$51.05	\$43.88	\$176.00	\$172.00	\$172.00	\$168.00									\$51.75	\$50.75
	Ayr	475	82%	18%			\$47.42	\$45.48	\$51.47	\$44.43	\$176.00	\$172.00	\$172.00	\$168.00									\$50.00	\$49.00

**DETAILED
HIGHWAY DEICING SALT BID TAB**

ALL VENDORS		Est. ann. rqmt	Avg % peak orders	Avg % off-peak orders	Black Strap Inc		Black Strap Inc		Central Salt, LLC		GMCO Corporation		GMCO Corporation		GMCO Corporation		Independent Salt Company		Morton Salt		Nebraska Salt & Grain Co.		
Superintendent Area	Yard				Product(s): Ice B Gone Magic Salt Explanation: Rejected Bid	Product(s): Hwy Grade Deicing Salt Kansas Medium Rock Salt Deicing Salt	Product(s): Bulk Deicing Salt	Product(s): Kansas Rock Salt	Product(s): Rocanville Standard	Product(s): Rapid Thaw	Product(s): NO BID	Product(s): NO BID	Product(s): Sodium Chloride Bulk Rock Salt Bulk Deicing Salt	Peak price per ton (1 Nov - 28 Feb)	Off-peak price per ton (1 Mar - 31 Oct)	Peak price per ton (1 Nov - 28 Feb)	Off-peak price per ton (1 Mar - 31 Oct)	Peak price per ton (1 Nov - 28 Feb)	Off-peak price per ton (1 Mar - 31 Oct)	Peak price per ton (1 Nov - 28 Feb)	Off-peak price per ton (1 Mar - 31 Oct)	Peak price per ton (1 Nov - 28 Feb)	Off-peak price per ton (1 Mar - 31 Oct)
		750	81%	19%																			
	Harvard	750	81%	19%																			
	Hastings	1,525	60%	40%																			
	Red Cloud	375	82%	18%																			
	Superior	400	81%	19%																			
		4,600	72%	28%	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID
510	Alliance	500	44%	56%																			
	Chadron	525	62%	38%																			
	Crawford	350	77%	23%																			
	Gordon	425	15%	85%																			
	Harrison	300	44%	56%																			
	Hemmingford	800	54%	46%																			
		2,900	50%	50%	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID
520	Bridgeport	750	79%	21%																			
	Gering	975	67%	33%																			
	Oshkosh	225	80%	20%																			
		1,950	73%	27%	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID
530	Chappell	950	37%	63%																			
	Harrisburg	900	100%	0%																			
	Kimball	1,325	73%	27%																			
	Sidney	1,800	43%	57%																			
		4,975	60%	40%	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID
610	Gothenburg	500	10%	90%																			
	Lexington	1,725	73%	27%																			
		2,225	59%	41%	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID
620	Maxwell	950	31%	69%																			
	North Platte (I-80)	1,125	76%	24%																			
	North Platte (W-30)	2,100	65%	35%																			
	Sutherland	1,275	68%	32%																			
	Wallace	1,400	70%	30%																			
		6,850	64%	36%	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID
630	Big Springs	1,525	44%	56%																			
	Ogallala	1,575	67%	33%																			
	Paxton	400	56%	44%																			
		3,500	56%	44%	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID
640	Ansley	475	82%	18%																			
	Arnold	50	64%	36%																			
	Broken Bow	2,025	88%	12%																			
	Oconto	1,425	43%	57%																			
		3,975	71%	29%	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID

**DETAILED
HIGHWAY DEICING SALT BID TAB**

ALL VENDORS		Est. ann. rqmt	Avg % peak orders	Avg % off-peak orders	Black Strap Inc		Black Strap Inc		Central Salt, LLC		GMCO Corporation		GMCO Corporation		GMCO Corporation		Independent Salt Company		Morton Salt		Nebraska Salt & Grain Co.		
Superintendent Area	Yard				Product(s): Ice B Gone Magic Salt Explanation: Rejected Bid	Product(s): Hwy Grade Deicing Salt Kansas Medium Rock Salt Deicing Salt	Product(s): Bulk Deicing Salt	Product(s): Kansas Rock Salt	Product(s): Rocanville Standard	Product(s): Rapid Thaw	Product(s): NO BID	Product(s): NO BID	Product(s): Sodium Chloride Bulk Rock Salt Bulk Deicing Salt	Peak price per ton (1 Nov - 28 Feb)	Off-peak price per ton (1 Mar - 31 Oct)	Peak price per ton (1 Nov - 28 Feb)	Off-peak price per ton (1 Mar - 31 Oct)	Peak price per ton (1 Nov - 28 Feb)	Off-peak price per ton (1 Mar - 31 Oct)	Peak price per ton (1 Nov - 28 Feb)	Off-peak price per ton (1 Mar - 31 Oct)	Peak price per ton (1 Nov - 28 Feb)	Off-peak price per ton (1 Mar - 31 Oct)
	650	Arthur	400	75%	25%																		
		Hyannis	615	77%	23%																		
		Mullen	425	80%	20%																		
		Stapleton	600	75%	25%																		
		Thedford	50	67%	33%																		
		2,090		76%	24%	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID
	710	Alma	250	80%	20%																		
		Franklin	75	73%	27%																		
		Holdrege	325	50%	50%																		
		Minden	350	67%	33%																		
		Arapahoe	350	74%	26%																		
		Elwood	275	77%	23%																		
	1,625		69%	31%	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	
	720	Maywood	250	84%	16%																		
		McCook	500	49%	51%																		
		Benkelman	350	93%	7%																		
		Grant	50	100%	0%																		
		Imperial	1,000	60%	40%																		
		Palisade	625	55%	45%																		
	2,775		64%	36%	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	
	810	Ainsworth	1,000	72%	28%																		
		Bassett	25	50%	50%																		
		Springview	325	64%	36%																		
	1,350		70%	30%	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	
	820	Atkinson	400	72%	28%																		
		Bartlett	325	58%	42%																		
		Burwell	400	63%	37%																		
		Naper	300	57%	43%																		
		O'Neill	700	65%	35%																		
		Spencer	300	76%	24%																		
	Taylor	275	16%	84%																			
	2,700		60%	40%	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	
	830	Cody	75	41%	59%																		
		Merriman	500	71%	29%																		
		Valentine	650	74%	26%																		
	1,225		71%	29%	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	INVALID	