

## DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

COMMODITY NAME				Black Strap Inc	Central Salt, LLC	GMCO Corporation	GMCO Corporation	GMCO Corporation	Independent Salt Company	Morton Salt, Inc.	Nebraska Salt & Grain Co.
	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UOM	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
1	Superintendent Area 110	9750	TN	\$ 547,080.58	\$ 444,124.26				NO BID	NO BID	\$ 613,701.00
2	Superintendent Area 120	8200	TN	\$ 423,525.97	\$ 352,657.35				NO BID	NO BID	\$ 489,797.00
3	Superintendent Area 130	7800	TN	\$ 443,619.19	\$ 369,979.60				NO BID	NO BID	\$ 498,968.00
4	Superintendent Area 210	9875	TN	\$ 628,601.04	\$ 493,066.69				NO BID	NO BID	\$ 492,114.25
5	Superintendent Area 220	5025	TN	\$ 301,683.93					NO BID	NO BID	\$ 271,735.50
6	Superintendent Area 230	7050	TN	\$ 419,164.85					NO BID	NO BID	\$ 428,036.00
7	Superintendent Area 310	4850	TN	\$ 260,617.50					NO BID	NO BID	\$ 332,315.00
8	Superintendent Area 320	4500	TN	\$ 278,199.44					NO BID	NO BID	\$ 321,870.00
9	Superintendent Area 330	3350	TN	\$ 203,105.43	\$ 185,422.67				NO BID	NO BID	\$ 228,525.00
10	Superintendent Area 340	2650	TN	\$ 182,824.70					NO BID	NO BID	\$ 191,147.50
11	Superintendent Area 350	4600	TN	\$ 300,364.67					NO BID	NO BID	\$ 335,772.50
12	Superintendent Area 410	2775	TN	\$ 146,740.97			\$ 482,528.00	\$ 471,428.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 185,665.00
13	Superintendent Area 430	4400	TN	\$ 201,458.68	\$ 208,540.74		\$ 774,179.00	\$ 760,979.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 215,944.50
14	Superintendent Area 440	4600	TN	\$ 229,400.54			\$ 768,834.00	\$ 750,434.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 287,313.00
15	Superintendent Area 450	4600	TN	\$ 222,060.93	\$ 226,104.52		\$ 804,384.00	\$ 785,984.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 228,842.25

## DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

COMMODITY NAME				Black Strap Inc	Central Salt, LLC	GMCO Corporation	GMCO Corporation	GMCO Corporation	Independent Salt Company	Morton Salt, Inc.	Nebraska Salt & Grain Co.
16	Superintendent Area 510	2900	TN	\$ 240,434.02			\$ 443,671.00	\$ 414,671.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 201,134.00
17	Superintendent Area 520	1950	TN	\$ 154,269.35			\$ 290,403.00	\$ 280,653.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 129,084.75
18	Superintendent Area 530	4975	TN	\$ 383,942.01			\$ 738,321.00	\$ 713,446.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 320,797.75
19	Superintendent Area 610	2225	TN	\$ 133,393.67			\$ 350,112.00	\$ 338,987.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 115,585.00
20	Superintendent Area 620	6850	TN	\$ 456,200.28			INVALID	\$ 996,996.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 384,149.75
21	Superintendent Area 630	3500	TN	\$ 237,921.37			\$ 518,801.00	\$ 501,301.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 207,520.25
22	Superintendent Area 640	3975	TN	\$ 239,065.05			\$ 631,365.00	\$ 623,415.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 214,846.25
23	Superintendent Area 650	2090	TN	\$ 151,949.18			\$ 328,248.20	\$ 311,528.20	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 128,747.55
24	Superintendent Area 710	1625	TN	\$ 83,198.32		\$ 125,242.50	\$ 270,990.00	\$ 274,240.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 80,482.50
25	Superintendent Area 720	2775	TN	\$ 172,677.11			\$ 426,122.00	\$ 428,897.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 175,097.00
26	Superintendent Area 810	1350	TN	\$ 94,030.22					NO BID	NO BID	\$ 92,462.00
27	Superintendent Area 820	2700	TN	\$ 165,755.63					NO BID	NO BID	\$ 183,530.00
28	Superintendent Area 830	1225	TN	\$ 93,625.29			\$ 200,692.00	\$ 194,567.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 87,403.75
PAYMENT TERMS:					NA	N/A	N/A	N/A			NET 30
DELIVERY DAYS ARO:					10	10,30,90	10,30,90	10,30,90			as required
COMMENTS:											

**Explanation:**  
Rejected Black Strap  
alternative bid