Buyer: Julie Schiltz

5891 OF
Statewide

;(t' 2019 or Current Production Year One Ton Diesel Crew Cab And Ford BAXTER C-D-J-R e - Ao @ sid billon Ford

o |(4) Door 4X4 Dual Rear Wheels Truck nderson For -D-J- ene Steffy Auto Group Ie] leMife [Felf

= |Description QTY|UOM SECONDARY AWARD PRIMARY AWARD

1 |1 TON DIESEL CREW CAB (4) DOOR 1| EA
4X4 DUAL REAR WHEELS TRUCK $ 43,425.00 | $ 46,884.00 | $ 46,518.00 | $ 43,368.00
Make: Ford DODGE Ram Ford
Model: F350 RAM CC 3500 CC4 X4 SLT F350
GVWR: 14,000 11,300 11,300 14,000
Series, Code, Trim Level: W3D, 623A, XLT SLT' 'D28H92' SLT, D28H92 Crew cab, W3D, XLT
Engine: . 6.7L 16 CUMMINS .

9 6.7L Diesel TURBO DIESEL 6.7L Cummins 6.7L
Transmission No./Gear Ratio No.: 44W/3.55 68RFE 3.42 68RFE/3.42 44W - 6 speed auto
EPA: N/A N/A NA NA
Delivery time after receipt of order (hnumber/days): 120/160 After 1st Day

90 120-150 of Production Jan 1, 40-180
2019
MSRP as bid: $ 58,690.00| $ 58,020.00 | $ 57,860.00 | $ 58,640.00
2 |E85 1 TON CREW CAB 4 DOOR 1 EA
4X4 DUAL REAR WHEELS TRUCK $ 35,556.00 N/A NA $ 35,430.00
Engine: 6.2L 6.2L
Transmission No./Gear Ratio No.: 44P/3.73 44P -6 speed auto
Make: Ford Ford
Model: F350 F350
GVWR: 14,000 14,000
Series, Code, Trim Level: W3D, 623A, XLT Crew cab- W3D- XLT
EPA: N/A NA
Delivery time after receipt of order (number/days): 90 40-180
MSRP as bid: $ 49,470.00 $ 49,420.00
OPTIONS
3 | ENGINE OTHER GAS 1| EA $ (7,243.00)
ALTERNATE ENGINE SIZE $ (6,495.00) No Bid $ 39,318.00 N
Deduct from line # 1
Specify Engine Size: 6.2L 6.4L 6.2L
4 | ENGINE OTHER GAS NO. 2 1| EA )
ALTERNATE ENGINE SIZE NIA No Bid NA IR
Specify Engine Size: NA
5 |ENGINE OTHER DIESEL 1| EA
INCLUDING BLOCK HEATER $ 8.593.00
FACTORY OR DEALER INSTALLED. $ 8,495.00 N/A NA add to Iine’#z ’
ALTERNATE ENGINE SIZE.
If Dealer Installed, Supply Manufacturer:
Model: Ford Powerstroke Ford
Warranty: 5 year/100k Powertrain same as line #1
Specify Engine Size: 6.7L 6.7L
6 |AIR CONDITIONING 1| EA
(DEDUCT) N/A STD STD NA
7 |FROM AUTOMATIC TO MANUAL 1| EA
FOUR SPEED TRANSMISSION N/A N/A SAME NA
(DEDUCT)
8 |FOG LIGHTS 1 | EALS 1,495.00 | $ 177.00 | $ 200.00| $ 1,600.00
9 |40-20-40 OR 60-40 1| EA
(DEDUCT) N/A STD. StD NA
Specify Bench Seat: 40/20/40 BENCH NA
10(40-20-40 OR 60-40 1| EA
WITH DRIVER 6 WAY POWER
CONTROLLED SEAT, IF AVAILABLE FROM $ 1,495.00 | $ 860.00 | $ 950.00( $ 1,600.00
MANUFACTURER
Specify Bench Seat: 40-20-40 40/20/40 PREMIUM 40-20-40
11 [VINYL COVERING 1| EA
BUCKET TYPE SEATS N/A N/A NA NA

(DEDUCT)
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12 gbgl:w\ég\gégﬂ! ! EA $ 1,295.00 | $ 268.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 969.00
13|TWO ELECTRIC REMOTE CONTROLLED 1 EA
OUTSIDE MIRRORS SWING AWAY TYPE, 6"X9" N/A STD. NA NA
(DEDUCT)
14 |RIGHT AND LEFT 1| EA
TELESCOPIC MIRRORS MINIMUM 6X8 $ 380.00 N/A Sie $ Sl
15|NO RADIO 1| EA
(DEDUCT) N/A STD. NA NA
16 |HEAVY DUTY ALTERNATOR 1 EA
OPTIONAL, MINIMUM 105 AMP ALTERNATOR $ 230.00 STD. STD $ 285.00
ify AMPS:
Specify AMPS 240 220 160 20
gas engine only
17 |HEAVY DUTY BATTERY OPTIONAL 1 EA N/A STD. STD NA
Specify CCA: 730 730 NA
18|SLIDING REAR VISION WINDOW 1 EA| $ 475.00 STD. STD $ 572.00
19 E\IDOEI[_)IL[J)C(?I_I)\I UTILITY BODY 1 EA $ (1,165.00)
warner
$ (600.00) N/A $ (1,025.00) $ (600.00)
Knapheide
20 (AIR BAG, DUAL IF NOT STANDARD 1 EA STD STD. STD STD
21 |CARPETED FLOOR 1 EA| $ 190.00 | STD. - VINYL IN BID STD $ 190.00
22 |SECOND POWER OUTLET 1 EA INC. IN PREMIUM
STD SEAT OPTION $ 100.00 STD
23 [SHORT PICKUP BOX LENGTH 1 EA s (370.00)
DEDUCT .
( ) $ (450.00) N/A Single Rear Wheel $ (E00LLD)
. SRW only
Drive Only
Specify Wheelbase:
pecity 160 149 160
Specify Dimensions of Box Bid (In Inches):
Length, Width and Width Between Wheel Wells: 81.9x 66.9 x 50.5 76,65,51 81.9x66.9 x 50.5
24 [SINGLE REAR WHEELS 1 EA $ (1178.00)
(DEDUCT) $ (1,105.00)| ~ LoV INC. N BID $ (196.00)| $ (589.00)
25 [SINGLE WHEEL CHASSIS WITH EIGHT FOOT 1 EA $ 6.909.00
UTILITY BODY (SEE ATTACHMENT) COLOR OF Kna heid’e '
UTILITY BODY TO MATCH MANUFACTURER $ 7,595.00 No Bid $ 6,159.00 $ p 10.990.00
COLOR CHARTS. ' '
warner
Specify Make And Model:
. Knapheide - 696
Knapheide 696 Warner - W$298M$MU
26 [DUAL WHEEL CHASSIS WITH EIGHT FOOT 1 EA $ 7,860.00
UTILITY BODY (SEE ATTACHMENT) COLOR OF . Knapheide
UTILITY BODY TO MATCH MANUFACTURER $ 8,495.00 No Bid $ B0 $ 12,267.00
COLOR CHARTS. Warner
Specify Make And Model: Kraoheide 696 Knapheide - 696D54
p Warner - R$98MDWU
27 |SINGLE WHEEL CHASSIS CAB WITH NO 1 EA . $ 43,710.00
UTILITY BOX $ 1,245.00 No Bid $ 45,922.00 60" CA
28 [DUAL WHEEL CHASSIS 1 EA . $ 44,698.00
CAB WITH NO UTILITY BOX $ 1,595.00 No Bid $ 46,118.00 60" CA
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2019 or Current Production Year One Ton Diesel Crew Cab

(4) Door 4X4 Dual Rear Wheels Truck

Anderson Ford

BAXTER C-D-J-R

Gene Steffy Auto Group

Sid Dillon Ford

Description

QTY

uom

SECONDARY AWARD

PRIMARY AWARD

N

9

HD RUBBERIZED SPRAY IN BED LINER
(LINEX, RHINO OR EQUIVALENT)

Specify Manufacturer:

1

EA

550.00 | $

496.00

$ 600.00

$

$

pickup

475.00

600.00

utility Body

Ford

CHRYSLER

FCA

30

TRAILER TOWING PACKAGE
(DEDUCT)

EA

N/A

STD.

NA

NA

31

CARGO LIGHT

EA

95.00

STD.

STD

STD

32

STANDARD PAINT ATTACH LIST AND IDENTIFY
AS NO ADDITIONAL COST PAINTS

See Attch.

SEE ATTACHED

NC

see attached

33

FOR DEPART OF TRANSPORTATION
YELLOW COLOR OF DODGE #PL1, FORD
#84S53, CHEVROLET/GMC #WA-253A CODE
(9W3) WITH NO MINIMUM ORDER REQUIRED.

EA

945.00

SEE ATTACHED

$ 450.00

868.00

34

EXTRA COST PAINT ATTACH LIST
AND IDENTIFY AS EXTRA COST PAINTS

EA

See Attch.

SEE ATTACHED

$ 100.00

$ 450.00

see attached

35

ANTI - LOCK BRAKING SYSTEM (ABS)

[y

EA

STD

STD.

STD

STD

36

ADDITIONAL REMOTE FOB FROM
MANUFACTURER

EA

225.00

200.00
(DEALER)

$ 225.00

135.00

37

DELIVERY WITH ONLY TWO SETS OF KEYS
PER VEHICLE
(DEDUCT)

EA

(20.00)

STD.

$ (75.00)

(27.00)

38

ELECTRONIC COMPASS TEMP DISPLAY
(DEDUCT)

EA

N/A

STD.

STD

NA

39

REARVIEW CAMERA
DEALER OR FACTORY INSTALLED

EA

380.00

STD.

STD

481.00

40

TAILGATE STEP
DEALER OR FACTORY INSTALLED

EA

375.00

STD.

$ 400.00

375.00

41

DUAL ALTERNATORS
DEALER OR FACTORY INSTALLED

EA

380.00 | $

359.00

$ 395.00

255.00

42

SEAT LUMBAR SUPPORT
LUMBAR SUPPORT IN SEATS IF NOT
STANDARD EQUIPMENT

EA

STD-Drivers

INC. IN PREMIUM
SEAT PKG

$ 950.00

STD - Drivers

43

PROTECTIVE VINYL
SIDE MOLDINGS DEALER INSTALLED IF NOT
STANDARD EQUIPMENT

EA

425.00 | $

300.00

$ 250.00

350.00

44

SERVICE REPAIR MANUAL EQUIPMENT AND
ENGINE

Specify Type Of Service Repair Manual Available:
Paper Copy, CD ROM Or Online:

EA

425.00

N/A AT THIS TIME

$ 150.00

395.00

CD Rom

CD

CD

45

PARTS MANUAL EQUIPMENT AND ENGINE

Specify Type Of Parts Manual Available: Paper
Copy, CD ROM, Or Online:

EA

N/A

N/A AT THIS TIME

NA

NA

NA

46

ADDITIONAL COSTS FOR WARRANTIES FROM
MANUFACTURER

Specify Years And Miles:

EA

3,395.00

No Bid

$ 3,895.00

Call for options

5 year/ 100k
Premium Care

5 yrs/ 100,000
miles

Call

a7

DROP SHIPMENT CHARGES

OUTSIDE THE LINCOLN AREA

ADDITIONAL COSTS OF CHARGES FOR
VEHICLE DROP SHIPMENT OUTSIDE THE
LINCOLN AREA. DROP SHIPMENT CHARGES
WOULD BE FOR VEHICLES BOUGHT BY
POLITICAL ENTITIES AND OTHER DIVISIONS
OF GOVERNMENT.

425.00 | $

400.00

$ 500.00

400.00

Payment Terms

0 30
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;(t' 2019 or Current Production Year One Ton Diesel Crew Cab .

v (4) Door 4X4 Dual Rear Wheels Truck Anderson Ford BAXTER C-D-J-R Gene Steffy Auto Group Sid Dillon Ford
= |Description [oTY[uOM SECONDARY AWARD PRIMARY AWARD
Delivery Days ARO 90 120/160

Comments

ATTACHED - Addendum 1
48. 9' Boss Straight Plow
$5,935.00

49. upgrade to 9'2" V-Plow
$6,930.00

50. down grade to 3/4 truck
with diesel engine - SRW,
SWB $(2599.00) deduct
from line #1

Exceptions for Technical Specifications

1. Cab and Body

B. 98.1" length, 66.9" width,
50.5" width between wheel
wells

O. Diesel: 34 Gasoline: 34
BB. 19,100

3. Suspension and Running
Gear

J. Type: limited slip

4. Electrical System

B. capacity: 750

C. output: 220

1. Cab and Body

B. 105.3" length, 66.4"
width, 51" width between
wheel wells

O. Diesel: 32

BB. 30,000

3. Suspension and Running
Gear

J. Type: ANTI-SPIN
4.Electrical System

B. capacity: 730

C. output: 220

1. Cab and Body

B. 96" length, 65" width, 51"
width between wheel wells
O. Diesel: 32 Gasoline: 32
3. Suspension and Running
Gear

J. Type: mopar

4. Electrical System

B. capacity: 730

C. output: 220

1. Cab and Body

B. 98.1" length, 66.9" width,
50.5" width between wheel
wells

O. Diesel: 48 Gasoline: 48
BB. See attached

3. Suspension and Running
Gear

J. Type: Limited Slip

4. Electrical System

B. capacity: 750 Dual -
Diesel

9. Warranty C. output: 220 amp
9-B 3 YRS. 36,000 MILES 6. Miscellaneous
5-YRS. 60,000 (6.E.) Delay Delivery orders
POWERTRAIN will be placed as late as
possible to reduce dealer
floor plan charges
Technical Specifications- 3. General No Bid 3500 Crew Cab 1. Paint and Coating
Utility Body for Single Rear Wheel Chassis H. 1 year Paint/ 6 year Rust 3. General (1.B) only white is a no
through 1. 17,050 charge color all other colors
1. 19,100 are an extra charge =
2200.00
3. General
I. see attached
Technical Specifications- 3. General No Bid 3. General 1. Paint And Coating
Utility Body for Dual Rear Wheel Chassis H. 1 year Paint/ 6 year Rust 1. 20,000 (1.B) only white is a no
through charge color all other colors
1. 19,100 are an extra charge -

2200.00
3. General
I. see attached

Master Agreement Terms and Conditions

C. 1. Nebraska Dealer
License Number 03970

C. 1. Nebraska Dealer
License Number: 3943

C. 1. Nebraska Dealer
License Number: 02298

C. 1. Nebraska Dealer
License Number: 06557

Life Cycle was not calculated since the 3/4 Ton Trucks are not listed on the Fuel Economy Guide
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