Buyer: Julie Schiltz

5888 OF REVISED
Statewide
** 12019 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR 3/4 TON CREW CAB .
% DIESEL 4X4 (4) DOOR TRUCK Anderson Ford BAXTER C-D-J-R Gene Steffy Auto Group Sid Dillon Ford
Description QTY|UOM PRIMARY AWARD
1 |3/4 Ton Crew Cab 4X4 Diesel (4) Door Truck $ 39,993.00 | $ 45125.00 | $ 45,435.00 40,330.00
Make: Ford DODGE RAM Ford
Model: F250 RAM SLT 2500 F250
GVWR: 10,000 9,000 9000 10,000
Series, Code, Trim Level: W2B, XLT, 603A 'SLT' 'DJ7H92' DJ7H92/SLT WZB-603A-XLT
Engine: 6.7L 6.7L 16 CUMMINS TURBO 6.7L 6.7L
1 EA DIESEL
Transmission No./Gear Ratio No.: 44W, X3H 68RFE 3.42 68RFE/3.42 44W - 6 speed auto
EPA: N/A N/A NA NA
Delivery time after receipt of order (number/days): 120-150
2019 PRODUCTION
90-120 BEGINS 40-180
JAN. 2019
MSRP as bid: $ 55,975.00 [ $ 56,190.00 56,020.00
2 |E85 3/4 Ton Crew Cab 4X4 Door Truck $ 32,124.00 No Bid No Bid 32,393.00
Engine: 6.2L 6.2L
Transmission No./Gear Ratio No.: 44S/X3E 44$ - 6 speed auto
Make: Ford Ford
Model: 1 |EA F250 F250
GVWR: 10,000 10,000
Series, Code, Trim Level: W2B, 603A, XLT W2B-603A-XLT
EPA: N/A NA
Delivery time after receipt of order (number/days): 90-120 40-180
MSRP as bid: $ 46,755.00 46,800.00
OPTIONS
3 | Engine Other Gas (6968.00)
1| Ea $ (6,495.00)| $ 36,860.00 | $ 37,129.00 from line # 1
Specifiy Engine Size: 6.2L 5.7L V-8 HEMI 5.7L 6.2L
4 | Engine Other Gas No. 2 1| Ea N/A $ 37,314.00 | $ 37,576.00 NA
Specify Engine Size: 6.4L HD V-8 HEMI 6.4L NA
5 [Engine Other Diesel Including Block Heater, 8368.00
Factory Or Dealer Installed $ 8,495.00 NA added to line 2
If Dealer Installed, Supply Manufacturer: 1 EA Ford N/A NA
Model: Powerstroke 6.7L
Warranty: 5 yr./100k Powertrain 5yr - 60,000
Specify Engine Size: 6.7L 6.7L
6 [Automatic To Manual Four-Speed Transmission X
(Deduct) 1| EA N/A N/C Same Price NA
7 |Electronic Shift 4 Wheel Drive System 1| EA|[S 285.00 STD STD 220.00
8 [Fog Lights 1| EA[S 1,395.00 | $ 177.00 | $ 200.00 1,600.00
9 [40-20-40 Or 60-40 Bench Seat W/ Vinyl (Deduct) 1| EA N/A N/A NA NA
10|40-20-40 Or 60-40 Bench Seat
With Driver 6 Way Power Controlled Seat, If 1| EA|S 795.00 [ $ 860.00 [ $ 950.00 1,600.00
Available From Manufacturer
11 [Bucket Type Seats Cloth W/Vinyl Trim 1| EA|S$ 1,095.00 | $ 1,087.00 | $ 1,200.00 945.00
12|Rear Seat (Deduct) 1| EA N/A N/A NA NA
13| Two Electric Remote Controlled Outside Mirrors
Swing Away Type, 6"X9" (Deduct) 1 EA MR STD STD NA
14 |Camper Type Mirrors, Extended Arm, Min. 7"X10' 1 EA N/A N/A NA NA
(Deduct)
15|Right And Left Telescopic Mirrors, Minimum 6"X8" 1| EAlS 265.00 N/A $ 195.00 380.00
16 [Second Power Outlet 1| EA STD STD $ 100.00 STD
17|Cargo Light 1 [EA|S 95.00 STD STD STD
18|Keyless Remote Entry Locking System 1| ea N/A STD STD NA
(Deduct)
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Description QTY|UOM PRIMARY AWARD
19 |Standard Paint h

Attach List And Identify As No Additional Cost Paints 1| EA S A SEE ATTACHED NC see attached
20 |For Department of Roads Use: Yellow Color of: Dodge

#PL1, Ford #84S53, Chevrolet/GMC #WA-253A code 1| EA 945.00 SEE ATTACHED $ 450.00 $860.00

(9W3) With No Minimum Order Required.
21|Extra Cost Paint Attach List And Identify As Extra Cost

Paints $ 100.00

1| EA See Attch SEE ATTACHED to see attached
$ 450.00
2 Ig?n\sll:;: IAlﬂrgl::a’Zlc?: ?I'lires $ (2712.00)
(Deduct) 1| EA (1,395.00) N/A Tow hook - NA $ (1,500.00)
Skid Plate - NA
23 |HD Rubberized Spray In Bed Liner $ 475.00
(Linex, Rhino or Equivalent) Truck
1| ea 550.00 | $ 496.00 | $ 600.00 3 600.00
utility Body

Bidder State Manufacturer: Ford CHRYSLER FCA
24 (Increased Pickup Box Length

Of Approximately 8 Feet With Corresponding 375.00 IN BID $ 17400 | $ 479.00

Wheelbase

Bidder Specify Wheelbase: 1]EA 172" 169 169 176"

Specify Dimensions Of Box Bid: Length, Width and 98.1 x 66.9 50.5

Width Between Wheel Wells: 98 x 69.3 x 50.9 105.3-66.4-51 96x65x51 between wells
25[Snow Plow Attachment Of Pickup Manufacturer

(Western, Boss and Meyer Brands With Power Angling, $ 5790.00

8 Foot Bolt On Blade, Plow Head And Turn Lights, 5,995.00 NO BID $ 5,200.00 | $ 6693.00

Snow Deflector, Blade Markers) To Include Snow Plow | 1 | EA V-Plow

Prep Package.

Specify Snow Plow Package Manufacturer and Details: B Boss 8 super Duty 8 straight - Boss

straight Blade
26 [Snow Plow Package Minus Snow Plow Blade 285.00 NO BID $ 4.020.00| $ 285.00
- - 1| EA

Specify Plow Package Minus Snow Plow Blade .

Manufacturer and Details: A2 SFIEE Ford
27|Sliding Rear-Vision Window 1 EA 450.00 STD STD 472.00
28|Chassis With Eight Foot 10850.00

Utility Body For Single Wheel To Include Cost Of Warner

8 Foot Pickup Box Length. See Attachment 7,895.00 NO BID $ 6,160.00 $ 7695.00

1 EA Knapheide
Specify Make And Model:
) . Warner - W$298M$WU
Knapheide 696J Knapheide Knapheide - 696
29 [Color Of Utility Body To Match
Manufacturer Color Charts $ (2250.00) $ 1250.00
1100.00 Warner
1 EA . NO BID yellow
white = n/c ) $ 2250.00
white NC .
Knapheide
30(No Lid On Utility Body (Deduct) $ (1145.00)
Warner
1| EA (600.00) NO BID $ (1,025.00) 3 (600.00)
Knapheide
31 [Deduction For Minimum 7,200 Pound GVWR

For Basic Unit With LT225/75R16D Tires, Rear Springs

Of Minimum 4,500 Pounds, 60-AMPS 1| EA N/A N/A NA NA

Alternator, 500 CCA Battery And Minimum 4.3L

Gasoline Engine.

32 |Electronic Compass/Temperature 1 EA N/A STD STD NA

Display System (Deduct)
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2019 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR 3/4 TON CREW CAB

DIESEL 4X4 (4) DOOR TRUCK

Anderson Ford

BAXTER C-D-J-R

Gene Steffy Auto Group

Sid Dillon Ford

Description

QTY

UoM

PRIMARY AWARD

Rearview Camera
Dealer Or Factory Installed

EA

275.00

STD

STD

STD

Tailgate Step
Dealer Or Factory Installed

EA

395.00

STD

425.00

375.00

35

Dual Alternators
Dealer Or Factory Installed

EA

380.00

395.00

400.00

235.00
Diesel

36

Seat Lumbar Support
Lumbar Support In Seats If Not Standard Equipment

EA

STD - Drivers

$

860.00

INC. W/PREMIUM SEAT

950.00

STD - Drivers

3

J

Protective Vinyl Side Moldings. Dealer Installed If Not
Standard Equipment

EA

425.00

$

300.00

250.00

350.00

3

(o]

Service Repair Manual Equipment and Engine

450.00

N/A AT THIS TIME

150.00

395.00

Specify Type Of Service Repair Manual Available:
Paper Copy, CD Rom Or Online:

EA

CD Rom

CD

39

Parts Manual Equipment And Engine

N/A

N/A AT THIS TIME

NA

N/A @ this time

Specify Type Of Parts Manual Available: Paper Copy,
CD Rom, Or Online.

EA

NA

4

o

Additional Costs For Warranties From Manufacturer

3,295.00

NO BID

3,355.00

call for options

Specify Years And Miles:

EA

5 yr./100k Premium
Care

5 yr/100,000/100
Deductable

Call

41

Drop Shipment Charges Outside The Lincoln Area.
Additional Costs Of Charges For Vehicle Drop Shipment
Outside The Lincoln Area. Drop Shipment Charges
Would Be For Vehicles Bought By Political Entities And
Other Divisions of Government.

425.00

400.00

500.00

400.00

42

Factory Or Dealer Disconnect Of Daylight Running
Lights If Factory Equipped.
Law Enforcement Only

EA

195.00

50.00

40.00

190.00

4

w

44

45

Disconnect Of Factory Dome Light Or Courtesy Lamp
Law Enforcement Only

EA

195.00

50.00

STD

190.00

Dome Light Or Courtesy Lamp

To Be Centered Not More Than Approximately 4" To 8"
From The Top Of The Windshield To Light The Driver's
Area. Controlled By Rotating Headlamp Switch To
Maximum Position Or By A Separate Switch. This May
Require Adding An Additional Light. Dealer Installation
Is Acceptatble If Not Available From The Factory.

Law Enforcement Only

EA

195.00

120.00

123.00

160.00

Auxiliary Battery

(Largest Available Battery.) (Dual Purpose AGM
Battery)With Dual Battery Separator For Accessory
Equipment. Installation Also To Include Battery Tray
And Bracket, Heavy Duty Fuse, 1 Gauge Or Larger
Cable.

Law Enforcement Only

EA

995.00

810.00

850.00

860.00

Indicate CCA:

750

750

750

4

(2]

Alternator With Highest Output Available
Law Enforcement Only

EA

285.00

91.00

400.00
Diesel only

279.00

Indicate AMPS:

200

220

440

240 gas only

47

Reverse Sensing Alarm System

Dealer Installation Is Acceptable If Not Available From
The Manufacturer.

Law Enforcement Only

EA

390.00

268.00

301.00

401.00
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Description QTY|UOM PRIMARY AWARD
48 [Alternating Headlight Flasher
Wig-Wag Module With Flasher Override For Optional
Override At Night Installed With Activation Lead Tagged
As Such And Terminating In Or Near The Passenger 1 EA|$ 22500 N/A $ 149.00 NA
Compartment.
Law Enforcement Only
49 [Vertical Mounted Two (2)
Clear/White LED Modules Mounted At 45-Degree
Angle To Front Of Vehicle On Push Bumper. Black
Bezel With Clear Lenses. Shock And Water Resistant.
Leads Tagged As Such That Terminate In Center 1| EA[S 295.00 | $ 22400 | $ 204.00 | $ 264.00
Console Area. LED's Meet SAE J845, Class 1
Specifications. Minimum Of Three (3) LED In Each
Module.
Law Enforcement Only
50 Two (2) Clear/White LED Module

Mounted On Either Side Of Rear License Plate On A
Plate Bracket For Two (2) light Heads. Black Bezel
With Clear Lenses, Shock And Water Resistant. Leads
Tagged As Such That Terminate In Center Console 1 |EA|S 295.00 [ $ 24400 | $ 224.00 | $ 284.00
Area. LED's Meet SAE J845, Class 1 Specifications.
Minimum Of Three (3) LED In Each Module.

Law Enforcement Only

51 (100 Watt Siren Speaker

Installed Behind Front Grill With Vehicle Specific
Mounting Bracket, Leads Tagged As Such That 1| EA[S 375.00 | $ 264.00 | $ 268.00
Terminate In Or Near The Passenger Compartment.
Law Enforcement Only

52 |Pro-Gard X Push Bumper

With Installation On Front Of Vehicle 1 EA N/A N/A NA NA
Law Enforcement Only

Setina PB 400 Push Bumper
With Installation On Front Of Vehicle 1| EA[S 695.00 | $ 634.00 [ $ 634.00 | $ 650.00
Law Enforcement Only

Bluetooth Hands Free Wireless

Network To Make And Receive Phone Calls Enabled By
A Push Button Or By Voice Command.

Law Enforcement Only

55 [Roof Mounted Antenna

Located Ten (10) Inches Forward From The Rear Of
Cab By Twelve (12) Inches Left From Roof Center

Line. Location To Be Determined By Buyer To 1 EA| $ 170.00 | $ 120.00 [ $ 120.00 | $ 140.00
Dealer/Outfitter. NMO Mount With RG58 Cable Ran Into
Rear Seating Area.

Law Enforcement Only

56 |Roof Mounted Blue Tree Antenna

Centered On Roof Ten (10) Inches Forward From The
Rear Of Cab. Location To Be Determined By Buyer To
Dealer/Outfitter. Cables Ran Into Center Console Area.
Make: AntennaPlus. Model: AP85/18GPS-QS22. Tri- 1 EA| $ 325.00 | $ 225.00 | $ 268.00 | $ 340.00
Mode Cellular/PCS/GPS Black Antenna. 824-896
MHZ,1885-1990 MHZ. Connectors SMA On Cell/PCS &
SMA On GPS. Foam Pad &Threaded Bolt. Website
WWW.ANTENNAPLUS.COM

$ 334.00
Code 3-C3500

5

w

5

5

1| EA|S 325.00 STD STD $ 525.00

Payment Terms 030 030 030
Delivery Days ARO 90 120/160
Comments ATTACHED - Addendum 1

Exceptions for Technical Specifications
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Description

[QTY[uOM

PRIMARY AWARD

Technical Specifications

1. Cab and Body

B. 80" length, 69" width,
50.9" width between wheel
wells.

O. Diesel: 29 Gaslone: 34
AA. 14,500

3. Suspension and
Running Gear

J. Type: electronic locking
4. Electrical System

C. output: 200

1. Cab and Body

B. 105.3" length, 66.4 width,
51" width between wheel wells
O. Diesel: 28 Gasoline: 32
AA. 11510

3. Suspension and Running
Gear

J. Type: ANTI-SPIN

4. Electrical System

C. output: 220

1. Cab and Body

B. 74" length, 65" width,
51" width between wheel
wells

O. Diesel: 32 Gasoline: 32
AA. 11,500

3. Suspension and
Running Gear

J. Type: mopar

4. Electrical System

C. output: 220

1. Cab and Body

B. 81.9" length, 66.9"
width, 50.5" width between
wheel wells

O. Diesel: 34 Gasoline: 34
see attached

AA. See attached

3. Suspension and
Running Gear

J. Type: elec. locking

4. Electrical System

C. output: 200

6. Miscellaneous

(6.E.) Delay Delivery orders
will be placed as late as
possible to reduce dealer
floor plan charges.

Exceptions for Master Agreement Terms and Conditions- 8. Warranty No Bid 8. Warranty 5. Paint and Coating
Utility Body for Single Rear Wheel Chassis 1 year Paint 5 year Limited. 9. Trailer Tow 5 years (5B) yellow is an upcharge
9. Trailer Tow A. 11510 9. Trailer Tow only white is included in
A. 14,500 A. 11,500 price
9. Trailer Tow

A. see attached

Master Agreement Terms and Conditions

C. 1. Nebraska Dealer
License Number 03970

C. 1. Nebraska Dealer
License Number: 3943

C. 1. Nebraska Dealer
License Number: 02298

C. 1. Nebraska Dealer
License Number: 06557

Life Cycle was not calculated since the 3/4 Ton Trucks are not listed on the Fuel Economy Guide
Revised Bid tab. Second line was not highlighted on the primary award
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