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LINE # DESCRIPTION EST QTY UOM
UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

1
GRAY RECYCLE 25,000-49,999M 
CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND 
PA

50
M NO BID #VALUE!

2
GRAY RECYCLE 50,000-74,999M 
CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND 
PA

75
M NO BID #VALUE!

3
GRAY RECYCLE 75,000-99,999M 
CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND 
PA

100
M NO BID #VALUE!

4
GRAY RECYCLE 100,000-124,999M 
CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND 
PA

125
M NO BID #VALUE!

5
GRAY RECYCLE 125,000-149,999M 
CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND 
PA

150
M NO BID #VALUE!

6
GRAY RECYCLE 150,000-174,999M 
CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND 
PA

175
M NO BID #VALUE!

7
GRAY RECYCLE 175,000-199,999M 
CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND 
PA

200
M NO BID #VALUE!

8
GRAY RECYCLE 200,000-224,999M 
CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND 
PA

225
M NO BID #VALUE!

9
GRAY RECYCLE 225,000-249,000M 
CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND 
PA

250
M NO BID #VALUE!

10
GRAY RECYCLE 250,000M PLUS 
CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND 
PA

250
M NO BID #VALUE!

11
GRAY VIRGIN 25,000-49,999M 
CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND 
PA

50
M 134.82$   6,741.00$     

12
GRAY VIRGIN 50,000-74,999M 
CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND 
PA

75
M 110.84$   8,313.00$     

13
GRAY VIRGIN 75,000-99,999M 
CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND 
PA

100
M 103.93$   10,393.00$   

COMMODITY NAME ENVELOPES PLUS, INC.
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14
GRAY VIRGIN 100,000-124,999M 
CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND 
PA

125
M 73.36$     9,170.00$     

15
GRAY VIRGIN 125,000-149,999M 
CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND 
PA

150
M 65.81$     9,871.50$     

16
GRAY VIRGIN 150,000-174,999M 
CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND 
PA

175
M 62.00$     10,850.00$   

17
GRAY VIRGIN 175,000-199,999M 
CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND 
PA

200
M 58.92 11,784.00$   

18
GRAY VIRGIN 200,000-224,999M 
CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND 
PA

225
M 56.81 12,782.25$   

19
GRAY VIRGIN 225,000-249,000M 
CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND 
PA

250
M 54.7 13,675.00$   

20
GRAY VIRGIN 250,000M PLUS 
CAMPGROUND REGISTRATION AND 
PA

250
M 54.7 13,675.00$   

PAYMENT TERMS:
DELIVERY DAYS ARO:
COMMENTS:

% NET 30
45
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