
Buyer:  Faith Camargo 5792 OF
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Description Qty UOM  Unit Price  Extended Price  Unit Price  Extended Price  Unit Price  Extended Price 

1 CRS-2P  DISTRICT 1 3425 TN  $    426.50  $1,460,762.50  $    423.08  $ 1,449,049.00  No Bid  No Bid 
2 CRS-2P  DISTRICT 3 7750 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    428.61  $ 3,321,727.50  No Bid  No Bid 
3 CRS-2P  DISTRICT 4 5300 TN  $    394.50  $2,090,850.00  $    408.34  $ 2,164,202.00  No Bid  No Bid 
4 CRS-2P  DISTRICT 6 4125 TN  $    421.50  $1,738,687.50  $    426.62  $ 1,759,807.50  No Bid  No Bid 
5 CRS-2P  DISTRICT 7 2250 TN  $    440.50  $   991,125.00  $    475.57  $ 1,070,032.50  No Bid  No Bid 
6 CRS-2P  DISTRICT 8 2325 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    429.72  $    999,099.00  No Bid  No Bid 
7 CSS-1H  DISTRICT 1 400 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    482.72  $    193,088.00  $  383.99  $     153,596.00 
8 CSS-1H  DISTRICT 3 75 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    464.70  $      34,852.50  $  427.42  $       32,056.50 
9 CSS-1H  DISTRICT 7 175 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    517.39  $      90,543.25  $  450.77  $       78,884.75 

10 CSS-1H 50/50  DISTRICT 3 50 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    264.70  $      13,235.00  $  382.99  $       19,149.50 
11 CSS-1H 50/50  DISTRICT 5 100 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    303.72  $      30,372.00  $  600.00  $       60,000.00 
12 CSS-1H 50/50  DISTRICT 6 525 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    310.47  $    162,996.75  $  363.00  $     190,575.00 
13 CSS-1H 50/50  DISTRICT 7 700 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    314.60  $    220,220.00  $  360.00  $     252,000.00 
14 CSS-1H 50/50  DISTRICT 8 325 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    298.89  $      97,139.25  $  284.00  $       92,300.00 
15 CSS-1H 75/25  DISTRICT 2 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    370.00  $        9,250.00  $  400.00  $       10,000.00 
16 CSS-1H 75/25  DISTRICT 3 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    370.00  $        9,250.00  $  500.00  $       12,500.00 
17 CSS-1H 75/25  DISTRICT 5 50 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    435.00  $      21,750.00  $  600.00  $       30,000.00 
18 CSS-1H 75/25  DISTRICT 6 475 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    419.00  $    199,025.00  $  417.00  $     198,075.00 
19 CSS-1H 75/25  DISTRICT 8 700 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    393.89  $    275,723.00  $  368.00  $     257,600.00 
20 CRS-2VHL  DISTRICT 5 875 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    669.00  $    585,375.00  No Bid  No Bid 
21 CRS-2P 80/20  DISTRICT 6 800 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
22 CRS-2  DISTRICT 3 50 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    418.39  $      20,919.50  No Bid  No Bid 
23 HFE-150  DISTRICT 3 125 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    418.39  $      52,298.75  No Bid  No Bid 
24 HFE-150  DISTRICT 5 1500 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    459.11  $    688,665.00  No Bid  No Bid 
25 HFE-150  DISTRICT 8 775 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    442.49  $    342,929.75  No Bid  No Bid 
26 HFE-300  DISTRICT 4 1525 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    484.59  $    738,999.75  No Bid  No Bid 
27 HFE-300  DISTRICT 6 1725 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    509.09  $    878,180.25  No Bid  No Bid 
28 HFE-300  DISTRICT 7 125 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    510.96  $      63,870.00  No Bid  No Bid 
29 HFE-300  DISTRICT 8 725 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    492.73  $    357,229.25  No Bid  No Bid 
30 HFE-1000  DISTRICT 4 50 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    537.27  $      26,863.50  No Bid  No Bid 
31 HFE-1000  DISTRICT 5 50 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    557.58  $      27,879.00  No Bid  No Bid 
32 HFE-1000  DISTRICT 6 50 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    550.24  $      27,512.00  No Bid  No Bid 
33 HFE-1000  DISTRICT 8 275 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    526.65  $    144,828.75  No Bid  No Bid 
34 MC-250  DISTRICT 4 100 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    548.05  $      54,805.00  No Bid  No Bid 
35 MC-250  DISTRICT 6 150 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    622.84  $      93,426.00  No Bid  No Bid 
36 MC-250  DISTRICT 8 125 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    585.98  $      73,247.50  No Bid  No Bid 
37 CRS-2P PLANT PICK-UP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    420.00  $      10,500.00  No Bid  No Bid 
38 CSS-1H PLANT PICK-UP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    400.00  $      10,000.00  $  435.00  $       10,875.00 
39 CSS-1H 50/50  PLANT PICK-UP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    250.00  $        6,250.00  $  415.00  $       10,375.00 
40 CSS-1H 75/25  PLANT PICK-UP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    325.00  $        8,125.00  $  425.00  $       10,625.00 
41 CRS-2VHL  PLANT PICK-UP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    600.00  $      15,000.00  No Bid  No Bid 
42 CRS-2P 80/20  PLANT PICK-UP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
43 CRS-2  PLANT PICK-UP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    410.00  $      10,250.00  No Bid  No Bid 
44 HFE-150  PLANT PICK-UP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    410.00  $      10,250.00  No Bid  No Bid 
45 HFE-300  PLANT PICK-UP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    460.00  $      11,500.00  No Bid  No Bid 
46 HFE-1000  PLANT PICK-UP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    495.00  $      12,375.00  No Bid  No Bid 
47 MC-250  PLANT PICK-UP 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $    575.00  $      14,375.00  No Bid  No Bid 
48 DEMURRAGE 1 HR  $           -    $                  -    $    180.00  $           180.00  $  230.00  $            230.00 
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Buyer:  Faith Camargo 5792 OF
Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 03/20/18  
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Description Qty UOM

1 CRS-2P  DISTRICT 1 3425 TN
2 CRS-2P  DISTRICT 3 7750 TN
3 CRS-2P  DISTRICT 4 5300 TN
4 CRS-2P  DISTRICT 6 4125 TN
5 CRS-2P  DISTRICT 7 2250 TN
6 CRS-2P  DISTRICT 8 2325 TN
7 CSS-1H  DISTRICT 1 400 TN
8 CSS-1H  DISTRICT 3 75 TN
9 CSS-1H  DISTRICT 7 175 TN

10 CSS-1H 50/50  DISTRICT 3 50 TN
11 CSS-1H 50/50  DISTRICT 5 100 TN
12 CSS-1H 50/50  DISTRICT 6 525 TN
13 CSS-1H 50/50  DISTRICT 7 700 TN
14 CSS-1H 50/50  DISTRICT 8 325 TN
15 CSS-1H 75/25  DISTRICT 2 25 TN
16 CSS-1H 75/25  DISTRICT 3 25 TN
17 CSS-1H 75/25  DISTRICT 5 50 TN
18 CSS-1H 75/25  DISTRICT 6 475 TN
19 CSS-1H 75/25  DISTRICT 8 700 TN
20 CRS-2VHL  DISTRICT 5 875 TN
21 CRS-2P 80/20  DISTRICT 6 800 TN
22 CRS-2  DISTRICT 3 50 TN
23 HFE-150  DISTRICT 3 125 TN
24 HFE-150  DISTRICT 5 1500 TN
25 HFE-150  DISTRICT 8 775 TN
26 HFE-300  DISTRICT 4 1525 TN
27 HFE-300  DISTRICT 6 1725 TN
28 HFE-300  DISTRICT 7 125 TN
29 HFE-300  DISTRICT 8 725 TN
30 HFE-1000  DISTRICT 4 50 TN
31 HFE-1000  DISTRICT 5 50 TN
32 HFE-1000  DISTRICT 6 50 TN
33 HFE-1000  DISTRICT 8 275 TN
34 MC-250  DISTRICT 4 100 TN
35 MC-250  DISTRICT 6 150 TN
36 MC-250  DISTRICT 8 125 TN
37 CRS-2P PLANT PICK-UP 25 TN
38 CSS-1H PLANT PICK-UP 25 TN
39 CSS-1H 50/50  PLANT PICK-UP 25 TN
40 CSS-1H 75/25  PLANT PICK-UP 25 TN
41 CRS-2VHL  PLANT PICK-UP 25 TN
42 CRS-2P 80/20  PLANT PICK-UP 25 TN
43 CRS-2  PLANT PICK-UP 25 TN
44 HFE-150  PLANT PICK-UP 25 TN
45 HFE-300  PLANT PICK-UP 25 TN
46 HFE-1000  PLANT PICK-UP 25 TN
47 MC-250  PLANT PICK-UP 25 TN
48 DEMURRAGE 1 HR

Comments

Li
ne

 #
Liquid Asphaltic Materials

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms

 Unit Price  Extended Price  Unit Price  Extended Price  Unit Price  Extended Price 

 No Bid  $  494.00  $  1,691,950.00  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  $  512.00  $  2,713,600.00  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  $  449.50  $       78,662.50 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 $  273.00  $       27,300.00  No Bid  $  265.50  $       26,550.00 
 No Bid  No Bid  $  289.50  $     151,987.50 
 No Bid  No Bid  $  309.50  $     216,650.00 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 $  370.85  $       18,542.50  No Bid  $  335.50  $       16,775.00 
 No Bid  No Bid  $  359.50  $     170,762.50 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  $  473.50  $     414,312.50 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 $  451.60  $     677,400.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  $  487.00  $     742,675.00  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 $  526.00  $       26,300.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  $  390.00  $         9,750.00 

 $  273.00  $         6,825.00  No Bid  $  270.00  $         6,750.00 
 $  370.85  $         9,271.25  No Bid  $  340.00  $         8,500.00 

 No Bid  No Bid  $  470.00  $       11,750.00 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  $  450.00  $       11,250.00 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 $    80.00  $      80.00/HR  $70.00/hr  $  180.00  $            180.00 

 Simon Contractors of South 
Dakota, Inc. 

 0 - N 30 
**PER SPECIFICATIONS

 Vance Brothers, Inc 

 n/A 
1

 Western States Asphalt, 
LLC 
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