
Buyer:  Julie Schiltz 5766 OF
Department of Transportation

Opening Date:  02/27/18
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Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

1
1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN 
ROCK DIST 2 FREMONT 
MAINT YARD

2000 TN  $            20.94  $     41,880.00  $            25.00  $     50,000.00  $               32.75  $     65,500.00 

2
1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN 
ROCK DIST 2 MORMON 
BRIDGE YARD

500 TN  $            19.75  $       9,875.00  NO BID  $               34.70  $     17,350.00 

3

1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN 
ROCK DIST 2 
PLATTSMOUTH MAINT 
YARD

2000 TN  $            17.85  $     35,700.00  $            20.00  $     40,000.00 

4
1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN 
ROCK DIST 2 MANLEY 
MAINT

500 TN  $            16.25  $       8,125.00  $            17.00  $       8,500.00 

5
1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN 
ROCK DIST 2 ELKHORN 
MAINT YARD

1000 TN  $            19.05  $     19,050.00  $            21.35  $     21,350.00 

6
1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN 
ROCK DIST 2 MELIA HILL 
MAINT

1500 TN  $            17.80  $     26,700.00  $            20.05  $     30,075.00 

7
1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN 
ROCK DIST 2 BLAIR 
MAINT YARD

1000 TN  $            21.95  $     21,950.00  NO BID  $               33.73  $     33,730.00 

8
1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN 
ROCK DIST 2 OMAHA 
108TH MAINT YARD

500 TN  $            19.25  $       9,625.00  NO BID 

9
1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN 
ROCK DIST 2 SOUTH 
OMAHA MAINT YARD

500 TN  $            19.25  $       9,625.00  NO BID 

10
1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN 
ROCK DIST 1 WAHOO 
YARD

200 TN  $            20.20  $       4,040.00  $            22.85  $       4,570.00 

11
1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN 
ROCK DIST 1 DAVID CITY 
YARD

250 TN  $            24.10  $       6,025.00  $            27.10  $       6,775.00 

12
1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN 
ROCK DIST 1 SEWARD 
YARD

250 TN  $            21.70  $       5,425.00  $            25.65  $       6,412.50 

AWARD

1 1/2" Crusher Run RockLi
ne

 # Armstrong Rentals, LLC L.G. Everist, Inc.BEATRICE SAND & GRAVEL
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Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price1 1/2" Crusher Run RockLi
ne

 # Armstrong Rentals, LLC L.G. Everist, Inc.BEATRICE SAND & GRAVEL

13
1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN 
ROCK DIST 1 SUPERIOR 
ST. YARD

200 TN  $            19.10  $       3,820.00  NO BID  $     33,730.00 

14
1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN 
ROCK DIST 1 HWY 15 MP 
12 2MI N OF FAIRBURY

750 TN  $            24.99  $     18,742.50  $            24.20  $     18,150.00 

15
1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN 
ROCK DIST 1 DUNBAR 
YARD

2000 TN  $            17.47  $     34,940.00  $            18.20  $     36,400.00 

16
PRICE PER TON MILE 
FOR ADD/ALT DELIVERY 
LOCATIONS

200 TN $   .16 Ton/mi  $              0.17  $  0.19/ton mile 

 $          299.65  $   255,522.50  $          221.40  $   222,232.50  $             101.18  $   150,310.00 

60

Comments

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms
Total

N/A   N/A
14-21
0   30

14
na   na
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1
1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN 
ROCK DIST 2 FREMONT 
MAINT YARD

2000 TN

2
1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN 
ROCK DIST 2 MORMON 
BRIDGE YARD

500 TN

3

1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN 
ROCK DIST 2 
PLATTSMOUTH MAINT 
YARD

2000 TN

4
1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN 
ROCK DIST 2 MANLEY 
MAINT

500 TN

5
1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN 
ROCK DIST 2 ELKHORN 
MAINT YARD

1000 TN

6
1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN 
ROCK DIST 2 MELIA HILL 
MAINT

1500 TN

7
1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN 
ROCK DIST 2 BLAIR 
MAINT YARD

1000 TN

8
1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN 
ROCK DIST 2 OMAHA 
108TH MAINT YARD

500 TN

9
1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN 
ROCK DIST 2 SOUTH 
OMAHA MAINT YARD

500 TN

10
1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN 
ROCK DIST 1 WAHOO 
YARD

200 TN

11
1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN 
ROCK DIST 1 DAVID CITY 
YARD

250 TN

12
1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN 
ROCK DIST 1 SEWARD 
YARD

250 TN

1 1/2" Crusher Run RockLi
ne

 #

Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

 $            23.30  $     46,600.00  $            19.35  $     38,700.00 

 $            21.65  $     10,825.00  $            17.70  $       8,850.00 

 $            18.69  $     37,380.00  $            17.55  $     35,100.00 

 $            16.76  $       8,380.00  $            16.00  $       8,000.00 

 $            20.19  $     20,190.00  $            19.20  $     19,200.00 

 $            18.79  $     28,185.00  $            17.30  $     25,950.00 

 $            22.09  $     22,090.00  $            16.45  $     16,450.00 

 $            19.98  $       9,990.00  $            17.80  $       8,900.00 

 $            19.89  $       9,945.00  $            19.05  $       9,525.00 

 $            22.44  $       4,488.00  $            21.05  $       4,210.00 

 $            26.89  $       6,722.50  $            23.75  $       5,937.50 

 $            23.45  $       5,862.50  $            23.55  $       5,887.50 

AWARD

Westover Rock & Sand Inc.James B. Wessels dba Wessels 
Trucking



Buyer:  Julie Schiltz 5766 OF
Department of Transportation

Opening Date:  02/27/18

Page 4 of 4

1 1/2" Crusher Run RockLi
ne

 #

13
1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN 
ROCK DIST 1 SUPERIOR 
ST. YARD

200 TN

14
1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN 
ROCK DIST 1 HWY 15 MP 
12 2MI N OF FAIRBURY

750 TN

15
1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN 
ROCK DIST 1 DUNBAR 
YARD

2000 TN

16
PRICE PER TON MILE 
FOR ADD/ALT DELIVERY 
LOCATIONS

200 TN

Comments

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms
Total

Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

Westover Rock & Sand Inc.James B. Wessels dba Wessels 
Trucking

 $            19.77  $       3,954.00  $            19.75  $       3,950.00 

 $            28.79  $     21,592.50  $            27.10  $     20,325.00 

 $            18.05  $     36,100.00  $            17.60  $     35,200.00 

 $   .18 CENTS  $              0.15 

 $          320.73  $   272,304.50  $          293.20  $   246,185.00 
0   0 100   30

as Requested

Line 16 is not included in the bid 
total

AS Needed
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