Buyer:

Julie Schiltz

5764 OF

Department of Roads

Opening Date: 02/22/18

Line #

1" Crusher Run Rock

Armstrong Rentals, LLC

BEATRICE SAND & GRAVEL

Gana Trucking & Excavating

Description

Qty

UoM

Unit Price

Ext. Price

Unit Price

Ext. Price

Unit Price

Ext. Price

1" CRUSHER RUN
ROCK DIST 2
FREMONT MAINT
YARD

2000

TN

$ 23.49

$ 46,980.00

$

25.00

$ 50,000.00

$ 25.22

$ 50,440.00

1" CRUSHER RUN
ROCK DIST 2
MORMON BRIDGE
YARD

500

TN

$ 22.35

$ 11,175.00

NO BID

$ 22.40

$ 11,200.00

1" CRUSHER RUN
ROCK DIST 2
PLATTSMOUTH MAINT
YARD

2000

TN

$ 19.50

$ 39,000.00

20.00

$ 40,000.00

$ 19.57

$ 39,140.00

1" CRUSHER RUN
ROCK DIST 2 MANLEY
MAINT

500

TN

$ 17.49

$ 8,745.00

17.00

$ 8,500.00

$ 17.31

$ 8,655.00

1" CRUSHER RUN
ROCK DIST 2
ELKHORN MAINT
YARD

1000

TN

$ 20.75

$ 20,750.00

21.35

$ 21,350.00

$ 21.83

$ 21,830.00

1" CRUSHER RUN
ROCK DIST 2 MELIA
HILL GRETNA MAINT
YRD

1500

TN

$ 19.80

$ 29,700.00

20.05

$ 30,075.00

$ 20.14

$ 30,210.00

1" CRUSHER RUN
ROCK DIST 2 BLAIR
MAINT YARD

1000

TN

$ 23.49

$ 23,490.00

NO BID

$ 19.01

$ 19,010.00

1" CRUSHER RUN
ROCK DIST 2 OMAHA
108TH MAINT YARD

500

TN

$ 22.75

$ 11,375.00

NO BID

$ 20.14

$ 10,070.00

1" CRUSHER RUN
ROCK DIST 2 SOUTH
OMAHA MAINT YARD

500

TN

$ 22.75

$ 11,375.00

NO BID

$ 20.14

$ 10,070.00

10

PRICE PER TON MILE
FOR ADD/ALT
DELIVERY
LOCATIONS

200

TN

$ 0.16 Ton/mile

0.17

$ 0.18

Total

$ 192.37

$ 202,590.00

$

103.40

$ 149,925.00

$ 185.76

$ 200,625.00

Payment Terms

0 30

N/A  N/A

0

0

Delivery Days ARO

14-21

60
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Buyer:

Julie Schiltz 5764 OF Opening Date: 02/22/18
Department of Roads
ﬁ 1" Crusher Run Rock Armstrong Rentals, LLC BEATRICE SAND & GRAVEL Gana Trucking & Excavating
c
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Buyer:

Julie Schiltz

5764 OF
Department of

Roads

Opening Date: 02/22/18

Line #

1" Crusher Run Rock

James B. Wessels dba Wessels
Trucking

L.G. Everist, Inc.

Westover Rock & Sand, Inc.

Description

Qty

UuoM

Unit Price

Ext. Price

Unit Price

Ext. Price

Unit Price

Ext. Price

1" CRUSHER RUN
ROCK DIST 2
FREMONT MAINT
YARD

2000

TN

$ 23.30

$ 46,600.00

$ 31.25

$ 62,500.00

$ 19.05

$ 38,100.00

1" CRUSHER RUN
ROCK DIST 2
MORMON BRIDGE
YARD

500

TN

$ 21.65

$ 10,825.00

$ 33.20

$ 16,600.00

$ 17.70

$ 8,850.00

1" CRUSHER RUN
ROCK DIST 2
PLATTSMOUTH MAINT
YARD

2000

TN

$ 18.69

$ 37,380.00

$ 17.60

$ 35,200.00

1" CRUSHER RUN
ROCK DIST 2 MANLEY
MAINT

500

TN

$ 16.76

$ 8,380.00

$ 16.05

$ 8,025.00

1" CRUSHER RUN
ROCK DIST 2
ELKHORN MAINT
YARD

1000

TN

$ 20.19

$ 20,190.00

$ 19.15

$ 19,150.00

1" CRUSHER RUN
ROCK DIST 2 MELIA
HILL GRETNA MAINT
YRD

1500

TN

$ 18.79

$ 28,185.00

$ 17.35

$ 26,025.00

1" CRUSHER RUN
ROCK DIST 2 BLAIR
MAINT YARD

1000

TN

$ 22.09

$ 22,090.00

$ 32.23

$ 32,230.00

$ 16.30

$ 16,300.00

1" CRUSHER RUN
ROCK DIST 2 OMAHA
108TH MAINT YARD

500

TN

$ 19.98

$ 9,990.00

$ 17.80

$ 8,900.00

1" CRUSHER RUN
ROCK DIST 2 SOUTH
OMAHA MAINT YARD

500

TN

$ 19.89

$ 9,945.00

$ 19.05

$ 9,525.00

10

PRICE PER TON MILE
FOR ADD/ALT
DELIVERY
LOCATIONS

200

TN

$ 0.18 CENTS

$ 0.19/ton mile

$ 0.15

Total

$ 181.34

$ 193,585.00

$ 96.68

$ 111,330.00

$ 160.05

$ 170,075.00

Payment Terms

0 0

na na

100 30

Delivery Days ARO

AS Needed

14

AS requested
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Buyer:

: 02/22/18

Julie Schiltz 5764 OF Opening Date
Department of Roads
ﬁ 1" Crusher Run Rock James B. Wessel; dba Wessels L.G. Everist, Inc. Westover Rock & Sand, Inc.
c Trucking
- Description [ Oty JuOM|[ UnitPrice | Ext. Price Unit Price |  Ext. Price Unit Price [  Ext. Price
Comments
No Bids
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K4 Trucking L.L.C.

Line 10 is NOT included in the
bid total
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