STATE OF NEBRASKA CONTRACT AWARD 301 Contonaial Sl Sath, 15t Floor

Lincoln, Nebraska 63508

OR
. P.O. Box 94847
PAGE ORDER DATE Lincoln, Nebraska 68509-4847
10f3 05/23/11 Telephone: (402) 471-2401
BUSINESS UNIT BUYER Fax: (402) 474-2089
001 SUZANNE SIEMER (AS)
VENDCR NUMBER: 500194 co‘lNZI:)’RSAg(;r NUMBER

VENDOR ADDRESS:

NEBRASKA SALT & GRAIN CO
415 W 16TH ST
GOTHENBURG NEBRASKA 69138-1302

AN AWARD HAS BEEN MADE TO THE VENDOR NAMED ABOVE FOR THE FURNISHING.OF EQUIPMENT, MATERIAL, OR SUPPLIES
AS LISTED BELOW FOR THE PERIOD:

JUNE 01, 2011 THROUGH MAY 31, 2012

NOC ACTION ON THE PART OF THE VENDOR NEEDS TG BE TAKEN AT THIS TIME. ORDERS FOR THE EQUIPMENT OR SUPFLIES
"WILL BE MADE AS NEEDED BY THE VARIOUS AGENCIES OF THE

THIS CONTRACT IS NOT AN EXCLUSIVE CONTRACT TO FUR
NOT PRECLUDE THE PURCHASE OF SIMILAR ITEMS FROM OTHE!

E EQUIPMENT OR SUPPLIES SHOWN BELOW, AND DOES
URCES.

THE STATE RESERVES THE RIGHT TO EXTEND THE PERiélﬁ 0
MUTUALLY AGREEABLE TO THE VENDOR AND THE STATE OF

HIS CONTRACT BEYOND THE TERMINATION DATE WHEN
SKA.

Original/Bid Document 12235 OC

1s, terms and conditions for a period of one (1) year
newed for cne (1) additional one (1) year period

¢ State reserves the right to extend the period of this
endor and the State of Nebraska.

Contract to supply and deliver Road Salt as per the atia
beginning June 01, 2011 through May 31, 2012. The c
when mutually agreeable to the vendor and the State of b
contract beyond the termination date when mutually ag

Contract subject to thirty (30) days cancellation by eithe itten notice.

Quantities shown are estimates only and are not to be :firm quantities. The State of Nebraska reserves the

right to increase or decrease any:guantities ho n.

The State may request that {lment Form can be
found at: hitp/fwww.das.state
The Contractor. e work eligibility
status of new employees phy: thi : ederalimmigration verification
system mean the electronic verification of the work authorization program authorlzed by the Hlegal Immigration Reform and
Responsibility Act of 1996, 8 U.S.C. 1324a, known as E-Verify Program, or an equivalent federal program designed by the
United States Department of Homeland Security or other federal agency authorized to verify the work eligibility status of a
newly hired employee.

The contractor certifies that the contractor is not presently debarred, suspended, proposed for debarment, declared ineligible,
or voluntarily excluded by any federal department or agency from participating in transactions (debarred). The contractor also
agrees 1o include the above requirements in any and all subcontracts into which it enters. The contractor shall immediately
notify the Department if, during the ferm of this contract, contractor becomes debarred. The Depariment may immediately
terminate this contract by providing contractor written notice if contractor becomes debarred during the term of this contract.

if the Contractor is an individual or sole proprietorship, the following applies:

1. The Contractor must complete the United States Citizenship Attestation Form, avallable on the Department of
Administrative Services website at: www.das.state.ne.us.

2. If the Coniractor indicates on such attestation form that he or she is a qualified alien, the Coniractor agrees to provide the
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Lincoln, Nebraska 68508
OR
P.O. Box 94847

STATE OF NEBRASKA CONTRACT AWARD 301 Contoneiat Mall South, 16t Foor

PAGE ORDER DATE ; y
Lincoln, Nebraska 685094847
20of3 05/23111 Telephone: (402) 471-2401
BUSINESS UNIT BUYER : Fax: (402) 471-2089
9001 SUZANNE SIEMER (AS)
- CONTRACT NUMBER
VENDCR NUMBER: 500194 12235 OC

US Citizenship and Immigration Services documentation require to verify the Contractor's tawful presence in the United States
using the Systematic Alien Verification for Entitlements (SAVE) Program.

3. The Contractor understands and agrees that lawful presence in the United States is required and the Contractor may be
disqualified or the contract terminated if such lawful presence cannot be verified as required by Neb. Rev. Stat. §4-108.

The parties hereby agree that the following documents are incorporated into the contract resulting from this Invitation to Bid:
1. The signed Invitation to Bid Contract document;

2. The original ITB document; . .

3. Any Addenda and or Amendments fo include Questions and Answers;

. 4. Warranty documents supplied with the bid;
5. The contract award.

of any conflict between the incorporated documents,
umber 1 receiving preference over all other documents

/ higher numbered document: 1) the contract award, 2)

h the Iatest dated amendment having the highest priority,
documents supplied with the bid.

Unless otherwise specifically stated in a contract amendment; 6_%,?9
the documents shall govern in the following order of preference Witk
and with each lower numbered document having preference:
ITB addenda or amendments, to include Questions and An%;

3) the original ITB, 4) the signed ITB Caontract document,

" Any remaining uncertainty or ambiguity shall not be interg 160 her party because such party prepared any portion
of the Agreement, but shall be interpreted according to ules of interpretation of contracts generally.

limitation on the contractor's liability is
n 2 and that any limitation of liability shall not be
cuments supplied with the contractor’s bid.

It is understood by the parties that in the State of Nebra
unconstitutionat under the Nebraska State Constitution,
binding on the Staie of Nebraska despite inclusion of su

Vendor Contact: Norman Geiken
Phone: 308-537-7191
Fax: 308-537-7193
E-Mail: N/A

THIS IS THE FIRST:RENEWAE OF THE CONTRACT 205 {polusiye ndment Oie and{TWe. (05/23/11 dig)

Ty

Unit

Line Descr| wMet Price
1 Region 1-Southeastern - Peak” ' 18,334. 54.5100
2 Region 3—West—Centralfoﬁ?Peak 21,000.0000 TN 50.5300
3 | Region 3-West-Central - Peak _ 13,000.0000 TN 61.4100
4 Region 4 - Panhandle-Off Peak B 11,000.0000 TN 58.8100
5 Region 4- Panhandie - Peak : §,000.0000 TN 65.7700
6 Region 1-Southeastern-Off Peak = : 31,666.0000 TN _ 45.2600

BUYER INITIALS

R435D0{NISCRIGT 100423




STANDARD CONDITIONS AND TERMS OF BID SOLICITATION AND OFFER Invitations to Bid and Contract Awards

It is the responsibility of the bidder to check the website for all information relevant to this sclicitation to include addenda andlor
amendments issued prior to the opening date. Webslte address: http:/iwww.das state.ne.us/materiel/purchasing/purchasing.htm

SCOPE- These standard conditions and terms of bid solicitation and acceptance apply in like force to this inquiry and o any subseguent contract resulting therefrom.
PRICES- Prices quoted shall be net, including transportation and delivery charges fully prepaid by the bidder, F.0.B. destination named in the Invitation to Bid. No
additional charges will be allowed for packing, packages or pariial delivery costs. When an arithmetic error has been made in the extended total, the unit price will govern.
EXECUTION- Bids must be signed in ink by the hidder on the State of Nebraska's Invitation to Bid form. All bids must be typewritten or in ink on the State of Nebraska's
Invitation fo Bid form. Erasures and alterations must be initialed by the bidder in ink. No telephone or voice bids will be accepted. Failure to comply with these provisions
may result in the rejection of the bid.

FACSIMILE DOCUMENTS- The State Purchasing Bureau will only accept facsimile responses to Invitations to Bid on bids under $25,0600 and up to ten (10} pages.
However, two party sealed bids containing facsimile pages are acceptable. No direct facsimile solicitation responses will be accepted for a commodity contract.
VALID BID TIME- Bids shall be firm for a minimum of sixty (80} calendar days after the opening date, unless otherwise stipulated by either party in the Invitation to Bid.
DISGOUNTS- Prices quoted shall be inclusive of ALL trade discounts. Cash discount terms of less than thirty (30) days will not be considered as part of the bid. Cash
discount periods will be computed from the date of recelpt of a propetly executed claim voucher or the date of completion of delivery of all items in a satisfactory condition,
whichever is later.

PAYMENT- Payment will be made by the responsible agency in conjunction with the State of Nebraska Prompt Payment Act 81-2401 through 2408. The State may
request that payment be made electronically instead of by state warrant.

COLLUSIVE BIDDING- The bidder guarantees that the prices quoted have been arrived at without collusion with other eligible bidders and without effort to preclude the
State of Nebraska frem obtaining the lowest possible competitive price.

LUMP SUM OR ALL OR NONE BIDS- The State reserves the right to purchase item-by-item, by groups or as a total when the State may benefit by so doing. Bidders
may submit a bid on an "all or none” or "lump sum" basis but should also submit & bid on an item-by-item basis. The term "all or none" means a conditional bid which
requires the purchase of all items on which bids are offered and bidder declines to accept award on individua! items; a "lump sum" bid is one in which the bidder offers a
lower price than the sum of the individual bids if all items are purchased but agrees to deliver individual items at the prices quoted.

SPECIFICATIONS- Any manufaciurer's names, frade names, brand names, information and/or catalog numbers listed in a specification are for reference and not
intended to limit competition, but will be used as the standard by which equivale aterial offered will be judged. The State Purchasing Director will be the sole judge of
equivalency. The bidder may offer any brand which meets or exceeds the specifi n: When a specific product is required, the Invitation to Bid will so state. Any item bid
is to be the latest current mode! under standard production at the time of order. or refurbished equipment will be accepted, unless otherwise stated.
“ALTERNATE/EQUIVALENT BIDS- Bidder may offer bids which are at varian: ‘the: express specifications of the Invitation to Bid. The State reserves the right to
consider and accept such bids i, in the judgement of the State Purchasing Dire bid will result in goods and/or services equivalent to or better than those which
would be supplied in the original bid specifications. Bidders must indicate o Tvitation to Bid the manufaciurer'’s name, number and shall submit with their bid,
sketches, descriptive literature and/or complete specifications. Reference fo literaty bmitted with & previous bid will not satisfy this provision. Bids which do not
comply with these requirements are subject to rejection. In the absence of any stated deviation: or exception, the bid will be accepted as in strict compliance with all terms,
conditions and specifications, and the bidder shall be held liable therefore. S :
SAMPLES- When requested, samples shall be furnished at the bidders expense prioritoithe:opening of the bid, unless ofherwise speciiied. Each sample must be labeled
clearly and identify the bidders name, the Invitation to Bid number and the numbe Sémp]es submitted must be representative of the commodities or equipment
which would be delivered if awarded the bid. The State of Nebraska reservi ght; cfu:est samples even though this may not have been set forth in the Invitation to
Bid. Samples not destroyed in testing will be returned at bidders expense, ill be donated to a public institution.

RECYCLING- Preference will be given to items which are manufactured o rgzbyt:!ed material or which can be readily reused or recycled after their normal
use as per State Statute Section 81-15,159. :

- LATE BIDS- All bids will be time and date stamped upon receipt by the St

the time of the bid opening will be considered late bids and will be retumed ¢
requests due to mail service inadequacies, traffic or other similar reasons. ; ;" | ‘
BID OPENING- Openings shall be public on the date and time specified on tﬁeklgviﬁtaitio
designated date, time and place of the bid opening-T&lsphone bids are not:
NO BID- If not submitting a bid, respond by returning: the InVitation 10.Bi
he cause for the removal of the bidder's name the maili
than the stated bid opening date.and time, "> '
AWARD- All purchases, Icases, of
provisions of State Statute Section 81
are not material, do not
interest of the State. .
BID TABULATIONS- Tabulations will be furnished upon:written request. A self-ad welope which must include the agency and solicitation number
must be enclosed. Bid tabulations will not be provided by telephone or facsimile. Bid files may be examined during normal working hours by appointment. Bid tabulations
are available on the website at: hitp://lwww .das stat us/materigh] ing/bidtab,

PERFORMANCE AND DEFAULT- The State reserves the right to require a performance bond from the successful bidder, as provided by law, without expense to the
State. Otherwise, in case of default of the contractor, the State may procure the atficles from other seurces and hold the contractor responsible for any excess cost
occasioned thereby.

IN-STATE PREFERENCE- A resident hidder shall be allowed a preference against a nonresident from a state which gives or requires a preference to bidders from that
stake. The preference shall be equat to the preference given or required by the state of the nonresident bidders. Where the lowest responsible bid from a resident bidder is
equal in all respects to one from a nonresident bidder from a state which has no preference law, the resident bidder shall he awarded the contract.
NONDISCRIMINATION- The Nebraska Fair Employment Practice Act prohibits contractors of the State of Nebraska, and their subcontractors, from discriminating against
any employee or applicant for employment, to be employed in the performance of such contracts, with respect to hire, tenure, terms, conditions or privileges of
employment because of race, color, religion, sex, disability, or national origin. (State Statute Sections 48-1101 through 48-1125) The bidder guarantees compliance with
the Nebraska Fair Employment Practice Act, and breach of this provision shall be regarded as a material breach of contract. The contractor shall insert a similar provision
in all subcontracts for services to be covered by any contract resulting from this Invitation to Bid.

TAXES- Purchases made by the State of Nebraska are exempt from the payment of Federal Excise Taxes, and exemption certificates will be furnished on request. State
and local taxes are exempt by State Statute Section 77-2704 (1} (m) R.R.S. 1943 and must not be included in the bid prices. Exemption by statute precludes the furnishing
of State exemption certificates.

DRUG POLICY - Bidder cerifies that it maintains a drug free work place environment to ensure worker safety and workplace integrity. Contractor agrees to provide a
copy of its drug free workplace policy at any time upon request by the State.

GRIEVANCE AND PROTEST- Grievance and protest procedure is available by contacting the buyer. Protest must be filed within ten (10) days of award.

NE ACCESS TECHNOLOGY STANDARDS- Vendor agrees to ensure compliance with Nebraska Access Technology Standards. See website at:
http:fwww.nitc.state.ne.us/standards/accessibility/

Revised: 02/2004

@réau, and this shall be the official time and date of receipt. Bids received after
r unopened. The State Purchasing Bureau is not responsible for late bids or lost

,to' Bid form. 1t is the bidder's responsibility to assure the bid is delivered at the
ptable. A bid may not be altered after opening of the bids.

explaining the'reasen in ace provided. Failure to respond to an Invitation to Bid may
o qualify-aga responden er must.submit:a "NO BID" and it must be received no later

determined according fo the
-any devlations or erors that
“manner deemed in the best
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Lincoln, Nebraska 68508

STATE OF NEBRASKA cONTRACT AMENDMENT S e e, 15t Floor

OR
PAGE ORDER DATE P.O. Box 94847
Lincoln, Nebraska 685094847
10F6 08/10/09 Telephone: (402) 471-2401
BUSINESS UNIT BUYER Fax: {(402) 471-2089

9000 SUZANNE SIEMER CONTRACT NUMBER
VENDOR NUMBER: 500194 12235 OC
VENDOR ADDRESS:

NEBRASKA SALT & GRAIN CO.
115 W 16TH ST
GOTHENBURG NE 69138-1302

THE CONTRACT PERIOD IS JUNE 20, 2008 THROUGH MAY 31, 2011,
THIS CONTRACT HAS BEEN AMENDED PER THE FOLLOWING INFORMATION:

NO ACTION ON THE PART OF THE VENDOR NEEDS TO BE TAKEN AT THIS TIME. ORDERS FOR THE EQUIPMENT OR SUPPLIES
WILL BE MADE AS NEEDED BY THE VARIOUS AGENCIES OF THE STATE.

THIS CONTRACT IS NOT AN EXCLUSIVE CONTRACT TC FURNISH THE EQUIPMENT OR SUPPLIES SHOWN BELOW, AND DOES
NOT PRECLUDE THE PURCHASE OF SIMILAR ITEMS FROM OTHER SOURCES.

THE STATE RESERVES THE RIGHT TO EXTEND THE PERIOD OF THIS CONTRACT BEYOND THE TERMINATION DATE WHEN
MUTUALLY AGREEABLE TC THE VENDOR AND THE STATE OF NEBRASKA.

Original/Bid Document 2489 OF

Contract to supply and deliver Road Salt as per the attached specifications, terms and conditions for a period of
three (3) years beginning June 20, 2008 through May 31, 2011. The contract may be renewed for two (2)
additional one (1) year periods when mutually agreeable to the vendor and the State of Nebraska. The State
reserves the right to extend the period of this contract beyond the termination date when mutually agreeable to the
vendor and the State of Nebraska.

Contract subject to thirty (30} days cancellation by either party upon written notice.

Quantities shown are estimates only and are not to be co‘n_strued to mean firm quantities. The State of
Nebraska reserves the right to increase or decrease any 'q'uantities shown.

The parties hereby agree that the following documents are 1ncorporated into the contract resulting from this
invitation to Bid:

1. The signed Invitation to Bid Contract document;

2. The original ITB document;

3. Any Addenda and or Amendments to include Questions and Answers
4, Warranty documents supplied with the bid,;

5. The contract award.

Unless otherwise specifically stated in a contract amendment, in case of any conflict between the

incorporated documents, the documents shall govern in the following order of preference with number 1

receiving preference over all other documents and with each lower numbered document having preference

over any higher numbered document: 1) the contract award, 2} ITB addenda or amendments, to include Questions
and Answers, with the latest dated amendment having the highest priority, 3) the original ITB, 4) the signed ITB
Contract document, 5) warranty documents supplied with the bid.

Any remaining uncertainty or ambiguity shall not be interpreted against either party because such party
prepared any portion of the Agreement, but shall be interpreted according to the application of rules of




Lincoln, Nebraska 68508

STATE OF NEBRASKA conNTRACT AMENDMENT B e B 1et Fioor

OR
PAGE ORDER DATE P.0. Box 94847
Lincoln, Nebrask
20F8 08/10/09 T;“s‘é&?ane? (5?2)34%326‘%847
BUSINESS UNIT BUYER Fax: (402) 471-2089
9000 SUZANNE SIEMER CONTRACT NUMBER
VENDOR NUMBER: 500194 12235 OC
L Est. Unit of Unit
Line Description Qty Measure Price

interpretation of contracts generally.

it is understood by the parties that in the State of Nebraska's opinion, any limitation on the contractor's
liability is unconstitutional under the Nebraska State Constitution, Article Xlil, Section 3 and that any
limitation of liability shall not be binding on the State of Nebraska despite inclusion of such language in
documents supplied with the contractor's bid. .

VENDOR CONTACT: Norman Geiken
PHONE: 308-537-7191
FAX: 308-537-7193

AMENDMENT ONE (1) - Contract has been amended to reflect a price increase on line items 2 through 7
effective August 1, 2009. (08/10/09 jc) .

Est. Unit of Unit

Line Description : Qty Measure Price
2 Region 1-Southeastern - Peak . : 18334 TN 54.5100
3 Region 3-West-Central-Off-Peak 21000 TN 50.5300
4 Region 3-West-Central - Peak _ 13000 TN 61.4100
5 Region 4 - Panhandle-Off Peak 11000 TN 58.8100
8 Region 4- Panhandle - Peak BOOO TN 65.7700
7 Region 1-Southeastern-Off Peak o 31666 TN 45.2600

SN

BUYER INITIALS




STANDARD CONDITIONS AND TERMS OF BID SOLICITATION AND OFFER Invitations to Bid and Contract Awards
It is the responsibility of the bidder to check the website for al information relevant to this solicitation to include addenda andfor amendments issued prior

to the opening date. Website address: http:/fwww.das state.ne.us/materielfpurchasing/purchasing htm

SCOPE- These standard conditions and terms of bid solicitation and acceptance apply in like forge to this inquiry and to any subsequent contract resulting therefrom.

PRICES- Prices quoted shall be net, including transportation and delivery charges fully prepaid by the bidder, F.O.B. destination named in the Invitation to Bid. No
additicnal charges will be allowed for packing, packages or partial delivery costs. When an arithmetic error has been made in the extended total, the unit price will
govern.

EXECUTION- Bids must be signed in ink by the bidder on the State of Nebraska’s Invitation te Bid form, All bids must be typewritten or in ink on the State of
Nebraska's Invitation to Bid form. Erasures and alterations must be initialed by the bidder in ink. No telephone or voice bids will be accepted. Failure to comply with
these provisions may result in the rejection of the bid.

FACSIMILE DOCUMENTS- The State Purchasing Bureau will only accept facsimile responses to Invitations to Bid on bids under $25,000 and up 1o ten {10) pages.
However, two party sealed bids containing facsimile pages are acceptable. No direct facsimile solicitation responses will be accepted for 2 commodity contract.

VALID BID TIME- Bids shall be firm for a minimum of sixty (60) calendar days after the cpening date, unless otherwise stipulated by either party in the Invitation to Bid.

DISCOUNTS- Prices quoted shall be inclusive of ALL trade discounts. Cash discount terms of tess than thirty (30) days will not be considered as part of the bid. Cash
discount periods wili be computed from the date of receipt of 2 properly executed claim voucher or the date of completion of delivery of all ltems In a satisfactory
condition, whichever is later.

PAYMENT- Payment will be made by the responsible agency in conjunction with the State of Nebraska Prompt Payment Act 81-2401 through 2408. The State may
request that payment be made electronically instead of by state warrant.

COLLUSIVE BIDDING- The bidder guarantees that the prices quoted have been arrived at without collusion with other efigible bidders and without effort to preciude
the State of Nebraska from cbtaining the lowest possible competitive price.

LUMP SUM OR ALL OR NONE BIDS- The State reserves the right fo purchase item-by-item, by groups or as a total when the State may benefit by so doing. Bidders
may submit a bid on an "all or none” or "lump sum" basis but should also submit a bid on an item-by-item basis. The term "alf ar none" means a conditionat bid which
requires the purchase of all items on which bids are offered and bidder declines to accept award on individual items; a "lump sum" bid is one in which the bidder offers
a lower price than the sum of the individual bids if all items are purchased but agrees to deliver individuat items at the prices quoted.

SPECIFICATIONS- Any manufacturer's names, trade names, brand names, information and/for catalog numbers listed in a specification are for reference and not
intended to limit competition, bui will be used as the standard by which equivalent material offered will be judged. The State Purchasing Director will be the sole judge
of equivalency. The bidder may offer any brand which meets or exceeds the specification. When a specific preduct is required, the Invitation fo Bid will so state, Any
itemn bid is to be the latest current model under standard production at the time of order. No used or refurbished equipment will be acceptad, unless otherwise stated.

ALTERNATE/EQUIVALENT BIDS- Bidder may offer bids which are at varfance from the express specifications of the Invitation {o Bid. The State reserves the right ta
consider and accept such bids i, in the judgement of the State Purchasing Director, the bid will result in goods and/or services equivalent 1o or better than those which
would be supplied in the original bid specifications. Bidders must indicate on the Invitation to Bid the manufacturer's name, number and shall submit with their bid,
sketches, descriptive literature and/or complete specifications. Reference to literature submitted with a previous bid will not satisfy this provision. Bids which do not
comply with these requirements aze subject to rejection. In the absence of any stated deviation or exception, the bid will be accepted as in strict compliance with all
terms, conditions and specifications, and the bidder shall be held liable therefore.

SAMPLES- When requested, samples shall be furnished at the bidders expense prior to the opening of the bid, uniess otherwise spacified. Each sample must be
labeled clearly and identify the bidders name, the Irvitation 1o Bid number and the item number. Samples submitted must be representative of the commodities or
equipment which would be delivered if awarded the bid. The State of Nebraska reserves the right to request samples even though this may not have been set forth in
the Invitation to Bid. Samples not destroyed in testing will be returned at bidders expense, if requested, or will be donated to a public institution.

RECYCLING- Preference will be given te items which are manufactured or produced from recycled materizl or which can be readily reused or recycled after their
normal use as per State Statute Section 81-15,159.

LATE BIDS- All bids will be time and date stamped upon receipt by the State Purchasing Bureau, and this shall be the official time and daie of receipt. Bids received
after the time of the bid opening will be considered late bids and will be returned fo the bidder unopened. The State Purchasing Bureau is not responsible for late bids
or lost requests due fo mail service inadequacies, traffic or other similar reasons.

BID OPENING- Cpenings shali be public on the date and time specified on the Invitation to Bid form. It is the bidder's responsibility to assure the bid is delivered at the
designated date, time and place of the bid opening. Telephone bids are not acceptable. A bid may not be altered after opening of the bids.

NO BID- If not submitting a bid, respond by refurning the Invitation to Bid form explaining the reason in the space provided. Failure to respond to an Invitation to Bid
may be cause for the removal of the bidder's name from the mailing list. NOTE: To qualify as a respondent, bidder must submit a "NO BID" and it must be received no
later than the stated bid opening daie and iime.

AWARD- All purchases, leases, or contracts which are based on competitive bids will be awarded 1o the lowest responsible bidder, determined according o the
provisions of State Statute Section §1-161, R.R.S. 1943. The State reserves the right io reject any or all bids, wholly or In part and to waive any deviations or errors
that are not material, do not invalidate the legitimacy of the bid and do not improve the bidders competitive position. All awards will be made in a manner deemed in the
best interest of the State.

BID TABULATIONS- Tabulations will be furnished upon written request. A self-addressed, stampeg envelope which must include the agency and solicitation number
must be enclosed. Bid tabulations will not be provided by telephone or facsimile. Bid files may be examined during normal working hours by appointment. Bid
tabulations are available on the website af: hitp://www.das stale.ne.us/materiel/purchasing/bidtabs.htm

PERFORMANCE AND DEFAULT- The State reserves the right fo require a performance bond from the successiul bidder, as provided by law, without expense to the
State. Otherwise, in case of default of the contractor, the State may procure the articles from other scurces and hold the contractor responsible for any excess cost
occasioned thereby.

IN-STATE PREFERENCE- A resident bidder shall be allowed a preference against a nonresident from a state which gives or requires a preference 1o bidders from that
state. The preference shall be equal fo the preference given or required by the state of the nonresident bidders. Where the lowest responsible bid from a resident
bidder is equal in all respects to ane from a nonresident bidder from a state which has no preference law, the resident bidder shall be awarded the contract.

NONDISCRIMINATION- The Nebraska Fair Employment Practice Act prohibits contractors of the State of Nebraska, and their subcontractors, from discriminating
against any employee or applicant for employment, to be employed in the performance of such contracts, with respect to hire, tenure, terms, conditions or privileges of
employment because of race, color, religion, sex, disability, or national crigin. (State Statute Sections 48-1101 through 48-1125) The bidder guarantees compliance
with the Nebraska Fair Employment Practice Act, and breach of this provision shall be regarded as a material breach of contract. The contractor shall insert a similar
provision in all subcontracts for services to be covered by any contract resulting from this Invitation to Bid.

TAXES- Purchases made by the State of Nebraska are exempt from the payment of Federal Excise Taxes, and exemption certificates will be fumished on request.
State and local taxes are exempt by State Statute Section 77-2704 (1) (m) R.R.S. 1943 and must not be included in the bid prices. Exemption by statute preciudes the
furnishing of State exemption certificates.,

DRUG POLICY - Bidder certifies that it maintains a drug free work place environment to ensure worker safety and workplace integrity. Contractor agrees to provide a
copy of its drug free workplace policy at any time upon request by the State.

GRIEVANCE AND PROTEST- Grievance and protest procedure is available by contacting the buyer. Protest must be filed within ten (10) days of award.

NE ACCESS TECHNOLOGY STANDARDS- Vendor agrees to ensure compliance with Nebraska Access Technology Standards. See website at:
hitp-Aiwww.nitc.state.ne.us/standards/accessibility/

Revised: 02/2004 30F B




STATE OF NEBRASKA conTRACT AWARD 307 Contonmial et S, 15t Foor

Lincoln, Nebraska 68508

OR
PAGE ORDER DATE P.O. Box 94847
Lincoln, Nebraska 68508-4847
10F3 06/19/08 Tlglgphone: (402) 471-2401
BUSINESS UNIT BUYER Fax: (402) 471-2089

2000 TOM MORGAN CONTRACT NUMBER
VENDOR NUMBER: 500194 12235 OC
VENDOR ADDRESS:

NEBRASKA SALT & GRAIN CO
115 W 16TH ST
GOTHENBURG NE €9138-1302

AN AWARD HAS BEEN MADE TO THE VENDOR NAMED ABOVE FOR THE FURNISHING OF EQUIPMENT, MATERIAL, OR
SUPPLIES AS LISTED BELOW FOR THE PERIOD:

JUNE 20, 2008 THROUGH MAY 31, 2011
NO ACTION ON THE PART OF THE VENDOR NEEDS TO BE TAKEN AT THIS TIME. ORDERS FOR THE EQUIPMENT OR SUPPLIES
WILL BE MADE AS NEEDED BY THE VARIOUS AGENCIES OF THE STATE.

THIS CONTRACT IS NOT AN EXCLUSIVE CONTRACT TO FURNISH THE EQUIPMENT OR SUPPLIES SHOWN BELOW, AND DOES
NOT PRECLUDE THE PURCHASE OF SIMILAR ITEMS FROM OTHER SOURCES.

THE STATE RESERVES THE RIGHT TO EXTEND THE PERIOD OF THIS CONTRACT BEYOND THE TERMINATION DATE WHEN
MUTUALLY AGREEABLE TO THE VENDOR AND THE STATE OF NEBRASKA

Original/Bid Document 2489 OF

Contract to supply and deliver Road Salt as per the attached Specifications, terms and conditions for a period of
three (3} years beginning June 20, 2008 through May 31, 2011.- The contract may be renewed for two (2)
additional one (1) year periods when mutually agreeable to the.vendor.and the Sfate of Nebraska. The State
reserves the right to extend the period of this contract beyond the terminatlon date when mutually agreeable to the

vendor and the State of Nebraska.

Contract subject to thirty (30) days cancellation by eJthe;r arty upon wntten notice.

Quantities shown are estimates only and are not to be co__ ued to! mean firm quantities. The State of
Nebraska reserves the right fo increase or decrease any gu ntltles shown

The parties hereby agree that the foliowing documents are corporated into the contract resulting from this
Invitation to Bid: £ D

1. The signed Invitation to Bid Contract document;

2. The original ITB document; - : :
3. Any Addenda and or Amendments to mCiude Questlons and Answers
4. Warranty documents supphed WJth the bid; - B
5. The contract award o

the' h:ghest prlonty, 3) rlglnal' ITB' 4)4 tne signed ITB

Contract dooument 5) warranty documents supphed with the bid.

Any remaining uncertalnty or amblgwty shall not be mterpreted against either party because such party
prepared any portion of the Agreem but shall be ipterpreted according to the application of rules of

MATERIEL ADMIMISTRATOR



STATE OF NEBRASKA coNTRACT AWARD

PAGE ORDER DATE
20F3 06/19/08
BUSINESS UNIT BUYER
9000 TOM MORGAN

State Purchasing Bureau
301 Centennial Mail Scuth, 1st Floor
Lincoln, Nebraska 68508

OR

P.O. Box 94847

Lincoin, Nebraska 68509-4847
Telephone: (402) 471-2401
Fax: (402) 471-2089

CONTRACT NUMBER
12235 OC

VENDOR NUMBER: 500194

Est.
Qty

Line Description
interpretation of contracts generally.

Unit of Unit
Measure Price

It is understood by the parties that in the State of Nebraska's opinion, any limitation on the contractor's

liability is unconstitutional under the Nebraska State Constitution, Article XIil, Section 3 and that any

limitation of liability shall not be binding on the State of Nebraska despite inclusion of such language in

documents supplied with the contractor's bid.

VENDCOR CONTACT: Norman Geiken
PHONE: 308-537-7191
FAX: 308-537-7193

Line Description

1 Region-1-Southeastern-Off-Peak

2 Region 1-Southeastern - Peak

3 Region 3-West-Central-Off-Peak

4 Region 3-West-Central - Peak

5 Region 4 - Panhandle-Off Peak

6 Region 4- Panhandle - Peak

Est. Unit of Unit

Qty Measure Price
28666 TN 42.2600
14334 TN 51.5100
18000 TN 47.5300
9000 TN 58.4100
8000 TN 55.8100
4000 TN 62.7700

BUYER INITIALS



STANDARD CONDITIONS AND TERMS OF BID SOLICITATION AND OFFER Invitations to Bid and Contract Awards
It is the responsibility of the bidder to check the wehsite for all information relevant to this solicitation to include addenda and/or amendments issued prior

to the opening date. Website address: http://www.das.state.ne.us/materielipurchasing/purchasing.htm

SCOPE- These standard conditions and terms of bid solicitation and acceptance apply in like force to this inquiry and to any subsequent contract resulting therefrom.

PRICES- Prices quoted shall be net, including fransportation and delivery charges fully prepaid by the bidder, F.0.B. destination named in the Invitation to Bid. No
additionat charges will be allowed far packing, packages or partial delivery costs. When an arithmetic error has been made in the extended total, the unit price will
govern.

EXECUTION- Bids must be signed in ink by the bidder on the State of Nebraska's Invitation to Bid form. All bids must be fypewritten or in ink on the State of
Nebraska’s Invitation te Bid form. Erasures and alterations must be initialed by the bidder in ink. No telephone or voice bids will be accepted. Failure ta comply with
these provisions may result in the rejection of the bid.

FACSIMILE DOCUMENTS- The State Purchasing Bureau will only accept facsimile responses to Invitations to Bid on bids under $25,000 and up to ten (t0) pages.
However, two party sealed bids containing facsimile pages are acceptable. No direct facsimile salicitation responsas will be accepted for a commeodity coptract.

VALID BID TIME- Bids shall be firm for a minimum of sixty (60) calendar days after the opening date, unless otherwise stipulated by either parly in the Invitation fo Bid.

DISCOUNTS- Prices quoted shall be inclusive of ALL trade discounts. Cash discount terms of less than thirty (30) days will not be considered as part of the bid. Cash
discourt periods will be computed from the date of receipt of a properly executed claim voucher or the date of completion of delivery of all items in a satisfactory
condition, whichever is later.

PAYMENT- Payment will be made by the responsible agency in conjunction with the State of Nebraska Prompt Payment Act 81-2401 through 2408. The State may
request that payment be made electronically instead of by state warrant.

COLLUSIVE BIDDING- The bidder guarantees that the prices quoted have been arrived at without collusicn with other eligible bidders and without effort to preciude
the State of Nebraska from obtaining the lowest possible competitive price.

LUMP SUM OR ALL OR NONE BIDS- The State reserves the right to purchase item-by-item, by groups or as a total when the State may benefit by sa doing. Bidders
may submit a bid on an "all or nane” or "lump sum" basis but shouid alsa subsmit a bid on an item-by-item basis. The term "all or none" means a conditional bid which
requires the purchase of all items on which bids are offered and bidder declines to accept award on individual items; a "lump sum" bid is ene in which the bidder offers
a lower price than the sum of the individual bids if all items are purchased but agrees to deliver individual items at the prices quoted.

SPECIFICATIONS- Any manufacturer's names, trade names, brand names, information and/or cataleg numbers listed in a specification are for reference and not
inlended to fimit competition, but will be used as the standard by which equivalent material offered will be judged. The State Purchasing Director will be the sole judge
of equivalency. The bidder may offer any brand which meets or exceeds the specification. When a specific product is required, the Invitation to Bid will so state. Any
item bie! s 1o be the latest current model under standard production at the time of order, No used or refurbishad equipment will be accepted, unless otherwise stated.

ALTERNATE/EQUIVALENT BIDS- Bidder may offer bids which are at variance from the express specifications of the Invitation to Bid. The State reserves the right to
consider and accept such bids if, in the judgement of the State Purchasing Director, the bid will result in goods and/or services equivalent to or better than those which
would be supplied in the original bid specffications. Bidders must indicate on the invitation to Bid the manufacturer’s name, number and shall subisit with their bid,
sketches, descriptive literature andfor complete specifications. Reference o literature submitted with a previous bid will not satisfy this provision. Bids which do not
comply with these requirements are subject to rejection. In the absence of any staled deviation or exception, the bid will be accepted as in strict compliance with afl
terms, conditions and specifications, and the bidder shall be held liable therefore.

SAMPLES- When requested, samples shall be furnished at the bidders expense prior to the opening of the bid, unless ctherwise specified. Each sample must be
labeled clearly and identify the bidders name, the Invitation to Bid number and the item number. Samples submkted must be representative of the commaodities or
equlpment which would be delivered if awarded the bid. The State of Nebraska reserves the right to request samples even though this may not have been set forth in
the Invitation to Bid. Samples not destroyed in testing will be returned at bidders expense, if requested, or will be donated to a public institution.

RECYCLING- Preference will be given to items which are manufactured or produced from recycied material or which can be readily reused or recycled after their
nermal use as per State Statute Section 84-15,159.

LATE BIDS- All bids will be time and date stamped upon receipt by the State Purchasing Bureau, and this shall be the official time and date of receipt, Bids received
after the time of the bid opening will be considered late bids and will be returned to the bidder unapened. The State Purchasing Bureau is rigt responsible for late bids
or lost requests due to malil service inadequacies, traffic or other similar reasons,

BID OPENING- Openings shall be public on the date and time specified on the Invitation to Bid form. It is the bidder’s responsibility te assure the bid is delivered at the
desighated date, time and place of the bid epening. Telephone bids are not acceptable. A bid may not be altered after opening of the bids.

NO BID- If nct submitting & bid, respond by returning the Invitation to Bid form explaining the reason in the space provided. Failure to respend to an Invitation to Bid
may be cause for the removal of the bidder's name from the mailing fist. NOTE: To quatify as a respondent, bidder must submit a "NO BID" and it must be received no
later than the stated bid epening date and time.

AWARD- All purchases, leases, or contracts which are based on competitive bids will be awardad to the lowest respensible bidder, determined according to the
provisions of State Statute Section 81-161, R.R.S. 1943, The State reserves the right to reject any or all bids, wholly or in part and to waive any deviations or errors
that are not material, do not invalidate the legitimacy of the bid and do not improve the bidders competitive position. All awards will be made in a manner deemed in the
best interest of the State.

BID TABULATIONS- Tabulations will be furnished upon wrilten request. A self-addressed, stamped envelope which must include the agency and solicitation number
must be enclosed. Bid tabulations will nat be pravided by telephone or facsimile. Bid files may be examined during normal working hours by appeintment. Bid
tabulations are available on the website at: http://www.das. state.ne.us/materiel/purchasing/bldtabs him

PERFORMANCE AND DEFAULT- The State reserves the right to require a performance bond from the successful bidder, as provided by law, without expense to the
State. Otherwise, in case of default of the contractor, the State may procure the articles from other sources and hold the contractor responsible for any excess cost
occasioned thereby.

IN-STATE PREFERENCE- A resident bidder shall be allowed a preference against a nonresident from a state which gives or requires a preference to bidders from that
state. The preference shall be equal ta the preference given or required by the state of the nonresident bidders. Where the lowest responsible bid from a resident
bidder is equal in all respects to one from a nonresident bidder from a state which has no preference law, the resident bidder shall be awarded the contract,

NONDISCRIMINATION- The Nebraska Fair Employment Practice Act prohibits contractors of the State of Nebraska, and their subcontractors, from discriminating
against any employee or applicant for employment, to be emplayed in the performance of such contracts, with respect to hire, tenure, terms, conditions or privileges of
employment because of race, color, religion, sex, disability, or national origin. (State Statute Sections 48-1101 through 48-1125) The bidder guarantees compliance
with the Nebraska Fair Emplayment Practice Act, and breach of this provision shall be regarded as a material breach of contract. The contracior shall insert a similar
provision in all subcontracts for services te be covered by any contract resulting from this invitation to Bid.

TAXES- Purchases made by the Stale of Nebraska are exempt from the payment of Federal Excise Taxes, and exempion certificates will be furnished on request,
State and local taxes are exempt by State Statute Section 77-2704 (1) (m) R.R.S. 1943 and must not be included in the bid prices. Exemption by statute preciudes the
furnishing of State exemption ceriificates.

DRUG POLICY - Bidder certifies that it maintains a drug free work place environment to ensure worker safety and workplace integrity. Contractor agrees to provide a
copy of its drug fres workplace policy at any time upon request by the State.

GRIEVANCE AND PROTEST- Grievance and protest procedure is available by contacting the buyer, Protest must be filed within ten (10) days of award.

NE ACCESS TECHNOLOGY STANDARDS- Vendor agrees to ensure compliance with Nebraska Access Technalogy Standards, See website at:
hitp:hwww.nite.state.ne.us/standards/accessibility/

Revised: 02/2004 30F 3 i



STATE OF NEBRASKA
DEPARTMENT OF ROADS

SPECIFICATION FOR HIGHWAY DEICING SALT

SCOPE
Bidder shall supply and deliver highway deicing salt that will comply with the State of Nebraska, Department of

Roads specifications and locations starting from date of award through May 31, 2011. Vendor may submit bid
for crushed rock salt or solar salt. Vendor should complete and submit “yes, no, or other” specification form
found on page 5 (crushed rock salt) or page 6 (solar sait).

RIGHTS

The State of Nebraska reserves the right to waive technicalities and to reject any or all bids.

The State reserves the right to reject any and all bids, wholly or in part, to waive any technicality in any bid, to
make awards in a manner deemed in the best interest of the State and, unless otherwise specified by the
bidder, to accept any item in the bid. The State reserves the right to issue multiple contract awards based on
the bids submitted and the requirements as set forth in the bid document. ‘

NON-COMPLIANCE STATEMENT

Read this specification carefully. Any and all exceptions fo this specification must be written on or attached to
bid document. Non-compliance can void your bid. it is the responsibility of Bidders to obtain information and
clarifications as provided below. The State of Nebraska is not responsible for any erroneous or incomplete
understands or wrongful interpretations of this Invitation to Bid by any Bidder.

No interpretation related to the meaning of bid specifications or other pre-bid documents will be made
orally to any Bidder by the State of Nebraska. Any request for bid interpretation must be put in writing
and should be submitted via e-mail to matpurch.dasmat@nebraska.gov Written questions may also be
submitted by fax to (402) 471-2089 (Inquiries received within 48 hours of bid opening may not he
addressed).

TERMS OF CONTRACT
Contract to supply and deliver highway deicing salt in accordance with the following general requirements and

attached specifications for a three (3) year period beginning from award of contract through May 31, 2011 with
the option for two renewals in one (1) year increments when mutually agreeable with the vendor and the State
of Nebraska.

BASIS OF ACCEPTANCE

Highway Deicing Salt furnished under this Contract will be accepted on the basis of the producer certifying, in
writing, the salt will be in Compliance with the Specifications for the duration of the Contract Period. The Letter
of Certification must be furnished upon notification of Contract Award within 7 days. The Certification must be
on the producer's letterhead, signed by the producer's representative and display the seal and signature of a

Notary Public

PRICE
The price bid shall be FOB destination and shall not include the Federal Transportation Tax. (The State of

Nebraska is exempt).

Bid prices shall be firm for 90 days from the date of award. The official notification to revise bid prices must be
submitted in writing & minimurm of 30 days prior to the proposed effective date of increase to State Purchasing
Bureau, 301 Centennial Mall South, Lincoln, NE 68509-4847. The State will not entertain a price increase of
less than 2%. A request to increase 2% or more must include justification, actual documentation such as
invoices that demonstrate increase in cost to all customers, not just the State of Nebraska, and is not designed
to increase profit beyond the leve! intended in the original bid price. Further documentation may be required by
the State to authenticate the increase. Failing to supply any requested supporting documentation may be
grounds to deny the proposed increase. The State further reserves the right to reject any proposed price




increase(s), cancel the contract and re-bid if determined to be in the best interest of the State. The State shall
receive full proportional benefit of decreases immediately at any time during contract period.

When a change to establish contract prices is required by the Supplier, the State Purchasing Bureau will reply,
in writing within 10 days of such notification, accepting or rejecting the revision.

Bidders must bid on price per TON. For each of the conditions listed below, the vendor will provide a single per
ton price for delivery fo all locations within the entire region. Regions are defined in the Annual Usage Section.
Current storage capacities and historical usage for each location are provided in Attachment A.

Vendors shali provide pricing for two separate conditions:
Off-Peak, Months of March through October (See Orders and Delivery Section for details)
Peak, Months of November through February (Late delivery penalties apply. See Orders and Delivery

Section for details.)
Prices must be provided for both Peak and Off-Peak and award will be for the entire period for the

duration of the contract,

Bids will be evaluated based on the Weighted Average Price, where the Off-peak price will be
multiplied by two, added to the Peak price, and the sum divided by three.

Weighted Average Price = {2(OP)+P)/3
See the Orders and Delivery Section for details on delivery reguirements.
BASIS OF PAYMENT

Contractors should forward al! invoices and supporting paperwork to the NDOR, Operations Division, P.O. Box
94759, Lincoln, NE 68509. :

Invoices must show vendor’s F.I.D. number and reference the purchase order number

It is the responsibility of the contractor to ensure stamped weight tickets are provided for each load delivered.
All delivery tickets and invoices must reference the purchase order number so they can be easily identified.

ORDERS AND DELIVERY
Orders will be faxed to the vendor by NDOR Procurement stating the location, quantity and purchase order
number. Orders and directions for delivery locations shall only be authorized by NDOR Procurement

personnel at the Operations Division in Lincoln.

Off-Peak Season (March through October) orders will be placed as needed to refill sait storage facilities.
Regular progress toward filling orders must be made. Delivery of orders placed before October 1% must be
complete by October 31%. Qrders placed during the month of October shall be completed By November 15.

Peak Season (November through February) orders will be faxed to the vendor on Wednesday of each week.
Quantities required at each location in the region will be specified. Deiivery of required quantities to each
specified location shall be completed by Friday of the following week. A penalty of $5/ton per day will be
assessed for late deliveries, not to exceed per ton bid price.

Example:
An order is placed on Wednesday, November 5, Delivery as specified in the order must be complete by 4:00

pm on Friday, November 14.

A second order is placed on Wednesday, November 12", Delivery, as specified in this order must be complete
by 4:00 pm on Friday, November 21%,

Deliveries are to be made during normal working hours, except holidays, between 8:00 a.m. and 4:00 p.m.,
Monday — Friday. if an emergency exists, delivery may be made through prior arrangements with receiving
personnel.



For the Peak Season, Maximum Weekly Order Quantities for each region have been established to enable
the vendor to meet the delivery requirements. The vendor agrees to deliver up to the maximum order quantity
each week fo locations specified on the order. The maximum weekly order quantity for each region is shown in

Table 1.

Shipments of highway deicing salt to specified locations within the region will be in truckloads of approximately
25 tons.

If the contractor cannot make delivery as stated on the order, the State of Nebraska reserves the right to
purchase highway deicing salt by any means it deems necessary to fulfill requirements and the contractor may
be held responsible for any excess cost.

As a condition of acceptance, bidder declares that it is a bona fide dealer in highway deicing salt, that it is not
primarily a transporter of goods for hire, and if awarded a contract, the contractor wilf either use its privately-
owned equipment for delivery of highway deicing salt or obtain transportation through a non-owned duly
licensed common carrier.

Random sampling of material will be done and if material does not meet specification a charge of 20% of the
per ton price will be deducted from current invoices. Sampling & testing will be done in accordance with ASTM
D632. The final decision will be with the Department of Roads Materials and Research Division.

The contractor will be notified immediately of material not meeting specifications and will be expected to take
action to correct the problem. If problems are not corrected, all shipments from that contractor will cease and
contract termination may resuit.

The contractor, in accepting an award agrees to fumish the State Purchasing Bureau 30 days prior to the
expiration of this contract, the volume purchased by the state for each location.

BREACH OF CONTRACT
If the Contractor breaches this Contract, the State of Nebraska may, at its discretion, terminate the Contract

immediately upon written notice to the Contractor. The State of Nebraska shall pay the Contractor only for such
performance as has been properly completed and is of use to the State of Nebraska. The State of Nebraska
may, at its discretion, contract for provision of the goods or services required to complete this Contract and
hold the Contractor liable for all expenses incurred in such additional contract over and above the total cost of
performance. This provision shall not preclude the pursuit of other remedies for breach of contract as allowed

by law.

CANCELLATION CLAUSE
The contract may be terminated at any time upon the mutual consent of the parties, or by either party, with or
without cause at the anniversary of the contract with 60 days written notice to the other party.




ANNUAL USAGE

The Annual Usage is based on storage capacity and historical usage. The state will guarantee purchase of at
least 80% of the Annual Usage. The vendor will guarantee delivery of 120% of the Annual Usage. The Annual
Usage includes deliveries at all times throughout the year.

The state is divided into four geographic regions and each will be bid separately. Regions are shown on the
attached map and are established as follows:

Southeastern Region comprises Districts 1 and 2.

East-Central Region comprises Districts 3 and 4.

West-Central Region comprises Distticts 6, 7 and 8.

Panhandle Region is District 5.

Table 1
Region 80% Quantity | Expected Annual 120% Max. Weekly
: Guaranteed Usage Guaranteed Order Qty
purchase (tons) Delivery {Peak Nov-Feh)

(tons) (tons) (tons)

Southeastern 34,400 43,000 51,600 1,200

East-Centrai 33,600 42,000 50,400 1,200
West-Central 21,600 27,000 32,400 800
Panhandle 9,600 12,000 14,400 500

Expected Annual Usage will be reviewed and may be adjusted each year 60 days prior to the anniversary date
of the contract.

Capacities and historical usage for alf location within each region are provided in Attachment A. Delivery is
required to all locations within the region, as specified in the orders. Maximum Weekly Order Quantities during
the peak season apply to the region as a whole.



SALT SHEDS IN SOUTHEAST
REGION - Districts 1 and 2 -

STORAGE CAPACITY AND
ANNUAL USAGE (TONS)
2008 2007 - 2008
DISTRICT #1 CAPACITY Annual Usage
AUBURN 1,200 1,760
BEATRICE 650 1,354
DAVID CITY 1,250 2,251
DORCHESTER 250 262
FAIRBURY 300 785
FALLS CITY 400 600
GREENWQOOD 1,650 1,126
LINCOLN - SALT VALLEY 900 1,246
LINCOLN - 302 SUPERIOR ST 1,000 1,728
NEBRASKA CITY 1,400 513
PALMYRA 1,600 1,511
PAWNEE CITY 350 955
SEWARD 350 565
SYRAEUSE 234 flote!
TECUMSEH 325 900
WAHCO 250 1,080
WILBUR 1,000 584
Total 13,125 17,485
2008 2007 - 2008
DISTRICT #2 CAPACITY Annual Usage
BLAIR 350 1,397
ELKHORN 520 3.281
FREMONT 350 2,937
OMAHA SOUTH 350 350
OMAHA-MORMAN BRIDGE 350 350
OMAHA-DOME 13,200 14,072
PAPILLION 950 1,796
PLATTSMOUTH 350 975
Total 16,420 25,158
TOTAL FOR REGION 29,545 42,643



SALT SHEDS IN EAST CENTRAL
REGION - Districts 3 and 4 -
STORAGE CAPACITY AND
ANNUAL USAGE (TONS)

2007 -
DISTRICT # 3 2008 CAPACITY
ALBION 400
BLOOMFIELD 500
CLARKSON 530
COLUMBUS 400
CROFTON 525
DAKOTA CITY 200
HARTINGTON 450
HUMPHREY 400
LAUREL 750
LYONS 200
NELIGH 1,450
NIOBRARA 600
NORFOLK 8,000
PLAINVIEW 400
SO.SI0UX CITY 270
WAYNE 350
WEST POINT 250
Total 15,675
2007 -
DISTRICT #4 2008 CAPACITY
AURORA 400
CENTRAL CITY 400
FULLERTON 400
GENEVA 250
GRAND ISLAND 400
GREELEY 400
HASTINGS 1,200
HEBRON 250
KEARNEY I-80 850
KEARNEY W HWY 30 650
LOUP CITY 250
ORD . 250
OSCEOLA 400
RAVENNA 400
RED CLOUD 250
SHELTON 1,000
ST PAUL 600
STRANG 3,450
SUPERIOR 250
YORK 3,000
Total 15,050
TOTAL FOR REGION 30,725

2008 Annual
Usage
480
1,349
765
1,438
338
520
1,123
242
1,056
1,031
1,839
901
5,814
776
710
1,464
1,069
20,909

2008 Annual
Usage
856
601
603
225
925
453
1,022
894
838
734
170
418
1,373
357
441
1,200
946
4,197
611
4,961
21,824

42,744



SALT SHEDS IN WEST
CENTRAL REGION - Districts

6,7 and 8 - STORAGE
CAPACITY AND ANNUAL

USAGE (TONS)
2008 2007 - 2008 Annuai
DISTRICT #6 CAPACITY Usage
ANSLEY 174
BIG SPRINGS 1,800 1,220
BROKEN BOW 400 807
GOTHERNBURG-DOME 13,500 10,950
LEXINGTON 400 400
NORTH PLATTE 1-80 400 527
NORTH PLATTE W 30 400 375
OGALLALA 400 322
STAPLETON 1,200 1,085
SUTHERLAND 250 461
THEDFORD 400 666
Total 19,150 16,987
2008 2007 - 2008 Annual
BISTRIETE7Y ERPRCITY Usage
ALMA 400 699
ARAPAHOE 400 623
BENKELMAN 400 613
ELWOOD 400 453
FRANKLIN 400 425
GRANT 400 591
HAYES CENTER 400 471
HOLDREGE 400 554
IMPERIAL 400 519
MAYWOOD 400 352
MCCOOK 400 731
MINDEN 400 696
Totaf 4,800 6,727
2008 2007 - 2008 Annual
DISTRICT # 8 CAPACITY Usage
AINSWORTH 400 391
ATKINSON 400 257
BARTLETT 500 195
BURWELL 250 425
O'NEILL 400 495
SPENCER 400 285
VALENTINE 400 94
MERRIMAN 0
SPRINGVIEW G
Total 2,750 2,142
TOTAL FOR REGION 26,700 25,856




SALT SHEDS IN PANHANDLE
REGION - District 5 - STORAGE
CAPACITY AND ANNUAL

USAGE (TONS)
2008 2007 - 2008 Annual

DISTRICT #5 CAPACITY Usage
ALLIANCE 201
BRIDGEPORT 400 656
CHADRON 500 1,282
CHAPPELL 400 1,092
CRAWFORD 450 1,349
GERING 1,200 1,908
GORDON 450 432
HARRISON 600 914
KIMBALL 400 2,462
CSHKOSH 400 292
SIDNEY 400 1,257

Total 5,200 11,845






