Buyer: Rick Nunemaker

CA-5758; CSCO0O-2-02026J MEDICAL PRODUCTS

Bid Opening: 11/1/01

Capital Enterprises Food Express Henry Schein, Inc. Home-Aid-Healthcare, Inc*
DESCRIPTION SIZE SPECIFY UNIT SPECIFY UNIT SPECIFY UNIT SPECIFY
BRAND, SIZE . o, CASE | BRAND,SIZE ... CASE BRANDSIZE . . .. CASE BRANDSIZE UNITPRICE CASE
and COUNT EACH QTY and COUNT EACH QTY and COUNT EACH QTY and COUNT BY EACH QTY
BIDDING BIDDING BIDDING BIDDING
ACNE TREATMENT MAX |1 o0z Acne 10 Clearasil
1 CREME 1507 Lotion $ 136 12 0.607 $ 366 24 NO BID NO BID
2 NASAL SPRAY, AFRIN 120z -KEAMN™ g 126 12 Medalist1oz $ 1.50 12 Afrin $ 853 Altare  $ 0.950 36
15ml Genericloz $ 1.84
INSOLES, DR
SCHOLLS, AIR
PILLOW, WORKING,
3 AEROBIC, VARIOUS PR NO BID NO BID NO BID Dr.Scholls  $ 2.090 144
SIZES - CUT TO SIZE
BRAND NOT
ACCEPTABLE
INSOLES, GENERIC,
VARIOUS SIZES, CUT
4 7O SIZE BRAND NOT PR NO BID NO BID NO BID Saderma | $ 2.375 12
ACCEPTABLE
A 5 Tolnaf::te 15 ¢ 1.88 144
5 MICATIN CREAM NO BID _g - NO BID Upjohn $ 5630 24
oz Tinactin $ 6.08 36
15gm )
MAX 5
6 MICATIN POWDER 07 NO BID NO BID $ 5.89 40z $ 4730 24
7 PREPARATIONH 1NE|>AOXZ NO BID Anusolloz | $ 447 24 NO BID 20z $ 8590 24
8 ' TEARS NATURAL 502z NO BID Generic $ 145 24 Generic $ 1.13 Watson $ 1690 72
9 TRONOLONE CREAM | 1-2 0OZ NO BID 20z $ 549 36 NO BID Ross 1oz | $ 3.260| 36

S/H $10 on all orders < $100




Buyer: Rick Nunemaker CA-5758; CSCO-2-02026J MEDICAL PRODUCTS Bid Opening: 11/1/01

PARTIAL AWARD, see
highlighted items
Keefe Supply Medline Industries Midland Medical Supply Co
DESCRIPTION SIZE SPECIFY SPECIFY UNIT SPECIFY UNIT
BRAND, SIZE | UNIT PRICE CASE BRAND, SIZE PRICE BY CASE | BRAND, SIZE PRICE BY CASE
and COUNT BY EACH QTY and COUNT EACH QTY and COUNT EACH QTY
BIDDING BIDDING BIDDING
ACNE TREATMENT MAX
1 CREME 1507 1oz $ 136 12 NO BID
2 NASALSPRAY,AFRIN 1-20Z 1oz $ 117 12 LONGACtng o g4 g Afin  $ 7.95
1 oz Nasal
INSOLES, DR
SCHOLLS, AIR
PILLOW, WORKING,
3 AEROBIC, VARIOUS PR NO BID NO BID
SIZES - CUT TO SIZE
BRAND NOT
ACCEPTABLE
INSOLES, GENERIC,
VARIOUS SIZES, CUT .
4 10 SIZE BRAND NOT PR 2 pair $ 107 12 NO BID
ACCEPTABLE
MAX 5 . .
5 MICATIN CREAM 07 NO BID 1oz $ 273 1 Tinactin30z| $ 8.85
MAX 5 . .
6 MICATIN POWDER 07 NO BID 150zBottle $ 271 1 Tinactn3o0z $ 5.65
MAX
7 PREPARATION H 1507 20z $ 208 12 20z $ 220 1 loz $ 524
8 TEARS NATURAL 50z 50z $ 119 12 0.5 0z $ 141 1 .50z $ 8.00
9 TRONOLONE CREAM | 1-20Z  NO BID 20z $ 575




Buyer: Rick Nunemaker CA-5758; CSCO-2-02026J MEDICAL PRODUCTS Bid Opening: 11/1/01

PARTIAL AWARD- see
highlighted items
Omaha Medical Supplies Progressive Medical Union Supply Company, Inc Village Sundries & Tobacco
Supply Inc. Inc
DESCRIPTION SIZE SPECIFY SPECIFY UNIT SPECIFY UNIT SPECIFY UNIT
BRAND, SIZE | UNITPRICE| CASE ' BRAND, SIZE PRICE BY CASE BRAND, SIZE PRICE BY CASE | BRAND, SIZE PRICE BY CASE
and COUNT BY EACH QTY and COUNT EACH QTY and COUNT EACH QTY and COUNT EACH QTY
BIDDING BIDDING BIDDING BIDDING
ACNE TREATMENT MAX MD Forte Ambi
0,
CREME 1.50Z  Glycare Gel $ 1799 12 .025% $ 5.99 1 NO BID NO BID
10gm
NASAL SPRAY, AFRIN | 1-2 OZ NO BID NO BID NO BID Afrin1/20z $ 5.13 6
INSOLES, DR
SCHOLLS, AIR
PILLOW, WORKING,
AEROBIC, VARIOUS PR NO BID Dr. Scholls $ 2.38 1 DrScholls | $ 2.68 36 NO BID
SIZES - CUT TO SIZE
BRAND NOT
ACCEPTABLE
INSOLES, GENERIC,
VARIOUS SIZES, CUT
7O SIZE BRAND NOT PR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ACCEPTABLE
MAX 5
MICATIN CREAM 07 NO BID loz $11.45 1 NO BID NO BID
MAX 5
MICATIN POWDER 07 NO BID 3oz $ 7.21 1 NO BID NO BID
MAX | Hemorrhoida
PREPARATION H 1507 | Cream USA $ 599 12 9oz $ 7.03 1 NO BID loz $ 5.19 6
8 [ TEARS NATURAL 50z NO BID 5oz \ $ 11.48\ 1 NO BID NO BID
TRONOLONE CREAM | 1-2 OZ NO BID loz $ 435 1 NO BID NO BID




