Buyer: Ruth Gray

960 OF

Bid Opening: 09/09/05

NETC
AWARD
. Lucid, Inc. Axcera, LLC
Television Translator Unit Price Unit Price
K68AV/K24 GQ, Blair, NE $7,262.00 *$20,700.00

Brand and Model # bidding:

Technalogix TLU-10

Axcera LU10AL

1 _ *Price includes environmental enclosure (2)
Comment: : .
options for item No. 1.
5 K66AR/K341B, Decatur, NE $7,262.00 $11,150.00
Brand and Model # bidding: Technalogix TLU-10 Axcera LUL0AL
3 K65AT/K5010, Neligh, NE $10,540.00 $14,150.00
Brand and Model # bidding: Technalogix TLU-100 Axcera LUL00AL
K69BM/K14MI, Niobrara, NE $6,706.00 *$20,400.00
4 Brand and Model # bidding: Technalogix TLU-5 Axcera LULAL
_ *Price includes environmental enclosure (2)
Comment: : .
options for item No. 4.
5 K69BN/K201J, Wauneta, NE $6,706.00 $11,150.00
Brand and Model # bidding: Technalogix TLU-5 Axcera LUL0AL
6 K06JC, Chadron, NE $7,651.00 $14,740.00
Brand and Model # bidding: Technalogix TLV-25 Axcera LV20AL
7 |Performance Bond Did not comply $2,325.00
Translator(s) Delivery Schedule: 60 %
Days After Receipt of Order
External Weatherproof Enclosure for No bid Unit Price
8 Item No. 1 $5,900.00
Comment: Vendor provided pricing for Vented
' Equipment Enclosure w/ Mounting Kit
External Weatherproof Enclosure for No bid Unit Price
Item No. 4 $8,900.00
9 Vendor provided pricing for Environmentally
Comment: Controlled Enclosure w/ Mounting Kit
includes AC/Heater
Payment Terms 1% 10 Days 0%
Comment:
No Bid Late Bid Late No Bid
Larcan Paola Fregoso Acrodyne Industries

Professional Video Supply, LLC

Bid Rejected
Lucid, Inc.-see attached for justification

Lucid's bid is non-compliant for the following reasons:

(Lucid is a distributor bidding Technalogix television translators.)
The RF tuner section of the processor is a 50 ochm input, not 75 ohm as required in the bid.

The specifications stated that the bidder must provide an external weatherproof enclosure for the translator systems for
the Blair and Niobrara sites. Lucid did not supply a bid for these two (2) external enclosures as required.

Performance Bond - Lucid did not provide the option for the State to request a certified check or performance bond as
stated in the specifications. Lucid's response was "the state will receive and accept goods prior to payment.”

Lucid only submitted a list of three references to include address (station), contact name and telephone number versus
the five requested. Lucid provided a list of testimonials, but contact information was not provided. NETC attempted to
contact all three references numerous times over a three week period. One of the contacts responded, but reported that
the Technalogix systems must be kept in a controlled environment because the frequency tends to drift with temperature
changes. The responder told NETC that he had six (6) of these systems and they all have this problem. NETC has a
real concern with this as none of the translator sites in question have an a controlled environment. The temperature at
each location will be the same as ambient outside temperature. The translators are in locations where NETC does not
have technicians on site. Translator systems with these issues cannot be considered by NETC for use at these sites.




