
Buyer: Mary Lanning 858 OF
Department of Roads

Opening date: 06/14/2005

 Unit Price  Ext. Price  Comments  Unit Price  Ext Price  Comments  Unit Price  Ext Price  Comments 

1 Poly Contrast III RC Paper 
Med, 122-4645 10   8"x10" 

100/box  $       44.64  $     446.40 

 Poly 
Contrast IV, 
Glossy, 166-
2568 

 $       42.88  $       428.80 

 Poly 
Contrast IV, 
glossy, 166-
2568 
KP54030 

 $       43.08  $       430.80  10 or more 

2 Panalure Select RC Paper 
FM 126-3037 2  8"x10" 

250/box  $     177.87  $     355.74  No Bid  $       78.61  $       157.22 

 replaced by 
8604324, panalure 
select RC paper F 
100/box 

3 Poly Contrast Rapid Paper 
RC 133-0232 1  16"x20" 

50/box  $       85.06  $       85.06  Glossy, 844-
0604  $       86.91  $         86.91 

 IV Glossy, 
844-0604, 
KP54058 

 $       82.08  $         82.08 

 Replaced by 
1757889 
Polycontrast IV RC 
Paper (N) 16x20 
50/box 

4 Kodak Accumax 2000 
RA 887-5569 60  5liter  No Bid  $       52.88  $    3,172.80 

5 Rapid Fixer Cubitainer A 
197-3247 30  5 gallon  $       93.33  $    2,799.90  1/cs, 

KP02030  $       61.18  $    1,835.40 

6 Polycontrast III Paper E 
889-6904 3 40" x 164"

 roll  $     335.67  $  1,007.01 
 844-6742, 
101.6 sm x 
50 m 

 $     492.55  $    1,477.65 
 IV, 889-
7183, 
KP54108 

 $     323.90  $       971.70 
 Replaced by 844-
6742 Polymax II (E) 
40"x50 Meters 

7 Rapid Fixer Solution B
173-3013 4  72 oz each  $       10.00  $         40.00  KP02032  $         7.83  $         31.32 

8 Ektacolor Supra Paper E
882-3908 40  8"x10" 

100/box  $       34.12  $  1,364.80  $       33.15  $    1,326.00  KP48206  $       32.92  $    1,316.80 

9 Ektacolor Supra Paper E 
142-9208 2  11"x14"     

50/box  $       33.42  $       66.84  $       32.45  $         64.90  KP48220  $       32.24  $         64.48 

10 Ektacolor Supra Paper E 
179-9253 2 16"x20"

50/box  $       64.84  $     129.68  $       66.25  $       132.50  KP48226  $       62.57  $       125.14 

11 Ektacolor Supra Paper E 
190-8375 1 20"x24"

50/box  $       96.59  $       96.59  $       98.69  $         98.69  KP48232  $       93.20  $         93.20 

12 Ektacolor Supra Paper F 
166-0323 50 11"x14"

 50/box  $       33.42  $  1,671.00  $       32.45  $    1,622.50  KP48222  $       32.24  $    1,612.00 

13 Cotton Gloves Lg TIF   807-
2761 20  12pr/box  $       27.50  $       550.00  KK9493  $       22.92  $       458.40 

14 C-41 Flexicolor Developer 
192-7698 20  1gallon  $     150.60  $    3,012.00  12/cs, 

KP02840  $     119.16  $    2,383.20 

15 C-41 Flexicolor Bleach III 
894-0801 20 1gallon  $       75.60  $    1,512.00  2/cs, 

KP02869  $       49.36  $       987.20 

 Enovation Graphic Systems 
Film & Chemistry Supplies Qty

 Calumet Photo 
Model# 
size/um

 Bernie's Photo  
 SEE ATTACHED EXPLANATION 

 PARTIAL AWARD 
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Buyer: Mary Lanning 858 OF
Department of Roads

Opening date: 06/14/2005

 Unit Price  Ext. Price  Comments  Unit Price  Ext Price  Comments  Unit Price  Ext Price  Comments 

 Enovation Graphic Systems 
Film & Chemistry Supplies Qty

 Calumet Photo 
Model# 
size/um

 Bernie's Photo  
 SEE ATTACHED EXPLANATION 

 PARTIAL AWARD 

16 C-41 Fixer & Replenisher 
169-3837 4 1gallon  $       67.60  $       270.40  4/cs, 

KP02854  $       29.60  $       118.40 

17 C-41 Final Rinse & 
Replenisher 813-6368 6  $     124.44  $       746.64  12/cs, 

KP02912  $       66.72  $       400.32 

18 Ekatcolor RA Developer 
Starter  102-6681 6  9.5 liter  $       14.55  $         87.30  1/cs, 

KP04040  $       33.92  $       203.52 

19
Ekatcolor RA Dev/Replenish 

Rt.
841-5580

200  10 liter  $     106.80  $  21,360.00  4/cs 
KP04043  $       72.24  $  14,448.00 

20 Ekatcolor RA Bleach-Fix & 
Rep 830-9031 200  10 liter  $     127.08  $  25,416.00  4/cs 

KP04045  $       72.52  $  14,504.00 

21
Ekatcolor RA Control Strips 

(RA-4/RA-4NP)
828-2170

110  50/box  $       69.99  $    7,698.90  KK9870  $       49.22  $    5,414.20 

22 Ekatcolor Stabilizer RA-4 MX-
1624 826-4442 100  10 liter  $     227.40  $  22,740.00  12/cs, 

KP04057  $     148.56  $  14,856.00 

23 Flexicolor SM Tank Bleach 
882-4690 55  2.7 liter  $       75.70  $    4,163.50  2/cs, 

KP02938  $         7.22  $       397.10 

24 Flexicolor SM Tank 
Developer 175-6337 50  2 liter  $       25.80  $    1,290.00  6/cs, 

KP02933  $       21.66  $    1,083.00 

25 Flexicolor SM Tank Fixer 
846-2681 30  3.7 liter  $       17.20  $       516.00  2/cs, 

KP02926  $       14.54  $       436.20 

26 Flexicolor Sm Tank Stabilizer 
192-5254 30  1.5 liter  $       28.20  $       846.00  12/cs, 

KPO2927  $       23.76  $       712.80 

27 Flexicolor SM-F1 Proc Unit 
Rep. 874-0110 20  $     141.42  $    2,828.40  2/cs 

KP02937  $     119.72  $    2,394.40 

28 Flexicolor SM-F2 Proc Unit 
Rep.117-3319 30  $       78.90  $    2,367.00  2/cs 

KP02921  $       33.39  $    1,001.70 
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Buyer: Mary Lanning 858 OF
Department of Roads

Opening date: 06/14/2005

 Unit Price  Ext. Price  Comments  Unit Price  Ext Price  Comments  Unit Price  Ext Price  Comments 

 Enovation Graphic Systems 
Film & Chemistry Supplies Qty

 Calumet Photo 
Model# 
size/um

 Bernie's Photo  
 SEE ATTACHED EXPLANATION 

 PARTIAL AWARD 

29 Process C-41 Control Strips 
151-9677 10  50/box  $       64.99  $       649.90  KK9854  $       45.28  $       452.80 

30 Kodak Supra III Paper
804-9470 24 6" roll  $       88.10  $  2,114.40 

 Supra 
Endura F, 
190-6593, 
15.2cm x 
176m 

 $     143.25  $    3,438.00 
 glossy, 190-
6593, 
KP48271 

 $     135.26  $    3,246.24  Replaced by 
1906593 

31 Kodak Supra III Paper 828-
7187 40 6" roll  $       88.10  $  3,524.00 

 Supra 
Endura N, 
190-6247, 
15.2cm x 
176m 

 $     143.25  $    5,730.00 
 "N", 109-
6247, 
KP48272 

 $     135.26  $    5,410.40  Replaced by 
1096247 

32 Kodak Supra III Paper 120-
5319 10  8" roll  $     117.46  $  1,174.60 

 Supra 
Endura N 
137-2291, 
20.3cm x 
176m 

 $     189.20  $    1,892.00 
 "N", 137-
2291, 
KP48285 

 $     178.68  $    1,786.80  Replaced by 
1372291 

33 Kodak Supra II Paper
837-3920 5 5" roll  No Bid  $       57.49  $       287.45  Replaced by 

8939639 
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Buyer: Mary Lanning 858 OF
Department of Roads

Opening date: 06/14/2005

 Unit Price  Ext. Price  Comments  Unit Price  Ext Price  Comments  Unit Price  Ext Price  Comments 

 Enovation Graphic Systems 
Film & Chemistry Supplies Qty

 Calumet Photo 
Model# 
size/um

 Bernie's Photo  
 SEE ATTACHED EXPLANATION 

 PARTIAL AWARD 

34 Kodabrome II RC Paper   N2 
192-3580 20 10"x10"  $     198.16  $  3,963.20 

 897-7258, 
25.4cm x 
25.4cm 

 No Bid  $     191.11  $    3,822.20  Replaced by 
8977258 

35 Plus-X Aerographic Film
162-0608 5  Spec 981 

9.5"x 250' roll  $     560.04  $  2,800.20  No Bid  $     540.34  $    2,701.70 

36 Double-X Aerographic Film 
162-1366 10  Spec 981 

9.5"x 250' roll  $     569.92  $  5,699.20  No Bid  $     549.89  $    5,498.90 

37 Kodabrome II RC Paper N4 
192-3978 15  10"x10" 

250/box  $     198.16  $  2,972.40  No Bid  $     191.11  $    2,866.65 

38 Infrared Aerographic Film 
162-1580 3 Spec 981 

9.5"x 250' roll  $  1,866.04  $  5,598.12 
 must order 
min/multiple
s of 5 (qty 5) 

 No Bid  n/a  n/a 

39 Ilfotec Rt Rap Film Dev/Start 
INF 180-7813 5   1liter  No Bid  $     110.50  $       552.50  Min order of 5, non-

stock/non-returnable 

40 Ilfotec RT Rapid Film Dev 
878-176 10 2x5 liter  No Bid  $       79.98  $       799.80 

41 Ilfospeed 2000 Fix/Rep Conc 
INF 1817986 570425 6  2.5 gallon  No Bid  $       26.06  $       156.36 

 Replaced by 
1918409, 10-liter 
cube/makes 50 liters 

net 30 days

15-45 businessDelivery Date

Comments 

Payment Terms
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Buyer: Mary Lanning 858 OF
Department of Roads

Opening date: 06/14/2005

1 Poly Contrast III RC Paper 
Med, 122-4645 10   8"x10" 

100/box

2 Panalure Select RC Paper 
FM 126-3037 2  8"x10" 

250/box

3 Poly Contrast Rapid Paper 
RC 133-0232 1  16"x20" 

50/box

4 Kodak Accumax 2000 
RA 887-5569 60  5liter 

5 Rapid Fixer Cubitainer A 
197-3247 30  5 gallon

6 Polycontrast III Paper E 
889-6904 3 40" x 164"

 roll

7 Rapid Fixer Solution B
173-3013 4  72 oz each

8 Ektacolor Supra Paper E
882-3908 40  8"x10" 

100/box

9 Ektacolor Supra Paper E 
142-9208 2  11"x14"     

50/box

10 Ektacolor Supra Paper E 
179-9253 2 16"x20"

50/box

11 Ektacolor Supra Paper E 
190-8375 1 20"x24"

50/box

12 Ektacolor Supra Paper F 
166-0323 50 11"x14"

 50/box

13 Cotton Gloves Lg TIF   807-
2761 20  12pr/box

14 C-41 Flexicolor Developer 
192-7698 20  1gallon 

15 C-41 Flexicolor Bleach III 
894-0801 20 1gallon

Film & Chemistry Supplies Qty Model# 
size/um  Unit Price  Ext Price  Comments  Unit Price  Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Comments  Unit Price  Ext Price Comments

 $       36.50  $     365.00  $       39.95  $     399.50  $       38.85  $        388.50 

 $       81.36  $     162.72  $     178.00  $     356.00  No Bid  $       71.00  $        142.00 
8604324, 
100 sheet 
box

 $       84.96  $       84.96  $       80.00  $       80.00  $       83.95  $       83.95  $       78.85  $          78.85 

 $       29.95  $  1,797.00  $       64.50  $     3,870.00 2-5 litres 
pencare

 $       90.95  $  2,728.50  $       74.00  $     2,220.00 

 $     326.50  $     979.50  $     335.00  $  1,005.00  $     350.95  $  1,052.85  $     320.00  $        960.00 

 $       15.95  $       63.80  $         9.85  $          39.40 

 $       33.18  $  1,327.20  $       34.00  $  1,360.00  $       27.95  $  1,118.00  $       22.00  $        880.00 

 $       32.50  $       65.00  $       29.95  $       59.90  $       27.00  $          54.00 

 $       63.06  $     126.12  $       63.00  $     126.00  $       49.95  $       99.90  $       56.00  $        112.00 

 $       93.95  $       93.95  $       94.00  $       94.00  $       82.95  $       82.95  $       83.00  $          83.00 

 $       32.50  $  1,625.00  $       29.95  $  1,497.50  $       27.00  $     1,350.00 

 $       26.95  $     539.00  $         9.00  $        180.00 

24  $       13.95  $     334.80 
 must 
purchase in 
Qty of 12 

 $     117.00  $     2,340.00 12/cs

 $       41.95  $     839.00  $       54.00  $     1,080.00 2/cs

Unique Photo  Valley Litho Supply  National Graphic Supply 
QtyQty

 HPI International Inc 
 SEE ATTACHED EXPLANATION 

 PARTIAL AWARD 
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Buyer: Mary Lanning 858 OF
Department of Roads

Opening date: 06/14/2005

Film & Chemistry Supplies Qty Model# 
size/um

16 C-41 Fixer & Replenisher 
169-3837 4 1gallon

17 C-41 Final Rinse & 
Replenisher 813-6368 6

18 Ekatcolor RA Developer 
Starter  102-6681 6  9.5 liter 

19
Ekatcolor RA Dev/Replenish 

Rt.
841-5580

200  10 liter

20 Ekatcolor RA Bleach-Fix & 
Rep 830-9031 200  10 liter 

21
Ekatcolor RA Control Strips 

(RA-4/RA-4NP)
828-2170

110  50/box

22 Ekatcolor Stabilizer RA-4 MX-
1624 826-4442 100  10 liter 

23 Flexicolor SM Tank Bleach 
882-4690 55  2.7 liter

24 Flexicolor SM Tank 
Developer 175-6337 50  2 liter 

25 Flexicolor SM Tank Fixer 
846-2681 30  3.7 liter 

26 Flexicolor Sm Tank Stabilizer 
192-5254 30  1.5 liter 

27 Flexicolor SM-F1 Proc Unit 
Rep. 874-0110 20

28 Flexicolor SM-F2 Proc Unit 
Rep.117-3319 30

 Unit Price  Ext Price  Comments  Unit Price  Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Comments  Unit Price  Ext Price Comments

Unique Photo  Valley Litho Supply  National Graphic Supply 
QtyQty

 HPI International Inc 
 SEE ATTACHED EXPLANATION 

 PARTIAL AWARD 

 $       46.00  $     184.00  $       13.95  $       55.80  $       31.75  $        127.00 4/cs

 $         6.95  $       41.70  $       71.00  $        426.00 12/cs

 $       14.95  $       89.70  $         8.75  $          52.50 1/cs

 $       29.95  $  5,990.00  $       74.00  $   14,800.00 4/cs

 $       28.95  $  5,790.00  $       74.00  $   14,800.00 4/cs

 $       50.95  $  5,604.50 

 All control 
strips must 
ship over 
night, 
$25.00 
freight fee 

 $       49.50  $     5,445.00 

96  $       14.95  $  1,435.20 
 must 
purchase 
qty's of 12 

 $     143.00  $   14,300.00 12/cs

54  $       46.95  $  2,535.30 

 must 
purchase in 
quantities of 
2 

 $       64.00  $     3,520.00 2/cs

48  $         8.95  $     429.60 
 must 
purchase in 
qty's of 6 

 $       24.50  $     1,225.00 6/cs

 $       20.95  $     628.50  $       16.00  $        480.00 2/cs

24  $         4.95  $     118.80 
 must 
purchase in 
qty's of 12 

 $       26.00  $        780.00 12/cs

 $       80.95  $  1,619.00  $     118.00  $     2,360.00 2/cs

 $       49.95  $  1,498.50  $       70.00  $     2,100.00 2/cs
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Buyer: Mary Lanning 858 OF
Department of Roads

Opening date: 06/14/2005

Film & Chemistry Supplies Qty Model# 
size/um

29 Process C-41 Control Strips 
151-9677 10  50/box

30 Kodak Supra III Paper
804-9470 24 6" roll

31 Kodak Supra III Paper 828-
7187 40 6" roll

32 Kodak Supra III Paper 120-
5319 10  8" roll

33 Kodak Supra II Paper
837-3920 5 5" roll

 Unit Price  Ext Price  Comments  Unit Price  Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Comments  Unit Price  Ext Price Comments

Unique Photo  Valley Litho Supply  National Graphic Supply 
QtyQty

 HPI International Inc 
 SEE ATTACHED EXPLANATION 

 PARTIAL AWARD 

 $       52.98  $     529.80 

 All control 
strips must 
ship over 
night, 
$25.00 
freight fee 

 $       46.00  $        460.00 

 $     136.30  $  3,271.20  $     137.00  $  3,288.00  $     127.95  $  3,070.80  $     121.00  $     2,904.00 1906593

 $     136.30  $  5,452.00  $     137.00  $  5,480.00  $     129.95  $  5,198.00  $     121.00  $     4,840.00 1096247

 $     184.93  $  1,849.30  137-2291  $     182.00  $  1,820.00  $     160.00  $     1,600.00 1372291

 $     116.62  $     583.10  X577 feet  $       51.00  $        255.00 8939639

 must be 
ordered in 
qty's of 2, 
price listed 
per piece 
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Buyer: Mary Lanning 858 OF
Department of Roads

Opening date: 06/14/2005

Film & Chemistry Supplies Qty Model# 
size/um

34 Kodabrome II RC Paper   N2 
192-3580 20 10"x10"

35 Plus-X Aerographic Film
162-0608 5  Spec 981 

9.5"x 250' roll

36 Double-X Aerographic Film 
162-1366 10  Spec 981 

9.5"x 250' roll

37 Kodabrome II RC Paper N4 
192-3978 15  10"x10" 

250/box

38 Infrared Aerographic Film 
162-1580 3 Spec 981 

9.5"x 250' roll

39 Ilfotec Rt Rap Film Dev/Start 
INF 180-7813 5   1liter 

40 Ilfotec RT Rapid Film Dev 
878-176 10 2x5 liter 

41 Ilfospeed 2000 Fix/Rep Conc 
INF 1817986 570425 6  2.5 gallon 

Delivery Date

Comments 

Payment Terms

 Unit Price  Ext Price  Comments  Unit Price  Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Comments  Unit Price  Ext Price Comments

Unique Photo  Valley Litho Supply  National Graphic Supply 
QtyQty

 HPI International Inc 
 SEE ATTACHED EXPLANATION 

 PARTIAL AWARD 

 $     197.90  $  3,958.00  $     299.00  $  5,980.00  $     206.50  $  4,130.00  $     169.50  $     3,390.00 

 $     532.99  $  2,664.95  $     537.00  $  2,685.00  $     554.95  $  2,774.75  $     477.00  $     2,385.00 

 $     542.40  $  5,424.00  $     545.00  $  5,450.00  $     489.95  $  4,899.50  $     484.00  $     4,840.00 

 $     197.90  $  2,968.50  $     196.00  $  2,940.00  $     196.95  $  2,954.25  $     169.50  $     2,542.50 

3  $  1,814.00  $  5,442.00 5  $     184.95  $     924.75 
 must 
purchase in 
qty's of 5 

 $  1,570.00  $     4,710.00 

 $     149.95  $     749.75  $     114.00  $        570.00 1/cs

 $     124.95  $  1,249.50  $       81.50  $        815.00 1/cs, 
1878176

 $       63.95  $     383.70  $       48.00  $        288.00 
1918409, 
10 liter 
cube, 1/cs

0% 30 days

5 days

0% 30 days

7-20 days

No Bids
B& H Photo 

Focus Camera, Inc

Withdrew from bid due to $100 min order for 
free ground shipping
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