
Buyer:  Lyn Koenig Dept of Roads Logistic
815 OF

Opening Date:  05/11/05

AWARD AWARD AWARD

Beatrice Hwy 8 MP 82 55
Unit Price $87.20 $85.60

Extended Price $4,796.00 $4,708.00
Pawnee City Hwy 8 MP 91 90

Unit Price $88.70 $85.50
Extended Price $7,983.00 $7,695.00

Pawnee City Hwy 50 MP 19 30
Unit Price $84.70 $84.75

Extended Price $2,541.00 $2,542.50
Pawnee City Hwy 4 MP 196 100

Unit Price $0.00 $84.75
Extended Price $0.00 $8,475.00

Beatrice Hwy 77 MP 0 160
Unit Price $86.20 $88.50

Extended Price $13,792.00 $14,160.00
Beatrice Hwy 77 MP 25 50

Unit Price $87.90 $90.50
Extended Price $4,395.00 $4,525.00

Beatrice Hwy S-34D MP 0 50
Unit Price $87.90

Extended Price $4,395.00
Salt Valley Hwy 77 MP 50 50

Unit Price $87.00
Extended Price $4,350.00

Fairbury Hwy 15 MP 0 20
Unit Price $88.50

Extended Price $1,770.00
Tecumseh Hwy 50

Unit Price $84.00 $86.00
Extended Price $12,600.00 $12,900.00
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Buyer:  Lyn Koenig Dept of Roads Logistic
815 OF

Opening Date:  05/11/05

Concrete 
Industries

Beatrice Concrete 
Co Binder Bros Inc

47B 8 SACK CONCRETE Qty

Tecumseh Hwy 136
Unit Price $82.00 $86.00

Extended Price $8,200.00 $8,600.00
Tecumseh Hwy 75

Unit Price No Bid $87.00 $87.25
Extended Price $13,050.00 $13,087.50

Tecumseh Hwy 136-228
Unit Price No Bid $89.00 $87.25

Extended Price $8,900.00 $8,725.00
Tecumseh Hwy 105

Unit Price No Bid $86.00 $87.25
Extended Price $8,600.00 $8,725.00

Tecumseh Hwy 67
Unit Price $83.20 $91.00 $87.25

Extended Price $8,320.00 $9,100.00 $8,725.00
Falls City Hwy 75

Unit Price No Bid $86.90 $87.25
Extended Price $8,690.00 $8,725.00

Falls City Hwy 73
Unit Price No Bid $86.90

Extended Price $8,690.00
Falls City Hwy 8

Unit Price No Bid $85.50
Extended Price $12,825.00
Payment Terms 100% 60 Days 100% 60 Days

Delivery Days ARO 1 1 30 Days

NO BID
Concrete Industries
Hills Materials Company
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