Buyer: Mary Lanning

Dept of Roads Logistic

Opening Date: 05/10/05

792 OF
PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD
Aluminum S|ng Blanks QTY Inters.tate Highway Rocal Inc US Standard Sign Vulcan Aluminum
and Sheeting Sign Corp.
Unit Price | Ext Price | Unit Price | Ext Price | Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price | Ext Price
1 12"x 25' Extruded panel 114 | $139.75 |$15,931.50( $113.00 [$12,882.00] no bid no bid No bid No bid
2 4'x8'x.080" aluminum sheet 413 no bid no bid $68.00 [$28,084.00] $60.08 $24,813.04 $57.25 | $23,644.25
3| 4'x10'x.040" aluminum sheet 250 no bid no bid $50.90 [$12,725.00] $37.55 $9,387.50 $37.22 | $9,305.00
4| 4'x10'x.125" aluminum sheet 388 no bid no bid $135.00 [$52,380.00 $116.63 $45,252.44 $111.67 | $43,327.96
5 12"x36"x.063" sign blank 750 no bid no bid $4.84 $3,630.00 | $4.59 $3,442.50 $4.37 $3,277.50
6 21"x15"x.063" sign blank 1000 no bid no bid $3.54 $3,540.00 | $3.34 $3,340.00 $3.23 $3,230.00
7 18"x18"x.063" sign blank 800 no bid no bid $3.63 $2,904.00 | $10.30 $8,240.00 $3.33 $2,664.00
8 12"x12"x.063" sign blank 750 no bid no bid $1.62 $1,215.00 | $220.00 | $165,000.00 $1.60 $1,200.00
9 18"x18"x.063" sign blank 100 no bid no bid $3.63 $363.00 $3.66 $366.00 $3.33 $333.00
10 24"x12"x.063" sign blank 1400 no bid no bid $3.23 $4,522.00 | $3.13 $4,382.00 $2.95 $4,130.00
11 24"x18"x.080" sign blank 2000 no bid no bid $5.89 |$11,780.00[ $5.83 $11,660.00 $5.45 |$10,900.00
12 24"x30"x.080" sign blank 2850 no bid no bid $9.82 |$27,987.00f $9.73 $27,730.50 $9.04 [ $25,764.00
13 24"x36"x.080" sigh blank 250 no bid no bid $11.78 | $2,945.00| $11.66 $2,915.00 $10.96 | $2,740.00
14 30"x30"x.080" sign blank 1975 no bid no bid $12.28 [$24,253.00] $12.08 $23,858.00 $11.32 | $22,357.00
15 30"x36"x.080" sign blank 715 no bid no bid $14.70 [$10,510.50] $14.58 $10,424.70 $13.62 | $9,738.30
16 36"x36"x.100" school sign blank | 100 no bid no bid $20.49 | $2,049.00| $21.65 $2,165.00 $17.98 | $1,798.00
17| 36"x48"x48"x100" pennant sign | 1000 no bid no bid $14.88 [$14,880.00] $12.89 $12,890.00 $15.42 | $15,420.00
18 30"x48"x.100" sign blank 200 no bid no bid $23.99 [ $4,798.00| $24.31 $4,862.00 $22.69 | $4,538.00
19 36"x48"x.100" sign blank 150 no bid no bid $28.79 | $4,318.50| $29.16 $4,374.00 $27.26 | $4,089.00
20 48"x24"x.100" sign blank 934 no bid no bid $19.19 ([$17,923.46] $19.44 $18,156.96 $18.24 | $17,036.16
21 48"x48"x.080" sign blank 1100 no bid no bid $31.43 [$34,573.00] $30.75 $33,825.00 $29.01 | $31,911.00
22 48"x48"x.100" sign blank 500 no bid no bid $38.38 [$19,190.00] $38.67 $19,335.00 $36.37 | $18,185.00
23 36"x36"x.100" sign blank 1250 no bid no bid $21.59 [$26,987.50] $21.75 $27,187.50 $20.44 | $25,550.00
24 24"x60"x.125" sign blank 80 no bid no bid $29.22 | $2,337.60| $30.38 $2,430.40 $28.34 | $2,267.20
25 48"x60"x.125" sign blank 250 no bid no bid $58.43 [$14,607.50] $60.76 $15,190.00 $56.49 | $14,122.50
26| 24"x24"x.080" interstate shield | 100 no bid no bid $7.86 $786.00 $10.50 $1,050.00 $7.36 $736.00
27| 36"x36"x.100" interstate shield | 125 no bid no bid $21.50 | $2,687.50| $23.90 $2,987.50 $19.56 | $2,445.00
28 18"x18"x.063" octagon 400 no bid no bid $3.40 $1,360.00 | $2.95 $1,180.00 $3.25 $1,300.00
29 30"x30"x.080" octagon 1600 no bid no bid $11.60 [$18,560.00] $11.55 $18,480.00 $10.37 | $16,592.00
30 36"x36"x.100" octagon 400 no bid no bid $20.64 | $8,256.00 | $20.93 $8,372.00 $18.58 | $7,432.00
31] 36"x.100" dia round sign blank [ 100 no bid no bid $21.14 | $2,114.00| $23.40 $2,340.00 $18.25 | $1,825.00
32 24"x24"x.080" sign blank 1050 no bid no bid $7.86 $8,253.00 | $7.78 $8,169.00 $7.26 $7,623.00
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33| 42"x42"x.100" triangl sign blk 300 no bid no bid $15.10 | $4,530.00| $18.00 $5,400.00 $13.85 | $4,155.00
34| 36"x36"x.080" special order 300 no bid no bid $18.30 | $5,490.00| $19.11 $5,733.00 $16.40 | $4,920.00
35 non core list items 5000 no bid no bid no bid no bid *See bid *See bid No bid No bid
36 30"x60"x.125" sign blank 100 no bid no bid 29.99 $2,999.00 | 37.77 $3,777.00 35.45 $3,545.00
Payment Terms 0%30 Days Net%30 Days 0% 30 Days
Delivery Days ARO 30 Days 45-90 Days 28 Days 30-60 Days

NO BIDS

Hall Signs
Ryerson Tull

Rocal declined
partial award.

U.S. Standard Sign

declined partial award.




