
Buyer:  Robert Thompson State Print Shop
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Opening Date:  05/02/05
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1 6x9 Gum 1M-25M Kraft En 25 $28.17 $704.25 $27.55 $688.75 $32.20 $805.00  $  25.61 $640.25 $34.62 $865.50
2 6x9 Gum 26M-50M Kraft En 50 $27.33 $1,366.50 $27.55 $1,377.50 $29.82 $1,491.00  $  25.61 $1,280.50 $32.05 $1,602.50
3 6x9 Gum>50M Kraft En 51 $26.92 $1,372.92 $27.55 $1,405.05 $27.44 $1,399.44  $  25.08 $1,279.08 $29.49 $1,503.99
4 6.5x9.5 Gum 1M-25M Kraft En 25 $32.28 $807.00 $29.61 $740.25 $33.91 $847.75  $  28.96 $724.00 $36.45 $911.25
5 6.5x9.5 Gum 26M-50M Kraft En 50 $31.32 $1,566.00 $29.61 $1,480.50 $31.30 $1,565.00  $  28.09 $1,404.50 $33.64 $1,682.00
6 6.5x9.5 Gum>50M Kraft En 51 $30.85 $1,573.35 $29.61 $1,510.11 $28.69 $1,463.19  $  27.53 $1,404.03 $30.84 $1,572.84
7 7x10 Gum 1M-25M Kraft En 25 $59.94 $1,498.50 $66.46 $1,661.50 $90.83 $2,270.75  $  49.46 $1,236.50 $78.56 $1,964.00
8 7x10 Gum 26-50M Kraft En 50 $58.16 $2,908.00 $55.82 $2,791.00 $62.59 $3,129.50  $  47.97 $2,398.50 $59.16 $2,958.00
9 7x10 Gum>50M Kraft En 51 $57.28 $2,921.28 $55.63 $2,837.13 $59.02 $3,010.02  $  46.99 $2,396.49 $56.16 $2,864.16

10 7.5 x 10.5 Gum 1M-25M Kraft En 25 $47.55 $1,188.75 $43.00 $1,075.00 $71.10 $1,777.50  $  38.57 $964.25 $50.63 $1,265.75
11 7.5 x 10.5 Gum 26M-50M Kraft En 50 $46.15 $2,307.50 $43.00 $2,150.00 $39.41 $1,970.50  $  37.43 $1,871.50 $42.35 $2,117.50
12 7.5 x 10.5 Gum>50M Kraft En 51 $45.44 $2,317.44 $43.00 $2,193.00 $31.72 $1,617.72  $  36.65 $1,869.15 $34.10 $1,739.10
13 9 x 12 Gum 1M-25M Kraft En 25 $44.25 $1,106.25 $36.82 $920.50 $40.64 $1,016.00  $  40.84 $1,021.00 $43.68 $1,092.00
14 9 x 12 Gum 26M-50M Kraft En 50 $42.95 $2,147.50 $36.82 $1,841.00 $36.82 $1,841.00  $  39.61 $1,980.50 $39.58 $1,979.00
15 9 x 12 Gum>50M Kraft En 51 $42.29 $2,156.79 $36.82 $1,877.82 $32.99 $1,682.49  $  38.83 $1,980.33 $35.46 $1,808.46
16 9.5 x 12.5 Gum 1M-25M Kraft En 25 $52.53 $1,313.25 $40.94 $1,023.50 $53.52 $1,338.00  $  47.14 $1,178.50 $57.53 $1,438.25
17 9.5 x 12.5 Gum 26M-50M Kraft En 50 $50.97 $2,548.50 $40.94 $2,047.00 $39.47 $1,973.50  $  45.74 $2,287.00 $42.43 $2,121.50
18 9.5 x 12.5 Gum>50M Kraft En 51 $50.20 $2,560.20 $40.94 $2,087.94 $36.26 $1,849.26  $  44.82 $2,285.82 $38.97 $1,987.47
19 10 x 13 Gum 1M-25M Kraft En 25 $51.51 $1,287.75 $44.03 $1,100.75 $50.22 $1,255.50  $  47.05 $1,176.25 $53.98 $1,349.50
20 10 x 13 Gum 26M-50M Kraft En 50 $49.99 $2,499.50 $44.03 $2,201.50 $41.02 $2,051.00  $  45.63 $2,281.50 $44.09 $2,204.50
21 10 x 13 Gum>50M Kraft En 51 $49.23 $2,510.73 $44.03 $2,245.53 $38.88 $1,982.88  $  44.72 $2,280.72 $41.79 $2,131.29
22 10 x 15 Gum 1M-25M Kraft En 25 $88.56 $2,214.00 $59.48 $1,487.00 $87.15 $2,178.75  $  79.28 $1,982.00 $78.58 $1,964.50
23 10 x 15 Gum 26M-50M Kraft En 50 $85.94 $4,297.00 $59.48 $2,974.00 $70.89 $3,544.50  $  76.89 $3,844.50 $68.58 $3,429.00
24 10 x 15 Gum>50M Kraft En 51 $84.63 $4,316.13 $59.48 $3,033.48 $54.62 $2,785.62  $  75.31 $3,840.81 $54.58 $2,783.58
25 12 x 15.5 Gum 1M-25M Kraft En 25 $97.69 $2,442.25 $70.81 $1,770.25 $84.24 $2,106.00  $  87.46 $2,186.50 $85.64 $2,141.00
26 12 x 15.5 Gum 26M-50M Kraft En 50 $94.81 $4,740.50 $70.81 $3,540.50 $68.24 $3,412.00  $  84.84 $4,242.00 $68.04 $3,402.00
27 12 x 15.5 Gum>50M Kraft En 51 $93.36 $4,761.36 $70.81 $3,611.31 $63.30 $3,228.30  $  83.09 $4,237.59 $62.85 $3,205.35
28 6x9 SelfSeal 1M-25M Kraft En 25 $48.67 $1,216.75 $39.14 $978.50 $52.55 $1,313.75  $  48.70 $1,217.50 $51.53 $1,288.25
29 6x9 SelfSeal 26M-50M Kraft En 50 $39.83 $1,991.50 $37.85 $1,892.50 $50.18 $2,509.00  $  42.78 $2,139.00 $49.53 $2,476.50
30 6x9 SelfSeal>50M Kraft En 51 $37.42 $1,908.42 $37.85 $1,930.35 $47.80 $2,437.80  $  40.74 $2,077.74 $47.35 $2,414.85
31 6.5x9.5 SelfSeal 1M-25M Kraft En 25 $52.78 $1,319.50 $39.91 $997.75 $43.60 $1,090.00  $  51.84 $1,296.00 $52.76 $1,319.00
32 6.5x9.5 SelfSeal 26M-50M Krft En 50 $44.12 $2,206.00 $39.91 $1,995.50 $39.43 $1,971.50  $  46.66 $2,333.00 $51.58 $2,579.00
33 6.5x9.5 SelfSeal>50M Kraft En 51 $41.35 $2,108.85 $39.91 $2,035.41 $35.25 $1,797.75  $  45.40 $2,315.40 $34.15 $1,741.65
34 7x10 SelfSeal 1M-25M Kraft  En 25 $80.44 $2,011.00 $81.64 $2,041.00 $117.83 $2,945.75  $  80.87 $2,021.75 $81.31 $2,032.75
35 7x10 SelfSeal 26M-50M Kraft  En 50 $70.66 $3,533.00 $69.49 $3,474.50 $72.71 $3,635.50  $  78.45 $3,922.50 $70.72 $3,536.00
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36 7x10 SelfSeal>50M  Kraft  En 51 $67.78 $3,456.78 $69.30 $3,534.30 $68.13 $3,474.63  $  76.88 $3,920.88 $66.31 $3,381.81
37 7.5x10.5 SelfSeal 1M-25M Krft En 25 $68.05 $1,701.25 $54.59 $1,364.75 $67.45 $1,686.25  $  62.83 $1,570.75 $67.45 $1,686.25
38 7.5x10.5 SelfSeal 26M-50M Krft En 50 $58.65 $2,932.50 $53.30 $2,665.00 $59.76 $2,988.00  $  60.95 $3,047.50 $59.45 $2,972.50
39 7.5x10.5 SelfSeal>50M Kraft En 51 $55.94 $2,852.94 $53.30 $2,718.30 $52.07 $2,655.57  $  59.73 $3,046.23 $52.00 $2,652.00
40 9x12 Selfseal 1M-25M Kraft En 25 $64.75 $1,618.75 $48.41 $1,210.25 $57.48 $1,437.00  $  53.93 $1,348.25 $61.87 $1,546.75
41 9x12 Selfseal 26M-50M Kraft En 50 $55.45 $2,772.50 $47.12 $2,356.00 $46.71 $2,335.50  $  52.32 $2,616.00 $44.87 $2,243.50
42 9x12 Selfseal>50M Kraft En 51 $52.79 $2,692.29 $47.12 $2,403.12 $35.93 $1,832.43  $  51.26 $2,614.26 $34.98 $1,783.98
43 9.5X12.5 SelfSeal 1M-25M Kraft En 25 $73.03 $1,825.75 $52.53 $1,313.25 $70.51 $1,762.75  $  56.83 $1,420.75 $73.61 $1,840.25
44 9.5X12.5 SelfSeal 26M-50M Kraft En 50 $63.47 $3,173.50 $51.24 $2,562.00 $45.09 $2,254.50  $  55.02 $2,751.00 $43.98 $2,199.00
45 9.5X12.5 SelfSeal>50M Kraft En 51 $60.70 $3,095.70 $51.24 $2,613.24 $41.88 $2,135.88  $  54.03 $2,755.53 $41.85 $2,134.35
46 10x13 SelfSeal 1M-25M  Kraft En 25 $72.01 $1,800.25 $55.62 $1,390.50 $71.49 $1,787.25  $  59.34 $1,483.50 $70.94 $1,773.50
47 10x13 SelfSeal 26M-50M  Kraft En 50 $62.49 $3,124.50 $54.33 $2,716.50 $45.90 $2,295.00  $  57.56 $2,878.00 $45.65 $2,282.50
48 10x13 SelfSeal>50M  Kraft En 51 $59.73 $3,046.23 $54.33 $2,770.83 $44.93 $2,291.43  $  56.41 $2,876.91 $44.65 $2,277.15
49 10x15 SelfSeal 1M-25M Kraft En 25 $109.06 $2,726.50 $71.07 $1,776.75 $106.45 $2,661.25  $  92.96 $2,324.00 $102.78 $2,569.50
50 10x15 SelfSeal 26M-50M Kraft En 50 $98.44 $4,922.00 $69.78 $3,489.00 $85.39 $4,269.50  $  90.18 $4,509.00 $84.99 $4,249.50
51 10x15 SelfSeal>50M Kraft En 51 $95.13 $4,851.63 $69.78 $3,558.78 $77.12 $3,933.12  $  88.37 $4,506.87 $75.87 $3,869.37
52 12x15.5 SelfSeal1M-25M Kraft En 25 $118.19 $2,954.75 $82.40 $2,060.00 $106.10 $2,652.50  $  97.93 $2,448.25 $104.87 $2,621.75
53 12x15.5 SelfSeal 26M-50M Kraft En 50 $107.31 $5,365.50 $81.11 $4,055.50 $84.88 $4,244.00  $  95.00 $4,750.00 $80.25 $4,012.50
54 12x15.5 SelfSeal>50M Kraft En 51 $103.86 $5,296.86 $81.11 $4,136.61 $79.53 $4,056.03  $  93.10 $4,748.10 $76.98 $3,925.98
55 Reinforced (#4) 9.5x14.5 1M-5M 5 No bid $0.00 $237.70 $1,188.50 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
56 Reinforced (#4) 9.5x14.5 >5M 10 No bid $0.00 $222.17 $2,221.70 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
57 Reinforced (#5) 10.5x16 1M-5M 5 No bid $0.00 $291.60 $1,458.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
58 Reinforced (#5) 10.5x16>5M 10 No bid $0.00 $271.52 $2,715.20 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
59 Reinforced (#6) 12.5x19 1M-5M 5 No bid $0.00 $356.94 $1,784.70 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
60 Reinforced (#6) 12.5x19>5M 10 No bid $0.00 $332.51 $3,325.10 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
61 Reinforced (#7) 14.25x20 1M-5M 5 No bid $0.00 $422.95 $2,114.75 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
62 Reinforced (#7) 14.25x20>5M 10 No bid $0.00 $397.63 $3,976.30 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
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