Buyer: Annette Walton

PARTIAL AWARD

5435 OF
Csl

PARTIAL AWARD

Opening Date: 10/12/16

PARTIAL AWARD

E Aluminum Extruded Panels, Sign Blanks and Sheets | Interstate Highway Sign Corp. Mandelsl\tllggfr,dlr;ér?BA G Osburn Assocates Inc Alu\r/r:jilri?:\;lr;%ad\k;il(\:/:r:c;ir;;ns
- Description Qty |UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

1 gg,EfL%ETAL’ ALUMINUM .080 48" X 1000 | EA NO BID $ 54.36( $ 54,360.00 $61.44 $ 61,440.00| $ 53.92 $ 53,920.00
2 f?OIEE(T'g/g%TAL’ ALUMINUM .08036" X 100 EA NO BID $ 51.62| $ 5,162.00 $57.60 $ 5,760.00 | $ 5545 $ 5,545.00
3 f;O%iT-(ﬂ%TAL’ ALUMINUM .04048" X 100 EA NO BID $ 3442 $ 3,442.00 $59.20 $ 5,920.00 | $ 3507 $ 3,507.00
4 f?OIEE(Tl'\;sETAL’ ALUMINUM .12530" X 10 EA NO BID $ 67.22| $ 672.20 $76.25 $ 76250 | $ 7241 $ 724.10
5 f;O%iTlh;ISETAL’ ALUMINUM .12536" X 10 EA NO BID $ 80.67 | $ 806.70 $91.50 $ 915.00 | $ 86.63 | $ 866.30
6 fyOEE(T'EiTAL’ ALUMINUM .12548" X 1500 | EA NO BID $ 105.46 | $ 158,190.00 $122.00 $ 183,000.00( $ 114.24( $ 171,360.00
7 |AL, PRE-CUT BLANK12" X 12" X .063 500 EA NO BID $ 209 $ 1,045.00 $1.56 $ 780.00 | $ 159| $ 795.00
8 |AL, PRE-CUT BLANK18" X 12" X .063 500 EA NO BID $ 261 $ 1,305.00 $2.34 $ 1,170.00 | $ 2.00( $ 1,000.00
9 gtj&il?(l,zl-g};(EG"X.OGSWﬂ.5”CORNERS 2000 | EA NO BID $ 420 $ 8,400.00 $4.68 $ 9,360.00 | $ 410 $ 8,200.00
10 QII:VAT\IT(I,E]:S};(;I'X.OGSW/I.5"CORNERS 1500 | EA NO BID $ 323 $ 4,845.00 $3.41 $ 5,115.00 | $ 3.13( $ 4,695.00
11 gt&ilil,zl-g};(;ﬂx.OGSW/l.5”CORNERS 3000 | EA NO BID $ 280 $ 8,400.00 $3.12 $ 9,360.00 | $ 3.04( $ 9,120.00
12 QII:VAT\IT(I,E]:;[;(IB"X.OGSW/I.5"CORNERS 1500 | EA NO BID $ 315 $ 4,725.00 $3.51 $ 5,265.00 | $ 313 $ 4,695.00
13 gt&il?fl-gg(;ﬂx.osowll.5”CORNERS 5000 [ EA NO BID $ 523| $ 26,150.00 $5.76 $ 28,800.00| $ 5.62| $ 28,100.00
14 QII:VAT\ITJ,EZ_E};(EO"X.OSOW/I.5“CORNERS 5000 | EA NO BID $ 8.72( $ 43,600.00 $9.60 $ 48,000.00| $ 9.22 $ 46,100.00
15 gt&il?(ig};;(i”x.osowll.5”CORNERS 300 EA NO BID $ 1065| $ 3,195.00 $11.52 $ 3,456.00 | $ 1097 | $ 3,291.00
16 QII:VAT\ITJ,ES:(():"[;(EO"X.OSOW/Z.0"CORNERS 1500 | EA NO BID $ 11.10| $ 16,650.00 $12.00 $ 18,000.00( $ 11.63| $ 17,445.00
17 gt&il?(ig};;(é”x.osowlz.O”CORNERS 1000 | EA NO BID $ 13.32| $ 13,320.00 $14.40 $ 14,400.00( $ 14.06| $ 14,060.00
18 gtAilT(,Eég};(EG"X.lOOSCHOOL 50 EA NO BID $ 19.16 | $ 958.00 $22.23 $ 1,111.50  $ 17.87| $ 893.50
19 QII-EN'T\JRAE\#;GTXBJ_SA),\(‘:I(SXlOO 2500 [ EA NO BID $ 15.60| $ 39,000.00 $14.82 $ 37,050.00| $ 1519 $ 37,975.00
20 ¢E|555L23g522§§8x100 25 EA NO BID $ 19.84| $ 496.00 $19.76 $ 494.00 | $ 18.01| $ 450.25
21 :(IJ-XZF;E)-(C;%-\I/—V/BZLQN(?ORNERS 25 EA NO BID $ 2221 $ 555.25 $24.70 $ 61750 | $ 2294 $ 573.50
22 Q[G_VXF:SE);%[(JJ-\I;V/BZLQN::(ORNERS 25 EA NO BID $ 26.65| $ 666.25 $29.64 $ 741.00 | $ 2751 $ 687.75
23 ):AII-XZF;E)-(C;%-\I/—V/BZLQNgORNERS 1000 | EA NO BID $ 17.76 | $ 17,760.00 $19.76 $ 19,760.00( $ 18.37| $ 18,370.00
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ES . . . . Mandel Metals, Inc. DBA US Vulcan Inc, dba Vulcan

g Aluminum Extruded Panels, Sign Blanks and Sheets | Interstate Highway Sign Corp. Standard Sign Osburn Assocates Inc AT, €l Vil Sis

- Description Qty |UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
AL, PRE-CUT BLANK,

24 48"X48"X 08W/3.0" CORNERS 5000 | EA NO BID $ 27.89( $ 139,450.00 $30.72 $ 153,600.00( $ 27.89| $ 139,450.00
AL, PRE-CUT BLANK,

25 48"X48"X10W/3.0' CORNERS 300 EA NO BID $ 3554 $ 10,662.00 $39.52 $ 11,856.00( $ 36.66 [ $ 10,998.00
AL, PRE-CUT BLANK,

26 48"X48"X 100CTAGON 50 EA NO BID $ 33.29| $ 1,664.50 $39.52 $ 1,976.00 | $ 3325( $ 1,662.50
AL, PRE-CUT BLANK,

27 TRIANGLEA8"X48"X48"X.100 100 EA NO BID $ 20.20| $ 2,020.00 $39.52 $ 3,952.00 | $ 18.01( $ 1,801.00
AL, PRE-CUT

28 |[BLANK,36"X36"X.100W/2.5" 3000 [ EA NO BID $ 19.73| $ 59,190.00 $22.23 $ 66,690.00| $ 2053 $ 61,590.00
CORNERS
AL, PRE-CUT

29 [BLANK,24"X60"X.080W/2.5" 200 EA NO BID $ 17.76 | $ 3,552.00 $19.20 $ 3,840.00 | $ 1752 $ 3,504.00
CORNERS
AL, PRE-CUT

30 [BLANK,24"X60"X.125W/2.5" 25 EA NO BID $ 2776 | $ 694.00 $30.50 $ 76250 | $ 29.02( $ 725.50
CORNERS
AL, PRE-CUT

31|BLANK,30"X60"X.125W/2.0" 50 EA NO BID $ 3471 $ 1,735.50 $38.13 $ 1,906.50 | $ 36.73| $ 1,836.50
CORNERS
AL, PRE-CUT

32 [BLANK,48"X60"X.125W/3.0" 600 EA NO BID $ 5552 $ 33,312.00 $61.00 $ 36,600.00| $ 57.82 $ 34,692.00
CORNERS
AL, PRE-CUT

33 |BLANK,18"X24"X.080W/1.5" 4500 | EA NO BID $ 533 $ 23,985.00 $5.76 $ 25,920.00| $ 5.62| $ 25,290.00
CORNERS
AL, PRE-CUT

34 [BLANK,48"X60"X.080W/3.0" 25 EA NO BID $ 3554 $ 888.50 $38.40 $ 960.00 | $ 3475 $ 868.75
CORNERS
AL, PRE-CUT

35 BLANK, 18"X18"X.0630CTAGON 25 EA NO BID $ 9.80| $ 245.00 $3.51 $ 87.75| $ 295| $ 73.75
AL, PRE-CUT

36 BLANK, 30"X30"X.0800CTAGON 3000 [ EA NO BID $ 10.20| $ 30,600.00 $12.00 $ 36,000.00| $ 10.59| $ 31,770.00
AL, PRE-CUT

37 BLANK,36"X36"X.1000CTAGON 1000 | EA NO BID $ 18.35| $ 18,350.00 $22.23 $ 22,230.00| $ 18,58 | $ 18,580.00
AL, PRE-CUT

38 BLANK,36"X36"X.100ROUND 25 EA NO BID $ 2212 $ 553.00 $22.23 $ 555.75 | $ 1992 | $ 498.00

39 |AL, PRE-CUT BLANK,24"X24"X.080 3000 | EA NO BID $ 711 $ 21,330.00 $7.68 $ 23,040.00| $ 7.38| $ 22,140.00
AL, PRE-CUT

40 [BLANK,24"X24"X.080INTERSTATE 100 EA NO BID $ 9.10| $ 910.00 $7.68 $ 768.00 | $ 6.31| $ 631.00
SHIELD
AL, PRE-CUT

41 |BLANK,24"X30"X.100INTERSTATE 100 EA NO BID $ 17.24| $ 1,724.00 $12.35 $ 1,235.00 | $ 11.70( $ 1,170.00
SHIELD
AL, PRE-CUT

42 BLANK TRIANGLE36"X36"X36"X.080 25 EA NO BID $ 942 $ 235.50 $17.28 $ 432.00| $ 815 $ 203.75

43 |AL, PRE-CUT BLANK,12"X18"X.063 300 EA NO BID $ 248 $ 744.00 $2.34 $ 702.00 | $ 221 $ 663.00
AL, PRE-CUT

44 |BLANK,36"X36"X.100INTERSTATE 100 EA NO BID $ 2421 $ 2,421.00 $22.23 $ 2,223.00 | $ 1842 $ 1,842.00
SHIELD
AL, PRE-CUT

45 BLANK, TRIANGLE36"X36"X36"X.100 100 EA NO BID $ 11.95| $ 1,195.00 $22.23 $ 2,223.00 | $ 9.98| $ 998.00
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ES . . . . Mandel Metals, Inc. DBA US Vulcan Inc, dba Vulcan
g Aluminum Extruded Panels, Sign Blanks and Sheets | Interstate Highway Sign Corp. Standard Sign Osburn Assocates Inc AT, €l Vil Sis
- Description Qty |UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

EXTRUDED ALUMINUM PANEL
46 12"X25INTERSTATE HIGHWAY 800 EA | $ 129.50 | $ 103,600.00 NO BID NO BID $137.25 $ 109,800.00 NO BID NO BID
47 |% Discount off catalog / price list 1000 | EA -0- N/A N/A 5% NO BID NO BID
Total $ 129.50| $ 103,600.00 | $ 1,037.32| $ 769,164.40| $ 1,32431] $ 968,637.00| $ 1,040.09| $ 793,361.15
Payment Terms 030 N/A - N/A 0 Net 30
Delivery Days ARO 30 30 30 21-28

*We do not have a catalog or price

Comments list.
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AWARD EXPLANATION

AWARDED TO LOWEST
RESPONSIBLE BIDDERS TO
MAINTAIN MINIMUM NUMBER

OF CONTRACTS.



