Buyer: Dianna Gilliland

5367 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:

PRIMARY AWARD

THIRD AWARD

ﬁ 2017 or Current Production Year 1 Ton Diesel Regular Cab Anderson Ford Baxter C-D-J-R | Erdkamp Motors Inc.| Gene Steffy Auto
.‘_EI 4x4 Dual Rear Wheels Truck Group
Description QTY|UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 |1 Ton Diesel Regular Cab 4x4 Dual Rear 1 EA | $ 38,631.00 | $ 36,948.00 | $ 36,964.00 | $ 37,094.00
Wheels Truck
Make: Ford Dodge Ram Ram
Model: F350 Ram 3500 3500 RC 4X4 SLT
GVWR: 14,000 10,300 14,000 lbs 10,300
Series, Code, Trim Level: F3D, 623A, XLT 'STL' 'D28H62' STL, D28H62 STL, D28H62
Engine: 6.7 L, V8 Diesel | 6.7 L 16 Cummins 6.7L Cummins 6.7L Cummins
Diesel Diesel
Transmission No./Gear Ratio No.: 44W | 3.55 68RFE 3.42 68RFE 6-Speed 3.42
Auto
EPA: N/A N/A N/A N/A
Delivery time after receipt of order 90 90-120 120-150 days 90/120
(number/days):
MSRP as bid: $ 52,465.00 | $ 52,390.00 | $ 52,295.00| $ 52,735.00
2 [E85 1 Ton Regular Cab 4x4 Dual Rear Wheels |1 EA $ 31,206.00 N/A N/A $ 29,670.00
Truck
Engine: 6.2L, V8 N/A 6.4L E15
Transmission No./Gear Ratio No.: 44P/3.73 N/A 66 RFE
Make: Ford N/A Ram
Model: F350 N/A 3500 RC 4X4
GVWR: 14,000 N/A 10,300
Series, Code, Trim Level: F3D, 623A XLT N/A D28H62 SLT
EPA: N/A N/A N/A
Delivery time after receipt of order 90 N/A 90/150
(number/days):
MSRP as bid: $ 43,795.00 N/A $ 43,740.00
OPTIONS
3 | Engine (other gas). Alternate engine size. 1| EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 N/A No Bid $ 29,863.00 N/A
State Engine Size: - 6.4 L Hemi V8
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 N/A N/A N/A
State Engine Size: - N/A
4 | Engine (other gas) #2. Alternate engine size. 1| EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 N/A N/A N/A
State Engine Size: - N/A
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 N/A N/A N/A
State Engine Size: - N/A
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Buyer: Dianna Gilliland

5367 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:

PRIMARY AWARD

THIRD AWARD

ﬁ 2017 or Current Production Year 1 Ton Diesel Regular Cab Anderson Ford Baxter C-D-J-R | Erdkamp Motors Inc.| Gene Steffy Auto
.‘_EI 4x4 Dual Rear Wheels Truck Group
Description QTY|UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
5 [ Engine (other diesel), including block heater, 1| EA
factory or dealer installed. Alternate engine size.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 N/A N/A N/A N/A
If dealer installed, supply Manufacturer: - N/A
Model: - N/A
Warranty: - N/A
State Engine Size: - N/A
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 N/A N/A N/A N/A
If dealer installed, supply Manufacturer: - N/A
Model: - N/A
Warranty: - N/A
State Engine Size: - N/A
6 | Air-conditioning (deduct). 1| EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 N/A STD N/A N/A STD
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 N/A N/A N/A N/A STD
7 | From Automatic to Manual Four-Speed 1 EA
Transmission (deduct).
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 N/A N/A N/A N/C
6-speed manual
transmission is
available for the same
price as automatic
transmission
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 N/A N/A N/C
8 | Fog lights. 1 EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $1,460.00 166.00 | $ 166.00 | $ 200.00
XLT Value Pkg
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $1,460.00 N/A N/A $ 200.00
XLT Value Pkg
9 [ 40-20-40 or 60-40 Bench Seat (deduct). 1| EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 N/A N/A Included N/A STD
State Bench Seat: - 40/20/40 40/20/40
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 N/A N/A N/A N/A STD
State Bench Seat: - N/A 40/20/40
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Buyer: Dianna Gilliland 5367 OF Opening Date:  08/12/16
Statewide

PRIMARY AWARD | THIRD AWARD

ﬁ 2017 or Current Production Year 1 Ton Diesel Regular Cab Anderson Ford Baxter C-D-J-R | Erdkamp Motors Inc.| Gene Steffy Auto
.‘_EI 4x4 Dual Rear Wheels Truck Group
Description QTY|UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
10| 40-20-40- or 60-40 with driver 6 way power 1 EA
controlled seat, if available from manufacturer.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 N/A IN POP. EQUIP. $1,016.00 $ 1,200.00
GROUP (OPTION | Included with Popular
$1,016.00) Equipment Group
Package
State Bench Seat: - 40/20/40
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 N/A N/A N/A $ 1,200.00
State Bench Seat: - N/A
11| Vinyl covering - bucket type seats (deduct). 1 EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 N/A N/A $166.00 N/A
Additional cost
Vinyl seat covering only
available in 40/20/40
Bench seat. No price
reduction for vinyl
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 N/A N/A N/A N/A
12| Cloth wi/vinyl trim - bucket type seats. 1 EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 N/A $ 1,016.00 $1,016.00 $ 1,200.00

Cloth seat covering,
vinyl trim not available
with bucket seats.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 N/A N/A N/A $ 1,200.00
13| Two electric remote controlled outside mirrors, 1 EA
swing away type, 6' X 9" (deduct).

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 N/A STD Included STD
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 N/A N/A N/A STD
14| Right and left telescopic mirrors, minimum 6x8. | 1 | EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ 280.00 N/A Included STD
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ 280.00 N/A N/A STD
15| Heavy duty alternator, optional, minimum 105 1 EA
amp alternator.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ 85.00 | $ 85.00 Included $ 100.00
State amps: 220 220 220 amps 220
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ 85.00 N/A N/A $ 100.00
State amps: 220 N/A 220
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Buyer: Dianna Gilliland 5367 OF Opening Date:
Statewide
PRIMARY AWARD | THIRD AWARD
ﬁ 2017 or Current Production Year 1 Ton Diesel Regular Cab Anderson Ford Baxter C-D-J-R | Erdkamp Motors Inc.| Gene Steffy Auto
.‘_EI 4x4 Dual Rear Wheels Truck Group
Description QTY|UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
16| Heavy duty battery optional. 1| EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 N/A N/A N/A INC
State CCA: - Standard 750 Amp (2) 730 X 2
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 N/A N/A N/A INC
State CCA: - N/A 730 X 2
17 Sliding rear-vision window. 1 EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ 395.00 STD Included INC
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ 395.00 N/A N/A INC
18] No lid on Utility Body (deduct). 1| EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ (600.00) No Bid N/A $ (1,300.00)
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ (600.00) N/A N/A $ (1,300.00)
19| Second Power Outlet. 1 EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 STD 12V Auxiliary STD Included $ 75.00
115V Aux. in Popular
Equip. Group Option
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 STD N/A N/A $ 75.00
20| Short pickup box length (deduct). 1 EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 N/A N/A N/A N/A
State wheelbase: - N/A
State box size: State dimensions of box bid: - N/A
Length, width, and width between wheel wells.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 N/A N/A N/A N/A
State wheelbase: - N/A
State box size: State dimensions of box bid: - N/A
Length, width, and width between wheel wells.
21| Single rear wheels (deduct). GVWR (NOTE: 1 EA
Five wheels and tires will be required meeting
same requirements as defined in the
Specifications).
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ (899.00)] $ (1,101.00) |$ (1,101.00)| $ (1,062.00)
NOT BID
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ (899.00) N/A N/A N/A
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Buyer: Dianna Gilliland

5367 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:

PRIMARY AWARD

THIRD AWARD

ﬁ 2017 or Current Production Year 1 Ton Diesel Regular Cab Anderson Ford Baxter C-D-J-R | Erdkamp Motors Inc.| Gene Steffy Auto
.‘_EI 4x4 Dual Rear Wheels Truck Group
Description QTY|UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
22| Single wheel Chassis with eight foot Utility Body| 1 EA
(see ATTACHMENT) Color of Utility Body to
match manufacturer color charts.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 6,875.00 No Bid N/A $6,274.00
Warner
$6,090.00
Knapheide
State make and model: Knapheide N/A Warner/ white or
yellow
Knanpheide/white
only
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 6,875.00 N/A N/A $6,274.00
Warner
$6,090.00
Knapheide
State make and model: Knapheide N/A Warner/ white or
yellow
Knanpheide/white
only
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Buyer: Dianna Gilliland

5367 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:

PRIMARY AWARD

THIRD AWARD

ﬁ 2017 or Current Production Year 1 Ton Diesel Regular Cab Anderson Ford Baxter C-D-J-R | Erdkamp Motors Inc.| Gene Steffy Auto
.‘_EI 4x4 Dual Rear Wheels Truck Group
Description QTY|UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
23| Dual wheel Chassis with eight foot (8') Utility 1 EA
Body (see ATTACHMENT) Color of Utility Body
to match manufacturer color charts.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ 8,495.00 No Bid N/A $ 6,774.00
State make and model: Knapheide N/A Warner
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ 8,495.00 N/A N/A $ 6,774.00
State make and model: Knapheide N/A Warner-white or
yellow
24| Single wheels Chassis Cab with no Utility Box. | 1 EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ 1,295.00 No Bid N/A $ 36,032.00
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ 1,295.00 N/A N/A $ 28,690.00
25| Dual wheels Chassis Cab with no Utility Box. 1 EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ 1,895.00 No Bid N/A $ 37,094.00
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ 1,895.00 N/A N/A $ 29,670.00
26 | Two wheel drive (deduct). 1 EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ (1,275.00) No Bid $ (1.100.00) $ (2,180.00)
Onl/off road tires not No DRW
avaliable on 2WD
model.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ (1,275.00) N/A N/A $ (8,464.00)
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Buyer: Dianna Gilliland 5367 OF Opening Date:
Statewide
PRIMARY AWARD | THIRD AWARD
ﬁ 2017 or Current Production Year 1 Ton Diesel Regular Cab Anderson Ford Baxter C-D-J-R | Erdkamp Motors Inc.| Gene Steffy Auto
.‘_EI 4x4 Dual Rear Wheels Truck Group
Description QTY|UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
27| HD Rubberized spray in bed liner (Linex, Rhino | 1 EA
or equivalent).
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ 475.00( $ 42100 $ 421.00( $ 500.00
State manufacturer: Ford CHRYSLER Ultimate Linings from Mopar
factory
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ 475.00 N/A N/A $ 500.00
State manufacturer: Ford N/A Mopar
28| Cargo light. 1| EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ 95.00 STD Included STD
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ 95.00 N/A N/A STD
29| Standard Paint - Attach List and Identify as No 1 EA
Additional Cost Paints.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 STD SEE ATTACHED Included N/C
See List
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 STD N/A N/A N/C
See List
30| For Department of Roads Use: Yellow color of: | 1 EA
Dodge #PL1, Ford #84S53, Chevrolet/GMC
#WA-253A code (9W3) with no order required.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ 795.00 | SEE ATTACHED | $ 383.00| $ 450.00
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ 795.00 N/A N/A $ 450.00
31| Extra Cost Paint- Attach List and Identify as 1 EA
Extra Cost Paints.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $395.00 SEE ATTACHED | $ 383.00( $ 450.00
Ruby Red
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $395.00 N/A N/A $ 450.00
Ruby Red
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Buyer: Dianna Gilliland 5367 OF Opening Date:
Statewide
PRIMARY AWARD | THIRD AWARD
ﬁ 2017 or Current Production Year 1 Ton Diesel Regular Cab Anderson Ford Baxter C-D-J-R | Erdkamp Motors Inc.| Gene Steffy Auto
.‘_EI 4x4 Dual Rear Wheels Truck Group
Description QTY|UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
32| Rearview camera - dealer or factory installed. 1 EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 STD $ 710.00| $ 400.00 | $ 540.00
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 STD N/A N/A $ 540.00
33| Tailgate step - dealer or factory installed. 1 EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 375.00 STD N/A $ 375.00
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 375.00 N/A N/A $ 375.00
34| Dual alternators - dealer or factory installed. 1 EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 380.00( $ 336.00 $336.00 $ 400.00
440 Amps Total
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 380.00 N/A N/A $ 400.00
35| Additional remote fob from manufacturer. 1 EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 150.00 $180.00 $ 175.00 | $ 180.00
(DEALER)
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 150.00 N/A N/A $ 180.00
36| Electronic compass/temp display (deduct). 1| EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 N/A STD Included STD
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 N/A N/A N/A STD
37| Seat lumbar support: Lumbar support in seats if| 1 EA
not standard equipment.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 STD IN POP EQUIP $1,016.00 $ 1,295.00
GROUP (OPTION | Included with Premium
$1,016.00) Seat Packages for
Bench 40/20/40 or
Bucket seats
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 STD N/A N/A
38| Protective vinyl side moldings Dealer installed if| 1 | EA
not standard equipment.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 350.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 153.00 | $ 231.00
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 350.00 N/A N/A $ 231.00
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Buyer: Dianna Gilliland 5367 OF Opening Date:  08/12/16

Statewide
PRIMARY AWARD | THIRD AWARD
ﬁ 2017 or Current Production Year 1 Ton Diesel Regular Cab Anderson Ford Baxter C-D-J-R | Erdkamp Motors Inc.[ Gene Steffy Auto
.‘_EI 4x4 Dual Rear Wheels Truck Group
Description QTY|UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
39| Service repair manual equipment and engine. 1 EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ 295.00 | N/A AT THISTIME| $ 300.00 | $ 150.00
State type of service repair manual available: CD ROM CD Rom CD
paper copy, CD Rom, or Online.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ 295.00 N/A N/A $ 150.00
State type of service repair manual available: CD ROM N/A CD
paper copy, CD Rom, or Online.
40| Parts manual equipment and engine. 1 EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 N/A N/A AT THIS TIME N/A N/A
State type of parts manual available: paper - N/A N/A
copy, CD Rom, or Online.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 N/A N/A N/A N/A
State type of parts manual available: paper - N/A N/A
copy, CD Rom, or Online.
41| Additional costs for warranties from 1 EA
manufacturer.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ 2,995.00 No Bid N/A $ 3,210.00
State: Years and Miles 5yr/100 K N/A 5 yr /100,000
Premium Care miles -$100
deductible
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ 2,995.00 N/A N/A $ 3,200.00
State: Years and Miles 5yr/100 K N/A 5 yr /100,000
Premium Care miles -$100
deductible
42| Drop shipment charges outside the Lincoln 1| EA
area. Additional costs of charges for vehicle
drop shipment outside the Lincoln area. Drop
shipment charges would be for vehicles bought
by political entities and other Divisions of
Government.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ 295.00| $ 400.00 $2.00 per mile $ 500.00
$2.00 per mile, not to
exceed $500.00
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ 295.00 N/A N/A $ 500.00
Payment Terms 0 30 N/A N/A 030
Delivery Days ARO 90 150 90/120
Comments
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Buyer: Dianna Gilliland

5367 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:

PRIMARY AWARD

THIRD AWARD

2017 or Current Production Year 1 Ton Diesel Regular Cab
4x4 Dual Rear Wheels Truck

Line #

Anderson Ford

Baxter C-D-J-R

Erdkamp Motors Inc.

Gene Steffy Auto
Group

Description [oTY[uOM

Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

Exceptions for Technical Specifications

No exceptions

3.1. Tires- N/A with
DRW-LT275/70R
BSW All-Season STD

No exceptions

No exceptions

Technical Specifications

1.B. Box Bid: length -
98.1"; width - 66.9";
width between wheel
wells - 50.5".
1.0.Fuel Tank: Diesel
- 29; Gasoline - 34.
1.BB.Trailer Tow:
capacity - 19,100 -
Diesel.

3.J. Differential:
Limited Slip.

4.B Battery: Capacity -
750 CCA.

4.C. Alternator:
output - 220.

Color & Trim sheet
attached.

1.B. Box Bid: length -
105.3"; width - 66.4";
width between wheel
wells - 51".

1.0.Fuel Tank: Diesel
- 28; Gasoline - 32.
1.BB.Trailer Tow:
capacity - 22,150.
3.J. Differential: Anti-
spin.

4.B Battery: Capacity -
730.

4.C. Alternator:
output - 180.

9.B. 3 Yrs. 36,00
miles 5-Yrs. 60,000
miles powertrain

Color & Trim sheet
attached.

1.B. Box Bid: length -
98.3"; width - 66.4"; width
between wheel wells -
51.0"

1.0.Fuel Tank: Diesel - 32;
Gasoline - 32.

1.0 No fuel tank skid plate
available from
manufacturer.

1.X. Remote and key are
the same fob unit, two sets
come standard with a
truck.

1.BB.Trailer Tow: capacity
-17,180.

2. Axle ratio is 3.42 for
diesel engine, 3.73 with
the gas engine.

3. 140.5 inch wheel base.
3.J. Differential: Anti-spin.
4.B Battery: Capacity - 750
(2 batteries).

4.C. Alternator: output -
220 Amp, 220 Amp on
Gas Engine.

7. Sustainability: unknown
from manufacturer.

9. Warranty: 3yr/36,000
mile base factory warranty
5yr/100,000 mile
Powertrain factory
warranty

Color & Trim sheet
attached.

1.B. Box Bid: length -
96"; width -65"; width
between wheel wells -
51".

1.0.Fuel Tank: Diesel
- 32; Gasoline - 32.
1.BB.Trailer Tow:
capacity - 17,180.

3.J. Differential:
Mopar.

4.B Battery: Capacity -
730 x 2.

4.C. Alternator:
output - 220.

Color & Trim sheet
attached.

Exceptions for Attachment Technical Specifications -
Utility body for Single Rear Wheel Chassis

No exceptions

No Bid

N/A

No exceptions

Page 10 of 24

08/12/16



Buyer: Dianna Gilliland

5367 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:

PRIMARY AWARD

THIRD AWARD

fﬁ 2017 or Current Production Year 1 Ton Diesel Regular Cab Anderson Ford Baxter C-D-J-R | Erdkamp Motors Inc.[ Gene Steffy Auto

,5 4x4 Dual Rear Wheels Truck Group
Description [oTY[uOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Attachment Technical Specifications - 7.H. Warranty: 6 No Bid N/A 7.1 Trailer Tow:

Utility body for Single Rear Wheel Chassis year rust through. 17,560.

Exceptions for Attachment Technical Specifications - No exceptions No Bid N/A No exceptions

Utility body for Dual Rear Wheel Chassis

Attachment Technical Specifications - 7.H. Warranty: 6 No Bid N/A 7.1. Trailer Tow:

Utility body for Dual Rear Wheel Chassis year rust through 19,180.

Exceptions for Master Agreement Terms and Conditions None None None None

Master Agreement Terms and Conditions

NE Dealer License:
DL-03970

NE Dealer License:
3943

NE Dealer License:
Blank.

NE Dealer License:
02298
SOS Letter Included.
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Buyer: Dianna Gilliland

2017 or Current Production Year 1 Ton Diesel Regular Cab

5367 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:

PRIMARY AWARD

THIRD AWARD

Line #

4x4 Dual Rear Wheels Truck
Description

Anderson Ford

Baxter C-D-J-R

Erdkamp Motors Inc.

Gene Steffy Auto

[QTY[UOM

Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

Group
Unit Price
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Buyer: Dianna Gilliland

5367 OF

Statewide
SECONDARY/E85
AWARDS
ﬁ 2017 or Current Production Year 1 Ton Diesel Regular Cab | Husker Auto Group Sid Dillon Sid Dillon Ford
.5 4x4 Dual Rear Wheels Truck LLC Chevrolet Buick
Description QTY|UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 |1 Ton Diesel Regular Cab 4x4 Dual Rear 1 EA | $ 38,349.00 | $ 38,433.00| $ 38,583.00
Wheels Truck
Make: Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford
Model: Silverado Silverado F-350
GVWR: 13025 13025 14000
Series, Code, Trim Level: 3500-CK35903, CK35903, LT F3D, XLT
Base LT
Engine: LML Duramax 6.6 L 6.7
Transmission No./Gear Ratio No.: MW?7/GT4 3.73 MYD, 6 speed 44W, 6 speed
EPA: N/A @ This Time N/A N/A
Delivery time after receipt of order 35/120 40-120 40-120
(number/days):
MSRP as bid: $ 52,886.58 | $ 47,544.00| $ 52,465.00
2 |E85 1 Ton Regular Cab 4x4 Dual Rear Wheels |1 EA $ 30,730.00 | $ 30,803.00| $ 31,153.00
Truck
Engine: L96 6.0L E85 6.0L 6.2L
Transmission No./Gear Ratio No.: MYD/GT5 4.10 MYD, 6 speed 44P, 6 speed
Make: Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford
Model: Silverado Silverado F-350
GVWR: 13,400 13400 14000
Series, Code, Trim Level: 3500 - CK35903, CK35903, LT F3D, XLT
Base LT
EPA: N/A @ This Time N/A N/A
Delivery time after receipt of order 35/120 40-120 40-120
(number/days):
MSRP as bid: $ 44,101.75| $ 40,015.00| $ 43,795.00
OPTIONS
3 | Engine (other gas). Alternate engine size. 1| EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 N/A N/A N/A
State Engine Size: - -
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 N/A N/A N/A
State Engine Size: - -
4 | Engine (other gas) #2. Alternate engine size. 1| EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 N/A N/A N/A
State Engine Size: - -
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 N/A N/A N/A
State Engine Size: - -
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Buyer: Dianna Gilliland 5367 OF Opening Date:  08/12/16
Statewide

SECONDARY/E85
AWARDS

2017 or Current Production Year 1 Ton Diesel Regular Cab | Husker Auto Group Sid Dillon Sid Dillon Ford
4x4 Dual Rear Wheels Truck LLC Chevrolet Buick
Description QTY|UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Engine (other diesel), including block heater, 1| EA
factory or dealer installed. Alternate engine size.

Line #

&)]

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 N/A N/A N/A

If dealer installed, supply Manufacturer: - -
Model: - -
Warranty: - -
State Engine Size: - -
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 N/A N/A N/A
If dealer installed, supply Manufacturer: - -
Model: - -
Warranty: - -
State Engine Size: - -
6 | Air-conditioning (deduct). 1| EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 N/A N/A N/A
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 N/A N/A N/A
7 | From Automatic to Manual Four-Speed 1 EA
Transmission (deduct).
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 N/A N/A N/A

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 N/A N/A N/A
8 | Fog lights. 1 EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ 140.00 | $ 190.00 | $ 1,460.00

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ 140.00 | $ 190.00| $ 1,460.00

9 [ 40-20-40 or 60-40 Bench Seat (deduct). 1| EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 N/A N/A N/A
State Bench Seat: - -
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 N/A N/A N/A
State Bench Seat: - -
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Buyer: Dianna Gilliland

5367 OF

Statewide
SECONDARY/E85
AWARDS
ﬁ 2017 or Current Production Year 1 Ton Diesel Regular Cab | Husker Auto Group Sid Dillon Sid Dillon Ford
.5 4x4 Dual Rear Wheels Truck LLC Chevrolet Buick
Description QTY|UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
10| 40-20-40- or 60-40 with driver 6 way power 1 EA
controlled seat, if available from manufacturer.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ 295.00 | $ 495.00 N/A
State Bench Seat: 40/20/40 40-20-40 -
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ 295.00 | $ 495.00 N/A
State Bench Seat: 40/20/40 40-20-40 -
11] Vinyl covering - bucket type seats (deduct). 1 EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 N/A N/A N/A
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 N/A N/A N/A
12| Cloth w/vinyl trim - bucket type seats. 1 EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 N/A N/A N/A
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 N/A N/A N/A
13| Two electric remote controlled outside mirrors, 1 EA
swing away type, 6' X 9" (deduct).
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 N/A N/A N/A
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 N/A N/A N/A
14| Right and left telescopic mirrors, minimum 6x8. [ 1 | EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ 370.00 | $ 380.00 380.00
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ 370.00 | $ 380.00 380.00
15| Heavy duty alternator, optional, minimum 105 1 EA
amp alternator.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ 295.00 | $ 290.00( $ 280.00
Gas
State amps: 220 220 240
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ 295.00 | $ 290.00 | $ 280.00
Gas
State amps: 220 220 240
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Buyer: Dianna Gilliland

5367 OF
Statewide
SECONDARY/E85
AWARDS
ﬁ 2017 or Current Production Year 1 Ton Diesel Regular Cab | Husker Auto Group Sid Dillon Sid Dillon Ford
.5 4x4 Dual Rear Wheels Truck LLC Chevrolet Buick
Description QTY|UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
16| Heavy duty battery optional. 1| EA CA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ 295.00 N/A N/A
State CCA: 730 - -
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ 295.00 N/A N/A
State CCA: 730 - -
17] Sliding rear-vision window. 1 EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ 695.00 N/A N/A
Dlr.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ 695.00 N/A N/A
Dlr.
18] No lid on Utility Body (deduct). 1| EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ (550.00)| $ (600.00)| $ (600.00)
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ (550.00)| $ (600.00)| $ (600.00)
19( Second Power Outlet. 1 EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 STD STD STD
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 STD STD STD
20| Short pickup box length (deduct). 1 EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 N/A N/A N/A
State wheelbase: - -
State box size: State dimensions of box bid: - -
Length, width, and width between wheel wells.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 N/A N/A N/A
State wheelbase: - -
State box size: State dimensions of box bid: - -
Length, width, and width between wheel wells.
21| Single rear wheels (deduct). GVWR (NOTE: 1 EA
Five wheels and tires will be required meeting
same requirements as defined in the
Specifications).
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ (457.00)| $ (979.00)| $ (990.00)
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ (457.00)| $ (979.00)| $ (990.00)
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State make and model:

Price includes white
color only. Other colors
cost an additional

Statewide
SECONDARY/E85
AWARDS
ﬁ 2017 or Current Production Year 1 Ton Diesel Regular Cab | Husker Auto Group Sid Dillon Sid Dillon Ford
.5 4x4 Dual Rear Wheels Truck LLC Chevrolet Buick
Description QTY|UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
22| Single wheel Chassis with eight foot Utility Body| 1 EA
(see ATTACHMENT) Color of Utility Body to
match manufacturer color charts.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ 7,995.00 $ 6,675.00 $ 6,675.00
Kanpheide Kanpheide
$  7,595.00 $  7,595.00
Warner Warner

Price includes white
color only. Other colors
cost an additional

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2

$1,100.00 $1,100.00
Knapheide 696J/ Knapheide 696J Knapheide 696J
Warner 598M-SW Warner Warner

WS298-M-SW-U-RT

WS298-M-SW-U-RT

State make and model:

$ 7,995.00 $  6,675.00 $  6,675.00
Kanpheide Kanpheide
$ 7,595.00 $ 7,595.00
Warner Warner
Price includes white Price includes white
color only. Other colors | color only. Other colors
cost an additional cost an additional
$1,100.00 $1,100.00
Knapheide 696J/ Knapheide 696J Knapheide 696J
Warner 598M-SW Warner Warner

WS298-M-SW-U-RT

WS298-M-SW-U-RT
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Buyer: Dianna Gilliland

5367 OF

Statewide
SECONDARY/E85
AWARDS
ﬁ 2017 or Current Production Year 1 Ton Diesel Regular Cab | Husker Auto Group Sid Dillon Sid Dillon Ford
.5 4x4 Dual Rear Wheels Truck LLC Chevrolet Buick
Description QTY|UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
23| Dual wheel Chassis with eight foot (8") Utility 1 EA
Body (see ATTACHMENT) Color of Utility Body
to match manufacturer color charts.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ 8,995.00 $8,280.00 $8,280.00
Price includes white | Price includes white
color only. Other color only. Other
colors cost an colors cost an
additional $1,100.00 | additional $1,100.00
State make and model: Knapheide Knapheide 696D54J| Knapheide 696D54J
696JD547/ Warner or Warner or Warner
598M-DW
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ 8,995.00 $8,280.00 $8,280.00
Price includes white | Price includes white
color only. Other color only. Other
colors cost an colors cost an
additional $1,100.00 | additional $1,100.00
State make and model: Knapheide Knapheide 696D54J| Knapheide 696D54J
696JD547/ Warner or Warner or Warner
598M-DW
24| Single wheels Chassis Cab with no Utility Box. | 1 EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ (899.00) N/A $ 248.00
60 CA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ (899.00) N/A $ 248.00
60 CA
25| Dual wheels Chassis Cab with no Utility Box. 1 EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 CA=Cab to Axle $ 228.00 $ 448.00
56" CA $(550.00) 60 CA 60 CA
60" CA $(827.00)
84" CA $(777.00)
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 CA=Cab to Axle $ 228.00 $ 448.00
56" CA $(550.00) 60 CA 60 CA
60" CA $(827.00)
84" CA $(777.00)
26| Two wheel drive (deduct). 1 EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ (1,197.00)| $ (1,315.00)| $ (1,582.00)
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ (1,197.00)| $ (1,315.00)| $ (1,582.00)
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Buyer: Dianna Gilliland

5367 OF

Opening Date: 08/12/16

Statewide
SECONDARY/E85
AWARDS
ﬁ 2017 or Current Production Year 1 Ton Diesel Regular Cab | Husker Auto Group Sid Dillon Sid Dillon Ford
.5 4x4 Dual Rear Wheels Truck LLC Chevrolet Buick
Description QTY|UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
27| HD Rubberized spray in bed liner (Linex, Rhino | 1 EA
or equivalent).
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ 495.00 $ 475.00 $ 475.00
Pickup Box Pickup Box
$ 650.00 $ 650.00
Utility Box Utility Box
State manufacturer: Linex/Rhino Linex or Linex or
Equivalent Equivalent
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ 495.00 $ 475.00 $ 475.00
Pickup Box Pickup Box
$ 650.00 $ 650.00
Utility Box Utility Box
State manufacturer: Linex/Rhino Linex or Linex or
Equivalent Equivalent
28| Cargo light. 1| EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ 109.00 STD STD
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ 109.00 STD STD
29| Standard Paint - Attach List and Identify as No 1 EA
Additional Cost Paints.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 NC see attached see attached
See attached RPO
Paints
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 NC see attached see attached
See attached RPO
Paints
30| For Department of Roads Use: Yellow color of; | 1 EA
Dodge #PL1, Ford #84S53, Chevrolet/GMC
#WA-253A code (9W3) with no order required.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ 150.00 | $ 350.00| $ 835.00
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ 150.00 | $ 350.00  $ 835.00
31| Extra Cost Paint- Attach List and Identify as 1 EA
Extra Cost Paints.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $495.00 see attached see attached
See attached
SEO- Paints
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $495.00 see attached see attached
See attached
SEO- Paints
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5367 OF

Statewide
SECONDARY/E85
AWARDS

ﬁ 2017 or Current Production Year 1 Ton Diesel Regular Cab | Husker Auto Group Sid Dillon Sid Dillon Ford
.5 4x4 Dual Rear Wheels Truck LLC Chevrolet Buick

Description QTY|UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
32| Rearview camera - dealer or factory installed. 1 EA

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ 299.00( $ 376.00| $ 280.00

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ 299.00| $ 376.00| $ 280.00
33| Tailgate step - dealer or factory installed. 1 EA

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 NC N/A $ 375.00

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 NC N/A $ 375.00
34| Dual alternators - dealer or factory installed. 1 EA

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ 495.00 $ 380.00 $ 330.00

Diesel Diesel
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ 495.00 $ 380.00 $ 330.00
Diesel Diesel

35| Additional remote fob from manufacturer. 1 EA

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ 169.00 | $ 140.00| $ 150.00

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ 169.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 150.00
36| Electronic compass/temp display (deduct). 1| EA

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 N/A NA NA

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 N/A NA NA
37| Seat lumbar support: Lumbar support in seats if| 1 EA

not standard equipment.

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 std STD - Drivers STD - Drivers

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 std STD - Drivers STD - Drivers
38| Protective vinyl side moldings Dealer installed if| 1 | EA

not standard equipment.

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ 309.00| $ 350.00| $ 350.00

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ 309.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 350.00
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Buyer: Dianna Gilliland

5367 OF
Statewide
SECONDARY/E85
AWARDS
ﬁ 2017 or Current Production Year 1 Ton Diesel Regular Cab | Husker Auto Group Sid Dillon Sid Dillon Ford
.5 4x4 Dual Rear Wheels Truck LLC Chevrolet Buick
Description QTY|UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
39| Service repair manual equipment and engine. 1 EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ 695.00 | $ 590.00 | $ 375.00
State type of service repair manual available: paper copy paper CD
paper copy, CD Rom, or Online.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ 695.00 [ $ 590.00 | $ 375.00
State type of service repair manual available: paper copy paper CD
paper copy, CD Rom, or Online.
40 | Parts manual equipment and engine. 1 EA
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 N/A N/A N/A
State type of parts manual available: paper - -
copy, CD Rom, or Online.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 N/A N/A N/A
State type of parts manual available: paper - -
copy, CD Rom, or Online.
41| Additional costs for warranties from 1 EA
manufacturer.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 NC Call for options Call for options
State: Years and Miles 5 yr/ 100,000 mile - -
Pwr Train
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 NC Call for options Call for options
State: Years and Miles 5 yr/ 100,000 mile - -
Pwr Train
42| Drop shipment charges outside the Lincoln 1| EA
area. Additional costs of charges for vehicle
drop shipment outside the Lincoln area. Drop
shipment charges would be for vehicles bought
by political entities and other Divisions of
Government.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1 $ 500.00 | $2.00/mile or $400( $2.00/mile or $400
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 $ 500.00 | $2.00/mile or $400| $2.00/mile or $400
Payment Terms 0 15 0 30 0 30
Delivery Days ARO 35/120

Comments
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Statewide
SECONDARY/E85
AWARDS
ﬁ 2017 or Current Production Year 1 Ton Diesel Regular Cab | Husker Auto Group Sid Dillon Sid Dillon Ford
.5 4x4 Dual Rear Wheels Truck LLC Chevrolet Buick
Description [QTY|UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Exceptions for Technical Specifications

No exceptions

No exceptions

No exceptions

Technical Specifications

1.B. Box Bid: length -
97.8"; width -64.6";
width between wheel
wells - 51.3".
1.0.Fuel Tank: Diesel
- 36; Gasoline - 36.
Skid Plates - Comes
std with a DOT
approved, required &
installed shield.
1.BB.Trailer Tow:
capacity - 22,822.
3.J. Differential:
Locking.

4.B Battery: Capacity -
730 cca ea.

4.C. Alternator:
output - 150 amps.
6.G. GM.com.

10.D. Payment:
Husker Auto Group
LLC/Ally

6833 Telluride Dr
Lincoln, NE 68521
402-479-7500.

7. Sustainability: No.

Color & Trim sheet
attached.

1.B. Box Bid: length
97.76"; width blank;
51.02" width between
wheel wells.

1.0. Fuel Tank:
Diesel - 36; Gasoline -
36.

1.BB. Trailer Tow
capacity: blank.

3.J. - Differential: HD
Locking.

4.B. Battery: capacity
Dual 730 - Diesel.
4.C. Alternator:
output - 150.

6.E. - Delay delivery
orders will be placed
as late as possilbe to
reduce floor plan
charges.

Color & Trim sheet
attached.

1.B. Box Bid: length
98.1"; 66.9" width,
50.5" width between

wheel wells.

1.0. Fuel Tank:

Diesel - 29; Gasoline

34.

1.BB. Trailer tow
capacity: blank.

3.J. - Differential:
limited slip.

4.B. Battery: capacity
750.

4.C. Alternator:
output - 200.

6.E. - Delay delivery
orders will be placed
as late as possilbe to
reduce floor plan
charges.

Color & Trim sheet
attached.

Exceptions for Attachment Technical Specifications -
Utility body for Single Rear Wheel Chassis

No exceptions

No exceptions
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Description [QTY|UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Attachment Technical Specifications - 1.D Appox. Floor 7.1. Trailer tow: 7.1. Trailer tow:
Utility body for Single Rear Wheel Chassis width - 56" CA only.  [blank. blank.

7.H. Warranty for
utility body: 6yr
limited warranty see
attached.

7.1 Trailer Tow:
13,9109.

Exceptions for Attachment Technical Specifications -
Utility body for Dual Rear Wheel Chassis

No exceptions

No exceptions

No exceptions

Attachment Technical Specifications -
Utility body for Dual Rear Wheel Chassis

1.E. 56" CA

7.H. Warranty on
utility body: 6yr
limited warranty see
attached.

7.1. Trailer Tow:
22,822.

7.1. Trailer tow:
blank.

7.1. Trailer tow:
blank.

Exceptions for Master Agreement Terms and Conditions

None

None

None

Master Agreement Terms and Conditions

NE Dealer License:
Blank.

NE Dealer License:
05458.

NE Dealer License:
06577.

Vehicle Life Cycle not calculated since one ton trucks
not listed on Fuel Economy Guide Report.

Due to the requirement for utility body options and the
estimated contract usage, multiple contract awards have
been awarded to meet the needs of using agencies.

Primary Award is awarded to the lowest responsible bidder
meeting specifications. A Secondary Award may be awarded
to the next lowest responsible bidder of a different model
meeting specifications. A Third Award is possible to the next
lowest responsible bidder meeting specifications to allow
contract flexibilty with options. An E85 Award is awarded to
the lowest responsible bidder meeting specifications.

AWARD EXPLANATION
Baxter C-D-J-R excluded for tires bid.
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Gene Steffy Auto Group exlcuded for truck bid for line 2.
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