Buyer: Rita Schwabe 5350 Opening Date: 06/29/16
Military
Military Sand, Rock & Gravel Armstrong Rentals, LLC Deweese Sand & Gravel Gana Trucking & Excavating inc

H*

]

£

- Description Qty |UOM Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
SAND (MASON) GREENLIEF

1 TRAINING SITE 300 [ TN NO BID $ 1025 $  3,075.00( $ 1530 $  4,590.00
PEA GRAVEL GREENLIEF

2 TRAINING SITE 30 | TN NO BID $ 58.65( $ 1,759.50
1 1/2" CRUSH RUN LIMESTONE

3 |(CLEAN) GREENLIEF TRAINING | 200 | TN 34.85 $ 6,970.00 $ 3842 % 7,684.00
SIT
11/2" CRUSH RUN WITH FINES

4 GREEN LIEF TRAINING SITE 300 TN | $ 3385| $ 10,155.00 $ 3567 $ 10,701.00
1/4" CHIP LIMESTONE

5 GREENLIEE TRAINING SITE 100 TN | $ 37.95( $  3,795.00 $ 39.92($  3,992.00
RIVER ROCK GREENLIEF

6 TRAINING SITE 100 TN | $ 7400| $ 7,400.00 $ 76.15| $ 7,615.00
RIP RAP 8" GREENLIEF

7 TRAINING SITE 30 | TN NO BID $ 5859 | $ 1,757.70
ROAD GRAVEL GREENLIEF
TRAINING SITE LINES 1-8 SHIP

8 |TO: GREENLIEF TRAINING SITE| 300 | TN NO BID $ 1205 $ 3,615.00( $ 21.20| $ 6,360.00
6700 E "J" ST HASTINGS, NE
68901-8435
SAND (MASON) ASHLAND

9 TRAINING SITE 300 TN | $ 1050 $ 3,150.00 $ 919 $ 2,757.00
PEA GRAVEL ASHLAND

10 TRAINING SITE 50 | TN NO BID $ 4074 $ 2,037.00
11/2" CRUSH RUN LIMESTONE

11 [(CLEAN) ASHLAND TRAINING 400 TN | $ 19.70| $ 7,880.00 $ 2275 $ 9,100.00
SITE
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Buyer: Rita Schwabe 5350 Opening Date: 06/29/16

Military
Military Sand, Rock & Gravel Armstrong Rentals, LLC Deweese Sand & Gravel Gana Trucking & Excavating inc
BS
Q
£
- Description Qty |[UOM Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

1 1/2" CRUSH RUN WITH FINES
121 ASHLAND TRAINING SITE 300 | TN | $ 19101 $  5,730.00 $ 20.00 $  6,000.00

1/4" CHIP LIMESTOEN ASHLAND
13 TRAINING SITE 200 TN | $ 23401 $ 4,680.00 $ 2425] $ 4,850.00

RIVER ROCK ASHLAND
141 TRAINING SITE 300 TN | $ 7250 | $ 21,750.00 $ 51.74| $ 15522.00

15 le_IF_’ERAPS ASHLAND TRAINING 50 | TN NO BID s 3899 | 3 1.949.50

ROAD GRAVEL ASHLAND

TRAINING SITE LINE 9-16 SHIP
16 |[TO: CAMP ASHLAND TRAINING (400 [ TN | $ 16.35| $ 6,540.00 $ 1584 $ 6,336.00
SITE 220 COUNTY RD A
ASHLAND, NE 68003-600

SAND (MASON) MEAD

17 TRAINING SITE 300 TN | $ 10.70| $ 3,210.00 $ 8.93| $ 2,679.00
18 gﬁ_ﬁI\EGRAVEL MEAD TRAINING 50 | TN NO BID s 2908] 5 1 954.00
19 1 1/2" CRUSH RUN LIMESTONE 200 ™~ | 8 21.65| $ 8.660.00 s 0277 3 6.908.00

(CLEAN) MEAD TRAINING SITE

1 1/2" CRUSH RUN WITH FINES
20| \iEAD TRAINING SITE 300 TN | $ 2060 $  6,180.00 $ 22.02| $  6,606.00

1/4" CHIP LIMESTONE MEAD
21 TRAINING SITE 200 TN | $ 2475 $  4,950.00 $ 2627 $  5,254.00

RIVER ROCK MEAD TRAINING

22 SITE 300 TN | $ 7450 $ 22,350.00 $ 50.08 $ 15,024.00
23 gll_lF_’ERAPS MEAD TRAINING 50 | TN NO BID s 2899 $ 1949.50
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Buyer: Rita Schwabe 5350 Opening Date: 06/29/16

Military
Military Sand, Rock & Gravel Armstrong Rentals, LLC Deweese Sand & Gravel Gana Trucking & Excavating inc
BS
Q
£
- Description Qty |[UOM Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

ROAD GRAVEL MEAD TRAINING
SITE LINE 17-24 SHIP TP: MEAD
24 TRAINING SITE 785 CO ROAD J 400 TN | $ 1590 $ 6,360.00 $ 1558 $ 6,232.00

YUTAN, NE 68073-5058

OPTIONAL: SPREADING
25| GREENLIEF TRAINING SITE 3 | EA NO BID

OPTIONAL: SPREADING
26 | ASHLAND TRAINING SITE 3 | EA NO BID

OPTIONAL: SPREADING MEAD

27 TRAINING SITE 3 EA NOBID

$ 129,760.00 $ 6,690.00 $ 44,459.20
Payment Terms 030 Net 40 - -
Delivery Days ARO 21* 10 5

Line 32 - when available from

Comments .
supplier
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Buyer: Rita Schwabe

5350
Military

Opening Date: 06/29/16

Military Sand, Rock & Gravel Hooker Bros Sand & Gravel Westover Rock & Sand, Inc.
+*
[}
£
- Description Qty [UOM Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
SAND (MASON) GREENLIEF
1 l4RAINING SITE 300 TN [ $ 9.10( $  2,730.00
PEA GRAVEL GREENLIEF
2 |TRAINING SITE 30 [ TN | $ 3260 $ 978.00
11/2" CRUSH RUN LIMESTONE
3 [(CLEAN) GREENLIEF TRAINING | 200 [ TN | $ 3860 $ 7,720.00( $ 3345| $  6,690.00
SIT
11/2" CRUSH RUN WITH FINES
4 | GREEN LIEE TRAINING SITE 300| TN | $ 37.60| $ 11,280.00( $ 3150 $  9,450.00
1/4" CHIP LIMESTONE
> |GREENLIEF TRAINING SITE 100 1 TN $ 34.951 $ 349500
RIVER ROCK GREENLIEF
6 [TRAINING SITE 100 [ TN | $ 42.00| $  4,200.00
RIP RAP 8" GREENLIEF
" |TRAINING SITE 01 ™
ROAD GRAVEL GREENLIEF
TRAINING SITE LINES 1-8 SHIP
8 |TO: GREENLIEF TRAINING SITE| 300 [ TN | $ 1460 $  4,380.00
6700 E "J" ST HASTINGS, NE
68901-8435
SAND (MASON) ASHLAND
% |TRAINING SITE 300 | TN
PEA GRAVEL ASHLAND
10| TRAINING SITE 0| TN
11/2" CRUSH RUN LIMESTONE
11 [(CLEAN) ASHLAND TRAINING 400 | TN $ 21.90| $  8,760.00
SITE
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Buyer: Rita Schwabe

5350
Military

Opening Date: 06/29/16

Military Sand, Rock & Gravel Hooker Bros Sand & Gravel Westover Rock & Sand, Inc.
T+
Q
=
- Description Qty |UOM Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
1 1/2" CRUSH RUN WITH FINES
12 ASHLAND TRAINING SITE 300 ( TN $ 1915 $ 5,745.00
1/4" CHIP LIMESTOEN ASHLAND
13 TRAINING SITE 200 [ TN $ 23.40| $  4,680.00
RIVER ROCK ASHLAND
14 TRAINING SITE 300 | TN
15 RIP RAP 8" ASHLAND TRAINING 50 | TN
SITE
ROAD GRAVEL ASHLAND
TRAINING SITE LINE 9-16 SHIP
16 |TO: CAMP ASHLAND TRAINING | 400 | TN
SITE 220 COUNTY RD A
ASHLAND, NE 68003-600
SAND (MASON) MEAD
17 TRAINING SITE 300 | TN
18 PEA GRAVEL MEAD TRAINING 50 | TN
SITE
1 1/2" CRUSH RUN LIMESTONE
19 (CLEAN) MEAD TRAINING SITE 400 | TN $ 2355| $ 9,420.00
1 1/2" CRUSH RUN WITH FINES
20 MEAD TRAINING SITE 300 | TN $ 2080 | $ 6,240.00
1/4" CHIP LIMESTONE MEAD
21 TRAINING SITE 200 [ TN $ 2505( $ 5,010.00
29 RIVER ROCK MEAD TRAINING 300 | ™
SITE
RIP RAP 8" MEAD TRAINING
23 SITE 50 | TN
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Buyer: Rita Schwabe

5350
Military

Opening Date: 06/29/16
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Military Sand, Rock & Gravel Hooker Bros Sand & Gravel Westover Rock & Sand, Inc.
T+
Q
=
- Description Qty [UOM Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
ROAD GRAVEL MEAD TRAINING
SITE LINE 17-24 SHIP TP: MEAD
24 TRAINING SITE 785 CO ROAD J 400 | TN
YUTAN, NE 68073-5058
OPTIONAL: SPREADING
25| GREENLIEF TRAINING SITE 3 | EA see note 12D
OPTIONAL: SPREADING
26 | ASHLAND TRAINING SITE 3 | EA see note 12D
OPTIONAL: SPREADING MEAD
27 TRAINING SITE 3 EA see note 12D
$ 31,288.00 $ 19,635.00
Payment Terms 100 30 100 30
Delivery Days ARO 10 as ordered
Line 25 - Quoted price includes
Comments spreading if required via truck &
pup
No Bids

K4 Trucking L.L.C.

Lyman-Richey Sand & Gravel
Company
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