
Buyer:  Rita Schwabe 5200 OF

Department of Roads
Opening Date: 02/09/2016

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

1 CRS-2P DISTRICT 1 3925 TN  $           515.00  $   2,021,375.00  No Bid  $                  -   

2 CRS-2P DISTRICT 3 8550 TN  $           516.00  $   4,411,800.00  No Bid  $                  -   

3 CRS-2P DISTRICT 4 7650 TN  $           467.00  $   3,572,550.00  No Bid  $                  -   

4 CRS-2P DISTRICT 5 225 TN  $           576.00  $      129,600.00  $           556.36  $    125,181.00 

5 CRS-2P DISTRICT 6 2475 TN  $           507.00  $   1,254,825.00  No Bid  $                  -   

6 CRS-2P DISTRICT 7 2175 TN  $           505.00  $   1,098,375.00  No Bid  $                  -   

7 CRS-2P DISTRICT 8 3500 TN  $           464.00  $   1,624,000.00  No Bid  $                  -   

8 CRS-2P PLANT PICK UP 175 TN  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $                  -   

9 CRS-2VHL DISTRICT 5 225 TN  No Bid  $                     -    $           571.36  $    128,556.00 

10 CRS-2VHL PLANT PICK UP 25 TN  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $                  -   

11 CSS-1H 50/50 DISTRICT 3 75 TN  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $                  -   

12 CSS-1H 50/50 DISTRICT 5 150 TN  No Bid  $                     -    $           251.53  $      37,729.50 

13 CSS-1H 50/50 DISTRICT 6 800 TN  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $                  -   

14 CSS-1H 50/50 DISTRICT 7 225 TN  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $                  -   

15 CSS-1H 50/50 DISTRICT 8 300 TN  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $                  -   

16 CSS-1H 50/50 PLANT PICK UP 125 TN  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $                  -   

17 CSS-1H 75/25 DISTRICT 2 50 TN  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $                  -   

18 CSS-1H 75/25 DISTRICT 8 450 TN  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $                  -   

19 CSS-1H 75/25 PLANT PICK UP 50 TN  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $                  -   

20 CSS-1H STRAIGHT DISTRICT 5 150 TN  No Bid  $                     -    $           436.39  $      65,458.50 

21 CSS-1H STRAIGHT DISTRICT 7 150 TN  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $                  -   

22 CSS-1H STRAIGHT PLANT PICK UP 50 TN  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $                  -   

23 HFE-150 DISTRICT 5 1100 TN  No Bid  $                     -    $           463.53  $    509,883.00 

24 HFE-150 DISTRICT 8 25 TN  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $                  -   

25 HFE-150 PLANT PICK UP 75 TN  No Bid  $                     -    $           427.00  $      32,025.00 

26 HFE-300 DISTRICT 4 1600 TN  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $                  -   

27 HFE-300 DISTRICT 5 50 TN  No Bid  $                     -    $           547.73  $      27,386.50 

28 HFE-300 DISTRICT 6 1675 TN  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $                  -   

29 HFE-300 DISTRICT 7 700 TN  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $                  -   

30 HFE-300 DISTRICT 8 800 TN  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $                  -   

31 HFE-300 PLANT PICK UP 125 TN  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $                  -   

32 HFE-1000 DISTRICT 4 200 TN  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $                  -   

Partial Award

Liquid Asphaltic Materials Hills Materials CompanyFlint Hills Resources, L.P.
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Department of Roads
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Description Qty UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
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33 HFE-1000 DISTRICT 5 25 TN  No Bid  $                     -    $           537.04  $      13,426.00 

34 HFE-1000 DISTRICT 6 25 TN  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $                  -   

35 HFE-1000 DISTRICT 8 200 TN  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $                  -   

36 HFE-1000 PLANT PICK UP 100 TN  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $                  -   

37 MC-250 DISTRICT 4 100 TN  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $                  -   

38 MC-250 DISTRICT 6 100 TN  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $                  -   

39 MC-250 DISTRICT 8 100 TN  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $                  -   

40 MC-250 PLANT PICK UP 75 TN  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $                  -   

41 DEMURRAGE 1 TN  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $                  -   

 $        3,550.00  $ 14,112,525.00  $        3,790.94  $    939,645.50 

Delivery Days ARO Per Specifications

N/30Payment Terms

Total

1

0/30

Comments
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Buyer:  Rita Schwabe 5200 OF

Department of Roads
Opening Date: 02/09/2016

Description Qty UOM

1 CRS-2P DISTRICT 1 3925 TN

2 CRS-2P DISTRICT 3 8550 TN

3 CRS-2P DISTRICT 4 7650 TN

4 CRS-2P DISTRICT 5 225 TN

5 CRS-2P DISTRICT 6 2475 TN

6 CRS-2P DISTRICT 7 2175 TN

7 CRS-2P DISTRICT 8 3500 TN

8 CRS-2P PLANT PICK UP 175 TN

9 CRS-2VHL DISTRICT 5 225 TN

10 CRS-2VHL PLANT PICK UP 25 TN

11 CSS-1H 50/50 DISTRICT 3 75 TN

12 CSS-1H 50/50 DISTRICT 5 150 TN

13 CSS-1H 50/50 DISTRICT 6 800 TN

14 CSS-1H 50/50 DISTRICT 7 225 TN

15 CSS-1H 50/50 DISTRICT 8 300 TN

16 CSS-1H 50/50 PLANT PICK UP 125 TN

17 CSS-1H 75/25 DISTRICT 2 50 TN

18 CSS-1H 75/25 DISTRICT 8 450 TN

19 CSS-1H 75/25 PLANT PICK UP 50 TN

20 CSS-1H STRAIGHT DISTRICT 5 150 TN

21 CSS-1H STRAIGHT DISTRICT 7 150 TN

22 CSS-1H STRAIGHT PLANT PICK UP 50 TN

23 HFE-150 DISTRICT 5 1100 TN

24 HFE-150 DISTRICT 8 25 TN

25 HFE-150 PLANT PICK UP 75 TN

26 HFE-300 DISTRICT 4 1600 TN

27 HFE-300 DISTRICT 5 50 TN

28 HFE-300 DISTRICT 6 1675 TN

29 HFE-300 DISTRICT 7 700 TN

30 HFE-300 DISTRICT 8 800 TN

31 HFE-300 PLANT PICK UP 125 TN

32 HFE-1000 DISTRICT 4 200 TN

Liquid Asphaltic Materials

L
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e
 #

Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

 $           372.37  $   1,461,552.25  no bid  $                  -   

 $           367.37  $   3,141,013.50  no bid  $                  -   

 $           390.27  $   2,985,565.50  no bid  $                  -   

 $           425.86  $        95,818.50  no bid  $                  -   

 $           412.69  $   1,021,407.75  no bid  $                  -   

 $           425.75  $      926,006.25  no bid  $                  -   

 $           381.20  $   1,334,200.00  no bid  $                  -   

 $           360.00  $        63,000.00  no bid  $                  -   

 no bid  $                     -    no bid  $                  -   

 no bid  $                     -    no bid  $                  -   

 $           232.27  $        17,420.25  $           250.00  $      58,067.50 

 $           305.00  $        45,750.00  $           400.00  $    122,000.00 

 $           281.00  $      224,800.00  $           241.00  $      67,721.00 

 $           300.45  $        67,601.25  $           241.00  $      72,408.45 

 $           257.08  $        77,124.00  $           241.00  $      61,956.28 

 $           225.00  $        28,125.00  $           350.00  $      78,750.00 

 $           316.86  $        15,843.00  $           350.00  $    110,901.00 

 $           340.25  $      153,112.50  $           277.00  $      94,249.25 

 $           300.00  $        15,000.00  $           400.00  $    120,000.00 

 $           460.24  $        69,036.00  $           490.00  $    225,517.60 

 $           444.47  $        66,670.50  $           389.00  $    172,898.83 

 $           400.00  $        20,000.00  $           450.00  $    180,000.00 

 $           435.02  $      478,522.00  no bid  $                  -   

 $           425.78  $        10,644.50  no bid  $                  -   

 $           395.00  $        29,625.00  no bid  $                  -   

 $           435.90  $      697,440.00  no bid  $                  -   

 $           466.03  $        23,301.50  no bid  $                  -   

 $           457.86  $      766,915.50  no bid  $                  -   

 $           462.62  $      323,834.00  no bid  $                  -   

 $           432.00  $      345,600.00  no bid  $                  -   

 $           405.00  $        50,625.00  no bid  $                  -   

 $           460.95  $        92,190.00  no bid  $                  -   

Partial Award Partial Award

Martin Resource Management 

Corp. DBA Monarch Oil
Jebro Inc.
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Buyer:  Rita Schwabe 5200 OF

Department of Roads
Opening Date: 02/09/2016

Description Qty UOM

Liquid Asphaltic Materials

L
in

e
 #

33 HFE-1000 DISTRICT 5 25 TN

34 HFE-1000 DISTRICT 6 25 TN

35 HFE-1000 DISTRICT 8 200 TN

36 HFE-1000 PLANT PICK UP 100 TN

37 MC-250 DISTRICT 4 100 TN

38 MC-250 DISTRICT 6 100 TN

39 MC-250 DISTRICT 8 100 TN

40 MC-250 PLANT PICK UP 75 TN

41 DEMURRAGE 1 TN

Delivery Days ARO

Payment Terms

Total

Comments

Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

Partial Award Partial Award

Martin Resource Management 

Corp. DBA Monarch Oil
Jebro Inc.

 $           481.19  $        12,029.75  no bid  $                  -   

 $           473.82  $        11,845.50  no bid  $                  -   

 $           454.72  $        90,944.00  no bid  $                  -   

 $           425.00  $        42,500.00  no bid  $                  -   

 $           696.23  $        69,623.00  no bid  $                  -   

 $           710.57  $        71,057.00  no bid  $                  -   

 $           686.98  $        68,698.00  no bid  $                  -   

 $           660.00  $        49,500.00  no bid  $                  -   

 $           180.00  $             180.00  $           230.00  $      41,400.00 

 $      16,142.80  $ 15,064,121.00  $        4,309.00  $ 1,405,869.91 

0/30

Per Spec1

Net 45 
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