Buyer: Rita Schwabe 5185 OF Opening Date: 01/19/16
Department of Roads
Awarded Bid Tab

TRNLWB - LLC DBA Trinity

ﬁ Expanded Shale Buildex Inc Lightweight

£

- Description Qty uoMm Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
1 D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 690.0000 Cy [$ 56.50( $ 38,985.00( $ 60.42( $ 41,689.80

EAST JCT15 AND 92 DAVID CITY

D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8
2 SALT VALLEY YARD 120.0000 Cy [$ 52.20( $ 6,264.00| $ 58.94( $ 7,072.80

D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8
3 HWY15 MP 12 FAIRBURY 1,200.0000 Cy [$ 5295| $ 63,540.00| $ 58.20( $ 69,840.00

D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8
4 HWY15 MP 24 FAIRBURY 1,200.0000 Cy [$ 5295| $ 63,540.00| $ 58.20( $ 69,840.00

D-3 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8
5 HWY 24 MP 1 1,800.0000 Cy [$ 60.50( $ 108,900.00( $ 61.90| $ 111,420.00

D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 .
6 (ST PAUL YARD 1,600.0000 (3% No Bid $ 58.42| $ 93.472.00

D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 B

7 HWY 281 MP 120 2 MI N GREELEY 4,500.0000 CY $ 58.42| $ 262,890.00
D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 R

8 CENTRAL CITY YARD 3,400.0000 CY $ 58.42| $ 198,628.00

9 D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 2,300.0000 CY " $ 58.42| $ 134,366.00

HWY 92 MP 220 1 MI W LOUP CITY

D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 B
10 HWY 6 MP 253.3 SOUTH SIDE 1,200.0000 CY $ 58.20( $ 69,840.00

D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 B
11 S 93A MP 6 EAST SIDE 1,800.0000 CY $ 58.95( $ 106,110.00

D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 B

12 STRANG YARD JCT 81 AND 74 2,600.0000 CY $ 57.46| $  149,396.00
D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 R

13 HWY 8 MP 24 N SIDE 2,200.0000 CY $ 57.46| $ 126,412.00
D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 R

14 1 MI WEST JCT 81 AND 136 N SIDE 2,200.0000 CY $ 57.46| $ 126,412.00

15 D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 2,000.0000 CY " $ 59.68| $ 119,360.00

HWY 66 MP 18 COUNTY RD J
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16 D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 2,200.0000 CcY " $ 58.42( $ 128,524.00

JCT 81 AND 92 WEST OF OSCEOLA

D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 B
17 HWY 34 MP 218 8 MI N HASTINGS 500.0000 CY $ 56.95( $ 28,475.00

D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 "
18 HWY 4 MP 93 5 Ml W DAVENPORT 1,250.0000 CY $ 56.20( $ 70,250.00

D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 "
19 HWY 281 MP 20 14 MI N RED CLOUD 1,500.0000 CY $ 56.20( $ 84,300.00

D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 B
20 HWY 78 MP 9 4 MI N GUIDE ROCK 600.0000 CY $ 56.20( $ 33,720.00

D-5 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 .
21| SSHKOSH YARD 1,400.0000 (3% No Bid $ 56.20| $ 78,680.00

D-5 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 B
22|, \WY 385 RP 56 1,500.0000 (3% $ 56.20| $ 84,300.00

D-5 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 "
23 HWY 385 RP 65 JCT385 AND 92 1,500.0000 CY $ 56.20( $ 84,300.00

D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 "
24 ANSELMO 2,500.0000 CY $ 61.90| $ 154,750.00

D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 "
25 BROKEN BOW WEST 2,600.0000 CY $ 61.90| $ 160,940.00

D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 "
26 OGALLALA YARD 307 ED ST S 1,000.0000 CY $ 58.20( $ 58,200.00

D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 B
27 HWY 30 S SIDE MP 200 BRADY NE 600.0000 CY $ 59.68( $ 35,808.00

D-7 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 "
2811wy 83 RP 44.7 3.3 MI S JCT 23 AND 83 | 13000000 | €Y

$ 59.68| $ 77,584.00

D-7 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 B
291 ,\WY 34 RP 30.4 900.0000 (3% $ 57.40( $ 51,660.00

D-7 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 B
30 (WY 25 RP 10.0 600.0000 (3% $ 58.20( $ 34,920.00

D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8
31 JCT 8 AND 99 10 Ml W PAWNEE CITY 2,000.0000 Cy [ $ 48.89| $ 97,780.00( $ 58.42| $ 116,840.00

D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8
32 JCT 4 AND 99 3 MI N BURCHARD 1,000.0000 Cy [ $ 50.46| $ 50,460.00| $ 56.95( $ 56,950.00

D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8
33 JCT 4 AND 50 1 MI S STEINAUER 2,000.0000 Cy [ $ 49.70| $ 99,400.00( $ 56.95| $ 113,900.00

D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8
34 JCT 77 AND 112 7 MI S BEATRICE 2,000.0000 Cy [ $ 52.80( $ 105,600.00( $ 56.95| $ 113,900.00
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Buyer: Rita Schwabe

5185 OF
Department of Roads
Awarded Bid Tab

Opening Date: 01/19/16

TRNLWB - LLC DBA Trinity

ﬁ Expanded Shale Buildex Inc Lightweight

£

- Description Qty UoM Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8

35 JCT 136 AND 4 10 MI E BEATRICE 3,000.0000 Cy | $ 52.80| $ 158,400.00| $ 56.95| $ 170,850.00
D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8

36 HWY 4 MP 204.5 HUMBOLDT 1,500.0000 Cy | $ 48.301 $ 72,450.00( $ 59.16( $ 88,740.00
D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8

37 SALT VALLEY YARD 330.0000 Cy | $ 55.46| $ 18,301.80| $ 56.95( $ 18,793.50
D-2 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8

38 KIMBALL STOCKPILE HWY 1 RP 18 1,400.0000 Cy | $ 52,721 $ 73,808.00| $ 57.68( $ 80,752.00

39 |D-8 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 200.0000 CY No Bid $ 66.60| $ 13,320.00

40 [D-2 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 200.0000 CY ! $ 59.95| $ 11,990.00

41 [D-3 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 200.0000 CY ! $ 65.12| $ 13,024.00

42 |D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 200.0000 CY ! $ 60.68| $ 12,136.00

43 |D-5 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 200.0000 CY ! $ 62.90| $ 12,580.00

44 |D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 200.0000 CY ! $ 61.42| $ 12,284.00

45 |D-7 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 200.0000 CY ! $ 61.42| $ 12,284.00

46 [D-8 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 200.0000 CY ! $ 66.60| $ 13,320.00

47 |D-2 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200.0000 CY ! $ 59.95| $ 11,990.00

48 [D-3 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200.0000 CY ! $ 62.90| $ 12,580.00

49 [D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200.0000 CY ! $ 59.95| $ 11,990.00

50 |D-5 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200.0000 CY ! $ 59.95| $ 11,990.00

51|D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200.0000 CY ! $ 60.68| $ 12,136.00

52 |D-7 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200.0000 CY ! $ 59.95| $ 11,990.00

53 |D-8 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200.0000 CY ! $ 66.60| $ 13,320.00

54 |D-8 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200.0000 CY ! $ 66.60| $ 13,320.00
PRICE PER CUBIC YARD MILE i .

%% |FOR ALTERNATE DELIVERY LOCATIONS| 10000 cY $ Bosr)) - ol

Total $ 957,428.80 $ 3,814,139.10

Payment Terms 00

Delivery Days ARO 45

Comments

Line 6; ** No Bid - We Apologize,
we do not have the materials
available at this time.

Lines 7-20; " "

Line 21; No Bid No Bid

Lines 22-30; " "

Line 39; No Bid No Bid

Lines 40-50; " "

Line 51; No Bid No Bid

Lines 52-55; " "

Line 55; .047/mile
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